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DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Army 

Army Science Board Closed Meeting 
Notice 

AGENCY: Department of the Army, DoD. 
ACTION: Notice; meeting time 
corrections. 

SUMMARY: The meeting times for four 
Fiscal Year 2017 (FY17) ASB studies 
being presented on July 20, 2017, which 
published in the Federal Register on 
Thursday, June 22, 2017 (82 FR 28484) 
are changed to the following: 

Capabilities To Operate in Megacities 
and Dense Urban Areas. This study is 
classified and will be presented in a 
closed meeting at 1115–1215. 

Improving Transition of Laboratory 
Programs Into Warfighting Capabilities 
Through Experimentation. This study is 
not classified and will be presented 
during an open portion of the meeting 
at 1330–1430. 

Multi-Domain Battle. This study is 
classified and will be presented in the 
closed meeting at 0845–0945. 

The Future Character of Warfare and 
Required Capabilities. This study is 
classified and will be presented in a 
closed meeting at 1000–1100. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Army Science Board, Designated 
Federal Officer, 2530 Crystal Drive, 
Suite 7098, Arlington, VA 22202; MAJ 
Sean M. Madden, the committee’s 
Designated Federal Officer (DFO), at 
(703)–545–8652 or email: 
sean.m.madden.mil@mail.mil, or Mr. 
Paul Woodward at (703)–695–8344 or 
email: paul.j.woodward2.civ@mail.mil. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: None. 

Brenda S. Bowen, 
Army Federal Register Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2017–14160 Filed 7–5–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–03–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

Defense Advisory Committee on 
Investigation Prosecution and Defense 
of Sexual Assault in the Armed Forces; 
Notice of Federal Advisory Committee 
Meeting 

AGENCY: General Counsel of the 
Department of Defense, Department of 
Defense. 
ACTION: Notice of Federal Advisory 
Committee meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Defense 
(DoD) is publishing this notice to 

announce that the following Federal 
Advisory Committee meeting of the 
Defense Advisory Committee on 
Investigation Prosecution and Defense 
of Sexual Assault in the Armed Forces 
will take place. 
DATES: Open to the public, Friday, July 
21, 2017, from 8:30 a.m. to 4:45 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: One Liberty Center, 875 N. 
Randolph Street, Suite 1432, Arlington, 
Virginia 22203. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Dwight Sullivan, 703–695–1055 (Voice), 
703–693–3903 (Facsimile), 
dwight.h.sullivan.civ@mail.mil (Email). 
Mailing address is DACIPAD, One 
Liberty Center, 875 N. Randolph Street, 
Suite 150, Arlington, Virginia 22203. 
Web site: http://dacipad.whs.mil/. The 
most up-to-date changes to the meeting 
agenda can be found on the Web site. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
meeting is being held under the 
provisions of the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA) of 1972 (5 
U.S.C., Appendix, as amended), the 
Government in the Sunshine Act of 
1976 (5 U.S.C. 552b, as amended), and 
41 CFR 102–3.140 and 102–3.150. 

For further information please contact 
the DAC–IPAD staff director, Captain 
Tammy Tideswell, JAGC, U.S. Navy, 
One Liberty Center, 875 N. Randolph 
Street, Suite 150, Arlington, Virginia 
22203 via email 
whs.pentagon.em.mbx.dacipad@
mail.mil; phone (703) 693–3867; or 
facsimile (703) 693–3903. For 
submitting written comments or 
questions to the Panel, send via email to 
mailbox address: 
whs.pentagon.em.mbx.dacipad@
mail.mil. 

Purpose of the Meeting: In section 546 
of the National Defense Authorization 
Act for Fiscal Year 2015 (Pub. L. 113– 
291), as modified by section 537 of the 
National Defense Authorization Act for 
Fiscal Year 2016 (Pub. L. 114–92), 
Congress tasked the DAC–IPAD to 
advise the Secretary of Defense on the 
investigation, prosecution, and defense 
of allegations of rape, forcible sodomy, 
sexual assault, and other sexual 
misconduct involving members of the 
Armed Forces. This will be the third 
public meeting held by the DAC–IPAD. 
At this meeting, the Committee will 
receive a presentation on the mechanics 
of a sexual assault investigation from a 
representative of each Service’s military 
criminal investigation organization 
followed by a Committee strategic 
planning session. 

Agenda: 8:30 a.m.–8:45 a.m. Welcome 
and Introduction; 8:45 a.m.–10:45 a.m. 
Presentation on the Mechanics of a 
Military Sexual Assault Investigation; 

10:45 a.m.–12:45 p.m. DAC–IPAD 
Strategic Planning Session; 12:45 p.m.– 
1:30 p.m. Lunch; 1:30 p.m.–4:30 p.m. 
DAC–IPAD Strategic Planning Session 
(Continued); 4:30 p.m.–4:45 p.m. Public 
Comment; 4:45 p.m. Meeting 
Adjourned. 

Meeting Accessibility: Pursuant to 5 
U.S.C. 552b and 41 CFR 102–3.140 
through 102–3.165, and the availability 
of space, this meeting is open to the 
public. Seating is limited and is on a 
first-come basis. Visitors are required to 
sign in at the One Liberty Center 
security desk and must leave 
government-issued photo identification 
on file and wear a visitor badge while 
in the building. Department of Defense 
Common Access Card (CAC) holders 
who do not have authorized access to 
One Liberty Center must provide an 
alternate form of government-issued 
photo identification to leave on file with 
security while in the building. All 
visitors must pass through a metal 
detection security screening. 
Individuals requiring special 
accommodations to access the public 
meeting should contact the DAC–IPAD 
at whs.pentagon.em.mbx.dacipad@
mail.mil at least five (5) business days 
prior to the meeting so that appropriate 
arrangements can be made. In the event 
the Office of Personnel Management 
closes the government due to inclement 
weather or for any other reason, please 
consult the Web site for any changes to 
the public meeting date or time. 

Written Statements: Pursuant to 41 
CFR 102–3.140 and section 10(a)(3) of 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act of 
1972, the public or interested 
organizations may submit written 
comments to the Committee about its 
mission and topics pertaining to this 
public session. Written comments must 
be received by the DAC–IPAD at least 
five (5) business days prior to the 
meeting date so that they may be made 
available to the Committee members for 
their consideration prior to the meeting. 
Written comments should be submitted 
via email to the DAC–IPAD at 
whs.pentagon.em.mbx.dacipad@
mail.mil in the following formats: 
Adobe Acrobat or Microsoft Word. 
Please note that since the DAC–IPAD 
operates under the provisions of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, as 
amended, all written comments will be 
treated as public documents and will be 
made available for public inspection. 
Oral statements from the public will be 
permitted, though the number and 
length of such oral statements may be 
limited based on the time available and 
the number of such requests. Oral 
presentations by members of the public 
will be permitted from 4:30 p.m. to 4:45 
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p.m. on July 21, 2017, in front of the 
Committee members. 

Dated: June 30, 2017. 
Aaron Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2017–14198 Filed 7–5–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

Defense Advisory Committee on 
Military Personnel Testing; Notice of 
Federal Advisory Committee Meeting 

AGENCY: Under Secretary of Defense for 
Personnel and Readiness, Department of 
Defense. 
ACTION: Notice of Federal Advisory 
Committee meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Defense 
(DoD) is publishing this notice to 
announce that the following Federal 
Advisory Committee meeting of the 
Defense Advisory Committee on 
Military Personnel Testing will take 
place. 

DATES: Day 1: Open to the public 
Thursday, July 27, 2017 from 9:00 a.m. 
to 4:00 p.m. Day 2: Open to the public 
Friday, July 28, 2017 from 9:00 a.m. to 
12:00 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: The address of the meeting 
is the Doubletree Hotel, 525 West 
Lafayette Boulevard, Detroit, Michigan 
48226. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Jane 
Arabian, (703) 697–9271 (Voice), (703) 
614–9272 (Facsimile). Email: 
jane.m.arabian.civ@mail.mil. Mailing 
address is Assistant Director, Accession 
Policy, Office of the Under Secretary of 
Defense for Personnel and Readiness, 
Room 3D1066, The Pentagon, 
Washington, DC 20301–4000. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
meeting is being held under the 
provisions of the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA) of 1972 (5 
U.S.C., Appendix, as amended), the 
Government in the Sunshine Act of 
1976 (5 U.S.C. 552b, as amended), and 
41 CFR 102–3.140 and 102–3.150. 

Purpose of the Meeting: The purpose 
of the meeting is to review planned 
changes and progress in developing 
computerized tests for military 
enlistment screening. 

Agenda: The agenda includes an 
overview of current enlistment test 
development timelines, test 
development strategies, and planned 
research for the next 3 years. 

Meeting Accessibility: Pursuant to 5 
U.S.C. 552b and 41 CFR 102–3.140 
through 102–3.165, and the availability 
of space, this meeting is open to the 
public. 

Committee’s Designated Federal 
Officer or Point of Contact: Dr. Jane M. 
Arabian, Assistant Director, Accession 
Policy, Office of the Under Secretary of 
Defense for Personnel and Readiness, 
Room 3D1066, The Pentagon, 
Washington, DC 20301–4000, email: 
jane.m.arabian.civ@mail.mil, telephone 
(703) 697–9271. 

Written Statements: Persons desiring 
to make oral presentations or submit 
written statements for consideration at 
the committee meeting must contact the 
DFO, Dr. Jane Arabian at the address or 
telephone number in FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT no later than July 
14, 2017. 

Dated: June 30, 2017. 
Aaron Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2017–14155 Filed 7–5–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Army, Corps of 
Engineers 

Notice of Intent To Prepare a Draft 
Environmental Impact Statement 
(DEIS) in Cooperation With the North 
Carolina Department of Transportation 
and South Carolina Department of 
Transportation for Extending SC 31 
(Carolina Bays Parkway), in Horry 
County, South Carolina, To Connect to 
US 17, in Brunswick County, North 
Carolina 

AGENCY: Department of the Army, U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers. 
ACTION: Notice of intent. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Army Corps of 
Engineers, Wilmington District, 
Wilmington Regulatory Division and the 
U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, 
Charleston District, Charleston 
Regulatory Division (collectively COE) 
are issuing this notice to advise the 
public that a State (North Carolina 
Department of Transportation [NCDOT] 
and South Carolina Department of 
Transportation [SCDOT]) funded Draft 
Environmental Impact Statement (DEIS) 
will be prepared for improvements to 
SC 31 starting near Little River, Horry 
County, South Carolina and running 
northeast to US 17, in an area between 
Calabash and Shallotte, Brunswick 
County, North Carolina. This project is 
called the ‘‘Carolina Bays Parkway 

Extension’’ and is NCDOT Project 44604 
and SCDOT Project P029554. In 
accordance with the National 
Environmental Policy Act (NEPA), the 
COE is the lead Federal agency 
responsible for the preparation of the 
DEIS. Information included in the DEIS 
will serve as the basis for the COE’s 
evaluation of the proposed project 
pursuant to Section 404 of the Clean 
Water Act (CWA). As directed by CEQ 
regulations implementing NEPA, the 
COE will cooperate with the NCDOT to 
the fullest extent possible to reduce 
duplication between NEPA and the 
North Carolina Environmental Policy 
Act of 1971 (SEPA). Therefore, the DEIS 
will also serve as the basis for the 
NCDOT’s evaluation of the proposed 
project pursuant to SEPA. The DEIS will 
assess the potential effects of the 
proposed project and a range of 
reasonable project alternatives on 
impacts to navigable waters and other 
waters of the United States, including 
wetlands. The DEIS will also provide 
information for Federal, State, and local 
agencies having other jurisdictional 
responsibility. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Questions about the COE’s review of the 
proposed action, including preparation 
of the DEIS, can be directed to Mr. Brad 
Shaver, Regulatory Project Manager 
(Wilmington District), Wilmington 
Regulatory Field Office, 69 Darlington 
Avenue, Wilmington, NC 28403, by 
telephone: (910) 251–4611, or by email 
at Brad.E.Shaver@USACE.army.mil or 
Mr. John Policarpo, Regulatory Project 
Manager (Charleston District), 
Charleston Regulatory Field Office, 69A 
Hagood Avenue, Charleston, SC 29403, 
by telephone: (843) 329–8043, or by 
email at John.N.Policarpo@
USACE.army.mil. Questions about the 
NCDOT’s involvement with the 
proposed project, including use of the 
DEIS for purposes of SEPA, can be 
directed to Ms. Kim Gillespie P.E., 
NCDOT Project Planning Engineer, 
telephone: (919) 707–6023. Questions 
about SCDOT’s involvement with 
proposed project can be directed to Ms. 
Leah Quattlebaum P.E., SCDOT Program 
Manager, telephone (803) 737–1751. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The COE 
is evaluating a proposal from the 
NCDOT and SCDOT in accordance with 
Section 404 of the CWA and NEPA. 
Based on the available information, the 
COE has determined that the proposed 
project has the potential to significantly 
affect the quality of the human and 
natural environment, and therefore 
warrants the preparation of an EIS. 

Description of the Proposed Project. 
The NCDOT and SCDOT are proposing 
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