>
GPO,

Federal Register/Vol. 69, No. 59/Friday, March 26, 2004 /Notices

15919

metallurgical phases anhorthite and/or
pseudowollastonite); with calcium content
from 30 to 300 ppm and oxygen from 70 to
300 ppm, and with calcium-to-oxygen ratio
from 0.2 to 0.6; sometimes referred to as (but

not limited to) products known as ‘UGIMA’ .

(B) Effective with respect to goods entered,
or withdrawn from warehouse for
consumption, on or after September 1, 2002,
such subdivision (c)(cxcvi) is further
modified by deleting the language ““5,000t
during the 12-month period beginning on
September 1, 2002 or September 1, 2003 or
during the period from September 1, 2004
through March 20, 2005,” and by inserting in
lieu thereof the language ““5,590t during the
12-month period beginning on September 1,
2002, and not to exceed 5,000t during the
period beginning on September 1, 2003
through December 5, 2003,”.

(6) Effective with respect to goods entered,
or withdrawn from warehouse for
consumption, on or after January 1, 2004:

(A) U.S. note 12(b) to subchapter XI to
chapter 99 is modified by deleting the
following:

Beginning in calendar year 2015, quantitative
limitations on the aggregate quantity of goods
of Chile’s trade surplus entered under
subheading 9911.17.05 shall cease to apply
on such originating goods of Chile.

and by inserting the following in lieu thereof:

Beginning in calendar year 2015, the
aggregate quantity of originating goods of
Chile entered under heading 9911.17.05 in
any calendar year shall be the quantity of
goods equal to the amount of Chile’s trade
surplus in subdivision (a) of this note.

(B) The article description of subheading
9911.96.26 is modified by deleting “$2.025¢/
kg” and inserting “$2.025/kg” in lieu thereof.

(C) The article description of subheading
9911.96.44 is modified by deleting “$1.341¢/
kg” and inserting “$1.341/kg” in lieu thereof.

(D) The article description of subheading
9911.96.63 is modified by deleting
“$1.236kg” and inserting “$1.236/kg” in lieu
thereof.

(E) The article description of subheading
9911.96.68 is modified by deleting “93.6¢kg”
and inserting ““93.6¢/kg” in lieu thereof.

(F) The article description of subheading
9911.96.73 is modified by deleting “‘84.6¢kg”
and inserting “84.6¢/kg” in lieu thereof.

(G) The article description of subheading
9911.97.24 is modified by deleting “$2.214¢/
kg” and inserting “$2.214/kg” in lieu thereof.

[FR Doc. 04-6782 Filed 3—25-04; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 3190-W3-P

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
Office of the Secretary

Aviation Proceedings, Agreements
Filed the Week Ending March 12, 2004

The following Agreements were filed
with the Department of Transportation
under the provisions of 49 U.S.C. 412
and 414. Answers may be filed within
21 days after the filing of the
application.

Docket Number: OST-2004—17290.

Date Filed: March 10, 2004.

Parties: Members of the International
Air Transport Association.

Subject: Mail Vote 363, PTC2 AFR
0145 dated 09 March 2004, TC2 Within
Africa Resolution 002e r1, Intended
effective date: 01 April 2004.

Docket Number: OST-2004-17291.

Date Filed: March 10, 2004.

Parties: Members of the International
Air Transport Association.

Subject: Mail Vote 364, PTC2 AFR
0146 dated 09 March 2004, PTC2
Within Africa Resolutions r1-r23,
Intended effective date: 01 May 2004.

Docket Number: OST-2004—17340.

Date Filed: March 12, 2004.

Parties: Members of the International
Air Transport Association.

Subject: Mail Vote 365, PTC23 EUR—
SASC 0125 dated 16 March 2004, TC23
Special Passenger Amending Resolution
from Pakistan to Europe r1-r2, Intended
effective date: 01 April 2004.

Andrea M. Jenkins,

Program Manager, Docket Operations,
Federal Register Liaison.

[FR Doc. 04-6859 Filed 3—25-04; 8:45 am)|]
BILLING CODE 4910-62-P

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
Office of the Secretary

Notice of Applications for Certificates
of Public Convenience and Necessity
and Foreign Air Carrier Permits Filed
Under Subpart B (Formerly Subpart Q)
During the Week Ending March 12,
2004

The following Applications for
Certificates of Public Convenience and
Necessity and Foreign Air Carrier
Permits were filed under subpart B
(formerly subpart Q) of the Department
of Transportation’s Procedural
Regulations (See 14 CFR 301.201 et
seq.). The due date for Answers,
Conforming Applications, or Motions to
Modify Scope are set forth below for
each application. Following the Answer
period DOT may process the application
by expedited procedures. Such
procedures may consist of the adoption
of a show-cause order, a tentative order,
or in appropriate cases a final order
without further proceedings.

Docket Number: OST-2004—17264.

Date Filed: March 8, 2004.

Due Date for Answers, Conforming
Applications, or Motion to Modify
Scope: March 29, 2004.

Description: Application of JetBlue
Airways Corporation, requesting a
certificate of public convenience and

necessity to engage in foreign scheduled
air transportation of persons, property
and mail from the United States to the
Bahamas, Bermuda, Canada, the
Dominican Republic and Jamaica.

Docket Number: OST-2004-17311.

Date Filed: March 10, 2004.

Due Date for Answers, Conforming
Applications, or Motion to Modify
Scope: March 31, 2004.

Description: Application of Omega
Air Holdings, LLC, d/b/a Omega Air
Cargo, requesting a certificate of public
convenience and necessity to engage in
interstate scheduled and charter all-
cargo operations.

Docket Number: OST-2004-17312.

Date Filed: March 10, 2004.

Due Date for Answers, Conforming
Applications, or Motion to Modify
Scope: March 31, 2004.

Description: Application of Omega
Air Holdings, LLC, d/b/a Omega Air
Cargo, requesting a certificate of public
convenience and necessity to engage in
foreign charter all-cargo operations.

Docket Number: OST-2004-17315.

Date Filed: March 10, 2004.

Due Date for Answers, Conforming
Applications, or Motion to Modify
Scope: March 31, 2004.

Description: Application of Cargojet
Airways Ltd. d/b/a Starjet Airways,
requesting a foreign air carrier permit to
engage in charter and scheduled foreign
air transportation of persons, property,
and mail between any point or points in
Canada and any point or points in the
United States, and other charter foreign
air transportation.

Andrea M. Jenkins,

Program Manager, Docket Operations,
Federal Register Liaison.

[FR Doc. 04-6860 Filed 3—25-04; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 4910-62—P

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

Federal Aviation Administration
[Summary Notice No. PE-2004-21]

Petitions for Exemption; Dispositions
of Petitions Issued

AGENCY: Federal Aviation
Administration (FAA), DOT.

ACTION: Notice of dispositions of prior
petitions.

SUMMARY: Pursuant to FAA’s rulemaking
provisions governing the application,
processing, and disposition of petitions
for exemption part 11 of title 14, Code
of Federal Regulations (14 CFR), this
notice contains a summary of certain
dispositions of certain petitions
previously received. The purpose of this



		Superintendent of Documents
	2010-07-18T02:53:43-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




