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Complainant certifies that a copy of 
the complaint has been served on MISO 
and on the Kentucky Public Service 
Commission. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. The Respondent’s answer 
and all interventions, or protests must 
be filed on or before the comment date. 
The Respondent’s answer, motions to 
intervene, and protests must be served 
on the Complainant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on November 24, 2016. 

Dated: November 7, 2016. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2016–27379 Filed 11–14–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP17–5–000] 

Columbia Gas Transmission, LLC; 
Notice of Request Under Blanket 
Authorization 

Take notice that on October 28, 2016, 
Columbia Gas Transmission, LLC 
(Columbia), located at 5151 San Felipe, 

Suite 2500, Houston, Texas 77056, filed 
in Docket No. CP17–5–000, a prior 
notice request pursuant to sections 
157.205, and 157.208(b) of the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission’s 
regulations under the Natural Gas Act 
(NGA), seeking authorization to 
abandon and construct certain natural 
gas facilities in Gallia, Jackson and 
Lawrence Counties, Ohio, all as more 
fully set forth in the application, which 
is on file with the Commission and open 
to public inspection. The filing may also 
be viewed on the Web at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, contact FERC at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (866) 208–3676 or TTY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Any questions regarding the Request 
should be directed to Richard D. 
Bralow, Counsel, Columbia Gas 
Transmission, LLC, 700 Louisiana 
Street, Houston, Texas 77002, by 
telephone at: 832–320–5177, or by email 
at richard_bralow@transcanada.com. 

Any person may, within 60 days after 
the issuance of the instant notice by the 
Commission, file pursuant to Rule 214 
of the Commission’s Procedural Rules 
(18 CFR 385.214) a motion to intervene 
or notice of intervention. Any person 
filing to intervene or the Commission’s 
staff may, pursuant to section 157.205 of 
the Commission’s Regulations under the 
NGA (18 CFR 157.205) file a protest to 
the request. If no protest is filed within 
the time allowed therefore, the proposed 
activity shall be deemed to be 
authorized effective the day after the 
time allowed for protest. If a protest is 
filed and not withdrawn within 30 days 
after the time allowed for filing a 
protest, the instant request shall be 
treated as an application for 
authorization pursuant to section 7 of 
the NGA. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: complete 
its environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule for Environmental 
Review will serve to notify federal and 

state agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
federal authorizations within 90 days of 
the date of issuance of the Commission 
staff’s FEIS or EA. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commenter’s will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commenter’s will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commentary, 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and ill not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests, 
and interventions via the internet in lieu 
of paper. See 18 CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) 
and the instructions on the 
Commission’s Web site (www.ferc.gov) 
under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. Persons 
unable to file electronically should 
submit an original and 5 copies of the 
protest or intervention to the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426. 

Dated: November 7, 2016. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2016–27382 Filed 11–14–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket Nos. EL17–17–000; QF11–516–001] 

Western Water and Power Production 
Limited LLC; Notice of Petition for 
Enforcement 

Take notice that on November 7, 
2016, pursuant to section 210(h)(2)(B) of 
the Public Utility Regulatory Policies 
Act of 1978 (PURPA), Western Water 
and Power Production Limited LLC 
(Petitioner) filed a Petition for 
Enforcement, requesting the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission 
(Commission) to exercise its authority 
and initiate enforcement action against 
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the New Mexico Public Regulation 
Commission to remedy its alleged 
improper implementation of PURPA, all 
as more fully explained in the petition. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Petitioner. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
electronic review in the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room in Washington, 
DC. There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on 
the Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on November 28, 2016. 

Dated: November 7, 2016. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2016–27380 Filed 11–14–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0698] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission Under Delegated 
Authority 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 

ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501– 
3520), the Federal Communications 
Commission (FCC or Commission) 
invites the general public and other 
Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collections. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
The FCC may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid OMB 
control number. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before January 17, 
2017. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Nicole Ongele, FCC, via email to PRA@
fcc.gov and to Nicole.Ongele@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Nicole 
Ongele at (202) 418–2991. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Approval Number: 3060–0698. 
Title: Section 25.203(i) and 

73.1030(a)(2), Radio Astronomy 
Coordination Zone in Puerto Rico. 

Form No: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit, not-for-profit institutions, and 
State, local, or tribal Government. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 450 respondents, 4,000 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 5–40 
minutes (.0833 hours to .667 hours). 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement and third party 
disclosure requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is contained 47 U.S.C. 154(i), 303(f), 
303(r), and 309(j)(13). 

Total Annual Burden: 602 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Privacy Impact Assessment: No 

impact(s). 
Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 

There is no need for confidentiality. 
Needs and Uses: The Commission 

will submit this expiring information 
collection to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) after this 60 day 
comment period to obtain the three-year 
clearance from them. 

On October 15, 1997, the FCC 
released a Report and Order, ET Docket 
No. 96–2, RM–8165, FCC 97–347, that 
established a Coordination Zone for new 
and modified radio facilities in various 
communications services that cover the 
islands of Puerto Rico, Desecheo, Mona, 
Vieques, and Culebra within the 
Commonwealth of Puerto Rico. The 
coordination zone and notification 
procedures enable the Arecibo Radio 
Astronomy Observatory to receive 
information needed to assess whether 
an applicant’s proposed operations will 
cause harmful interference to the 
Arecibo Observatory’s operations, 
which also promotes efficient resolution 
of coordination problems between the 
applicants and the Arecibo Observatory. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Gloria J. Miles, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, Office of the 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2016–27331 Filed 11–14–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–XXXX] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
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