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If additional information is required, 
contact: Jerri Murray, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Justice Management 
Division, Two Constitution Square, 145 
N Street NE., Room 1407B, Washington, 
DC 20530. 

Dated: May 2, 2013. 

Jerri Murray, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, 
United States Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2013–10765 Filed 5–6–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed 
Consent Decree Under the 
Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation, and Liability 
Act 

On April 24, 2013, the Department of 
Justice lodged a proposed Consent 
Decree with the United States District 
Court for the Central District of 
California in the lawsuit entitled United 
States v. LeVan Specialty Company, 
Inc., Civil Action No. 2:13–cv–02887– 
PA–JEMx. 

The Consent Decree resolves a claim 
against LeVan Specialty Company, Inc., 
(‘‘LeVan’’), under Section 107 of the 
Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation, and Liability 
Act (‘‘CERCLA’’), 42 U.S.C. 9607 related 
to releases and threatened releases of 
hazardous substances at the Puente 
Valley Operable Unit (‘‘PVOU’’) of the 
San Gabriel Valley Superfund Site, Area 
4, Los Angeles County, California (the 
‘‘Site’’). The Consent Decree, reflecting 
an ability-to-pay settlement, recovers 
$155,000 in response costs. The Consent 
Decree provides a covenant not to sue 
to LeVan for past and certain future 
costs and response actions at the site 
under Sections 106 and 107 of CERCLA 
and Section 7003 of the Resource 
Conservation and Recovery Act, 
(‘‘RCRA’’), 42 U.S.C. 6973. 

The publication of this notice opens 
a period for public comment on the 
Consent Decree. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 
General, Environment and Natural 
Resources Division, and should refer to 
United States v. LeVan Specialty 
Company, Inc., D.J. Ref. No. 90–11–2– 
354/30. All comments must be 
submitted no later than thirty (30) days 
after the publication date of this notice. 
Comments may be submitted either by 
email or by mail: 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By e-mail .. pubcomment-ees.enrd@
usdoj.gov. 

By mail ...... Assistant Attorney General, U.S. 
DOJ—ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611. 

Under Section 7003(d) of RCRA, a 
commenter may request an opportunity 
for a public meeting in the affected area. 

During the public comment period, 
the Consent Decree may be examined 
and downloaded at this Justice 
Department Web site: http://
www.usdoj.gov/enrd/Consent_
Decrees.html. We will provide a paper 
copy of the Consent Decree upon 
written request and payment of 
reproduction costs. Please mail your 
request and payment to: 

Consent Decree Library, U.S. DOJ— 
ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

Please enclose a check or money order 
for $9.00 (25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the United 
States Treasury. 

Henry S. Friedman, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2013–10725 Filed 5–6–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed First 
Amendment to Consent Decree Under 
the Clean Water Act 

On April 30, 2013, the Department of 
Justice lodged a proposed first 
amendment to a consent decree with the 
United States District Court for the 
Northern District of Ohio in the lawsuit 
entitled United States, et al. v. City of 
Fostoria, Ohio, Civil Action No. 3:06 CV 
1626, consolidated with 3:06 CV 1627. 

Under the original 2006 consent 
decree, the City of Fostoria, Ohio 
(‘‘Fostoria’’) agreed to undertake 
numerous measures to come into 
compliance with the Clean Water Act, 
including developing and implementing 
a Long-Term Control Plan (‘‘LTCP’’). 
Fostoria still is in the process of 
complying with the 2006 Decree. 
However, under the proposed first 
amendment, the completion of the 
construction required by the recent, 
conditionally-approved LTCP is 
extended from December 31, 2025, to 
December 31, 2029. 

The publication of this notice opens 
a period of public comment on the first 
amendment. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 

General, Environment and Natural 
Resources Division, and should refer to 
United States, et al. v. City of Fostoria, 
Ohio, D.J. Ref. No. 90–5–1–1–08204. All 
comments must be submitted no later 
than thirty (30) days after the 
publication date of this notice. 
Comments may be submitted either by 
email or by mail: 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By e-mail .. pubcomment-ees.enrd@
usdoj.gov. 

By mail ...... Assistant Attorney General, U.S. 
DOJ—ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611. 

During the public comment period, 
the first amendment may be examined 
and downloaded at this Department of 
Justice Web site: http://www.usdoj.gov/ 
enrd/Consent_Decrees.html. We will 
provide a paper copy of the first 
amendment upon written request and 
payment of reproduction costs. Please 
mail your request and payment to: 
Consent Decree Library, U.S. DOJ— 
ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

Please enclose a check in the amount 
of $ 2.25 (25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the United 
States Treasury. 

Maureen Katz, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2013–10798 Filed 5–6–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, Firearms, 
and Explosives 

[OMB Number 1140–0042] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed Collection; 
Comments Requested: Statement of 
Process-Marking of Plastic Explosives 
for the Purpose of Detection 

ACTION: 30-Day notice. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, Firearms, 
and Explosives (ATF) will be submitting 
the following information collection 
request to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for review and approval 
in accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. The proposed 
information collection is published to 
obtain comments from the public and 
affected agencies. This proposed 
information collection was previously 
published in the Federal Register 

VerDate Mar<15>2010 15:24 May 06, 2013 Jkt 229001 PO 00000 Frm 00045 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\07MYN1.SGM 07MYN1tk
el

le
y 

on
 D

S
K

3S
P

T
V

N
1P

R
O

D
 w

ith
 N

O
T

IC
E

S

http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/Consent_Decrees.html
http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/Consent_Decrees.html
http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/Consent_Decrees.html
http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/Consent_Decrees.html
http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/Consent_Decrees.html
mailto:pubcomment-ees.enrd@usdoj.gov
mailto:pubcomment-ees.enrd@usdoj.gov
mailto:pubcomment-ees.enrd@usdoj.gov
mailto:pubcomment-ees.enrd@usdoj.gov

	WHDPRAComments@dol.gov
	http://  www.usdoj.gov/enrd/Consent_  Decrees.html
	http://www.usdoj.gov/  enrd/Consent_Decrees.html
	pubcomment-ees.enrd@  usdoj.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2013-05-07T02:00:59-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




