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(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, through use, as 
appropriate, of automated, electronic, 
mechanical, and other collection 
technologies; e.g., permitting electronic 
submission of responses. 

Estimate of burden: The public 
burden for this collection of information 
is estimated to average 0.55 hours per 
response. 

Respondents: Foreign federal 
government officials, owners of U.S.- 
origin pet birds and performing or 
theatrical birds or poultry returning to 
the United States, and U.S. importers of 
bird and poultry carcasses, parts, 
products and byproducts (bird blood, 
bird tissues, etc.) of birds and poultry 
and eggs (other than hatching eggs) from 
certain regions. 

Estimated annual number of 
respondents: 973. 

Estimated annual number of 
responses per respondent: 3.81. 

Estimated annual number of 
responses: 3,707. 

Estimated total annual burden on 
respondents: 2,041 hours. (Due to 
averaging, the total annual burden hours 
may not equal the product of the annual 
number of responses multiplied by the 
reporting burden per response.) 

All responses to this notice will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for OMB approval. All comments will 
also become a matter of public record. 

Done in Washington, DC, this 8th day of 
June 2020. 
Michael Watson, 
Acting Administrator, Animal and Plant 
Health Inspection Service. 
[FR Doc. 2020–12737 Filed 6–11–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–34–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Animal and Plant Health Inspection 
Service 

[Docket No. APHIS–2020–0046] 

Notice of Request for Revision to and 
Extension of Approval of an 
Information Collection; U.S. Origin 
Health Certificate 

AGENCY: Animal and Plant Health 
Inspection Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Revision to and extension of 
approval of an information collection; 
comment request. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, this 
notice announces the Animal and Plant 

Health Inspection Service’s intention to 
request a revision to and extension of 
approval of an information collection 
associated with the export of animals 
and animal products from the United 
States. 

DATES: We will consider all comments 
that we receive on or before August 11, 
2020. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments 
by either of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: Go to 
http://www.regulations.gov/ 
#!docketDetail;D=APHIS-2020-0046. 

• Postal Mail/Commercial Delivery: 
Send your comment to Docket No. 
APHIS–2020–0046, Regulatory Analysis 
and Development, PPD, APHIS, Station 
3A–03.8, 4700 River Road, Unit 118, 
Riverdale, MD 20737–1238. 

Supporting documents and any 
comments we receive on this docket 
may be viewed at http://
www.regulations.gov/#!docketDetail;
D=APHIS-2020-0046 or in our reading 
room, which is located in Room 1141 of 
the USDA South Building, 14th Street 
and Independence Avenue SW, 
Washington, DC. Normal reading room 
hours are 8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, except holidays. To be 
sure someone is there to help you, 
please call (202) 799–7039 before 
coming. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
information on the export of animals 
and animal products from the United 
States, contact Dr. Dix Harrell, 
Veterinarian in Charge, Veterinary 
Export Trade Services, Field Operations, 
VS, APHIS, Gainesville Service Center, 
8100 NW 15 Place, Gainesville, FL 
32606; (352) 313–3060. For more 
information on the information 
collection process, contact Mr. Joseph 
Moxey, APHIS’ Information Collection 
Coordinator, at (301) 851–2483. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title: U.S. Origin Health Certificate. 
OMB Control Number: 0579–0020. 
Type of Request: Revision to and 

extension of approval of an information 
collection. 

Abstract: Under the Animal Health 
Protection Act (7 U.S.C. 8301 et seq.), 
the Animal and Plant Health Inspection 
Service (APHIS) of the U.S. Department 
of Agriculture, among other things, has 
the authority to detect, control, or 
eradicate pests or diseases of livestock 
or poultry. The Secretary may also 
prohibit or restrict the import or export 
of any animal or related material if 
necessary to prevent the spread of any 
livestock or poultry pest or disease. 
Disease prevention is the most effective 
method for maintaining a healthy 

animal population and for enhancing 
APHIS’ ability to compete in the world 
market of animal and animal product 
trade. The export of agricultural 
commodities, including animals and 
animal products, is a major business in 
the United States and contributes to a 
favorable balance of trade. As part of its 
mission to facilitate the export of U.S. 
animals and products, APHIS’ 
Veterinary Services maintains 
information regarding the import health 
requirements of other countries for 
animals and animal products exported 
from the United States. 

Among other things, to ensure a 
favorable balance of trade, APHIS uses 
information collection activities, such as 
U.S. Origin Health Certificates; U.S. 
Origin Health Certificates for the Export 
of Horses from the United States to 
Canada; Health Certificates for the 
Export of Live Finfish, Mollusks, and 
Crustaceans (and their Gametes); 
Country-specific Health Certificates; 
United States Interstate and 
International Certificate of Health 
Examination for Small Animals 
(Exporters); Inspection and Certification 
for Animal Products; Undue Hardship 
Explanations-Animals; Applications for 
Approval of Inspection Facility- 
Environmental Certification; Annual 
Inspections of Export Inspection 
Facilities; Opportunities to Present 
Views Concerning Withdrawal of 
Facility Approval; Certifications to 
Carry Livestock; Inspections of Vessel 
Prior to Voyage; Notarized Statements; 
Aircraft Cleaning and Disinfection; and 
Travel Time. 

We are asking the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) to 
approve our use of these information 
collection activities, as described, for an 
additional 3 years. 

The purpose of this notice is to solicit 
comments from the public (as well as 
affected agencies) concerning our 
information collection. These comments 
will help us: 

(1) Evaluate whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of our 
estimate of the burden of the collection 
of information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, through use, as 
appropriate, of automated, electronic, 
mechanical, and other collection 
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technologies; e.g., permitting electronic 
submission of responses. 

Estimate of burden: The public 
burden for this collection of information 
is estimated to average 1.098 hours per 
response. 

Respondents: Owners and facility 
operators, accredited veterinarians, 
exporters, and owners or masters of 
vessel. 

Estimated annual number of 
respondents: 4,072. 

Estimated annual number of 
responses per respondent: 95. 

Estimated annual number of 
responses: 386,191. 

Estimated total annual burden on 
respondents: 424,316 hours. (Due to 
averaging, the total annual burden hours 
may not equal the product of the annual 
number of responses multiplied by the 
reporting burden per response.) 

All responses to this notice will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for OMB approval. All comments will 
also become a matter of public record. 

Done in Washington, DC, this 8th day of 
June 2020. 
Michael Watson, 
Acting Administrator, Animal and Plant 
Health Inspection Service. 
[FR Doc. 2020–12736 Filed 6–11–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–34–P 

ARCHITECTURAL AND 
TRANSPORTATION BARRIERS 
COMPLIANCE BOARD 

Performance Review Board 
Membership 

AGENCY: Architectural and 
Transportation Barriers Compliance 
Board. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Notice is given of the 
appointment of members to a 
performance review board for the 
Architectural and Transportation 
Barriers Compliance Board (Access 
Board). 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
David M. Capozzi, Executive Director, 
Access Board, 1331 F Street NW, Suite 
1000, Washington, DC 20004–1111. 
Telephone (202) 272–0010. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
4314 (c) of Title 5, U.S.C., requires each 
agency to establish, in accordance with 
regulations, one or more Senior 
Executive Service (SES) performance 
review boards. The function of the 
boards is to review and evaluate the 
initial appraisal of senior executives’ 
performance and make 
recommendations to the appointing 

authority relative to the performance of 
these executives. Because of its small 
size, the Access Board has appointed 
SES career members from other federal 
agencies to serve on its performance 
review board. The members of the 
performance review board for the 
Access Board are: 

• Craig Luigart, Chief Information 
Officer, Veterans Health Administration, 
Department of Veterans Affairs; 

• Rebecca Bond, Chief, Disability 
Rights Section, Department of Justice; 

• David Insinga, Chief, Space and 
Facilities Division, Administrative 
Office of the United States Courts 

David M. Capozzi, 
Executive Director. 
[FR Doc. 2020–12702 Filed 6–11–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8150–01–P 

CIVIL RIGHTS COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Meeting Notice 

AGENCY: United States Commission on 
Civil Rights. 
ACTION: Notice of Commission public 
business meeting. 

DATES: Friday June 19, 2020, 10:00 a.m. 
ET. 
ADDRESSES: Meeting to take place by 
telephone and open to the public by 
telephone: 800–289–0527, Conference 
ID 709–2711. Computer assisted real- 
time transcription (CART) will be 
provided. The web link to access CART 
(in English) on Friday, June 19, 2020, is 
https://www.streamtext.net/ 
player?event=USCCR. Please note that 
CART is text-only translation that 
occurs in real time during the meeting 
and is not an exact transcript. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Zakee Martin: 202–376–7700; 
publicaffairs@usccr.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Meeting Agenda 

I. Approval of Agenda 
II. Business Meeting 

A. Discussion and vote on the 
Commission’s report, Subminimum 
Wages: Impacts on the Civil Rights 
of People with Disabilities 

B. Discussion and vote on 
Commission Advisory Committees 

• Minnesota Advisory Committee 
• Vermont Advisory Committee 
C. Discussion and vote on 

Administrative Instruction 5–7, 
Advisory Committee Meetings and 
Reports 

D. Discussion and vote on timelines 
for Commission short-term projects 
on civil rights impacts of the 

COVID–19 pandemic 
E. Discussion and vote on 

Administrative Instruction 5–9, 
Advisory Committee Appointments 

F. Update from Staff Director on 
virtual briefing 

G. Management and Operations 
• Staff Director’s Report 

III. Adjourn Meeting 
Dated: June 9, 2020. 

David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2020–12779 Filed 6–10–20; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[S–98–2020] 

Foreign-Trade Zone 98—Birmingham, 
Alabama; Application for Subzone; 
Signature Express Transport, LLC, 
Fairfield, Alabama 

An application has been submitted to 
the Foreign-Trade Zones Board (the 
Board) by the City of Birmingham, 
Alabama, grantee of FTZ 98, requesting 
subzone status for the facility of 
Signature Express Transport, LLC, 
located in Fairfield, Alabama. The 
application was submitted pursuant to 
the provisions of the Foreign-Trade 
Zones Act, as amended (19 U.S.C. 81a– 
81u), and the regulations of the Board 
(15 CFR part 400). It was formally 
docketed on June 8, 2020. 

The proposed subzone (1.43 acres) is 
located at 3601 Lloyd Nolan Parkway, 
Fairfield, Alabama. No authorization for 
production activity has been requested 
at this time. The proposed subzone 
would be subject to the existing 
activation limit of FTZ 98. 

In accordance with the Board’s 
regulations, Christopher Kemp of the 
FTZ Staff is designated examiner to 
review the application and make 
recommendations to the Executive 
Secretary. 

Public comment is invited from 
interested parties. Submissions shall be 
addressed to the Board’s Executive 
Secretary and sent to: ftz@trade.gov. The 
closing period for their receipt is July 
22, 2020. Rebuttal comments in 
response to material submitted during 
the foregoing period may be submitted 
during the subsequent 15-day period to 
August 6, 2020. 

A copy of the application will be 
available for public inspection in the 
‘‘Reading Room’’ section of the Board’s 
website, which is accessible via 
www.trade.gov/ftz. 

For further information, contact 
Christopher Kemp at 
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