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process is conducted in accordance with 
5 CFR 1320.10. 

If you have comments especially on 
the estimated public burden or 
associated response time, suggestions, 
or need a copy of the proposed 
information collection instrument with 
instructions or additional information, 
please contact LaTonya Gamble, DOJ, 
Justice Management Division, 145 N 
Street NE., Washington DC, 20530. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
concerning the proposed collection of 
information are encouraged. Your 
comments should address one or more 
of the following four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agencies 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
New collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Employment Reference Questionnaire. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department of Justice sponsoring the 
collection: Form Number: None. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Business or other for- 
profit. Other: None. The form will be 
used as a part of DOJ’s employment 
selection process. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: It is estimated that 10,000 
respondents will complete a 20 minute 
form. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are an estimated 3,333 
annual total burden hours associated 
with this collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Jerri Murray, Department 
Clearance Officer, Policy and Planning 
Staff, Justice Management Division, 
Department of Justice, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE., Suite 2E.808, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Jerri Murray, 
Department Clearance Officer, Department of 
Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2012–10381 Filed 4–30–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–CG–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Consent Decree 
Under the Clean Water Act 

Notice is hereby given that on April 
19, 2012, a proposed Consent Decree in 
United States and the State of Kansas v. 
E.I. du Pont de Nemours and Co., 6:12– 
cv–01146–EFM–KMH, was lodged with 
the United States Court for the District 
of Kansas. The Joint Complaint filed by 
the United States and State of Kansas 
alleges claims for natural resource 
damages under the Clean Water Act and 
Kansas state law. The proposed Consent 
Decree settles these claims in exchange 
for a payment by Defendant of $252,739 
in natural resource damages and 
reimbursement of natural resource 
damage assessment costs. 

The Department of Justice will receive 
for a period of thirty (30) days from the 
date of this publication comments 
relating to the Consent Decree. 
Comments should be addressed to the 
Assistant Attorney General, 
Environment and Natural Resources 
Division, and either emailed to 
pubcomment-ees.enrd@usdoj.gov or 
mailed to P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611, and should refer to United 
States and the State of Kansas v. E.I. du 
Pont de Nemours and Co., 90–11–2– 
1081/6. 

During the public comment period, 
the Second Consent Decree may also be 
examined on the following Department 
of Justice Web site, to http:// 
www.usdoj.gov/enrd/ 
Consent_Decrees.html. A copy of the 
Consent Decree may also be obtained by 
mail from the Consent Decree Library, 
P.O. Box 7611, U.S. Department of 
Justice, Washington, DC 20044–7611 or 
by faxing or emailing a request to 
‘‘Consent Decree Copy’’ 
(EESCDCopy.ENRD@usdoj.gov), fax No. 
(202) 514–0097, phone confirmation 
number (202) 514–5271. If requesting a 
copy from the Consent Decree Library 
by mail, please enclose a check in the 
amount of $6 (25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the U.S. 

Treasury or, if requesting by email or 
fax, forward a check in that amount to 
the Consent Decree Library at the 
address given above. 

Robert E. Maher, Jr., 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2012–10390 Filed 4–30–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed 
Consent Decree Under the Clean Air 
Act 

Notice is hereby given that on April 
25, 2012, a proposed Consent Decree in 
United States of America and State of 
New Jersey v. Hess Corporation, Civil 
Action No. 2:12cv2335 was lodged with 
the United States District Court for the 
District of New Jersey. 

The Consent Decree in this Clean Air 
Act enforcement action against Hess 
Corporation resolves allegations by the 
Environmental Protection Agency, 
asserted in a complaint filed together 
with the Consent Decree, under section 
113(b) of the Clean Air Act, 42 U.S.C. 
7413(b), for alleged environmental 
violations at Hess Corporation’s 
petroleum refinery in Port Reading, New 
Jersey. 

This is one of numerous national 
settlements reached as part of the EPA’s 
Clean Air Act Petroleum Refinery 
Initiative. Consistent with the objectives 
of EPA’s national initiative, in addition 
to the payment of $850,000 in civil 
penalties, the settlement requires Hess 
Corporation to perform injunctive relief 
to reduce emission of nitrogen oxides 
and volatile organic compounds. 

The Department of Justice will receive 
for a period of thirty (30) days from the 
date of this publication comments 
relating to the Consent Decree. 
Comments should be addressed to the 
Assistant Attorney General, 
Environment and Natural Resources 
Division, and either emailed to 
pubcomment-ees.enrd@usdoj.gov or 
mailed to P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611, and should refer to Hess 
Corporation, D.J. Ref. 90–5–2–1–08229. 

During the public comment period, 
the Consent Decree may also be 
examined on the following Department 
of Justice Web site, to http:// 
www.usdoj.gov/enrd/ 
Consent_Decrees.html. A copy of the 
Consent Decree may also be obtained by 
mail from the Consent Decree Library, 
P.O. Box 7611, U.S. Department of 
Justice, Washington, DC 20044–7611 or 
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