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Officer, (202) 418–1096 (voice) or 
jeffery.goldthorp@fcc.gov (email); or 
Lauren Kravetz, Deputy Designated 
Federal Officer, (202) 418–7944 (voice) 
or lauren.kravetz@fcc.gov (email). 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
meeting will be held on September 12, 
2013, from 1:00 p.m. to 5:00 p.m. in the 
Commission Meeting Room of the 
Federal Communications Commission, 
Room TW–C305, 445 12th Street SW., 
Washington, DC 20554. The CSRIC is a 
Federal Advisory Committee that will 
provide recommendations to the FCC 
regarding best practices and actions the 
FCC can take to ensure the security, 
reliability, and interoperability of 
communications systems. On March 19, 
2013, the FCC, pursuant to the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, renewed the 
charter for the CSRIC for a period of two 
years through March 18, 2015. The 
meeting on September 12, 2013, will be 
the first meeting of the CSRIC under the 
current charter. The FCC will attempt to 
accommodate as many attendees as 
possible; however, admittance will be 
limited to seating availability. The 
Commission will provide audio and/or 
video coverage of the meeting over the 
Internet from the FCC’s Web page at 
http://www.fcc.gov/live. The public may 
submit written comments before the 
meeting to Jeffery Goldthorp, CSRIC 
Designated Federal Officer, by email to 
jeffery.goldthorp@fcc.gov or U.S. Postal 
Service Mail to Jeffery Goldthorp, 
Associate Bureau Chief, Public Safety 
and Homeland Security Bureau, Federal 
Communications Commission, 445 12th 
Street SW., Room 7–A325, Washington, 
DC 20554. 

Open captioning will be provided for 
this event. Other reasonable 
accommodations for people with 
disabilities are available upon request. 
Requests for such accommodations 
should be submitted via email to 
fcc504@fcc.gov or by calling the 
Consumer & Governmental Affairs 
Bureau at (202) 418–0530 (voice), (202) 
418–0432 (tty). Such requests should 
include a detailed description of the 
accommodation needed. In addition, 
please include a way the FCC can 
contact you if it needs more 
information. Please allow at least five 
days’ advance notice; last-minute 
requests will be accepted, but may be 
impossible to fill. 

Federal Communications Commission. 

Marlene H. Dortch, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–18519 Filed 7–31–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisitions of Shares of a Bank or 
Bank Holding Company 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 
§ 225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire shares of a bank 
or bank holding company. The factors 
that are considered in acting on the 
notices are set forth in paragraph 7 of 
the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The notices are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank indicated. The notices 
also will be available for inspection at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
Interested persons may express their 
views in writing to the Reserve Bank 
indicated for that notice or to the offices 
of the Board of Governors. Comments 
must be received not later than August 
16, 2013. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Dallas (E. 
Ann Worthy, Vice President), 2200 
North Pearl Street, Dallas, Texas 75201– 
2272: 

1. George W. Cummings, III and 
Nanette Weaver Cummings, both of 
Monroe, Louisiana, to acquire voting 
shares of Progressive Bancorp, Inc., and 
thereby indirectly acquire voting shares 
of Progressive Bank, both in Monroe, 
Louisiana. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, July 29, 2013. 
Margaret McCloskey Shanks, 
Deputy Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2013–18504 Filed 7–31–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The applications will also be 

available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than August 26, 
2013. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Dallas (E. 
Ann Worthy, Vice President) 2200 
North Pearl Street, Dallas, Texas 75201– 
2272: 

1. A.N.B. Holding Company, Ltd., 
Terrell, Texas; to acquire no more than 
38 percent of the voting shares of The 
ANB Corporation, and thereby 
indirectly acquire voting shares of The 
American National Bank of Texas, both 
in Terrell, Texas; Lakeside Bancshares, 
Inc.; and Lakeside National Bank, both 
in Rockwall, Texas. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, July 29, 2013. 
Margaret McCloskey Shanks, 
Deputy Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2013–18505 Filed 7–31–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

FEDERAL TRADE COMMISSION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request 

AGENCY: Federal Trade Commission 
(FTC or Commission). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The FTC intends to ask the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) to extend through November 30, 
2016, the current Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) clearance for the FTC’s 
shared enforcement with the Consumer 
Financial Protection Bureau (CFPB) of 
the information collection requirements 
in Regulation N (Mortgage Acts and 
Practices—Advertising). That clearance 
expires on November 30, 2013. The 
FTC’s current PRA clearance (OMB 
Control Number 3084–0156) for 
Regulation N is under the FTC’s 
Mortgage Acts and Practices— 
Advertising Rule, which was 
republished by the CFPB as Regulation 
N on December 16, 2011, and became 
effective December 30, 2011. The 
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