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Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name and 
docket number for this notice. All 
comments received may be posted 
without change, including any personal 
identifiers, contact information, or other 
personal information provided, to: 
http://www.regulations.gov. Do not 
submit confidential business 
information, trade secret information, or 
other sensitive or protected information 
that you do not want to be available to 
the public. If furnished at all, such 
information should be submitted in 
writing. 

Docket: For access to the docket to 
read background documents or 
comments received, go to: http://
www.regulations.gov, and insert the 
docket number CPSC–2012–0026, into 
the ‘‘Search’’ box, and follow the 
prompts. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Bretford J. Griffin, Consumer Product 
Safety Commission, 4330 East-West 
Highway, Bethesda, MD 20814; (301) 
504–7037, or by email to: bgriffin@
cpsc.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: CPSC 
seeks to renew the following currently 
approved collection of information: 

Title: Requirements Pertaining to 
Third Party Conformity Assessment 
Bodies. 

OMB Number: 3041–0156. 
Type of Review: Renewal of 

collection. 
Frequency of Response: On occasion. 
Affected Public: Third party 

conformity assessment bodies seeking 
acceptance of accreditation or 
continuing accreditation. 

Estimated Burden 

• New Applications From Third Party 
Conformity Assessment Bodies 

Æ We estimate approximately 40 new 
applications from independent third 
party conformity assessment bodies will 
be submitted per year, taking an 
estimated 75 minutes to complete the 
initial application materials, with an 
estimated burden of 50 hours per year. 

Æ We estimate approximately 3 
firewalled third party conformity 
assessment bodies will apply per year, 
taking an estimated 8.4 hours to 
complete the initial application 
materials, with an estimated burden of 
25.2 hours per year. 

Æ We estimate approximately 4 
governmental third party conformity 
assessment bodies will apply per year, 
taking an estimated 3 hours to complete 
the initial application materials, with an 
estimated burden of 12 hours per year. 

• Third Party Conformity Assessment 
Bodies Updating Information 

Æ We estimate that approximately 5 
third party conformity assessment 
bodies will take 15 minutes to update 
information for only those elements of 
information that need updating, with an 
estimated burden of 1.35 hours per year. 

• Third Party Conformity Assessment 
Bodies That Subcontracts Out Tests 

Æ We estimate that approximately 27 
third party conformity assessment 
bodies will take 7 minutes to comply 
with the subcontracting recordkeeping 
requirement for an estimated 68,769 
subcontract test, with an estimated of 
approximately 8,023 hours per year. 

• Third Party Conformity Assessment 
Bodies That Voluntarily Withdraw 

Æ We estimate approximately 8 third 
party conformity assessment bodies will 
withdraw yearly, taking an estimated 30 
minutes to create and submit the 
required documentation, with an 
estimated burden of 4 hours per year. 

• Third Party Conformity Assessment 
Bodies That Are Audited 

Æ We estimate that approximately 228 
independent third party conformity 
assessment bodies each year will be 
audited, taking approximately 4 minutes 
to resubmit their Form 223 and 
accreditation certificate, with an 
estimated burden of 15.2 hours per year. 

Æ We estimate that approximately 18 
firewalled third party conformity 
assessment bodies will spend 226 
minutes collecting and preparing the 
documentation to submit for an audit, 
with estimated burden of about 68 hours 
per year. 

Æ We estimate approximately 25 
governmental third party conformity 
assessment bodies will spend 1 hour 
collecting and preparing the 
documentation to submit for an audit, 
with estimated burden of 25 hours per 
year. 

• Total Annual Burden 
Adding all of the annual estimated 

burden hours results in a total of 8,224 
hours for third party conformity 
assessment bodies per year. At $38.78 
per hour, the total cost of the 
recordkeeping associated with the 
Requirements Pertaining to Third Party 
Conformity Assessment Bodies is 
approximately $318,927 (8,224 hours × 
$38.78 = $318,927). 

General Description of Collection: On 
March 12, 2013, the Commission issued 
a rule Pertaining to Third Party 
Conformity Assessment Bodies (78 FR 
15836). The rule established the general 
requirements concerning third party 

conformity assessment bodies, such as 
the requirements and procedures for 
CPSC acceptance of the accreditation of 
a third party conformity assessment 
body, and prescribed adverse actions 
that may be imposed against CPSC- 
accepted third party conformity 
assessment bodies. The rule also 
amended the audit requirements for 
third party conformity assessment 
bodies and amended the CPSC’s 
regulation on inspections. 

Request for Comments 

The CPSC solicits written comments 
from all interested persons about the 
proposed collection of information. The 
CPSC specifically solicits information 
relevant to the following topics: 
—Whether the collection of information 

described above is necessary for the 
proper performance of the CPSC’s 
functions, including whether the 
information would have practical 
utility; 

—Whether the estimated burden of the 
proposed collection of information is 
accurate; 

—Whether the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected could be enhanced; and 

—Whether the burden imposed by the 
collection of information could be 
minimized by use of automated, 
electronic or other technological 
collection techniques, or other forms 
of information technology. 

Alberta E. Mills, 
Secretary, Consumer Product Safety 
Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2019–05368 Filed 3–20–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6355–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Air Force 

[Docket ID: USAF–2019–HQ–0003] 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: Department of the Air Force, 
DoD. 
ACTION: Information collection notice. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Department of the Air Force announces 
a proposed public information 
collection and seeks public comment on 
the provisions thereof. Comments are 
invited on: Whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; the accuracy of the 
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agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed information collection; ways 
to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and ways to minimize the 
burden of the information collection on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
comments received by May 20, 2019. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by docket number and title, 
by any of the following methods: 

Federal eRulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Mail: Department of Defense, Office of 
the Chief Management Officer, 
Directorate for Oversight and 
Compliance, 4800 Mark Center Drive, 
Mailbox #24, Suite 08D09, Alexandria, 
VA 22350–1700. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name, docket 
number and title for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing on the internet at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
request more information on this 
proposed information collection or to 
obtain a copy of the proposal and 
associated collection instruments, 
please write to Office of the CIO, 
Headquarters Air Force Safety Center, 
ATTN: Mr. Douglas MacCurdy, 9700 G. 
Ave., Kirtland AFB, NM 87117, at 505– 
846–0675. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title; Associated Form; and OMB 
Number: Air Force Safety Automated 
System; AF978; OMB Control Number 
0701–XXXX. 

Needs and Uses: The Air Force Safety 
Automated System (AFSAS) and the 
AF978 are used to collect incident and 
witness information with regard to 
accidents involving Air Force personnel 
or property. The Air Force will use the 
collected information to conduct 
investigations and evaluate mishap 
events to prevent such incidents from 
recurring. The information collection is 
necessary to obtain and record name, 
email, and phone number of individuals 
who witness a mishap related to Air 
Force personnel or property and who 
volunteer to provide information about 
the incident. Respondents will include 
both DoD contractors and any non- 

government civilians who may witness 
an incident on an Air Force installation. 

Affected Public: Individuals and 
households. 

Annual Burden Hours: 1,202. 
Number of Respondents: 2,403. 
Responses per Respondent: 1. 
Annual Responses: 2,403. 
Average Burden per Response: 30 

minutes. 
Frequency: On occasion. 
Dated: March 15, 2019. 

Aaron T. Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2019–05310 Filed 3–20–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Army 

[Docket ID: USA–2019–HQ–0007] 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: Department of the Army, DoD. 
ACTION: Information collection notice. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Department of the Army, Army & Air 
Force Exchange Service (Exchange), 
announces a proposed public 
information collection and seeks public 
comment on the provisions thereof. 
Comments are invited on: Whether the 
proposed collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the agency, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed information collection; ways 
to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and ways to minimize the 
burden of the information collection on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
comments received by May 20, 2019. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by docket number and title, 
by any of the following methods: 

Federal eRulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Mail: Department of Defense, Office of 
the Chief Management Officer, 
Directorate for Oversight and 
Compliance, 4800 Mark Center Drive, 
Mailbox #24, Suite 08D09, Alexandria, 
VA 22350–1700. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name, docket 

number and title for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing on the internet at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
request more information on this 
proposed information collection or to 
obtain a copy of the proposal and 
associated collection instruments, 
please write to the Army & Air Force 
Exchange Service, Office of the General 
Counsel, Compliance Division, ATTN: 
Teresa Schreurs, 3911 South Walton 
Walker Blvd., Dallas, TX 75236–1598 or 
call the Exchange Compliance Division 
at 800–967–6067. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title; Associated Form; and OMB 
Number: Exchange Security Clearance 
Process for Contractors/Vendor 
Personnel; Exchange Form 3900–013 
‘‘Electronic Questionnaires for 
Investigations Processing (e-QIP) 
request’’, Exchange Form 3900–002 
‘‘Trusted Associate Sponsorship System 
(TASS Request Form)’’, Exchange Form 
3900–006 ‘‘Background Check for 
Vendors/Contractors’’; OMB Control 
Number 0702–0135. 

Needs and Uses: The information 
collection requirement is necessary for 
the processing of all Army and Air 
Force Exchange Service security 
clearance actions, to record security 
clearances issued or denied, and to 
verify eligibility for access to classified 
information or assignments to sensitive 
positions. 

Affected Public: Individuals and/or 
Households; Business or other for-profit. 

Annual Burden Hours: 1,450. 
Number of Respondents: 2,900. 
Responses per Respondent: 1. 
Annual Responses: 2,900. 
Average Burden per Response: 30 

minutes. 
Frequency: On occasion. 
Respondents are individuals and/or 

households affiliated with Army and 
Air Force Exchange Service (Exchange) 
by assignment, employment contractual 
relationship, or as a result of an inter- 
service support agreement on which 
personnel security clearance 
determination has been completed or is 
pending. Information collected is 
utilized to process the personnel 
security clearance of contractors and/or 
vendors to work at an Exchange facility, 
record the security clearances issued or 
denied, and to verify the eligibility for 
access to classified information or 
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