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Budget (OMB) to issue its Final 
Sequestration Report 15 calendar days 
after the end of a congressional session. 
With regard to this final report and to 
each of the three required sequestration 
reports, section 254(b) specifically states 
the following: 

Submission and Availability of 
Reports.—Each report required by this 
section shall be submitted, in the case 
of CBO, to the House of Representatives, 
the Senate and OMB and, in the case of 
OMB, to the House of Representatives, 
the Senate, and the President on the day 
it is issued. On the following day, a 
notice of the report shall be printed in 
the Federal Register. 

However, a provision in the 2018 
Continuing Resolution delayed the 
release of this report until 15 days after 
the 2018 Continuing Resolution expired 
on March 23, 2018. 
ADDRESSES: The OMB Sequestration 
Reports to the President and Congress is 
available on-line on the OMB home 
page at: https://www.whitehouse.gov/ 
omb/legislative/sequestration-reports- 
orders/. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Thomas Tobasko, 6202 New Executive 
Office Building, Washington, DC 20503, 
Email address: ttobasko@omb.eop.gov, 
telephone number: (202) 395–5745, fax 
number: (202) 395–4768. Because of 
delays in the receipt of regular mail 
related to security screening, 
respondents are encouraged to use 
electronic communications. 

John Mulvaney, 
Director. 
[FR Doc. 2018–07653 Filed 4–12–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3110–01–P 

NATIONAL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS 
ADMINISTRATION 

[NARA–2018–031] 

Records Schedules; Availability and 
Request for Comments 

AGENCY: National Archives and Records 
Administration (NARA). 
ACTION: Notice of availability of 
proposed records schedules; request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The National Archives and 
Records Administration (NARA) 
publishes notice at least once monthly 
of certain Federal agency requests for 
records disposition authority (records 
schedules). Once approved by NARA, 
records schedules provide mandatory 
instructions on what happens to records 
when agencies no longer need them for 
current Government business. The 

records schedules authorize agencies to 
preserve records of continuing value in 
the National Archives of the United 
States and to destroy, after a specified 
period, records lacking administrative, 
legal, research, or other value. NARA 
publishes notice in the Federal Register 
for records schedules in which agencies 
propose to destroy records they no 
longer need to conduct agency business. 
NARA invites public comments on such 
records schedules. 
DATES: NARA must receive requests for 
copies in writing by May 14, 2018. Once 
NARA finishes appraising the records, 
we will send you a copy of the schedule 
you requested. We usually prepare 
appraisal memoranda that contain 
additional information concerning the 
records covered by a proposed schedule. 
You may also request these. If you do, 
we will also provide them once we have 
completed the appraisal. You have 30 
days after we send to you these 
requested documents in which to 
submit comments. 
ADDRESSES: You may request a copy of 
any records schedule identified in this 
notice by contacting Records Appraisal 
and Agency Assistance (ACRA) using 
one of the following means: 

Mail: NARA (ACRA); 8601 Adelphi 
Road, College Park, MD 20740–6001. 

Email: request.schedule@nara.gov. 
FAX: 301–837–3698. 
You must cite the control number, 

which appears in parentheses after the 
name of the agency that submitted the 
schedule, and a mailing address. If you 
would like an appraisal report, please 
include that in your request. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Margaret Hawkins, Director, by mail at 
Records Appraisal and Agency 
Assistance (ACRA), National Archives 
and Records Administration, 8601 
Adelphi Road, College Park, MD 20740– 
6001, by phone at 301–837–1799, or by 
email at request.schedule@nara.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: NARA 
publishes notice in the Federal Register 
for records schedules they no longer 
need to conduct agency business. NARA 
invites public comments on such 
records schedules, as required by 44 
U.S.C. 3303a(a). 

Each year, Federal agencies create 
billions of records on paper, film, 
magnetic tape, and other media. To 
control this accumulation, agency 
records managers prepare schedules 
proposing records retention periods and 
submit these schedules for NARA’s 
approval. These schedules provide for 
timely transfer into the National 
Archives of historically valuable records 
and authorize the agency to dispose of 
all other records after the agency no 

longer needs them to conduct its 
business. Some schedules are 
comprehensive and cover all the records 
of an agency or one of its major 
subdivisions. Most schedules, however, 
cover records of only one office or 
program or a few series of records. Many 
of these update previously approved 
schedules, and some include records 
proposed as permanent. 

The schedules listed in this notice are 
media neutral unless otherwise 
specified. An item in a schedule is 
media neutral when an agency may 
apply the disposition instructions to 
records regardless of the medium in 
which it creates or maintains the 
records. Items included in schedules 
submitted to NARA on or after 
December 17, 2007, are media neutral 
unless the item is expressly limited to 
a specific medium. (See 36 CFR 
1225.12(e).) 

Agencies may not destroy Federal 
records without Archivist of the United 
States’ approval. The Archivist approves 
destruction only after thoroughly 
considering the records’ administrative 
use by the agency of origin, the rights 
of the Government and of private people 
directly affected by the Government’s 
activities, and whether or not the 
records have historical or other value. 

In addition to identifying the Federal 
agencies and any subdivisions 
requesting disposition authority, this 
notice lists the organizational unit(s) 
accumulating the records (or notes that 
the schedule has agency-wide 
applicability when schedules cover 
records that may be accumulated 
throughout an agency); provides the 
control number assigned to each 
schedule, the total number of schedule 
items, and the number of temporary 
items (the records proposed for 
destruction); and includes a brief 
description of the temporary records. 
The records schedule itself contains a 
full description of the records at the file 
unit level as well as their disposition. If 
NARA staff has prepared an appraisal 
memorandum for the schedule, it also 
includes information about the records. 
You may request additional information 
about the disposition process at the 
addresses above. 

Schedules Pending 
1. Department of Agriculture, Foreign 

Agricultural Service (DAA–0166–2018– 
0003, 2 items, 2 temporary items). 
Federal Register records. Included are 
correspondence, reports, notices, 
proposed rules, final rules, and 
announcements. 

2. Department of Agriculture, Foreign 
Agricultural Service (DAA–0166–2018– 
0029, 2 items, 2 temporary items). 
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Personnel records of non-Federal 
cooperators and consultants subsidized 
by market development funds. 

3. Department of Defense, Defense 
Logistics Agency (DAA–0361–2018– 
0001, 2 items, 1 temporary item). 
Records related to general orders 
including background material and 
related correspondence. Proposed for 
permanent retention are the official 
record copies. 

4. Department of Defense, Defense 
Security Service (DAA–0446–2016– 
0004, 11 items, 11 temporary items). 
Records relating to the handling of 
information in the context of foreign 
relations including embassy liaison 
visits, hand carriage requests, trip 
reports, briefing materials, and related 
information. 

5. Department of Justice, Federal 
Bureau of Investigation (DAA–0065– 
2018–0002, 2 items, 1 temporary item). 
Headquarters investigatory case files for 
crimes involving violations of the 
Organized Crime Control Act of 1970, 
maintained in a Racketeer Influenced 
and Corrupt Organizations (RICO) case. 
Proposed for permanent retention are 
those case files with more than one 
section, 30 or more serialized 
documents, or corresponding to field 
office case files retained as permanent. 

6. Department of the Navy, Agency- 
wide (DAA–NU–2015–0003, 60 items, 
36 temporary items). Records relating to 
operations and readiness, including 
flight safety, data dissemination, climate 
observations, diving safety, and 
associated matters. Proposed for 
permanent retention are records on 
policy, fleet command files, strategy, 
planning and tactical doctrine, 
operating plans, unit histories, counter- 
intelligence investigations, intelligence 
programs, status of forces and readiness, 
and emergency planning. 

7. Department of Veterans Affairs, 
Veterans Health Administration (DAA– 
0015–2016–0003, 14 items, 7 temporary 
items). Records related to public affairs 
including Congressional testimony, 
speeches and publications, news 
releases and summaries, and 
audiovisual records of public activities. 
Proposed for permanent retention are 
speeches and publications of national 
and regional high-level officials, and 
audiovisual records of national and 
regional significant events or programs. 

8. Consumer Financial Protection 
Bureau, Agency-wide (DAA–0587– 
2018–0002, 1 item, 1 temporary item). 
Director’s suggestion box records. 

9. Consumer Financial Protection 
Bureau, Office of Administrative 
Adjudication (DAA–0587–2017–0002, 5 
items, 2 temporary items). Working files 
of the Administrative Law Judge and 

administrative correspondence files. 
Proposed for permanent retention are 
the docket files and associated tracker, 
consent orders, and stipulations. 

10. Federal Retirement Thrift 
Investment Board, Office of Investments 
(DAA–0474–2017–0005, 5 items, 5 
temporary items). Records relating to 
the administration, management, and 
maintenance of the defined contribution 
plan for Federal employees. 

11. United States International Trade 
Commission, Office of the General 
Counsel (DAA–0081–2018–0001, 1 item, 
1 temporary item). Review and 
authorization records for statutory gift 
acceptance for the commissioners. 

Laurence Brewer, 
Chief Records Officer for the U.S. 
Government. 
[FR Doc. 2018–07691 Filed 4–12–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7515–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards (ACRS): Meeting of the 
ACRS Subcommittee on NuScale; 
Notice of Meeting 

The ACRS Subcommittee on NuScale 
will hold a meeting on April 16, 2018, 
at 11545 Rockville Pike, Room T–2B1, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

The meeting will be open to public 
attendance The meetings will be open to 
public attendance with the exception of 
portions that may be closed to protect 
information that is proprietary pursuant 
to 5 U.S.C. 552b(c)(4). The agenda for 
the subject meeting shall be as follows: 

Monday, April 16, 2018—1:00 p.m. 
Until 5:00 p.m. 

The Subcommittee will discuss the 
AREVA Topical Report ANP–10337, 
‘‘PWR Fuel Assembly Structural 
Response to Externally Applied 
Dynamic Excitations.’’ The 
Subcommittee will hear presentations 
by and hold discussions with the NRC 
staff, Framatome staff and other 
interested persons regarding this matter. 
The Subcommittee will gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the Full Committee. 

Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official (DFO), Michael 
Snodderly (Telephone 301–415–2241 or 
Email: Michael.Snodderly@nrc.gov) five 
days prior to the meeting, if possible, so 
that appropriate arrangements can be 

made. Thirty-five hard copies of each 
presentation or handout should be 
provided to the DFO thirty minutes 
before the meeting. In addition, one 
electronic copy of each presentation 
should be emailed to the DFO one day 
before the meeting. If an electronic copy 
cannot be provided within this 
timeframe, presenters should provide 
the DFO with a CD containing each 
presentation at least thirty minutes 
before the meeting. Electronic 
recordings will be permitted only 
during those portions of the meeting 
that are open to the public. Detailed 
procedures for the conduct of and 
participation in ACRS meetings were 
published in the Federal Register on 
October 4, 2017 (82 FR 46312). 

Detailed meeting agendas and meeting 
transcripts are available on the NRC 
website at http://www.nrc.gov/reading- 
rm/doc-collections/acrs. Information 
regarding topics to be discussed, 
changes to the agenda, whether the 
meeting has been canceled or 
rescheduled, and the time allotted to 
present oral statements can be obtained 
from the website cited above or by 
contacting the identified DFO. 
Moreover, in view of the possibility that 
the schedule for ACRS meetings may be 
adjusted by the Chairman as necessary 
to facilitate the conduct of the meeting, 
persons planning to attend should check 
with these references if such 
rescheduling would result in a major 
inconvenience. 

If attending this meeting, please enter 
through the One White Flint North 
building, 11555 Rockville Pike, 
Rockville, Maryland. After registering 
with Security, please contact Mr. 
Theron Brown (Telephone 301–415– 
6702 or 301–415–8066) to be escorted to 
the meeting room. 

Dated: April 9, 2018. 
Mark L. Banks, 
Chief, Technical Support Branch, Advisory 
Committee on Reactor Safeguards. 
[FR Doc. 2018–07689 Filed 4–12–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards; Notice of Meeting 

In accordance with the purposes of 
Sections 29 and 182b of the Atomic 
Energy Act (42 U.S.C. 2039, 2232b), the 
Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards (ACRS) will hold meetings 
on May 3–5, 2018, 11545 Rockville Pike, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 
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