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§ 1318.07 Non-liability of Drug 
Enforcement Administration. 

The Administration shall have no 
liability with respect to the performance 
of any contractual terms agreed to by a 
grower and buyer of bulk cannabis, 
including but not limited to the quality 
of any cannabis delivered to a buyer. In 
the event that a buyer deems the 
delivered cannabis to be defective, the 
buyer’s sole remedy for damages shall 
be against the grower and not the 
Administration. 

Dated: March 16, 2020. 
Uttam Dhillon, 
Acting Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2020–05796 Filed 3–20–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–09–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Army, Corps of 
Engineers 

33 CFR Part 209 

[COE–2016–0016] 

RIN 0710–AA72 

Use of U.S. Army Corps of Engineers 
Reservoir Projects for Domestic, 
Municipal & Industrial Water Supply; 
Withdrawal 

AGENCY: Army Corps of Engineers, DoD. 
ACTION: Proposed rule; withdrawal. 

SUMMARY: As a result of a policy 
determination by the Assistant Secretary 
of the Army (Civil Works), the U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers (Corps) is 
withdrawing the proposed rule titled 
‘‘Use of U.S. Army Corps of Engineers 
Reservoir Projects for Domestic, 
Municipal & Industrial Water Supply,’’ 
which was published on December 16, 
2016. 
DATES: The Corps is withdrawing the 
proposed rule published December 16, 
2016 (81 FR 91556) as of March 23, 
2020. 

ADDRESSES: U.S. Army Corps of 
Engineers, 441 G Street NW, 
Washington, DC 20314. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Amy K. Frantz, Planning and Policy 
(CECW–P); telephone number: (202) 
761–0106; email address: 
WSRULE2016@usace.army.mil; or 
Daniel Inkelas, Chief Counsel’s Office 
(CECC–L); phone number (202) 761– 
0345; email address: WSRULE2016@
usace.army.mil. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: None. 

Dated: March 16, 2020. 
R.D. James, 
Assistant Secretary of the Army, (Civil Works). 
[FR Doc. 2020–05919 Filed 3–20–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3720–58–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

34 CFR Chapter III 

[Docket No. ED–2020–OPE–0044] 

Proposed Waiver and Extension of the 
Project Period for the Predominantly 
Black Institutions Competitive Grant 
Program 

AGENCY: Office of Postsecondary 
Education (OPE), Department of 
Education. 
ACTION: Proposed waiver and extension 
of project period. 

SUMMARY: The Secretary proposes to 
waive the requirements in the Education 
Department General Administrative 
Regulations that generally prohibit 
project periods exceeding five years and 
project period extensions involving the 
obligation of additional Federal funds. 
The proposed waiver and extension 
would enable 23 projects under CFDA 
number 84.382A to receive funding for 
an additional period, not to exceed 
September 30, 2021. 
DATES: We must receive your comments 
on or before April 22, 2020. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal 
or via postal mail, commercial delivery, 
or hand delivery. We will not accept 
comments submitted by fax or by email 
or those submitted after the comment 
period. To ensure that we do not receive 
duplicate copies, please submit your 
comments only once. In addition, please 
include the Docket ID at the top of your 
comments. 

If you are submitting comments 
electronically, we strongly encourage 
you to submit any comments or 
attachments in Microsoft Word format. 
If you must submit a comment in Adobe 
Portable Document Format (PDF), we 
strongly encourage you to convert the 
PDF to print-to-PDF format or to use 
some other commonly used searchable 
text format. Please do not submit the 
PDF in a scanned format. Using a print- 
to-PDF format allows the Department to 
electronically search and copy certain 
portions of your submissions. 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: Go to 
www.regulations.gov to submit your 
comments electronically. Information 
on using Regulations.gov, including 
instructions for accessing agency 
documents, submitting comments, and 

viewing the docket, is available on the 
site under ‘‘Help.’’ 

• Postal Mail, Commercial Delivery, 
or Hand Delivery: The Department 
strongly encourages commenters to 
submit their comments electronically. 
However, if you mail or deliver your 
comments about the proposed waiver 
and extension, address them to: The 
Predominantly Black Institutions 
Competitive Grant Program, CFDA 
number 84.382A, Attention: Bernadette 
Miles, U.S. Department of Education, 
400 Maryland Avenue SW, Room 250– 
22, Washington, DC 20202. 

Privacy Note: The Department’s 
policy is to make all comments received 
from members of the public available for 
public viewing in their entirety on the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal at 
www.regulations.gov. Therefore, 
commenters should be careful to 
include in their comments only 
information that they wish to make 
publicly available. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Bernadette Miles, U.S. Department of 
Education, 400 Maryland Avenue SW, 
Room 250–22, Washington, DC 20202. 
Telephone: 202–453–7892. Email: 
Bernadette.Miles@ed.gov. 

If you use a telecommunications 
device for the deaf (TDD) or a text 
telephone (TTY), call the Federal Relay 
Service (FRS), toll free, at 1–800–877– 
8339. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Invitation to Comment: We invite you 

to submit comments regarding this 
proposed waiver and extension. 

We invite you to assist us in 
complying with the specific 
requirements of Executive Orders 
12866, 13563, and 13771 and their 
overall requirement of reducing 
regulatory burden that might result from 
this proposed waiver and extension. 
Please let us know of any further ways 
we could reduce potential costs or 
increase potential benefits while 
preserving the effective and efficient 
administration of the program. 

During and after the comment period, 
you may inspect all public comments 
about this proposed waiver and 
extension of the project period in Room 
5059, 550 12th Street SW, Washington, 
DC, between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 
4:00 p.m., Eastern time, Monday 
through Friday of each week, except 
Federal holidays. 

Assistance to Individuals with 
Disabilities in Reviewing the 
Rulemaking Record: On request, we will 
provide an appropriate accommodation 
or auxiliary aid to an individual with a 
disability who needs assistance to 
review the comments or other 
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