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Total Burden Hours: 506. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2014–07959 Filed 4–8–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–05–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

April 4, 2014. 
The Department of Agriculture has 

submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments 
regarding (a) whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of burden including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on those who are to respond, including 
through the use of appropriate 
automated, electronic, mechanical, or 
other technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology should be addressed to: Desk 
Officer for Agriculture, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB), OIRA_Submission@omb.eop.gov 
or fax (202) 395–5806 and to 
Departmental Clearance Office, USDA, 
OCIO, Mail Stop 7602, Washington, DC 
20250–7602. Comments regarding these 
information collections are best assured 
of having their full effect if received 
within 30 days of this notification. 
Copies of the submission(s) may be 
obtained by calling (202) 720–8958. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Food and Nutrition Service 
Title: WIC Local Agency Directory. 
OMB Control Number: 0584–0431. 
Summary of Collection: The 

Supplemental Nutrition Program for 
Women, Infants, and Children (WIC) is 

authorized by Section 17 of the Child 
Nutrition Act (CNA) of 1966 (42 U.S.C. 
1786), as amended. The Food and 
Nutrition Service (FNS) of USDA 
administers the WIC Program by 
awarding cash grants to State agencies 
(generally State health departments). 
The State agencies award sub-grants to 
local agencies (generally local health 
departments and nonprofit 
organizations) to deliver program 
benefits and services to eligible 
participants. As part of their State Plan 
submission, State agencies identify the 
local agencies that will provide WIC 
services. Local agencies authorized to 
furnish WIC participants with 
supplemental foods, nutrition 
education, breastfeeding promotion and 
support activities and referral to related 
health services are subject to change. 
New local agencies may be selected to 
operate the WIC Program and local 
agencies already in operation may be 
disqualified for continued operation. 
FNS will collect information using form 
FNS–648 to report additions and 
deletions of local agencies operating the 
WIC Program and local agency address 
changes, when such changes occur. 

Need and Use of the Information: FNS 
will collect information to maintain a 
local agency directory that lists the 
names and addresses of all WIC local 
agencies. The FNS–648 WIC local 
agency directory serves as the primary 
source of data on the number and 
location of local agencies and is 
published annually. It is used to refer 
individuals to the nearest source of WIC 
Program services and to maintain 
continuity of program services to 
migrant and other transient participants. 
It is also used as a mailing list to 
provide local agencies with technical 
assistance manuals and other 
information. 

Description of Respondents: State, 
Local, or Tribal Government. 

Number of Respondents: 90. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting: 

On occasion. 
Total Burden Hours: 15. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2014–07961 Filed 4–8–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–30–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Farm Service Agency 

Information Collection; Transfer of 
Farm Records Between Counties 

AGENCY: Farm Service Agency, USDA. 

ACTION: Notice; request for comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Farm Service Agency (FSA) is seeking 
comments from interested individuals 
and organizations on an extension with 
a revision of a currently approved 
information collection associated with 
transferring of farm records from one 
administrative county office to another. 
DATES: We will consider comments that 
we receive by June 9, 2014. 
ADDRESSES: We invite you to submit 
comments on this Notice. In your 
comment, include volume, date and 
page number of this issue of the Federal 
Register. You may submit comments by 
any of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: Go to: 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the online 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Melonie Sullivan, 
Agricultural Program Specialist, 
Program Policy Branch, 1400 
Independence Avenue SW., STOP 0512, 
Washington, DC 20250–0512. 

You may also send comments to the 
Desk Officer for Agriculture, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget, 
Washington, DC 20503. Copies of the 
information collection may be requested 
by contacting Melonie Sullivan. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Melonie Sullivan; (202) 690–1003. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title: Transfer of Farm Records 
Between Counties. 

OMB Control Number: 0560–0253. 
Type of Request: Extension with a 

revision. 
Abstract: Farm owners or operators 

may elect to transfer farm records 
between FSA county offices when the 
principal dwelling of the farm operator 
has changed; a change has occurred in 
the operation of the land; or there has 
been a change that would cause the 
receiving administrative county office to 
be more accessible, such as the 
construction of a new highway, 
relocation of the county office building 
site, etc. The transfer of farm records is 
also required when an FSA county 
office closes. The FSA County 
Committees from both the transferring 
and receiving counties must approve or 
disapprove all proposed farm record 
transfers. In some cases, the State 
Committee and/or the National Office 
must also approve or disapprove 
proposed farm record transfers. 

The revision is due to the reduction 
in number of FSA County Offices. FSA 
currently has 2,140 county offices, 
whereas there were 2,300 county offices 
at the time of the previous request. The 
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total annual burden hours are reduced 
by 2,053 hours in the request. 

Estimated Average Time to Respond: 
Public reporting burden for collection of 
this information is estimated to average 
10 minutes per response. The average 
travel time, which is included in the 
total annual burden, is estimated to be 
1 hour per respondent. 

Type of Respondents: Owners and 
operators. 

Estimate of Burden: Average 10 
minutes per response. The average 
travel time, which is included in the 
total annual burden, is estimated to be 
1 hour per respondent. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
21,240. 

Estimated Number of Responses per 
Respondent: 1. 

Estimated Annual Number of 
Responses: 21,240. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden on 
Respondents: 24,780. 

We are requesting comments on all 
aspects of this information collection to 
help us to: 

(1) Evaluate whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of FSA, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of FSA’s 
estimate of burden including the 
validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

All responses to this notice, including 
name and addresses when provided, 
will be summarized and included in the 
request for OMB approval. All 
comments will also become a matter of 
public record. 

Signed on April 2, 2014. 
Juan M. Garcia, 
Administrator, Farm Service Agency. 
[FR Doc. 2014–07867 Filed 4–8–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–05–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

South Central Idaho Resource 
Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Forest Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: The South Central Idaho 
Resource Advisory Committee will meet 
in Jerome, Idaho. The committee is 
authorized under the Secure Rural 
Schools and Community Self- 
Determination Act (Pub. L. 110–343) 
(the Act) and operates in compliance 
with the Federal Advisory Committee 
Act. The purpose of the committee is to 
improve collaborative relationships and 
to provide advice and recommendations 
to the Forest Service concerning projects 
and funding consistent with the title II 
of the Act. The meeting is open to the 
public. The purpose of the meeting is to 
review project applications for funding. 
DATES: The meeting will be held June 
23, 2014, 9:00 a.m. 

All RAC meetings are subject to 
cancellation. For status of meeting prior 
to attendance, please contact the person 
listed under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held at 
the Idaho Department of Fish and Game, 
319 S 417 E, Jerome, Idaho 83338. 

Written comments may be submitted 
as described under Supplementary 
Information. All comments, including 
names and addresses when provided, 
are placed in the record and are 
available for public inspection and 
copying. The public may inspect 
comments received at the Sawtooth 
National Forest, 2647 Kimberly Road 
East, Twin Falls, Idaho. Please call 
ahead to facilitate entry into the 
building. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Julie 
Thomas, Designated Federal Official, 
Sawtooth National Forest by phone at 
208–737–3200 or via email at 
jathomas@fs.fed.us. 

Individuals who use 
telecommunication devices for the deaf 
(TDD) may call the Federal Information 
Relay Service (FIRS) at 1–800–877–8339 
between 8:00 a.m. and 8:00 p.m., 
Eastern Standard Time, Monday 
through Friday. Please make requests in 
advance for sign language interpreting, 
assistive listening devices or other 
reasonable accomodation for access to 
the facility or procedings by contacting 
the person listed FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Additional RAC information, including 
the meeting agenda and the meeting 
summary/minutes can be found at the 
following Web site: http://fs.usda.gov/
sawtooth. The agenda will include time 
for people to make oral statements of 
three minutes or less. Individuals 
wishing to make an oral statement 
should request in writing by June 9, 
2014 to be scheduled on the agenda. 

Anyone who would like to bring related 
matters to the attention of the committee 
may file written statements with the 
committee staff before or after the 
meeting. Written comments and 
requests for time for oral comments 
must be sent to Julie Thomas, 
Designated Federal Official, Sawtooth 
National Forest, 2647 Kimberly Road 
East, Twin Falls, Idaho, 83301; or by 
email to jathomas@fs.fed.us, or via 
facsimile to 208–737–3236. 

Dated: March 18, 2014. 
Sarah A Lau, 
Acting Forest Supervisor. 
[FR Doc. 2014–07938 Filed 4–8–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–11–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–106–2013] 

Authorization of Production Activity; 
Foreign-Trade Subzone 37D; Xylem 
Water Systems USA LLC (Centrifugal, 
Submersible Pumps and Related 
Components); Auburn, New York 

On December 2, 2013, Xylem Water 
Systems USA LLC, operator of Subzone 
37D, submitted a notification of 
proposed production activity to the 
Foreign-Trade Zones (FTZ) Board for its 
facilities in Auburn, New York. 

The notification was processed in 
accordance with the regulations of the 
FTZ Board (15 CFR part 400), including 
notice in the Federal Register inviting 
public comment (78 FR 77649, 12–24– 
2013). The FTZ Board has determined 
that no further review of the activity is 
warranted at this time. The production 
activity described in the notification is 
authorized, subject to the FTZ Act and 
the FTZ Board’s regulations, including 
Section 400.14. 

Dated: April 2, 2014. 
Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–07962 Filed 4–8–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

RIN 0648–XD224 

Marine Mammals; File No. 18537 

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce. 
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