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DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Air Force 

Notice of Intent to Prepare an 
Environmental Impact Statement (EIS) 
for Entry Control Reconfiguration Area 
at Wright-Patterson Air Force Base, OH 

AGENCY: U.S. Air Force, Air Force 
Material Command and 88th Air Base 
Wing. 
ACTION: Notice of Intent. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the National 
Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) of 
1969, as amended (42 United States 
Code 4321, et seq.), the Council on 
Environmental Quality Regulations for 
implementing the procedural provisions 
of NEPA (40 Code of Federal Regulation 
(CFR) Parts 1500–1508), and U.S. Air 
Force (USAF) policy and procedures (32 
CFR part 989), the USAF is issuing this 
notice to advise the public of its intent 
to prepare an EIS to evaluate potential 
environmental impacts associated with 
the construction and operation of the 
proposed Entry Control Reconfiguration 
of Area A by Wright-Patterson Air Force 
Base (WPAFB). Public scoping meetings 
will be held to assist in identifying 
reasonable alternatives, potential 
impacts and the relative significance of 
impacts to be analyzed in the EIS. 

The purpose and need of the 
proposed action is to improve security, 
safety, and traffic flow into and on the 
military base. An EIS must be prepared 
to evaluate the environmental impacts 
associated with the relocation and 
reconfiguration of traffic entry into Area 
A of the base. The proposed action 
includes consolidating, relocating, and 
reconfiguring vehicle entry control 
points (ECPs); upgrading the ECPs to 
meet current Antiterrorism/Force 
Protection (ATFP) standards; and 
extending the base perimeter fence to 
encompass the Kittyhawk Center, 
enabling it to be contiguous with Area 
A of the base. 

The EIS will address issues associated 
with ECPs and the on-base roadway 
network located in Area A of the 
installation. The EIS will address 
primary concerns related to the ECPs 
and existing roadway network where 
State Route 444 separates the Kittyhawk 
Center. Another concern involves the 
need to consolidate the existing ECPs in 
Area A into a smaller set of upgraded 
and strategically placed gates. 

The EIS will analyze three 
alternatives: Closure existing State 
Route 444 through Area A and 
relocation of all traffic onto Kauffman 
Avenue and Central Avenue via Dayton- 
Yellow Springs Road, realignment of 

State Route 444 to the east of the 
WPAFB Kittyhawk Center and west of 
the existing railroad, and the No Action 
alternative. Technical studies related to 
the proposed reconfiguration of ECPs 
includes biological and cultural 
resources impact analysis, noise and air 
studies, and traffic analyses. The USAF 
intends to use the EIS process and 
documentation to fulfill its National 
Historic Preservation Act, Section 106 
consultation requirements (36 CFR 
800.8). 

Scoping: The USAF will hold public 
scoping meetings in mid January and 
early February at the Fairborn Council 
Chambers to solicit public participation 
in this environmental analysis. The 
public will be invited to participate in 
the scoping meetings and review the 
Draft Final EIS. Notification of the 
meeting locations, dates, and time will 
be made in the local area and will be 
announced via local news media. 
Information gathered during the public 
scoping will be used in the development 
of the Draft EIS. 

The scoping process will help identify 
the full range of reasonable alternatives, 
potential impacts and key issues to be 
emphasized in the environmental 
analysis. Recognizing that open 
communication of issues is a critical 
element of the EIS process, the USAF 
and WPAFB intend to ensure that the 
scoping experience is meaningful and 
productive for all participants. 
Accordingly, the project team is putting 
strong emphasis on an EIS process that 
fosters beneficial dialogue and 
relationship building among all 
stakeholders, particularly those in the 
Fairborn community in close proximity 
to WPAFB. Handicap assistance and 
translation service will be made 
available; please provide requests in 
advance to the point of contact listed 
below. 

Oral and written comments presented 
at the public scoping meetings, as well 
as written comments received by the 
USAF during this scoping period and 
throughout the EIS process, will be 
considered in the preparation of the EIS. 
Letters and other written or oral 
comments received may be published in 
the EIS along with the names of the 
individuals making the comments. 
(Personal home addresses and phone 
numbers will not be published.) As 
required by law, comments will be 
addressed in the EIS and made available 
to the public. Private addresses will 
only be used to develop a mailing list 
of those individuals requesting copies of 
the EIS. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Please direct any written comments or 

requests for information to Mr. Vince 
King, Public Affairs Office, 5215 
Thurlow Street, Bldg 70 Suite 4B, 
Wright-Patterson AFB, Ohio 45433– 
5543 (Phone: 937–522–3252; e-mail 
88ABWPAX@WPAFB.AF.MIL). 
Handicap assistance and translation 
service at the public meetings are 
available in advance through Mr. King. 

Bao-Anh Trinh, 
Air Force Federal Register Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–32616 Filed 12–27–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–10–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Air Force 

U.S. Air Force Scientific Advisory 
Board Notice of Meeting 

AGENCY: Department of the Air Force, 
U.S. Air Force Scientific Advisory 
Board. 
ACTION: Meeting notice. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act of 
1972 (5 U.S.C., Appendix, as amended), 
the Government in the Sunshine Act of 
1976 (5 U.S.C. 552b, as amended), and 
41 CFR 102–3.150, the Department of 
Defense announces that the United 
States Air Force Scientific Advisory 
Board (SAB) meeting will take place on 
Tuesday, January 11th, 2011, at the 
SAFTAS Conference Facility, 1550 
Crystal Drive Plaza Level, Arlington VA 
22202. The meeting will be from 7:25 
a.m.–4 p.m. 

The purpose of the meeting is to hold 
the SAB quarterly meeting to conduct 
FOUO and classified discussions on the 
FY11 SAB studies tasked by the 
Secretary of the Air Force. In addition, 
the SAB will discuss and reach a 
consensus on the results of the Air 
Force Research Laboratory Science and 
Technology FY11 Review. 

Pursuant to 5 U.S.C. 552b, as 
amended, and 41 CFR 102–3.155, the 
Administrative Assistant of the Air 
Force, in consultation with the Office of 
the Air Force General Counsel, has 
determined in writing that the public 
interest requires that all sessions of the 
United States Air Force Scientific 
Advisory Board meeting be closed to the 
public because they will be concerned 
with classified information and matters 
covered by sections 5 U.S.C. 552b(c)(1) 
and (4). 

Any member of the public wishing to 
provide input to the United States Air 
Force Scientific Advisory Board should 
submit a written statement in 
accordance with 41 CFR 102–3.140(c) 
and section 10(a)(3) of the Federal 
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Advisory Committee Act and the 
procedures described in this paragraph. 
Written statements can be submitted to 
the Designated Federal Officer at the 
address detailed below at any time. 
Statements being submitted in response 
to the agenda mentioned in this notice 
must be received by the Designated 
Federal Officer at the address listed 
below at least five calendar days prior 
to the meeting which is the subject of 
this notice. Written statements received 
after this date may not be provided to 
or considered by the United States Air 
Force Scientific Advisory Board until its 
next meeting. The Designated Federal 
Officer will review all timely 
submissions with the United States Air 
Force Scientific Advisory Board 
Chairperson and ensure they are 
provided to members of the United 
States Air Force Scientific Advisory 
Board before the meeting that is the 
subject of this notice. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: The 
United States Air Force Scientific 
Advisory Board Executive Director and 
Designated Federal Officer, Lt Col 
Anthony M. Mitchell, 301–981–7135, 
United States Air Force Scientific 
Advisory Board, 1602 California Ave., 
Ste. #251, Andrews AFB, MD 20762, 
anthonym.mitchell@pentagon.af.mil. 

Bao-Anh Trinh, 
Air Force Federal Register Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–32600 Filed 12–27–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–10–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Blue Ribbon Commission on 
America’s Nuclear Future 

AGENCY: Department of Energy, Office of 
Nuclear Energy. 
ACTION: Notice of open meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces an 
open meeting of the Blue Ribbon 
Commission on America’s Nuclear 
Future (the Commission). The 
Commission was organized pursuant to 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(Pub. L. 92–463, 86 Stat. 770) (the Act). 
This notice is provided in accordance 
with the Act. 
DATES: Thursday, January 6, 2011; 1 
p.m.–5 p.m. EST. Friday, January 7, 
2011; 8 a.m.–3:30 p.m. EST. 
ADDRESSES: Augusta Marriott Hotel and 
Suites, Two Tenth Street, Augusta, GA 
30901, (706) 722–8900. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Timothy A. Frazier, Designated Federal 
Officer, U.S. Department of Energy, 
1000 Independence Avenue, SW., 
Washington, DC 20585; telephone (202) 

586–4243 or facsimile (202) 586–0544; 
e-mail 
CommissionDFO@nuclear.energy.gov. 
Additional information may also be 
available at http://www.brc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
notice is being published less that 15 
days from the date of the meeting and 
tour due to logistical circumstances and 
the inability to delay and reschedule the 
meeting and tour in a timely fashion. In 
addition, the dates for the meeting and 
tour have been publicly known for 
several weeks and posted on http:// 
www.brc.gov. 

Background: The President directed 
that the Blue Ribbon Commission on 
America’s Nuclear Future (the 
Commission) be established to conduct 
a comprehensive review of policies for 
managing the back end of the nuclear 
fuel cycle. The Commission will 
provide advice and make 
recommendations on issues including 
alternatives for the storage, processing, 
and disposal of civilian and defense 
spent nuclear fuel and nuclear waste. 

The Commission is scheduled to 
submit a draft report to the Secretary of 
Energy by July 2011, and a final report 
by January 2012. 

Purpose of the Meeting: The meeting 
will provide the Commission with a 
range of local and regional perspectives 
from a wide variety of individuals and 
organizations. The Commission will 
also tour the Savannah River Site to see 
first-hand the site’s facilities involved in 
the treatment, packaging and storage of 
used fuel and high-level wastes and 
other facilities related to the back end of 
the nuclear fuel cycle. 

Tentative Agenda: The site tour is 
expected to start at 1 p.m. on January 6 
with the Commissioners touring 
relevant areas of the Savannah River 
Site. The meeting on January 7 will 
begin at 8 a.m. at the Augusta Marriott 
Hotel and Suites. The Commission will 
hear presentations and statements from 
various stakeholder groups, and ask 
questions of the presenters, to provide 
additional information for Commission 
consideration. The meeting on January 7 
is expected to conclude with public 
statements starting at approximately 
2:30 p.m. The meeting will end by 3:30 
p.m. 

Public Participation: A drive-by tour 
of some of the Savannah River Site 
facilities is being offered to the general 
public on a first come, first served basis. 
Registration for the public tour will 
open at 8 a.m. on Monday, January 3, 
2011, and close at 5 p.m. on Tuesday, 
January 4, 2011. Individuals interested 
in the public tour may register by 
calling 803–952–8467. A limited 
number of seats are available. 

Individuals and representatives of 
organizations who would like to offer 
comments and suggestions may do so at 
the end of the meeting on January 7, 
2011. Approximately one hour will be 
reserved for public comments. Time 
allotted per speaker will depend on the 
number who wish to speak but will not 
exceed five minutes. The Designated 
Federal Officer is empowered to 
conduct the meeting in a fashion that 
will facilitate the orderly conduct of 
business. Those wishing to speak 
should register to do so beginning at 8 
a.m. on January 7, 2011, at the Augusta 
Marriott Hotel and Suites. Registration 
to speak will close at 1 p.m., January 7, 
2011. 

Those not able to attend the meeting 
or have insufficient time to address the 
committee are invited to send a written 
statement to Timothy A. Frazier, U.S. 
Department of Energy, 1000 
Independence Avenue, SW., 
Washington, DC 20585, e-mail to 
CommissionDFO@nuclear.energy.gov, or 
post comments on the Commission Web 
site at http://www.brc.gov. 

Additionally, the meeting will be 
available via live webcast. The link will 
be available at http://www.brc.gov. 

Minutes: The minutes of the meeting 
will be available at http://www.brc.gov 
or by contacting Mr. Frazier. He may be 
reached at the postal address or e-mail 
address above. 

Issued in Washington, DC, on December 
22, 2010. 
LaTanya R. Butler, 
Acting Deputy Committee Management 
Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–32579 Filed 12–27–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

National Energy Technology 
Laboratory; Notice of Intent To Grant 
Exclusive License 

AGENCY: National Energy Technology 
Laboratory, Department of Energy. 
ACTION: Notice of Intent To Grant 
Exclusive License. 

SUMMARY: This notice is issued in 
accordance with 35 U.S.C. 209(c)(1) and 
37 CFR 404.7(a)(1)(i). NETL hereby 
gives notice of its intent to grant an 
exclusive license to practice the 
inventions described and claimed in 
U.S. Patent Application Numbers 61/ 
305,116 and 12/422,346, entitled 
‘‘Method for designing a reforming and/ 
or combustion catalyst system’’ and 
‘‘Pyrochlore-type catalysts for the 
reforming of hydrocarbon fuels,’’ 
respectively, to Pyrochem Catalyst 
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