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opportunity to comment on proposed, 
revised, and continuing collections of 
information. This helps the Department 
assess the impact of its information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand the 
Department’s information collection 
requirements and provide the requested 
data in the desired format. ED is 
soliciting comments on the proposed 
information collection request (ICR) that 
is described below. The Department of 
Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) Is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: Common Core of 
Data (CCD) School-Level Finance 
Survey (SLFS) 2025–2027. 

OMB Control Number: 1850–0930. 
Type of Review: An extension, 

without change, of a currently approved 
information collection. 

Respondents/Affected Public: State, 
Local, and Tribal Governments. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Responses: 325. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Burden Hours: 6,119. 

Abstract: The School-Level Finance 
Survey (SLFS) is an annual collection of 
school-level finance data published in 
the National Center for Education 
Statistics (NCES) Common Core of Data 
(CCD). The U.S. Census Bureau 
(Census), Economic Reimbursable 
Surveys Division, administers the SLFS 
data collection for NCES under 
interagency agreement in conjunction 
with the National Public Education 
Financial Survey (NPEFS) (OMB #1850– 
0067) and the Local Education Agency 
(School District) Finance Survey (F–33) 
(OMB #0607–0700). SLFS is a 
comprehensive source of school-level 
finance data for public education 
collected on a nationwide scale using 
uniform definitions, concepts, and 
procedures. The collection includes the 
salaries, benefits, and total current 
expenditures broken out by activity 
(function) for all publicly funded 
schools serving students in 
prekindergarten through 12th grade. In 
this notice, NCES is announcing its 

intention to extend the date of clearance 
for SLFS, without change, to the 
currently approved collection. Detailed 
information about the collection can be 
found at https://www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAViewICR?ref_
nbr=202307-1850-003. 

Data will be collected from State 
Education Agencies (SEAs) for all 50 
states and the District of Columbia. 
SEAs appoint state fiscal coordinators to 
work with NCES and the U.S. Census 
Bureau to provide accurate and 
comparable data across states and 
jurisdictions. SEAs typically collect 
finance data from school districts for 
their own uses. Many states produce a 
state-specific chart of accounts or 
accounting manual to assist school 
districts in classifying and reporting 
finance data and producing government- 
wide financial statements. Uniform 
definitions and concepts of revenues 
and expenditures are defined by the 
NCES handbook Financial Accounting 
for Local and State School Systems. 

Data on school-level spending 
patterns is helpful for parents to make 
choices for the education of their child. 
Uniform and comparable data helps 
states measure the effectiveness of 
resource allocation. Collecting this data 
at the national level addresses the need 
for reliable and unbiased measures that 
can be utilized to compare how 
resources are distributed among schools 
within local districts. Education finance 
statistics provided by this collection 
allow for comparisons of how public 
elementary-secondary schools are 
spending their funds. 

Ross Santy, 
Chief Data Officer, Office of Planning, 
Evaluation and Policy Development. 
[FR Doc. 2025–13487 Filed 7–17–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Request for Nominations: National 
Advisory Council on Indian Education 
(NACIE) 

AGENCY: U.S. Department of Education 
ACTION: Request for nominations for 
appointment to serve on NACIE. 

SUMMARY: The United States Department 
of Education (Department) is seeking 
nominations for individuals to fill 
vacant seats and serve on NACIE. 
DATES: Nominations must be received 
no later than August 31, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit 
nomination(s), including attachments, 
via email to: Julian.Guerrero@ed.gov 
(please specify in the email subject line 
‘‘NACIE Nomination’’). 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Julian Guerrero, Jr., Designated Federal 
Official, Office of Indian Education, U.S. 
Department of Education, 400 Maryland 
Avenue SW, Office 4B–116, 
Washington, DC 20202. Telephone: 
(202) 213–3416. Email: Julian.Guerrero@
ed.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Nomination(s) received should 
contain the following: 

(1) A cover letter from the nominating 
entity self-identifying as an Indian Tribe 
or an Indian Organization; 

(2) Reason(s) for nominating the 
individual; 

(3) A copy of the nominee’s current 
resume or curriculum vitae; 

(4) Contact information for the 
nominee (e.g., name, title, mailing 
address, phone number, and email 
address); and 

(5) A statement affirming that the 
nominee has agreed to be nominated 
and is willing to serve on NACIE if 
appointed by the President of the 
United States of America. 

Statutory Authority and Function: 
NACIE is a statutorily authorized and 
presidentially appointed 15-member 
federal advisory committee created via 
the Indian Education Act of 1972 (IEA) 
and reauthorized via the Elementary 
and Secondary Education Act (ESEA) as 
amended. The duties of NACIE (20 
U.S.C. 7471) are to: 

(A) Advise both the Secretary of 
Education and the Secretary of the 
Interior concerning the funding and 
administration (including development 
of regulations, administrative policies, 
and practices) of any program that 
includes Indian children or adults as 
participants or beneficiaries. 

(B) Make recommendations to the 
Secretary of Education for filling the 
position of Office of Indian Education 
(OIE) Director whenever a vacancy 
occurs. 

(C) Submit an annual report to 
Congress every year no later than June 
30; regarding the activities of NACIE 
and include any recommendations for 
the improvement of Federal education 
programs that include Indian children 
or adults as participants or beneficiaries; 
and funding recommendations. 

In addition, Section 6141(a) of the 
ESEA requires that nominations are 
furnished, from time to time, by Indian 
Tribes and Indian Organizations; and 
must represent different geographic 
areas of the United States. Section 2 of 
the NACIE Improvement Act (NIA) 
requires that one member must be a 
president of a Tribal College or 
University as defined in 20 U.S.C. 
1059c(b). NACIE members will serve as 
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Special Government Employees (SGEs), 
as defined in 18 U.S.C. 202(a). As SGEs, 
members are selected for their 
individual experience, integrity, 
impartiality, and good judgment. The 
President or his delegate shall appoint 
a Chairperson and a Vice Chairperson 
from among the members. NACIE 
members may receive reimbursement 
for travel expenses incident to attending 
NACIE meetings, including per diem, as 
authorized by 5 U.S.C. 5703 for persons 
intermittently employed in the 
government service. NACIE is governed 
by provisions of the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA) (Pub. L. 92–463; 
as amended, 5 U.S.C. app.) which sets 
forth standards for the formation and 
use of advisory committees. 

Electronic Access to this Document: 
The official version of this document is 
published in the Federal Register. Free 
internet access to the official edition of 
the Federal Register and the Code of 
Federal Regulations is available via the 
Federal Digital System at: 
www.govinfo.gov/. At this site, you can 
view this document, as well as all other 
documents of this Department 
published in the Federal Register, in 
text or Adobe Portable Document 
Format (PDF). To use PDF, you must 
have Adobe Acrobat Reader, which is 
available free at the site. You also may 
access documents of the Department 
published in the Federal Register by 
using the article search feature at: 
www.federalregister.gov. Specifically, 
through the advanced search feature at 
this site, you can limit your search to 
documents published by the 
Department. 

Authority: Section 6141 of the ESEA, 
as amended (20 U.S.C. 7471). 

Hayley B. Sanon, 
Principal Deputy Assistant Secretary and 
Acting Assistant Secretary, Office of 
Elementary and Secondary Education. 
[FR Doc. 2025–13490 Filed 7–17–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

ELECTION ASSISTANCE COMMISSION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: EAC Federal Financial 
Report 

AGENCY: Election Assistance 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice; request for comment. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995 (PRA), the U.S. Election 
Assistance Commission (EAC) gives 
notice that it is requesting from the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) approval for the information 
collection EAC Federal Financial Report 
(EAC–FFR). 
DATES: Comments should be submitted 
by 5 p.m. EST on Monday, August 18, 
2025. 
ADDRESSES: Comments on the proposed 
form should be submitted electronically 
via https://www.regulations.gov (docket 
ID: EAC–2025–0005). 

Written comments on the proposed 
information collection can also be sent 
to the U.S. Election Assistance 
Commission, 633 3rd Street NW, Suite 
200, Washington, DC 20001, Attn: Office 
of Grants Management OCFO. 

All requests and submissions should 
be identified by the title of the 
information collection. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: EAC 
Federal Financial Report (EAC–FFR); 
OMB Number: 3265–0022. 

Purpose 
This proposed information collection 

was previously published in the Federal 
Register on Wednesday, May 14, 2025, 
and allowed 60 days for public 
comment. In compliance with Section 
3507(a)(1)(D) of the Paperwork 
Reduction Act (PRA) of 1995, EAC has 
submitted to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) a request for review 
and approval of the information 
collection listed below. The purpose of 
this notice is to allow an additional 30 
days for public comment from all 
interested individuals and 
organizations. 

The EAC Office of Grants 
Management (EAC/OGM) is responsible 
for distributing, monitoring, and 
providing technical assistance to states 
and grantees on the use of federal funds. 
EAC/OGM also reports on how the 
funds are spent to Congress, negotiates 
indirect cost rates with grantees, and 
resolves audit findings on the use of 
HAVA funds. 

The EAC–FFR is employed for all 
financial reports for grants issued under 
HAVA authority. This revised format 
builds upon that report for the various 
grant awards given by EAC. 

The FFR directly benefits award 
recipients by making it easier for them 
to administer federal grant and 
cooperative agreement programs 
through the standardization of the types 
of information required in financial 
reporting, thereby reducing their 
administrative effort and costs. 

Public Comments 

The EAC is soliciting public 
comments on: 

• Ways to enhance the quality, utility, 
and clarity of the information collected 
from respondents, including using 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology; 
and 

• Ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Please note that comments submitted 
in response to this Notice are public 
record. Before including any detailed 
personal information, you should be 
aware that your comments as submitted, 
including your personal information, 
will be available for public review. 

Description: The EAC proposes 
collecting financial activity data for 
HAVA. EAC will use this data to ensure 
grantees are proceeding satisfactorily in 
meeting the approved goals and purpose 
of the project. 

Respondents: All EAC grantees and 
state governments. 

Annual Reporting Burden 

ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES 

EAC grant Instrument Total number 
of respondents 

Total number 
of responses 

per year 

Average 
burden hours 
per response 

Annual 
burden hours 

251 .................................................... EAC–FFR ......................................... 35 2 .5 35 
101 .................................................... EAC–FFR ......................................... 20 2 .5 20 
Election Security ............................... EAC–FFR ......................................... 56 4 .5 112 
HAVCP .............................................. EAC–FFR ......................................... 14 2 .5 14 

Total ........................................... ........................................................... ........................ ........................ ........................ 181 
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