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Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
The FCC may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid OMB 
control number. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before June 27, 2022. 
If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Cathy Williams, FCC, via email to PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control Number: 3060–1148. 
Title: Section 79.3, Audio Description 

of Video Programming. 
Form Number: Not Applicable. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities, Not for profit entities and 
Individuals or households. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 50 respondents, 54 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 1–5 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement. 

Total Annual Burden: 116 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: $22,740. 
Obligation To Respond: Required to 

obtain or retain benefits. The statutory 
authority for this collection is contained 
in 47 U.S.C. 151, 152, 154(i), 303, and 
613. 

Needs and Uses: Audio description is 
the insertion of audio narrated 

descriptions of a television program’s 
key visual elements into natural pauses 
in the program’s dialogue, thus making 
video programming more accessible to 
individuals who are blind or visually 
impaired. The information collection 
requirements consist of the following: 

Petitions for exemption based on 
‘‘economic burden’’ (47 CFR 79.3(d)). (1) 
Pursuant to 47 CFR 79.3(d), a video 
programming provider may petition the 
Commission for a full or partial 
exemption from the audio description 
requirements based upon a showing that 
the requirements would be 
economically burdensome. (2) Petitions 
for exemption must be filed with the 
Commission, placed on public notice, 
and subject to comment from the public. 

(b) Non-form consumer complaints 
alleging violations of the audio 
description rules (47 CFR 79.3(e)). (1) 
Section 79.3(e) of the rules provides that 
a complaint alleging a violation of the 
audio description rules may be 
transmitted to the Commission by ‘‘any 
reasonable means,’’ and that each 
complaint must include: (i) The name 
and address of the complainant; (ii) the 
name and address of the broadcast 
station against whom the complaint is 
alleged and its call letters and network 
affiliation, or the name and address of 
the MVPD against whom the complaint 
is alleged and the name of the network 
that provides the programming that is 
the subject of the complaint; (iii) a 
statement of facts sufficient to show that 
the video programming distributor has 
violated or is violating the 
Commission’s rules, and, if applicable, 
the date and time of the alleged 
violation; (iv) the specific relief or 
satisfaction sought by the complainant; 
(v) the complainant’s preferred format 
or method of response to the complaint 
(such as letter, facsimile transmission, 
telephone (voice/TRS/TTY), internet 
email, or some other method that would 
best accommodate the complainant’s 
disability); and (vi) a certification that 
the complainant attempted in good faith 
to resolve the dispute with the broadcast 
station or MVPD against whom the 
complaint is alleged. (2) After the 
Commission receives the complaint, the 
Commission notifies the video 
programming distributor (VPD) of the 
complaint, and the VPD generally has 
30 days to reply. 

Federal Communications Commission. 

Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09030 Filed 4–27–22; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 
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ADMINISTRATION 
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SPACE ADMINISTRATION 
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Contracting 

AGENCY: Department of Defense (DOD), 
General Services Administration (GSA), 
and National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration (NASA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act, the 
Regulatory Secretariat Division has 
submitted to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) a request to review 
and approve an extension of a 
previously approved information 
collection requirement regarding service 
contracting. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
May 31, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for this information 
collection should be sent within 30 days 
of publication of this notice to 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
Find this particular information 
collection by selecting ‘‘Currently under 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function. 

Additionally, submit a copy to GSA 
through https://www.regulations.gov 
and follow the instructions on the site. 
This website provides the ability to type 
short comments directly into the 
comment field or attach a file for 
lengthier comments. 

Instructions: All items submitted 
must cite OMB Control No. 9000–0152, 
Service Contracting. Comments received 
generally will be posted without change 
to https://www.regulations.gov, 
including any personal and/or business 
confidential information provided. To 
confirm receipt of your comment(s), 
please check www.regulations.gov, 
approximately two-to-three days after 
submission to verify posting. If there are 
difficulties submitting comments, 
contact the GSA Regulatory Secretariat 
Division at 202–501–4755 or 
GSARegSec@gsa.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Zenaida Delgado, Procurement Analyst, 
at telephone 202–969–7207, or 
zenaida.delgado@gsa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
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A. OMB Control Number, Title, and 
Any Associated Form(s) 

9000–0152, Service Contracting. 

B. Need and Uses 

This justification supports an 
extension of OMB Control No. 9000– 
0152. This clearance covers the 
information that offerors must submit to 
comply with the following Federal 
Acquisition Regulation (FAR) 
requirement: 

• FAR 52.237–10, Identification of 
Uncompensated Overtime. This 
provision requires offerors, when 
professional or technical services are 
acquired on the basis of the number of 
hours to be provided, to identify 
uncompensated overtime hours in 
excess of 40 hours per week, whether at 
the prime or subcontract level. This 
includes uncompensated overtime 
hours that are in indirect cost pools for 
personnel whose regular hours are 
normally charged direct. 

The contracting officer will use the 
collected information to perform an 
adequate cost realism analysis of the 
offerors’ proposed labor rates. Proposals 
which include unrealistically low labor 
rates, or which do not otherwise 
demonstrate cost realism, will be 
considered by the contracting officer in 
a risk assessment and evaluated 
appropriately. The primary purpose for 
obtaining the information and using it 
during the source selection process is to 
discourage the use of uncompensated 
overtime. 

C. Annual Burden 

Respondents: 19,738. 
Total Annual Responses: 19,738. 
Total Burden Hours: 9,869. 

D. Public Comment 

A 60-day notice was published in the 
Federal Register at 87 FR 9356, on 
February 18, 2022. A comment was 
received; however, it did not change the 
estimate of the burden. 

Comment: The commenter expressed 
his approval of the details set forth 
under the Federal Regulations in regard 
to serving contracts and other 
collaborative efforts in the aerospace 
industry. 

Response: Noted. The commenter did 
not express an opinion on whether the 
estimated number of burden hours is 
accurate; or ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information. 

Obtaining Copies: Requesters may 
obtain a copy of the information 
collection documents from the GSA 
Regulatory Secretariat Division by 
calling 202–501–4755 or emailing 
GSARegSec@gsa.gov. Please cite OMB 

Control No. 9000–0152, Service 
Contracting. 

Janet Fry, 
Director, Federal Acquisition Policy Division, 
Office of Governmentwide Acquisition Policy, 
Office of Acquisition Policy, Office of 
Governmentwide Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09155 Filed 4–27–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6820–EP–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Agency for Healthcare Research and 
Quality 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request 

AGENCY: Agency for Healthcare Research 
and Quality, HHS. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces the 
intention of the Agency for Healthcare 
Research and Quality (AHRQ) to request 
that the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) approve the proposed 
information collection project: 
‘‘TeamSTEPPS® Stakeholder Surveys 
for AHRQ’s ACTION III Diagnostic 
Safety Capacity Building Contract 
Task.’’ This proposed information 
collection was previously published in 
the Federal Register on February 9th, 
2022 and 60 days for public comment. 
AHRQ did not receive substantive 
comments from members of the public 
during this period. The purpose of this 
notice is to allow an additional 30 days 
for public comment. 
DATES: Comments on this notice must be 
received by May 31, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Doris Lefkowitz, AHRQ Reports 
Clearance Officer, (301) 427–1477, or by 
email at doris.lefkowitz@AHRQ.hhs.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Proposed Project 

TeamSTEPPS® Stakeholder Surveys for 
AHRQ’s ACTION III Diagnostic Safety 
Capacity Building Contract Task 3 

AHRQ awarded a contract to the 
MedStar Health Research Institute 
(MHRI) in 2019 and received OMB fast 

track clearance (OMB control number 
0935–0179, expiration date of 11/30/23), 
to provide program support and 
expertise related to improving 
diagnostic safety and quality across five 
distinct contract tasks. Task 3 of the 
contract is to develop, pilot test and 
promote a TeamSTEPPS® Course to 
improve communication among 
providers related to diagnosis. 
TeamSTEPPS® to Improve Diagnosis 
provides communication strategies, 
including methods to improve intra- 
professional communication and 
communication during the referral 
process and to practice mutual support 
and situation monitoring during the 
diagnostic process. TeamSTEPPS® to 
Improve Diagnosis includes an 
educational module for leaders on 
strategies to facilitate improved 
communication with and among 
providers related to diagnosis. This 
module also includes a Team 
Assessment Tool for Improving 
Diagnosis (the ‘‘Team Assessment 
Tool’’). 

The Team Assessment Tool is an 
instrument developed as a method of 
self-assessment, with the goal of helping 
teams reflect on their current diagnostic 
and teamwork practices. In addition, it 
orients them to the repertoire of tools 
available within the TeamSTEPPS for 
Improving Diagnosis course that are 
available to support improvement 
efforts. The Team Assessment Tool asks 
participants to complete self-assessment 
ratings as a mechanism to identify 
strengths and opportunities for 
improvement in unit-based teamwork. 
The unit level aggregate results of the 
assessments help unit leaders identify 
priorities for training via use of course 
modules and specific interventions with 
their diagnostic improvement teams. 

AHRQ would like to further develop 
this Team Assessment Tool into a 
measurement instrument, expanding on 
its intended use as an educational 
activity and formative assessment. The 
opportunity to provide evidence (via 
publication in peer reviewed journals) 
that the tool is both valid and reliable 
will strengthen its acceptance in the 
care delivery community and provide a 
scientifically sound method for teams to 
assess changes in performance overtime. 
The Team Assessment Tool requires 
psychometric testing in order to ensure 
validity and reliability. 

Psychometrics is the construction and 
validation of measurement instruments 
and assessing if these instruments are 
reliable (have consistency in 
measurement) and valid (have accuracy 
in measurement). Reliability and 
validity indicate how well a method, 
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