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amended energy conservation standards 
for the consumer furnaces covered by 
this notification (specifically, WGFs, 
NWOFs, WOFs, MHOFs, and electric 
furnaces). After the close of the 
comment period, DOE will review the 
public comments received and may 
begin collecting data and conducting the 
analyses discussed in this document. 

Submitting comments via 
www.regulations.gov. The 
www.regulations.gov web page requires 
you to provide your name and contact 
information. Your contact information 
will be viewable to DOE Building 
Technologies staff only. Your contact 
information will not be publicly 
viewable except for your first and last 
names, organization name (if any), and 
submitter representative name (if any). 
If your comment is not processed 
properly because of technical 
difficulties, DOE will use this 
information to contact you. If DOE 
cannot read your comment due to 
technical difficulties and cannot contact 
you for clarification, DOE may not be 
able to consider your comment. 

However, your contact information 
will be publicly viewable if you include 
it in the comment or in any documents 
attached to your comment. Any 
information that you do not want to be 
publicly viewable should not be 
included in your comment, nor in any 
document attached to your comment. If 
this instruction is followed, persons 
viewing comments will see only first 
and last names, organization names, 
correspondence containing comments, 
and any documents submitted with the 
comments. 

Do not submit to www.regulations.gov 
information for which disclosure is 
restricted by statute, such as trade 
secrets and commercial or financial 
information (hereinafter referred to as 
Confidential Business Information 
(‘‘CBI’’)). Comments submitted through 
www.regulations.gov cannot be claimed 
as CBI. Comments received through the 
website will waive any CBI claims for 
the information submitted. For 
information on submitting CBI, see the 
Confidential Business Information 
section. 

DOE processes submissions made 
through www.regulations.gov before 
posting. Normally, comments will be 
posted within a few days of being 
submitted. However, if large volumes of 
comments are being processed 
simultaneously, your comment may not 
be viewable for up to several weeks. 
Please keep the comment tracking 
number that www.regulations.gov 
provides after you have successfully 
uploaded your comment. 

Submitting comments via email. 
Comments and documents submitted 
via email also will be posted to 
www.regulations.gov. If you do not want 
your personal contact information to be 
publicly viewable, do not include it in 
your comment or any accompanying 
documents. Instead, provide your 
contact information in a cover letter. 
Include your first and last names, email 
address, telephone number, and 
optional mailing address. The cover 
letter will not be publicly viewable as 
long as it does not include any 
comments. 

Include contact information each time 
you submit comments, data, documents, 
and other information to DOE. Faxes 
will not be accepted. 

Comments, data, and other 
information submitted to DOE 
electronically should be provided in 
PDF (preferred), Microsoft Word or 
Excel, or text (ASCII) file format. 
Provide documents that are not secured, 
written in English, and free of any 
defects or viruses. Documents should 
not contain special characters or any 
form of encryption and, if possible, they 
should carry the electronic signature of 
the author. 

Campaign form letters. Please submit 
campaign form letters by the originating 
organization in batches of between 50 to 
500 form letters per PDF or as one form 
letter with a list of supporters’ names 
compiled into one or more PDFs. This 
reduces comment processing and 
posting time. 

Confidential Business Information. 
Pursuant to 10 CFR 1004.11, any person 
submitting information that he or she 
believes to be confidential and exempt 
by law from public disclosure should 
submit via email two well-marked 
copies: One copy of the document 
marked ‘‘confidential’’ including all the 
information believed to be confidential, 
and one copy of the document marked 
‘‘non-confidential’’ with the information 
believed to be confidential deleted. DOE 
will make its own determination about 
the confidential status of the 
information and treat it according to its 
determination. 

It is DOE’s policy that all comments 
may be included in the public docket, 
without change and as received, 
including any personal information 
provided in the comments (except 
information deemed to be exempt from 
public disclosure). 

DOE considers public participation to 
be a very important part of the process 
for developing test procedures and 
energy conservation standards. DOE 
actively encourages the participation 
and interaction of the public during the 
comment period in each stage of this 

process. Interactions with and between 
members of the public provide a 
balanced discussion of the issues and 
assist DOE in the process. Anyone who 
wishes to be added to the DOE mailing 
list to receive future notices and 
information about this process should 
contact Appliance and Equipment 
Standards Program staff at (202) 287– 
1445 or via email at 
ApplianceStandardsQuestions@
ee.doe.gov. 

Signing Authority 

This document of the Department of 
Energy was signed on January 23, 2022, 
by Kelly J. Speakes-Backman, Principal 
Deputy Assistant Secretary for Energy 
Efficiency and Renewable Energy, 
pursuant to delegated authority from the 
Secretary of Energy. That document 
with the original signature and date is 
maintained by DOE. For administrative 
purposes only, and in compliance with 
requirements of the Office of the Federal 
Register, the undersigned DOE Federal 
Register Liaison Officer has been 
authorized to sign and submit the 
document in electronic format for 
publication, as an official document of 
the Department of Energy. This 
administrative process in no way alters 
the legal effect of this document upon 
publication in the Federal Register. 

Signed in Washington, DC, on January 25, 
2022. 
Treena V. Garrett, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, U.S. 
Department of Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2022–01765 Filed 1–27–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

14 CFR Part 71 

[Docket No. FAA–2022–0027; Airspace 
Docket No. 21–ANM–70] 

RIN 2120–AA66 

Proposed Amendment of Domestic 
VOR Federal Airway V–356; Mile High, 
CO 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice of proposed rulemaking 
(NPRM). 

SUMMARY: This action proposes to 
amend Domestic VOR Federal Airway 
V–356, by revoking the segment 
between the FIDLE and ELORE 
intersections due to the absence of a 
supporting navigational aid signal. 
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DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before March 14, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Send comments on this 
proposal to the U.S. Department of 
Transportation, Docket Operations, 1200 
New Jersey Avenue SE, West Building 
Ground Floor, Room W12–140, 
Washington, DC 20590; telephone: 
1(800) 647–5527, or (202) 366–9826. 
You must identify FAA Docket No. 
FAA–2022–0027; Airspace Docket No. 
21–ANM–70 at the beginning of your 
comments. You may also submit 
comments through the internet at 
https://www.regulations.gov. 

FAA Order JO 7400.11F, Airspace 
Designations and Reporting Points, and 
subsequent amendments can be viewed 
online at https://www.faa.gov/air_
traffic/publications/. For further 
information, you can contact the Rules 
and Regulations Group, Federal 
Aviation Administration, 800 
Independence Avenue SW, Washington, 
DC 20591; telephone: (202) 267–8783. 
FAA Order JO 7400.11F is also available 
for inspection at the National Archives 
and Records Administration (NARA). 
For information on the availability of 
FAA Order JO 7400.11F at NARA, 
email: fr.inspection@nara.gov or go to 
https://www.archives.gov/federal- 
register/cfr/ibr-locations.html. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Christopher McMullin, Rules and 
Regulations Group, Office of Policy, 
Federal Aviation Administration, 800 
Independence Avenue SW, Washington, 
DC 20591; telephone: (202) 267–8783. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Authority for This Rulemaking 

The FAA’s authority to issue rules 
regarding aviation safety is found in 
Title 49 of the United States Code. 
Subtitle I, Section 106 describes the 
authority of the FAA Administrator. 
Subtitle VII, Aviation Programs, 
describes in more detail the scope of the 
agency’s authority. This rulemaking is 
promulgated under the authority 
described in Subtitle VII, Part A, 
Subpart I, Section 40103. Under that 
section, the FAA is charged with 
prescribing regulations to assign the use 
of the airspace necessary to ensure the 
safety of aircraft and the efficient use of 
airspace. This regulation is within the 
scope of that authority as it would 
modify the route structure as necessary 
to preserve the safe and efficient flow of 
air traffic within the National Airspace 
System. 

Comments Invited 

Interested parties are invited to 
participate in this proposed rulemaking 
by submitting such written data, views, 

or arguments as they may desire. 
Comments that provide the factual basis 
supporting the views and suggestions 
presented are particularly helpful in 
developing reasoned regulatory 
decisions on the proposal. Comments 
are specifically invited on the overall 
regulatory, aeronautical, economic, 
environmental, and energy-related 
aspects of the proposal. 

Communications should identify both 
docket numbers (FAA Docket No. FAA– 
2022–0027; Airspace Docket No. 21– 
ANM–70) and be submitted in triplicate 
to the Docket Management Facility (see 
ADDRESSES section for address and 
phone number). You may also submit 
comments through the internet at 
https://www.regulations.gov. 

Commenters wishing the FAA to 
acknowledge receipt of their comments 
on this action must submit with those 
comments a self-addressed, stamped 
postcard on which the following 
statement is made: ‘‘Comments to FAA 
Docket No. FAA–2022–0027; Airspace 
Docket No. 21–ANM–70.’’ The postcard 
will be date/time stamped and returned 
to the commenter. 

All communications received on or 
before the specified comment closing 
date will be considered before taking 
action on the proposed rule. The 
proposal contained in this action may 
be changed in light of comments 
received. All comments submitted will 
be available for examination in the 
public docket both before and after the 
comment closing date. A report 
summarizing each substantive public 
contact with FAA personnel concerned 
with this rulemaking will be filed in the 
docket. 

Availability of NPRM 

An electronic copy of this document 
may be downloaded through the 
internet at https://www.regulations.gov. 
Recently published rulemaking 
documents can also be accessed through 
the FAA’s web page at https://
www.faa.gov/air_traffic/publications/ 
airspace_amendments/. 

You may review the public docket 
containing the proposal, any comments 
received and any final disposition in 
person in the Dockets Office (see 
ADDRESSES section for address and 
phone number) between 9:00 a.m. and 
5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, 
except Federal holidays. An informal 
docket may also be examined during 
normal business hours at the office of 
the Western Service Center, Operations 
Support Group, Federal Aviation 
Administration, 2200 South 216th 
Street, Des Moines, WA 98198. 

Availability and Summary of 
Documents for Incorporation by 
Reference 

This document proposes to amend 
FAA Order JO 7400.11F, Airspace 
Designations and Reporting Points, 
dated August 10, 2021, and effective 
September 15, 2021. FAA Order JO 
7400.11F is publicly available as listed 
in the ADDRESSES section of this 
document. FAA Order JO 7400.11F lists 
Class A, B, C, D, and E airspace areas, 
air traffic service routes, and reporting 
points. 

Background 
While conducting a routine flight 

inspection of V–356 in the vicinity of 
Mile High, CO, the FAA has determined 
that the Mile High, CO, (DVV) VHF 
Omnidirectional Radar and Tactical Air 
Navigational System (VORTAC) beacon 
is unusable on the airway below 18,000 
mean sea level (MSL) between the 
FIDLE and ELORE intersections. The 
section of V–356 in this area is 
dependent upon the DVV signal for 
identification of the airway. The FAA is 
proposing to revoke the section between 
FIDLE and ELORE, since it can no 
longer be supported. There are several 
alternate routes that can be utilized 
when navigating between Red Table, CO 
and DVV, including V–134 to V–328, 
and V–361 to V–8, as well as other 
combinations of airways in between. 

The Proposal 
The FAA is proposing an amendment 

to 14 CFR part 71 to revoke the segment 
of the Domestic VOR Federal Airway V– 
356 between the FIDLE and ELORE 
intersection due to the lack of usable 
signal transmitted from DVV. 

V–356: V–356 currently extends from 
Red Table, CO via the intersection of 
Red Table 058° and Mile High, CO 265° 
radials, to Mile High. The proposed 
route would revoke the segment 
between the intersection of Red Table 
058° (T) 046° (M) and Kremling, CO 
190° (T) 176° (M) radials and the 
intersection of Gill, CO 211° (T) 198° 
(M) and Mile High, CO 265° (T) 257° (M) 
radials. The rest of the route would 
remain unchanged. 

Domestic VOR Federal Airways are 
published in paragraph 6010(a) of FAA 
Order JO 7400.11F dated August 10, 
2021 and effective September 15, 2021, 
which is incorporated by reference in 14 
CFR 71.1. The Domestic VOR Federal 
Airway listed in this document would 
be published subsequently in FAA 
Order JO 7400.11. 

FAA Order JO 7400.11, Airspace 
Designations and Reporting Points, is 
published yearly and effective on 
September 15. 
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Regulatory Notices and Analyses 

The FAA has determined that this 
proposed regulation only involves an 
established body of technical 
regulations for which frequent and 
routine amendments are necessary to 
keep them operationally current. It, 
therefore: (1) Is not a ‘‘significant 
regulatory action’’ under Executive 
Order 12866; (2) is not a ‘‘significant 
rule’’ under Department of 
Transportation (DOT) Regulatory 
Policies and Procedures (44 FR 11034; 
February 26, 1979); and (3) does not 
warrant preparation of a regulatory 
evaluation as the anticipated impact is 
so minimal. Since this is a routine 
matter that will only affect air traffic 
procedures and air navigation, it is 
certified that this proposed rule, when 
promulgated, will not have a significant 
economic impact on a substantial 
number of small entities under the 
criteria of the Regulatory Flexibility Act. 

Environmental Review 

This proposal will be subject to an 
environmental analysis in accordance 
with FAA Order 1050.1F, 
‘‘Environmental Impacts: Policies and 
Procedures’’ prior to any FAA final 
regulatory action. 

List of Subjects in 14 CFR Part 71 

Airspace, Incorporation by reference, 
Navigation (air). 

The Proposed Amendment 

In consideration of the foregoing, the 
Federal Aviation Administration 
proposes to amend 14 CFR part 71 as 
follows: 

PART 71—DESIGNATION OF CLASS A, 
B, C, D, AND E AIRSPACE AREAS; AIR 
TRAFFIC SERVICE ROUTES; AND 
REPORTING POINTS 

■ 1. The authority citation for 14 CFR 
part 71 continues to read as follows: 

Authority: 49 U.S.C. 106(f), 106(g); 40103, 
40113, 40120; E.O. 10854, 24 FR 9565, 3 CFR, 
1959–1963 Comp., p. 389. 

§ 71.1 [Amended] 
■ 2. The incorporation by reference in 
14 CFR 71.1 of FAA Order JO 7400.11F, 
Airspace Designations and Reporting 
Points, dated August 10, 2021, and 
effective September 15, 2021, is 
amended as follows: 

Paragraph 6010 (a)—Domestic VOR Federal 
Airways. 

* * * * * 

V–356 [Amended] 

From Red Table, CO; to INT Red Table 058° 
(T) 046° (M) and Kremmling, CO 190° (T) 
176° (M) radials. From INT Gill, CO 211° 

(T) 198° (M) and Mile High, CO 265° (T) 
257° (M) radials; to Mile High. 

* * * * * 
Issued in Washington, DC, on January 25, 

2022. 
Michael R. Beckles, 
Acting Manager, Rules and Regulations 
Group. 
[FR Doc. 2022–01719 Filed 1–27–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–13–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

34 CFR Chapter II 

[Docket ID ED–2021–OESE–0122] 

Proposed Priorities, Requirements, 
and Definition—Project Prevent Grant 
Program 

AGENCY: Office of Elementary and 
Secondary Education, Department of 
Education. 
ACTION: Proposed priorities, 
requirements, and definition. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Education 
(Department) proposes priorities, 
requirements, and a definition under the 
Project Prevent grant program, 
Assistance Listing Number (ALN) 
84.184M. We may use one or more of 
these priorities, requirements, and 
definition for competitions in fiscal year 
(FY) 2022 and later years. We propose 
priorities and requirements designed to 
direct funds toward local educational 
agencies (LEAs) impacted by 
community violence and to expand the 
capacity of LEAs to implement 
community- and school-based strategies 
to help prevent community violence 
and mitigate the impacts of exposure to 
community violence. The Department 
also proposes to define ‘‘community 
violence’’ for purposes of the Project 
Prevent grant program. 
DATES: We must receive your comments 
on or before February 28, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal 
or via postal mail, commercial delivery, 
or hand delivery. We will not accept 
comments submitted by fax or by email 
or those submitted after the comment 
period. To ensure we do not receive 
duplicate copies, please submit your 
comments only once. In addition, please 
include the Docket ID at the top of your 
comments. 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: Go to 
www.regulations.gov to submit your 
comments electronically. Information 
on using Regulations.gov, including 
instructions for accessing agency 
documents, submitting comments, and 

viewing the docket, is available on the 
site under ‘‘FAQ.’’ 

• Postal Mail, Commercial Delivery, 
or Hand Delivery: If you mail or deliver 
your comments about the proposed 
priorities, requirements, and definition, 
address them to Nicole White, U.S. 
Department of Education, 400 Maryland 
Avenue SW, Room 3E326, Washington, 
DC 20202. 

Privacy Note: The Department’s 
policy is to make all comments received 
from members of the public available for 
public viewing in their entirety on the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal at 
www.regulations.gov. Therefore, 
commenters should be careful to 
include in their comments only 
information that they wish to make 
publicly available. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Nicole White, U.S. Department of 
Education, 400 Maryland Avenue SW, 
Room 3E326, Washington, DC 20202. 
Telephone: (202) 453–6729. Email: 
Project.Prevent@ed.gov. 

If you use a telecommunications 
device for the deaf (TDD) or a text 
telephone (TTY), call the Federal Relay 
Service (FRS), toll-free, at 1–800–877– 
8339. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Invitation to Comment: We invite you 

to submit comments regarding the 
proposed priorities, requirements, and 
definition. To ensure that your 
comments have maximum effect in 
developing the notice of final priorities, 
requirements, and definition, we urge 
you to clearly identify the specific 
section of the proposed priorities, 
requirements, or definition that each 
comment addresses. 

We invite you to assist us in 
complying with the specific 
requirements of Executive Orders 12866 
and 13563 and their overall requirement 
of reducing regulatory burden that 
might result from the proposed 
priorities, requirements, and definition. 
Please let us know of any further ways 
we could reduce potential costs or 
increase potential benefits while 
preserving the effective and efficient 
administration of the program. 

During and after the comment period, 
you may inspect all public comments 
about the proposed priorities, 
requirements, and definition by 
accessing Regulations.gov. You may also 
inspect the comments in person. Please 
contact the person listed under FOR 
FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT to make 
arrangements to inspect the comments 
in person. 

Assistance to Individuals with 
Disabilities in Reviewing the 
Rulemaking Record: On request we will 
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