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Interactive Life Forms, LLC of Austin, 
Texas (‘‘ILF’’). 75 FR 47027 (Aug. 4, 
2010). The complaint alleged violations 
of section 337 of the Tariff Act of 1930, 
as amended (19 U.S.C. 1337), based 
upon the importation into the United 
States, the sale for importation, and the 
sale within the United States after 
importation of certain devices having 
elastomeric gel and components thereof 
by reason of infringement of certain 
claims of U.S. Patent Nos. 5,782,818 and 
5,807,360. The complaint originally 
named 26 respondents, including 
Polydigitech Inc. of Schaumburg, 
Illinois (‘‘Polydigitech’’), and Satistic, 
LLC of Las Vegas, Nevada (‘‘Satistic’’). 
The complaint was later amended, as 
was the notice of investigation, to add 
two respondents and correct the 
identification of two original 
respondents. 75 FR 64742 (Oct. 20, 
2010). Since institution, Satistic has 
been found in default and all remaining 
respondents, save Polydigitech, have 
been terminated from the investigation 
based upon consent order stipulations 
and consent orders or based upon 
settlement. 

On December 29, 2010, ILF filed a 
motion to terminate the investigation in 
its entirety, in which it represented that 
it is not seeking entry of a limited 
exclusion order, a cease and desist 
order, or any other relief despite Satistic 
having been found in default. ILF 
further represented that it had decided 
to withdraw its complaint against 
Polydigitech, the last remaining 
respondent in the investigation, because 
its allegations against Polydigitech were 
based upon that firm’s distribution of 
products manufactured by original 
respondent TENGA Co., Ltd. of Tokyo, 
Japan, which has since entered into a 
consent order and been terminated from 
the investigation. ILF also stated that 
neither Polydigitech nor the 
Commission investigative attorney 
opposed the motion. 

On January 28, 2011, the ALJ issued 
the subject ID. Given ILF’s decision not 
to seek any relief against the defaulted 
party, and finding no extraordinary 
circumstances that would preclude the 
Commission from terminating the 
investigation in its entirety based on the 
withdrawal of the complaint as to 
Polydigitech, the only remaining 
respondent in the investigation, the ALJ 
granted ILF’s unopposed motion. No 
petitions for review of the ID were filed. 

The Commission has determined not 
to review the subject ID. 

This action is taken under the 
authority of section 337 of the Tariff Act 
of 1930, as amended (19 U.S.C. 1337), 
and Commission Rules 210.21, 210.42 
(19 CFR 210.21, 210.42). 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: February 17, 2011. 

William R. Bishop, 
Hearings and Meetings Coordinator. 
[FR Doc. 2011–5680 Filed 3–10–11; 8:45 am] 
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Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Extension of a Previously 
Approved Collection; Comments 
Requested 

ACTION: 60-Day Notice of Information 
Collection Under Review: Department 
Annual Progress Report. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ) 
Office of Community Oriented Policing 
Services (COPS) will be submitting the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. The revision of 
a currently approved information 
collection is published to obtain 
comments from the public and affected 
agencies. 

The purpose of this notice is to allow 
for 60 days for public comment until 
May 10, 2011. This process is conducted 
in accordance with 5 CFR 1320.10. 

If you have comments especially on 
the estimated public burden or 
associated response time, suggestions, 
or need a copy of the proposed 
information collection instrument with 
instructions or additional information, 
please contact Ashley Hoornstra, 
Department of Justice Office of 
Community Oriented Policing Services, 
145 N Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20530. 

Written comments concerning this 
information collection should be sent to 
the Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs, Office of Management and 
Budget, Attn: DOJ Desk Officer. The best 
way to ensure your comments are 
received is to e-mail them to 
oira_submission@omb.eop.gov or fax 
them to 202–395–7285. All comments 
should reference the 8 digit OMB 
number for the collection or the title of 
the collection. If you have questions 
concerning the collection, please call 
Ashley Hoornstra at 202–616–1314 or 
the DOJ Desk Officer at 202–395–3176. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
concerning the proposed collection of 
information are encouraged. Your 
comments should address one or more 
of the following four points: 

—Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Extension of a previously approved 
collection; comments requested. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Department Annual Progress Report. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
None. U.S. Department of Justice Office 
of Community Oriented Policing 
Services. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Law enforcement and 
public safety agencies that are recipients 
of COPS hiring grants. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond/reply: It is estimated that 
approximately 100 respondents can 
complete the report in an average of 1 
hour. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: 100 total burden hours. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Lynn Murray, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, 145 N Street, NE., Suite 
2E–502, Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: March 8, 2011. 
Lynn Murray, 
Department Clearance Officer, PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2011–5678 Filed 3–10–11; 8:45 am] 
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