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that are considered in acting on the 
notices are set forth in paragraph 7 of 
the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The notices are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank indicated. The notices 
also will be available for inspection at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
Interested persons may express their 
views in writing to the Reserve Bank 
indicated for that notice or to the offices 
of the Board of Governors. Comments 
must be received not later than February 
17, 2016. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of 
Minneapolis (Jacquelyn K. Brunmeier, 
Assistant Vice President) 90 Hennepin 
Avenue, Minneapolis, Minnesota 
55480–0291: 

1. Irrevocable Trust Agreement of 
Robert Vogel effective February 11, 
1994, Elko New Market, Minnesota, 
Laura Vogel, trustee of the Trust, Elko 
New Market, Minnesota; to acquire 
voting shares of Market Bancorporation, 
Elko New Market, Minnesota, and join 
the Vogel Family Group that controls 
shares of Market Bancorporation, Elko 
New Market, Minnesota, and thereby 
indirectly controls New Market Bank, 
Elko New Market, Minnesota. 

B. Federal Reserve Bank of Dallas 
(Robert L. Triplett III, Senior Vice 
President) 2200 North Pearl Street, 
Dallas, Texas 75201–2272: 

1. Bastrop Bancshares, Inc. Employee 
Stock Ownership Plan, Bastrop, Texas 
(‘‘ESOP’’), and Amanda Lorraine 
Wickliffe, Bastrop, Texas; John Daniel 
Mican, Bastrop, Texas; Dianna Fiebrich 
Kana, Bastrop, Texas; Tammy Lynn 
Goertz, Rosanky, Texas; and Robert 
Edward Berryhill, Smithville, Texas; 
individually and as co-trustees of ESOP, 
acting as a group in concert, to retain 
and acquire additional shares of Bastrop 
Bancshares, Inc., Bastrop, Texas, and 
indirectly First National Bank of 
Bastrop, Bastrop, Texas. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, January 29, 2016. 
Michael J. Lewandowski, 
Associate Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2016–02086 Filed 2–3–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 

holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The applications will also be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than February 29, 
2016. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Richmond 
(Adam M. Drimer, Assistant Vice 
President) 701 East Byrd Street, 
Richmond, Virginia 23261–4528: 

1. Parkway Acquisition Corp, Floyd, 
Virginia, to become a bank holding 
company through the acquisition of 100 
percent of the voting securities of 
Grayson Bankshares, Inc., 
Independence, Virginia, and indirectly 
acquire The Grayson National Bank, 
Independence, Virginia; and 100 
percent of the voting securities of 
Cardinal Bankshares Corporation, 
Floyd, Virginia, and thereby indirectly 
acquire Bank of Floyd, Floyd, Virginia. 

B. Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta 
(Chapelle Davis, Assistant Vice 
President) 1000 Peachtree Street NE., 
Atlanta, Georgia 30309: 

1. Commercial Bancgroup, Inc., 
Harrogate, Tennessee; to acquire 
National Bank of Tennessee, Newport, 
Tennessee Bank. In addition, 
Commercial Bank, Harrogate, 
Tennessee, to merge with Bank. 

2. WCSB Holding Company, Inc., to 
become a bank holding company by 
acquiring 100 percent of the outstanding 
shares of Wilcox County State Bank, 
both of Abbeville, Georgia. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, January 29, 2016. 
Michael J. Lewandowski, 
Associate Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2016–02088 Filed 2–3–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

GOVERNMENT ACCOUNTABILITY 
OFFICE 

Request for Health Information 
Technology Policy Committee 
Nominations 

AGENCY: Government Accountability 
Office (GAO). 
ACTION: Request for letters of 
nomination and resumes. 

SUMMARY: The American Recovery and 
Reinvestment Act of 2009 (ARRA) 
established the Health Information 
Technology Policy Committee (HIT 
Policy Committee) and gave the 
Comptroller General responsibility for 
appointing 13 of its 20 members. As a 
result of terms ending in April 2016, 
GAO is accepting nominations of 
individuals for three openings on the 
committee in the following categories of 
representation or expertise required in 
ARRA: Advocate for patients or 
consumers, representative of a health 
plan or third party payer, and 
representative of purchasers or 
employers. For appointments to the HIT 
Policy Committee to be made in April 
2016 in these categories, I am 
announcing the following: Letters of 
nomination and resumes should be 
submitted by March 2, 2016 to ensure 
adequate opportunity for review and 
consideration of nominees. 
Acknowledgement of submissions will 
be provided within one week of 
submission. Please contact Mary Giffin 
at (202) 512–3710 if you do not receive 
an acknowledgment. 
ADDRESSES: Email: HITCommittee@
gao.gov; Mail: U.S. GAO, Attn: HITPC 
Appointments, 441 G Street NW., 
Washington, DC 20548. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
GAO Office of Public Affairs, (202) 512– 
4800. 42 U.S.C. § 300jj–12. 

Gene L. Dodaro, 
Comptroller General of the United States. 
[FR Doc. 2016–02009 Filed 2–3–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 1610–02–M 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Advisory Committee on Immunization 
Practices Meeting 

In accordance with section 10(a)(2) of 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(Pub. L. 92–463), the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention (CDC) announce 
the following meeting of the 
aforementioned committee. 
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