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travel processing for federal employees, 
Commissioned Corps and all CDC- 
invited guests; (2) provides direct 
management and execution of the 
administrative aspects of human 
resources across NCIRD, including 
training, and administration of policies 
and guidelines developed by Office of 
Human Resources, Atlanta Operations 
Center, Department of Health and 
Human Services, CDC Ethics Office, 
Financial Management Office, Office of 
Commissioned Corps Personnel, Center 
for Global Health, Office of Personnel 
Management, and Procurement and 
Grants Office; (3) provides direct 
management and execution of the 
coordination of office facilities, and 
supplies technical guidance and 
expertise regarding occupancy and 
facilities management to emergency 
situations; (4) provides direct and daily 
management and execution of the 
distribution, accountability and 
maintenance of CDC property and 
equipment; (5) provides direct 
management and execution of 
procurement requisitions, and contracts 
and performs administrative tasks 
related to initiating, processing and 
maintaining interagency agreements; (6) 
provides direct management and 
execution of the creation, organization, 
access, maintenance and disposition of 
CDC records, and of the establishment 
of policies and procedures coordinating 
a NCIRD response to Freedom of 
Information Act requests; and (7) 
provides direct management and 
execution of the coordination of 
logistics for Federal government 
committee meetings and NCIRD 
conferences. 

Office of Science and Integrated 
Programs (CVG17). (1) Links strategies 
and priorities of the primarily 
programmatic-focused NCIRD divisions 
with those of primarily disease-based 
divisions; (2) facilitates development 
and ongoing implementation of 
integrated infectious respiratory disease 
(including influenza) surveillance, 
research, and prevention and control 
activities across the divisions, both 
domestically and globally, including 
supporting implementation of NCIRD’s 
respiratory diseases strategic prevention 
priorities; (3) interfaces with other CDC 
CIOs working in the area of respiratory 
diseases; (4) coordinates and facilitates 
the center’s overall respiratory and 
vaccine preventable disease scientific/ 
research agenda; (5) assumes 
responsibility for the protection of 
human research subjects, scientific 
review, clearance of manuscripts and 
other written materials; (6) provides 
planning and coordination of overall 

surveillance strategies, preparedness, 
response, and prevention effectiveness 
related to a center-wide public health 
scientific agenda and in quantifying 
how programs and activities promote 
cost-effective and high impact 
prevention strategies with respect to 
immunization and other vaccine 
preventable disease programs; (7) 
provides leadership (agency and center- 
wide) for vaccine preventable and 
respiratory disease surveillance to 
include guidance and coordination of 
NCIRD surveillance activities and 
systems, as well as leadership on issues 
related to internal and external 
integration of CDC surveillance 
activities; (8) coordinates, facilitates and 
integrates domestic and international 
respiratory and vaccine preventable 
disease surveillance activities through 
existing methods while developing new 
approaches, tools and analyses for these 
activities; (9) fosters a multidisciplinary 
approach to epidemiology, statistics, 
informatics, laboratory methods and 
evaluation; (10) facilitates cross-cutting 
health services research and economic 
analyses in the area of vaccine 
preventable and respiratory diseases 
and immunization programs and their 
impact on and relationships to health 
insurance reform; (11) provides 
leadership in developing a center-wide 
prevention effectiveness priority agenda 
and facilitates the development and 
ongoing implementation of integrated 
modeling activities; (12) provides 
leadership in facilitating the 
development and implementation of the 
center’s overarching influenza 
surveillance, research, and prevention 
strategy (pandemic and seasonal); and 
(13) provides leadership across the 
divisions with respect to linking 
preparedness and response elements to 
the overall influenza prevention and 
control strategy, and interfaces with 
other parts of CDC with respect to this 
strategy. 

Dated: April 19, 2011. 
James D. Seligman, 
Acting Chief Operating Officer, Centers for 
Disease Control and Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2011–10503 Filed 4–29–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4160–18–M 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Statement of Organization, Functions, 
and Delegations of Authority 

Part C (Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention) of the Statement of 

Organization, Functions, and 
Delegations of Authority of the 
Department of Health and Human 
Services (45 FR 67772–76, dated 
October 14, 1980, and corrected at 45 FR 
69296, October 20, 1980, as amended 
most recently at 76 FR 15984–15985, 
dated March 22, 2011) is amended to 
reflect the reorganization of the 
Laboratory Science, Policy, and Practice 
Program Office, Office of Surveillance, 
Epidemiology and Laboratory Services, 
Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention. 

Section C–B, Organization and 
Functions, is hereby amended as 
follows: 

Delete item (1) of the functional 
statement for Division of Laboratory 
Policy and Practice (CPGB), Laboratory 
Science, Policy, and Practice Program 
Office (CPG), and insert the following: 

(1) Ensures coordination and liaison 
with the Office of Safety, Health and 
Environment (OSHE) on laboratory 
biosafety issues as part of the larger 
Quality Management Systems for 
laboratories. 

Delete item (1) of the functional 
statement for Technology Management 
Branch (CPGBB) and insert the 
following: 

(1) Coordinates with OSHE and other 
federal partners on cross-cutting safety 
issues. 

Delete items (2), (3) and (4) of the 
functional statement for Technology 
Management Branch (CPGBB) and 
renumber the remaining items 
accordingly. 

Dated: April 15, 2011. 
Carlton Duncan, 
Acting Chief Operating Officer, Centers for 
Disease Control and Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2011–10402 Filed 4–29–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4160–18–M 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Proposed Information Collection 
Activity; Comment Request 

Title: Low Income Home Energy 
Assistance Program (LIHEAP) Carryover 
and Reallotment Report. 

OMB No.: 0970–0106. 
Description: The LIHEAP statute and 

regulations require LIHEAP grantees to 
report certain information to HHS 
concerning funds forwarded and funds 
subject to reallotment. The 1994 
reauthorization of the LIHEAP statute, 
the Human Service Amendments of 
1994 (Pub. L. 103–252), requires that the 
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