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7 18 CFR 16.25(b)(1) (2018). 

This notice sets a deadline of 120 
days from the date of this notice for 
interested applicants, other than the 
existing licensee, to file NOIs, PADs, 
and requests to use the traditional 
licensing process or alternative 
procedures. A potential applicant that 
timely files an NOI and PAD must file 
an application for a subsequent license 
no later than 18 months after the date 
on which it filed its NOI.7 

Questions concerning this notice 
should be directed to Ryan Hansen at 
(202) 502–8074 or ryan.hansen@
ferc.gov. 

Dated: May 3, 2019. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–09977 Filed 5–14–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 1904–000] 

Great River Hydro, LLC; Notice of 
Authorization for Continued Project 
Operation 

On October 31, 2012 Great River 
Hydro, LLC, licensee for the Vernon 
Hydroelectric Project, filed an 
Application for a New License pursuant 
to the Federal Power Act (FPA) and the 
Commission’s regulations thereunder. 
The Vernon Hydroelectric Project is 
located on the Connecticut River in 
Orange and Windsor counties, Vermont, 
and Grafton County, New Hampshire. 

The license for Project No. 1904 was 
issued for a period ending April 30, 
2019. Section 15(a)(1) of the FPA, 16 
U.S.C. 808(a)(1), requires the 
Commission, at the expiration of a 
license term, to issue from year-to-year 
an annual license to the then licensee 
under the terms and conditions of the 
prior license until a new license is 
issued, or the project is otherwise 
disposed of as provided in section 15 or 
any other applicable section of the FPA. 
If the project’s prior license waived the 
applicability of section 15 of the FPA, 
then, based on section 9(b) of the 
Administrative Procedure Act, 5 U.S.C. 
558(c), and as set forth at 18 CFR 
16.21(a), if the licensee of such project 
has filed an application for a subsequent 
license, the licensee may continue to 
operate the project in accordance with 
the terms and conditions of the license 
after the minor or minor part license 
expires, until the Commission acts on 

its application. If the licensee of such a 
project has not filed an application for 
a subsequent license, then it may be 
required, pursuant to 18 CFR 16.21(b), 
to continue project operations until the 
Commission issues someone else a 
license for the project or otherwise 
orders disposition of the project. 

If the project is subject to section 15 
of the FPA, notice is hereby given that 
an annual license for Project No. 1904 
is issued to the licensee for a period 
effective May1, 2019 through April 30, 
2020, or until the issuance of a new 
license for the project or other 
disposition under the FPA, whichever 
comes first. If issuance of a new license 
(or other disposition) does not take 
place on or before April 30, 2020, notice 
is hereby given that, pursuant to 18 CFR 
16.18(c), an annual license under 
section 15(a)(1) of the FPA is renewed 
automatically without further order or 
notice by the Commission, unless the 
Commission orders otherwise. 

If the project is not subject to section 
15 of the FPA, notice is hereby given 
that the licensee, Great River Hydro, 
LLC, is authorized to continue operation 
of the Vernon Hydroelectric Project 
until such time as the Commission acts 
on its application for a subsequent 
license. 

Dated: May 9, 2019. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–10048 Filed 5–14–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Filings Instituting Proceedings 

Docket Number: PR19–59–000. 
Applicants: Columbia Gas of Ohio, 

Inc. 
Description: Tariff filing per 

284.123(b),(e)/: COH Rates effective May 
1, 2019 to be effective 5/1/2019. 

Filed Date: 5/7/19. 
Accession Number: 201905075067. 
Comments/Protests Due: 5 p.m. ET 

5/28/19. 
Docket Number: PR19–60–000. 
Applicants: ONEOK WesTex 

Transmission, L.L.C. 
Description: Tariff filing per 

284.123(b),(e)/: OWT PR16–11–003 
–004 Compliance Filing to be effective 
5/1/2019. 

Filed Date: 5/7/19. 
Accession Number: 201905075127. 
Comments/Protests Due: 5 p.m. ET 

5/28/19. 
Docket Numbers: RP19–1216–000. 
Applicants: Texas Eastern 

Transmission, LP. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: 

Negotiated Rates—May 2019 Cleanup 
Filing to be effective 6/7/2019. 

Filed Date: 5/8/19. 
Accession Number: 20190508–5000. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 5/20/19. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the links or querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: May 9, 2019. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–10046 Filed 5–14–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 1892–000] 

Great River Hydro, LLC; Notice of 
Authorization for Continued Project 
Operation 

On October 31, 2012 Great River 
Hydro, LLC, licensee for the Wilder 
Hydroelectric Project, filed an 
Application for a New License pursuant 
to the Federal Power Act (FPA) and the 
Commission’s regulations thereunder. 
The Wilder Hydroelectric Project is 
located on the Connecticut River in 
Orange and Windsor counties, Vermont, 
and Grafton County, New Hampshire. 

The license for Project No. 1892 was 
issued for a period ending April 30, 
2019. Section 15(a)(1) of the FPA, 16 
U.S.C. 808(a)(1), requires the 
Commission, at the expiration of a 
license term, to issue from year-to-year 
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