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DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of Disability Employment Policy 

[OMB Number 1230–NEW] 

Solicitation for Grant Applications 
(SGA) 07–09; National Technical 
Assistance Center on Transition and 
Employment for Youth With 
Disabilities 

AGENCY: Office of Disability 
Employment Policy, Department of 
Labor. 
ACTION: Notice of correction. 

SUMMARY: Solicitation for Grant 
Applications (SGA) 07–09; National 
Technical Assistance Center on 
Transition and Employment for Youth 
with Disabilities; Notice of Correction. 

1. Subject: National Technical 
Assistance Center on Transition and 
Employment for Youth with Disabilities; 
Solicitation for Cooperative Agreement. 

2. Purpose: The Office of Disability 
Employment Policy (ODEP) announced 
a competition to fund a cooperative 
agreement to establish the National 
Technical Assistance Center on 
Transition and Employment for Youth 
with Disabilities within a 24-month 
period of performance. This solicitation 
was previously published in the Federal 
Register (72 FR 26836) on May 11, 2007. 
ODEP has since determined that 
$150,000 should be added to the total 
amount being awarded; accordingly, 
this document serves as notification that 
up to $1,850,000 is now available to 
fund this cooperative agreement. 

3. Originator: Office of Disability 
Employment Policy (ODEP). 

4. Dates: Applications must be 
mailed, hand-delivered or electronically 
sent to: U.S. Department of Labor, 
Procurement Services Center, Attention: 
Cassandra Mitchell, Reference SGA 07– 
09, Room S–4307, 200 Constitution 
Avenue, NW., Washington, DC 20210. 
Applications sent by e-mail or 
telefascimile (FAX) will not be 
accepted. The closing date for receipt of 
applications is June 25, 2007. All 
applications, including those hand- 
delivered, must be received not later 
than 4:45 p.m. (EST). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Any 
questions regarding this SGA prior to 
the closing deadline, should be directed 
to Cassandra Mitchell, Procurement 
Services Center, e-mail address: 
Mitchell.cassandra@dol.gov or at 
telephone (202) 693–4570 (note that this 
is not a toll-free number). To obtain 
further information about the Office of 
Disability Employment Policy of the 
U.S. Department of Labor, visit the DOL 
Web site of the Office of Disability 

Employment Policy at http:// 
www.dol.gov/odep. 

Signed at Washington, DC, this 12th day of 
June, 2007. 
Cassandra R. Mitchell, 
Grant Officer. 
[FR Doc. E7–11562 Filed 6–14–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4510–FK–P 

LIBRARY OF CONGRESS 

Copyright Office 

[Docket No. 2007–5] 

Cable Compulsory License: Specialty 
Station List 

AGENCY: Copyright Office, Library of 
Congress. 
ACTION: Notice of filings, request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Copyright Office is 
publishing a final list of stations listed 
in affidavits sent to the Copyright Office 
in which the owner or licensee of the 
station attests that the station qualifies 
as a specialty station in accordance with 
the Federal Communications 
Commission’s (FCC) definition of 
specialty station in effect on June 24, 
1981. Any party may file an objection to 
an owner’s claim of specialty station 
status with the Copyright Office. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before July 16, 2007. The effective 
date of the annotated list will coincide 
with the beginning of the accounting 
period that starts after the publication of 
the final list in the Federal Register. 
ADDRESSES: If hand delivered by a 
private party, the sworn affidavit should 
be brought to Room 401 of the James 
Madison Building between 8:30 a.m. 
and 5 p.m. The material should be 
addressed as follows: Office of the 
General Counsel, Library of Congress, 
James Madison Building, LM–401, 
Washington, DC, 20559–6000. 

If delivered by a commercial courier, 
the sworn affidavit must be delivered to 
the Congressional Courier Acceptance 
Site (‘‘CCAS’’) located at 2nd and D 
Streets, NE, Washington, D.C. between 
8:30 a.m. and 4 p.m. The envelope 
should be addressed as follows: Office 
of the General Counsel, U.S. Copyright 
Office, LM 401, James Madison 
Building, 101 Independence Avenue, 
SE, Washington, DC. Please note that 
CCAS will not accept delivery by means 
of overnight delivery services such as 
Federal Express, United Parcel Service 
or DHL. 

If sent by mail (including overnight 
delivery using U.S. Postal Service 
Express Mail), the sworn affidavit 

should be addressed to U.S. Copyright 
Office, Copyright GC/I&R, P.O. Box 
70400, Southwest Station, Washington, 
DC 20024. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Tanya M. Sandros, Acting General 
Counsel, P.O. Box 70977, Southwest 
Station, Washington, DC 20024–0977. 
Telephone: (202) 707–8380. Telefax: 
(202) 252–3423. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Under the 
cable compulsory license, section 111 of 
title 17, United States Code, a cable 
operator may carry the signal of a 
television station classified as a 
specialty station at the base rate rather 
than at the higher 3.75% rate that is 
incurred for the carriage of a non– 
permitted signal. 37 CFR 256.2(c). 
Specialty station status is determined by 
reference to the former regulations of 
the Federal Communications 
Commission (FCC) which defined a 
specialty station as ‘‘a commercial 
television broadcast station that 
generally carries foreign–language, 
religious, and/or automated 
programming in one–third of the hours 
of an average broadcast week and one– 
third of the weekly prime–time hours.’’ 
47 CFR 76.5(kk) (1981). The FCC no 
longer determines whether a station 
qualifies as a specialty station; however, 
the Copyright Office updates the list 
periodically, because the list remains 
relevant to the cable statutory license 
scheme. 

The Copyright Office published its 
first specialty station list in 1990 under 
a procedure which allowed the licensee 
of the station to file an affidavit with the 
Office attesting to the fact that the 
station’s 

programming comports with the 1981 
FCC definition and hence, qualifies it as 
a specialty station. At the same time, the 
Office also announced its intention to 
regularly update the list. 55 FR 40021 
(October 1, 1990). The Office’s second 
list was published in 1995. 60 FR 34303 
(June 30, 1995). Its third list was 
published in 1998. 63 FR 67703 
(December 8, 1998). 

On February 8, 2007, the Copyright 
Office published a notice asking the 
licensee, or a valid agent of the licensee, 
to file a sworn affidavit with the 
Copyright Office stating that the 
station’s programming satisfies the 
FCC’s former requirements for specialty 
station status. 72 FR 6008 (February 8, 
2007). In response to the notice, the 
Copyright Office received affidavits on 
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