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watercraft, and have a pier with a 
platform, and a gas pump; a delineated 
swim area; riprap; a drainage ditch; and 
a concrete walkway. 

l. Locations of the Application: A 
copy of the application is available for 
inspection and reproduction at the 
Commission’s Public Reference Room, 
located at 888 First Street NE, Room 2A, 
Washington, DC 20426, or by calling 
(202) 502–8371. This filing may also be 
viewed on the Commission’s web site at 
http://www.ferc.gov using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link. Enter the docket 
number excluding the last three digits in 
the docket number field to access the 
document. You may also register online 
at http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, call 1–866–208–3676 or 
email FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, for 
TTY, call (202) 502–8659. A copy is also 
available for inspection and 
reproduction at the address in item (h) 
above. Agencies may obtain copies of 
the application directly from the 
applicant. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene: Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214, 
respectively. In determining the 
appropriate action to take, the 
Commission will consider all protests or 
other comments filed, but only those 
who file a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Rules may become a party to the 
proceeding. Any comments, protests, or 
motions to intervene must be received 
on or before the specified comment date 
for the particular application. 

o. Filing and Service of Documents: 
Any filing must (1) bear in all capital 
letters the title ‘‘COMMENTS’’, 
‘‘PROTEST’’, or ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’ as applicable; (2) set forth 
in the heading the name of the applicant 
and the project number of the 
application to which the filing 
responds; (3) furnish the name, address, 
and telephone number of the person 
commenting, protesting or intervening; 
and (4) otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 385.2001 
through 385.2005. All comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
set forth their evidentiary basis. Any 
filing made by an intervenor must be 
accompanied by proof of service on all 
persons listed in the service list 

prepared by the Commission in this 
proceeding, in accordance with 18 CFR 
385.2010. 

Dated: April 23, 2019. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–08561 Filed 4–26–19; 8:45 am] 
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Michael Eisenfeld, James Neidhart, 
Jeffrey Neidhart, Steven Bair, Neil 
Tribbett, Jerry Knutson, Victoria 
Slikkerveer, Crystal Williams, The 
Coliseum, Inc., David Fosdeck, 
Stephen Ellison, Erin Hourihan, and 
Vote Solar; Notice of Petition for 
Enforcement 

Take notice that on April 19, 2019, 
pursuant to section 210(h)(2)(B) of the 
Public Utility Regulatory Policies Act of 
1978 (PURPA), Michael Eisenfeld, James 
Neidhart, Jeffrey Neidhart, Steven Bair, 
Neil Tribbett, Jerry Knutson, Victoria 
Slikkerveer, Crystal Williams, The 
Coliseum, Inc., David Fosdeck, Stephen 
Ellison, Erin Hourihan, and Vote Solar 
(together, Petitioners) filed a Petition for 
Enforcement (petition), requesting that 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission (Commission) initiate an 
enforcement action against the City of 
Farmington, New Mexico, d/b/a 
Farmington Electric Utility System to 
remedy their alleged improper 
implementation of PURPA, all as more 
fully explained in their petition. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Petitioners. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 

should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
website that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on May 10, 2019. 

Dated: April 23, 2019. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–08554 Filed 4–26–19; 8:45 am] 
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Commission Information Collection 
Activities (FERC–729); Comment 
Request; Extension 

AGENCY: Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, DOE. 
ACTION: Notice of information collection 
and request for comments. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
requirements of the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995, the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission 
(Commission or FERC) is soliciting 
public comment on the currently 
approved information collection, FERC– 
729 (Electric Transmission Facilities). 
DATES: Comments on the collection of 
information are due June 28, 2019. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments 
(identified by Docket No. IC19–21–000) 
by either of the following methods: 

• eFiling at Commission’s Website: 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
efiling.asp 

• Mail/Hand Delivery/Courier: 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
Secretary of the Commission, 888 First 
Street NE, Washington, DC 20426. 

Instructions: All submissions must be 
formatted and filed in accordance with 
submission guidelines at: http://
www.ferc.gov/help/submission- 
guide.asp. For user assistance, contact 
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