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Program information may be made 
available in languages other than 
English. Persons with disabilities who 
require alternative means of 
communication to obtain program 
information (e.g., Braille, large print, 
audiotape, American Sign Language) 
should contact the responsible Mission 
Area, agency, or staff office; the USDA 
TARGET Center at (202) 720–2600 
(voice and TTY); or the Federal Relay 
Service at (800) 877–8339. 

To file a program discrimination 
complaint, a complainant should 
complete a Form AD–3027, USDA 
Program Discrimination Complaint 
Form, which can be obtained online at 
https://www.ocio.usda.gov/document/ 
ad-3027, from any USDA office, by 
calling (866) 632–9992, or by writing a 
letter addressed to USDA. The letter 
must contain the complainant’s name, 
address, telephone number, and a 
written description of the alleged 
discriminatory action in sufficient detail 
to inform the Assistant Secretary for 
Civil Rights (ASCR) about the nature 
and date of an alleged civil rights 
violation. The completed AD–3027 form 
or letter must be submitted to USDA by: 
(1) Mail: U.S. Department of 

Agriculture, Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Civil Rights, 1400 
Independence Avenue SW, 
Washington, DC 20250–9410; 

(2) Fax: (833) 256–1665 or (202) 690– 
7442; or 

(3) Email: program.intake@usda.gov. 
USDA is an equal opportunity 

provider, employer, and lender. 

Paul Kiecker, 
Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08553 Filed 4–21–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–DM–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

Flathead Resource Advisory 
Committee 

AGENCY: Forest Service, Agriculture 
(USDA). 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Flathead Resource 
Advisory Committee (RAC) will hold a 
public meeting according to the details 
shown below. The committee is 
authorized under the Secure Rural 
Schools and Community Self- 
Determination Act (the Act) and 
operates in compliance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (FACA). The 
purpose of the committee is to improve 
collaborative relationships and to 
provide advice and recommendations to 

the Forest Service concerning projects 
and funding consistent with Title II of 
the Act as well as to make 
recommendations on recreation fee 
proposals for sites on the Flathead 
National Forest within Flathead County, 
consistent with the Federal Lands 
Recreation Enhancement Act. 
DATES: An in-person and virtual meeting 
will be held on May 25, 2023, 4:30 
p.m.–6:00 p.m. and May 31, 2023— 
4:30–6:00 p.m. Mountain Standard Time 
(MST). 

Written and Oral Comments: Anyone 
wishing to provide in-person or virtual 
oral comments must pre-register by 
11:59 p.m. MST on May 23, 2023. 
Written public comments will be 
accepted by 11:59 p.m. MST on May 23, 
2023. Comments submitted after this 
date will be provided to the Agency, but 
the Committee may not have adequate 
time to consider those comments prior 
to the meeting. 

All RAC meetings are subject to 
cancellation. For status of the meeting 
prior to attendance, please contact the 
person listed under FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT. 
ADDRESSES: This meeting will be held 
in-person and virtually at the Flathead 
National Forest Supervisor’s Office 
located at 650 Wolfpack Way, Kalispell, 
Montana 59901. The public may also 
join virtually via webcast, 
teleconference, videoconference and/or 
Homeland Security Information 
Network (HSIN) virtual meeting by 
calling 1–202–650–0124 and when 
prompted enter #497251381. RAC 
information and meeting details can be 
found at the following website: https:// 
www.fs.usda.gov/main/flathead/ 
workingtogether/advisorycommittees or 
by contacting the person listed under 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT. 

Written Comments: Written comments 
must be sent by email to ivy.gehling@
usda.gov or via mail (i.e., postmarked) 
to Ivy Gehling, 650 Wolfpack Way, 
Kalispell, Montana 59901. The Forest 
Service strongly prefers comments be 
submitted electronically. 

Oral Comments: Persons or 
organizations wishing to make oral 
comments must pre-register by 11:59 
p.m. MST, May 23, 2023, and speakers 
can only register for one speaking slot. 
Oral comments must be sent by email to 
ivy.gehling@usda.gov or via mail (i.e., 
postmarked) to Ivy Gehling, 650 
Wolfpack Way, Kalispell, MT 59901. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Tami MacKenzie, Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO), by phone at 406–758– 
5252 or email at tamara.mackenzie@
usda.gov or Ivy Gehling, RAC 

Coordinator, at 406–758–5251 or email 
at ivy.gehling@usda.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
purpose of the meeting is to: 

1. Hear from Title II project 
proponents and discuss Title II project 
proposals; 

2. Make funding recommendations on 
Title II projects; 

3. Approve meeting minutes; 
4. Schedule the next meeting; and 
5. Other. 
The agenda will include time for 

individuals to make oral statements of 
three minutes or less. Individuals 
wishing to make an oral statement 
should make a request in writing at least 
three days prior to the meeting date to 
be scheduled on the agenda. Written 
comments may be submitted to the 
Forest Service up to 14 days after the 
meeting date listed under DATES. 

Please contact the person listed under 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT, by 
or before the deadline, for all questions 
related to the meeting. All comments, 
including names and addresses when 
provided, are placed in the record and 
are available for public inspection and 
copying. The public may inspect 
comments received upon request. 

Meeting Accommodations: The 
meeting location is compliant with the 
Americans with Disabilities Act, and the 
USDA provides reasonable 
accommodation to individuals with 
disabilities where appropriate. If you are 
a person requiring reasonable 
accommodation, please make requests 
in advance for sign language 
interpretation, assistive listening 
devices, or other reasonable 
accommodation to the person listed 
under the FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT section or contact USDA’s 
TARGET Center at (202) 720–2600 
(voice and TTY) or USDA through the 
Federal Relay Service at (800) 877–8339. 
Additionally, program information may 
be made available in languages other 
than English. 

USDA programs are prohibited from 
discriminating based on race, color, 
national origin, religion, sex, gender 
identity (including gender expression), 
sexual orientation, disability, age, 
marital status, family/parental status, 
income derived from a public assistance 
program, political beliefs, or reprisal or 
retaliation for prior civil rights activity, 
in any program or activity conducted or 
funded by USDA (not all bases apply to 
all programs). Remedies and complaint 
filing deadlines vary by program or 
incident. 

Equal opportunity practices in 
accordance with USDA’s policies will 
be followed in all appointments to the 
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Committee. To ensure that the 
recommendations of the Committee 
have taken into account the needs of the 
diverse groups served by USDA, 
membership shall include to the extent 
possible, individuals with demonstrated 
ability to represent minorities, women, 
and persons with disabilities. USDA is 
an equal opportunity provider, 
employer, and lender. 

Dated: April 18, 2023. 
Cikena Reid, 
USDA Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08535 Filed 4–21–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3411–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Bureau of Industry and Security 

Materials and Equipment Technical 
Advisory Committee; Notice of 
Partially Closed Meeting 

The Materials and Equipment 
Technical Advisory Committee will 
meet on May 11, 2023, 10:00 a.m., 
Eastern Daylight Time, in the Herbert C. 
Hoover Building, Room 48019, 1401 
Constitution Avenue NW, Washington, 
DC (enter through Main Entrance on 
14th Street between Constitution and 
Pennsylvania Avenues). The Committee 
advises the Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Export Administration 
with respect to technical questions that 
affect the level of export controls 
applicable to transportation and related 
equipment or technology. 

Agenda 

Open Session 

1. Opening Remarks and Introduction 
by BIS Senior Management. 

2. Report from working groups. 
3. Report by regime representatives. 

Closed Session 

4. Discussion of matters determined to 
be exempt from the open meeting and 
public participation requirements found 
in sections 1009(a)(1) and 1009(a)(3) of 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) (5 U.S.C. 1001–1014). The 
exemption is authorized by Section 
1009(d) of the FACA, which permits the 
closure of advisory committee meetings, 
or portions thereof, if the head of the 
agency to which the advisory committee 
reports determines such meetings may 
be closed to the public in accordance 
with subsection (c) of the Government 
in the Sunshine Act (5 U.S.C. 552b(c)). 
In this case, the applicable provisions of 
5 U.S.C. 552b(c) are subsection 
552b(c)(4), which permits closure to 
protect trade secrets and commercial or 

financial information that is privileged 
or confidential, and subsection 
552b(c)(9)(B), which permits closure to 
protect information that would be likely 
to significantly frustrate implementation 
of a proposed agency action were it to 
be disclosed prematurely. The closed 
session of the meeting will involve 
committee discussions and guidance 
regarding U.S. Government strategies 
and policies. 

The open session will be accessible 
via teleconference. To join the 
conference, submit inquiries to Yvette 
Springer at Yvette.Springer@bis.doc.gov, 
no later than May 4, 2023. 

A limited number of seats will be 
available for the public session. 
Reservations are not accepted. To the 
extent time permits, members of the 
public may present oral statements to 
the Committee. The public may submit 
written statements at any time before or 
after the meeting. However, to facilitate 
distribution of public presentation 
materials to Committee members, the 
Committee suggests that presenters 
forward the public presentation 
materials prior to the meeting to Ms. 
Springer. 

The Assistant Secretary for 
Administration, with the concurrence of 
the delegate of the General Counsel, 
formally determined on April 12, 2023, 
pursuant to 5 U.S.C. 1009(d) of the 
FACA, that the portion of the meeting 
dealing with pre-decisional changes to 
the Commerce Control List and the U.S. 
export control policies shall be exempt 
from the provisions relating to public 
meetings found in 5 U.S.C. 1009(a)(1) 
and 1009(a)(3). The remaining portions 
of the meeting will be open to the 
public. 

For more information, contact Ms. 
Springer. 

Yvette Springer, 
Committee Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08540 Filed 4–21–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–JT–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Bureau of Industry and Security 

Transportation and Related Equipment 
Technical Advisory Committee; Notice 
of Partially Closed Meeting 

The Transportation and Related 
Equipment Technical Advisory 
Committee will meet on May 10, 2023, 
9:30 a.m., Eastern Standard Time, in the 
Herbert C. Hoover Building, Room 3884, 
1401 Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC (enter through Main 
Entrance on 14th Street between 
Constitution and Pennsylvania 

Avenues). The Committee advises the 
Office of the Assistant Secretary for 
Export Administration with respect to 
technical questions that affect the level 
of export controls applicable to 
transportation and related equipment or 
technology. 

Agenda 

Public Session 

1. Welcome and Introductions. 
2. Status reports by working group 

chairs. 
3. Public comments and Proposals. 

Closed Session 

4. Discussion of matters determined to 
be exempt from the open meeting and 
public participation requirements found 
in Sections 1009(a)(1) and 1009(a)(3) of 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) (5 U.S.C. 1001–1014). The 
exemption is authorized by section 
1009(d) of the FACA, which permits the 
closure of advisory committee meetings, 
or portions thereof, if the head of the 
agency to which the advisory committee 
reports determines such meetings may 
be closed to the public in accordance 
with subsection (c) of the Government 
in the Sunshine Act (5 U.S.C. 552b(c)). 
In this case, the applicable provisions of 
5 U.S.C. 552b(c) are subsection 
552b(c)(4), which permits closure to 
protect trade secrets and commercial or 
financial information that is privileged 
or confidential, and subsection 
552b(c)(9)(B), which permits closure to 
protect information that would be likely 
to significantly frustrate implementation 
of a proposed agency action were it to 
be disclosed prematurely. The closed 
session of the meeting will involve 
committee discussions and guidance 
regarding U.S. Government strategies 
and policies. 

The open session will be accessible 
via teleconference. To join the 
conference, submit inquiries to Yvette 
Springer at Yvette.Springer@bis.doc.gov, 
no later than May 3, 2023. 

A limited number of seats will be 
available for the public session. 
Reservations are not accepted. To the 
extent time permits, members of the 
public may present oral statements to 
the Committee. The public may submit 
written statements at any time before or 
after the meeting. However, to facilitate 
distribution of public presentation 
materials to Committee members, the 
Committee suggests that presenters 
forward the public presentation 
materials prior to the meeting to Ms. 
Springer. 

The Assistant Secretary for 
Administration, with the concurrence of 
the delegate of the General Counsel, 
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