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1 See Certain Frozen Warmwater Shrimp From the 
People’s Republic of China,Ecuador, India, 
Indonesia, Malaysia, Thailand, and the Socialist 
Republic of Vietnam: Initiation of Countervailing 
Duty Investigations, 78 FR 5416 (January 25, 2013) 
(Initiation Notice). 

Department of Commerce building. In 
addition, a complete version of the 
Preliminary Reconsideration 
Memorandum can be accessed directly 
on the Internet at http://www.trade.gov/ 
ia/. The signed Preliminary 
Reconsideration Memorandum and the 
electronic versions of the Preliminary 
Reconsideration Memorandum are 
identical in content. 

For the reasons detailed in the 
Preliminary Reconsideration 
Memorandum, we preliminarily 
determine that Hilltop is not the 
successor-in-interest to Yelin and is 
considered part of the PRC-wide entity. 
In making this determination we have 
relied on adverse facts available, in 
accordance with section 776(a) and (b) 
of the Tariff Act of 1930, as amended 
(‘‘the Act’’). 

Public Comment 
Any interested party may request a 

hearing within 14 days of publication of 
this notice in accordance with 19 CFR 
351.310(c). Interested parties may 
submit case briefs no later than 14 days 
after the date of publication of this 
notice, in accordance with 19 CFR 
351.309(c)(1)(ii). Rebuttal briefs, which 
must be limited to issues raised in the 
case briefs, may be filed no later than 
five days after the case briefs, in 
accordance with 19 CFR 351.309(d)(1). 
Any hearing, if requested, will normally 
be held two days after rebuttal briefs are 
due, in accordance with 19 CFR 
351.310(d)(1). 

The Department will issue its final 
results of review within 270 days after 
the date on which the preliminary 
reconsideration of this CCR is published 
in the Federal Register, or within 45 
days if all parties to the proceeding 
agree to the outcome of the review, in 
accordance with 19 CFR 351.216(e), and 
will publish these results in the Federal 
Register. 

The current requirement for a cash 
deposit of estimated antidumping duties 
on all subject merchandise will 
continue unless and until it is modified 
pursuant to the final results of this CCR. 
We note that Hilltop was determined to 
be part of the PRC-wide entity in AR6 
and is currently subject to the cash 
deposit requirements applicable to the 
PRC-wide entity. 

This notice is published in 
accordance with sections 751(b) and 
777(i) of the Act and 19 CFR 351.216. 

Dated: February 21, 2013. 
Paul Piquado, 
Assistant Secretary for Import 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2013–04550 Filed 2–22–13; 4:15 pm] 
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Certain Frozen Warmwater Shrimp 
From the People’s Republic of China, 
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Vietnam: Postponement of Preliminary 
Determinations in the Countervailing 
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AGENCY: Import Administration, 
International Trade Administration, 
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DATES: Effective Date: February 27, 
2013. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Eric 
Greynolds or Christopher Hargett, AD/ 
CVD Operations, Office 8, Import 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Commerce, Room C–100, 14th Street 
and Constitution Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20230; telephone: 202– 
482–6071 and 202–482–4161, 
respectively. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

On January 17, 2013, the Department 
of Commerce (the Department) initiated 
countervailing duty investigations of 
certain frozen warmwater shrimp from 
the People’s Republic of China, 
Ecuador, India, Indonesia, Malaysia, 
Thailand, and the Socialist Republic of 
Vietnam.1 Currently, the preliminary 
determinations are due no later than 
March 23, 2013. In the Initiation Notice, 
the Department incorrectly listed the 
case number for Certain Frozen 
Warmwater Shrimp From the People’s 
Republic of China as C–570–988; 
however, the case number should read 
C–570–989. 

Postponement of Due Date for 
Preliminary Determinations 

Section 703(b)(1) of the Tariff Act of 
1930, as amended (the Act), requires the 
Department to issue the preliminary 
determination in a countervailing duty 
investigation within 65 days after the 
date on which the Department initiated 
the investigation. However, if the 
petitioner makes a timely request for an 
extension, section 703(c)(1)(A) of the 
Act allows the Department to postpone 
making the preliminary determination 

until no later than 130 days after the 
date on which the administering 
authority initiated the investigation. 

On February 8, 2013, the Coalition of 
Gulf Shrimp Industries, the petitioner in 
these investigations, requested that the 
deadline for the preliminary 
determination in each of these cases be 
extended to 130 days from the date of 
initiation in accordance with 19 CFR 
§ 351.205(b)(2). Therefore, in 
accordance with section 703(c)(1)(A) of 
the Act, we are fully extending the due 
date for the preliminary determinations 
to no later than 130 days after the day 
on which the investigations were 
initiated. However, as that date falls on 
a federal holiday (i.e., May 27, 2013), 
the deadline for completion of the 
preliminary determinations is now May 
28, 2013, the next business day. 

This notice is issued and published 
pursuant to section 703(c)(2) of the Act. 

Dated: February 21, 2013. 
Paul Piquado, 
Assistant Secretary for Import 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2013–04577 Filed 2–26–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 
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National Institute of Standards and 
Technology 

Proposed Information Collection; 
Comment Request; Research on 
Evacuating Persons With Mobility 
Impairments 

AGENCY: National Institute of Standards 
and Technology (NIST), Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of 
Commerce, as part of its continuing 
effort to reduce paperwork and 
respondent burden, invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on 
proposed and/or continuing information 
collections, as required by the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Written comments must be 
submitted on or before April 29, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all written comments 
to Jennifer Jessup, Departmental 
Paperwork Clearance Officer, 
Department of Commerce, Room 6616, 
14th and Constitution Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20230 (or via the 
Internet at jjessup@doc.gov). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
copies of the information collection 
instrument and instructions should be 
directed to Kathryn Butler, 100 Bureau 
Drive, Mailstop 8662, Gaithersburg, MD 
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20899–8662, kathryn.butler@nist.gov, 
301–975–6673. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Abstract 
NIST’s research on elevators has 

primarily focused on the technical 
aspects of ensuring safe and reliable 
evacuation for the occupants of tall 
buildings. In addition, the International 
Code Council and the National Fire 
Protection Association provide 
requirements for the use of elevators for 
both occupant evacuation and fire 
fighter access into the building. 
However, there still is little 
understanding of how occupants use 
elevator systems during fire 
emergencies. 

The focus of this research effort is 
two-fold: (1) To gain an understanding 
of how building occupants with 
mobility impairments currently 
evacuate multi-story buildings in the 
United States during fire emergencies, 
and (2) to learn about the concerns of 
persons with mobility impairments on 
using elevators during fire evacuations. 
This research aims to provide guidance 
to designers and building managers on 
aspects of fire evacuation that concern 
occupants with mobility impairments 
and on how to improve elevator design 
and usage during fire emergencies. The 
research includes four opportunities for 
participation: 

(a) Building managers and designated 
safety personnel from a sample of four 
to ten existing and new federal high-rise 
buildings in the United States will be 
contacted to fill out a questionnaire 
requesting information on the 
emergency plans and procedures for the 
building, including how the buildings’ 
evacuation plans incorporate the use of 
the existing elevator system to evacuate 
occupants with mobility impairments 
during fire emergencies. The building 
emergency plan will be requested from 
either the General Services 
Administration (GSA) or from the 
building manager. 

(b) Occupants with mobility 
impairments in the buildings identified 
in part (a) will be asked for basic 
information on their mobility with 
regard to evacuation, previous 
evacuation experiences, and preferences 
on how to evacuate during a fire 
emergency. At the end of the 
questionnaire, they will be invited to 
participate in a one-on-one interview to 
discuss these issues in more detail. 

(c) Occupants with mobility 
impairments identified in part (b) will 
participate in a one-on-one interview 
requesting more detailed information on 
previous evacuation experiences, 
awareness of emergency procedures, 

and views and preferences on using an 
elevator to evacuate during a fire 
emergency. 

(d) Professionals involved with 
emergency planning (e.g., GSA, USDA, 
DHS, building emergency managers, 
researchers) and building occupants 
with mobility impairments, if willing, 
will be invited to participate in one of 
two focus groups. A preliminary 
analysis of the data resulting from parts 
(a) through (c) will be summarized in 
the form of two sets of potential plans 
for the use of elevators during fire 
evacuation by occupants with mobility 
impairments: One for existing buildings 
and one for new buildings. Members of 
the focus groups will review both of 
these potential plans. They will then 
participate in a discussion that will lead 
to guidance for designers and building 
managers on aspects of fire evacuation 
that concern occupants with mobility 
impairments and on how to improve 
elevator design and usage during fire 
emergencies. The order of the 
discussion of plans for existing and new 
buildings will be switched for the two 
focus groups to ensure that each plan 
receives the same amount of attention 
overall. 

II. Method of Collection 
The data from questionnaire (a) will 

be collected electronically. The 
questionnaire will be made available on 
a secured Web site and the link to this 
Web site will be distributed by NIST 
staff to building property managers and 
designated safety personnel. 

The data from questionnaire (b) will 
be collected electronically. The 
questionnaire will be made available on 
a secured Web site and the link to this 
Web site will be distributed by NIST 
staff to occupants with mobility 
impairments in the buildings identified 
in part (a). 

The data from the one-on-one 
interviews will be audiotaped if 
permission is granted or recorded in 
written notes if not. Participants will 
identify their interest in the 
questionnaire from part (b). Each 
interview will be conducted by a 
member of the NIST research team at 
the participant’s workplace or by phone. 

The data from the focus groups will 
be audio taped and recorded in written 
notes. Professionals involved with 
emergency planning (e.g., GSA, USDA, 
DHS, building emergency managers, 
researchers) and building occupants 
with mobility impairments, if willing, 
will be invited to participate. 

III. Data 
OMB Control Number: None. 
Form Number: None. 

Type of Review: Regular submission 
(new information collection). 

Affected Public: Collections (a) and 
(d): Selected individuals, such as 
building managers and designated safety 
personnel, who are familiar with or in 
charge of developing emergency 
procedures for multi-story buildings in 
the United States, including both federal 
and private sector buildings; Collections 
(b) and (c): Selected high-rise building 
occupants with mobility impairments. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
180. 

Estimated Time per Response: 
Surveys, 15 minutes; Interviews, 2 
hours; and Focus groups, 2 hours. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 168. 

Estimated Total Annual Cost to 
Public: $0. 

IV. Request for Comments 

Comments are invited on: (a) Whether 
the proposed collection of information 
is necessary for the proper performance 
of the functions of the agency, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden 
(including hours and cost) of the 
proposed collection of information; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on respondents, including through the 
use of automated collection techniques 
or other forms of information 
technology. 

Comments submitted in response to 
this notice will be summarized and/or 
included in the request for OMB 
approval of this information collection; 
they also will become a matter of public 
record. 

Dated: February 21, 2013. 
Gwellnar Banks, 
Management Analyst, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2013–04491 Filed 2–26–13; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 
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Administration 
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New England Fishery Management 
Council; Public Meeting 

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce 
ACTION: Notice; public meeting. 
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