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SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a 
summary of the Commission’s 
document DA 07–3512, released August 
3, 2007, in CG Docket No. 03–123. 
Pursuant to §§ 1.415 and 1.419 of the 
Commission’s rules, 47 CFR 1.415, 
1.419, interested parties may file 
comments and reply comments on or 
before the dates indicated on the first 
page of this document. Comments may 
be filed using: (1) The Commission’s 
Electronic Comment Filing System 
(ECFS), (2) the Federal Government’s 
eRulemaking Portal, or (3) by filing 
paper copies. See Electronic Filing of 
Documents in Rulemaking Proceedings, 
63 FR 24121, May 1, 1998. 

• Electronic Filers: Filings may be 
filed electronically using the Internet by 
accessing the ECFS: http://www.fcc.gov/ 
cgb/ecfs/ or the Federal eRulemaking 
Portal: http://www.regulations.gov. 
Filers should follow the instructions 
provided on the Web site for submitting 
electronic filings. 

• For ECFS filers, if multiple docket 
or rulemaking numbers appear in the 
caption of this proceeding, filers must 
transmit one electronic copy of the 
filing for each docket or rulemaking 
number referenced in the caption. In 
completing the transmittal screen, filers 
should include their full name, U.S. 
Postal Service mailing address, and the 
applicable docket or rulemaking 
number, which in this instance is CG 
Docket No. 03–123. Parties may also 
submit an electronic filing by Internet e- 
mail. To get filing instructions, filers 
should send an e-mail to ecfs@fcc.gov, 
and include the following words in the 
body of the message, ‘‘get form <your e- 
mail address>.’’ A sample form and 
directions will be sent in response. 

• Paper Filers: Parties who choose to 
file by paper must file an original and 
four copies of each filing. If more than 
one docket or rulemaking number 
appears in the caption in this 
proceeding, filers must submit two 
additional copies of each additional 
docket or rulemaking number. 

• Filings can be sent by hand or 
messenger delivery, by commercial 
overnight courier, or by first-class or 
overnight U.S. Postal Service mail 
(although the Commission continues to 
experience delays in receiving U.S. 
Postal Service mail). All filings must be 
addressed to the Commission’s 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary, 
Federal Communications Commission. 

• The Commission’s contractor will 
receive hand-delivered or messenger- 
delivered paper filings for the 
Commission’s Secretary at 236 
Massachusetts Avenue, NE., Suite 110, 
Washington, DC 20002. The filing hours 
at this location are 8 a.m. to 7 p.m. All 

hand deliveries must be held together 
with rubber bands or fasteners. Any 
envelopes must be disposed of before 
entering the building. 

• Commercial mail sent by overnight 
mail (other than U.S. Postal Service 
Express Mail and Priority Mail) must be 
sent to 9300 East Hampton Drive, 
Capitol Heights, MD 20743. 

• U.S. Postal Service first-class, 
Express, and Priority mail should be 
addressed to 445 12th Street, SW., 
Washington, DC 20554. 

A copy of document DA 07–3512 and 
any subsequently file documents in this 
matter will be available during regular 
business hours at the FCC Reference 
Center, Portals II, 445 12th Street, SW., 
Room CY–A257, Washington, DC 20554, 
(202) 418–0270. Document DA 07–3512 
and any subsequently filed documents 
in this matter may also be purchased 
from the Commission’s duplicating 
contractor at their Web site, http:// 
www.bcpiweb.com, or call (800) 378– 
3160. A copy of DA 07–3512 and any 
subsequently filed documents in this 
matter may also be found by searching 
the Commission’s Electronic Comment 
Filing System (ECFS) at http:// 
www.fcc.gov.cgb/ecfs (insert CG Docket 
No. 03–123 into the Proceeding block). 

To request materials in accessible 
formats for people with disabilities 
(Braille, large print, electronic files, 
audio format), send an e-mail to 
fcc504@fcc.gov or call the Consumer & 
Governmental Affairs Bureau at (202) 
418–0530 (voice), (202) 418–0432 
(TTY). 

Synopsis 
The Commission seeks comment on 

the Petition for Declaratory Ruling and 
Complaint Concerning the Provision of 
Video Relay Service by Sorenson 
Communications, Inc., CG Docket 03– 
123, filed May 18, 2007, by five VRS 
providers: Hands On Video Relay 
Services, Inc., Communications Services 
for the Deaf VRS, LLC, Snap 
Telecommunications, Inc., GoAmerica, 
Inc., and Communication Access Center 
for the Deaf and Hard of Hearing 
(Petitioners). Petitioners claim that 
Sorenson’s alleged employment contract 
clause that VRS Communications 
Assistants may not work with other 
similar entities for one year after 
employment at Sorenson is contrary to 
the public interest and therefore should 
be prohibited. 

Federal Communications Commission. 
Nicole McGinnis, 
Deputy Chief, Consumer & Governmental 
Affairs Bureau. 
[FR Doc. E7–16158 Filed 8–15–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request 

AGENCY: Federal Maritime Commission. 
ACTION: Final notice of submission for 
OMB review. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Federal Maritime Commission (FMC or 
Commission) hereby gives notice that it 
has submitted to the Office of 
Management and Budget a request for a 
revision of an approved information 
collection regarding the licensing of 
ocean transportation intermediaries, as 
listed below. 
DATES: Written comments on this final 
notice must be submitted on or before 
September 17, 2007. 
ADDRESSES: Comments should be 
addressed to: Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget, Attention: 
Desk Officer for Federal Maritime 
Commission, 725 17th Street, NW., 
Washington, DC 20503, 
OIRA_Submission@OMB.EOP.GOV or 
fax (202) 395–5806, and to Peter J. King, 
Director, Office of Administration, 
Federal Maritime Commission, 800 
North Capitol Street, NW., Washington, 
DC 20573, (Telephone: (202) 523–5800), 
administration@fmc.gov. Please 
reference the information collection’s 
title and OMB number in your 
comments. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
obtain additional information, copies of 
the information collection and 
instructions, or copies of any comments 
received, contact Jane Gregory, 
Management Analyst, Office of 
Administration, Federal Maritime 
Commission, 800 North Capitol Street, 
NW., Washington, DC 20573, 
(Telephone: (202) 523–5800), 
jgregory@fmc.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: A notice 
that FMC would be submitting this 
request was published in the Federal 
Register on June 8, 2007, allowing for a 
60-day comment period. No comments 
were received. 

The FMC hereby informs potential 
respondents that an agency may not 
conduct or sponsor, and that a person is 
not required to respond to, a collection 
of information unless it displays a 
currently valid OMB control number. 

Information Collection Open for 
Comment 

Title: 46 CFR 515—Licensing, 
Financial Responsibility Requirements 
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and General Duties for Ocean 
Transportation Intermediaries and 
Related Forms. 

OMB Approval Number: 3072–0018 
(Expires August 31, 2007). 

Abstract: Section 19 of the Shipping 
Act of 1984 (the ‘‘Act’’), 46 U.S.C. 
40901–40904 (2006), as modified by 
Public Law 105–258 (The Ocean 
Shipping Reform Act of 1998) and 
section 424 of Pub. L. 105–383 (The 
Coast Guard Authorization Act of 1998), 
provides that no person in the United 
States may act as an ocean 
transportation intermediary (OTI) unless 
that person holds a license issued by the 
Commission. The Commission shall 
issue an OTI license to any person that 
the Commission determines to be 
qualified by experience and character to 
act as an OTI. Further, no person may 
act as an OTI unless that person 
furnishes a bond, proof of insurance or 
other surety in a form and amount 
determined by the Commission to 
ensure financial responsibility. The 
Commission has implemented the 
provisions of section 19 in regulations 
contained in 46 CFR 515, including 
financial responsibility forms FMC–48, 
FMC–67, FMC–68, and FMC–69, 
Optional Rider Forms FMC–48A and 
FMC–69A, and its related license 
application form, FMC–18. 

Current Actions: The Commission 
intends to revise Form FMC–18, 
Application for a License as an Ocean 
Transportation Intermediary. 
Specifically, language is being added to 
the Privacy Act Notice regarding 
voluntary disclosure of the applicant’s 
Social Security Number, and the System 
of Records citation is being updated. In 
the Paperwork Reduction Act Notice, 
the estimated time to prepare an 
Application is being revised from 1.5 
hours per response to 2 hours. 
Throughout the Application, any 
reference to the Bureau of Consumer 
Complaints and Licensing (‘‘BCCL’’) has 
been changed to the Bureau of 
Certification and Licensing (‘‘BCL’’). 
Also, language has been added to 
Question 7(2) in Part B, and to Question 
13(3) in Part D, allowing applicant or its 
qualifying individual to disclose 
whether he/she has ‘‘been declared 
bankrupt, been subject to a tax lien, or 
had legal judgment rendered for a debt.’’ 
In accordance with the Privacy Act of 
1974, this would allow the agency, to 
the greatest extent practicable, to collect 
information about an applicant that may 
be used in making a decision with 
respect to the granting of an OTI license, 
directly from the applicant. 

Type of Review: Revision to an 
approved information collection. 

Needs and Uses: The Commission 
uses information obtained under this 
part and through Form FMC–18 to 
determine the qualifications of OTIs and 
their compliance with shipping statutes 
and regulations and to enable the 
Commission to discharge its duties 
under the Act by ensuring that OTIs 
maintain acceptable evidence of 
financial responsibility. If the collection 
of information were not conducted, 
there would be no basis upon which the 
Commission could determine if 
applicants are qualified for licensing. 

Frequency: This information is 
collected when applicants apply for a 
license or when existing licensees 
change certain information in their 
application forms. 

Type of Respondents: The 
respondents are persons desiring to 
obtain a license to act as an OTI. Under 
the Act, OTIs may be either an ocean 
freight forwarder, a non-vessel-operating 
common carrier, or both. 

Number of Annual Respondents: The 
Commission estimates a potential 
annual respondent universe of 4,765 
entities. 

Estimated Time Per Response: The 
time per response for completing 
Application Form FMC–18 averages 2 
hours. The time to complete a financial 
responsibility form averages 20 minutes. 

Total Annual Burden: The 
Commission estimates the total annual 
person-hour burden at 3,596 person- 
hours. 

Bryant L. VanBrakle, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E7–16064 Filed 8–15–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6730–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

[Document Identifier: OS–0990–New] 

Agency Information Collection 
Request; 60-Day Public Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: Office of the Secretary, HHS. 
ACTION: Agency Information Collection 
Request. 60-Day Public Comment 
Request. 

In compliance with the requirement 
of section 3506(c)(2)(A) of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Office of the Secretary (OS), Department 
of Health and Human Services, is 
publishing the following summary of a 
proposed information collection request 
for public comment. Interested persons 
are invited to send comments regarding 
this burden estimate or any other aspect 
of this collection of information, 

including any of the following subjects: 
(1) The necessity and utility of the 
proposed information collection for the 
proper performance of the agency’s 
functions; (2) the accuracy of the 
estimated burden; (3) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (4) the 
use of automated collection techniques 
or other forms of information 
technology to minimize the information 
collection burden. To obtain copies of 
the supporting statement and any 
related forms for the proposed 
paperwork collections referenced above, 
e-mail your request, including your 
address, phone number, OMB number, 
and OS document identifier, to 
Sherette.funncoleman@hhs.gov, or call 
the Reports Clearance Office on (202) 
690–6162. Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collections must be 
received within 60-days, and directed to 
the OS Paperwork. 

Proposed Project 
Meeting Request Routing System for 

MedicalCountermeasures.gov—New— 
Office of the Assistant Secretary for 
Preparedness and Response (ASPR)— 
Office of the Biomedical Advanced 
Research and Development Authority 
(BARDA). 

Both naturally occurring and 
intentional public health threats have 
the potential to cause catastrophic harm 
in a variety of ways, including economic 
repercussions and adverse effects on 
health, in some cases leading to loss of 
life. To meet these challenges, federal 
government encourages open 
communication with its stakeholders in 
the research and development 
communities and in industry. One 
method of improving this 
communication will be through the 
MedicalCountermeasures.gov Web site. 
The two key functions of the 
MedicalCountermeasures.gov Web site 
will be (1) to centrally manage 
stakeholder requests for meetings with 
government to present product 
information related to medical 
countermeasures against public health 
disasters, both manmade and naturally 
occurring; and (2) to provide our 
stakeholders in industry and academia 
with information on government 
sponsored opportunities and events 
related to medical countermeasures. 

In order to route product developers 
to the most appropriate personnel 
within the Department of Health and 
Human Services (HHS), HHS will 
collect some basic information about the 
company’s product through 
MedicalCountermeasures.gov. Using 
this information and a routing system 
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