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Reconsideration Investigations 

The following are reconsideration 
investigations following the receipt of a 

properly filed application for 
reconsideration. 

TA–W No. Workers’ firm Location Investigation 
start date 

96803 ........... Wabtec Corporation ...................................................... Wilmerding, PA .............................................................. 6/10/2021 

A record of these investigations and 
petitions filed are available, subject to 
redaction, on the Department’s website 
https://www.dol.gov/agencies/eta/ 
tradeact under the searchable listing or 
by calling the Office of Trade 
Adjustment Assistance toll free at 888– 
365–6822. 

Signed at Washington, DC, this 7th day of 
2021. 
Hope D. Kinglock, 
Certifying Officer, Office of Trade Adjustment 
Assistance. 
[FR Doc. 2021–16297 Filed 7–29–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–FN–P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice (21–047)] 

Notice of Intent To Grant a Partially 
Exclusive License 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration. 
ACTION: Notice of intent to grant a 
partially exclusive patent license. 

SUMMARY: NASA hereby gives notice of 
its intent to grant a partially exclusive 
patent license in the United States to 
practice the invention described and 
claimed in U.S. Patent Application 
Number 16/503,663 titled ‘‘Bistable 
Collapsible Tubular Mast Boom’’ to 
MMA Design, LLC, having its principal 
place of business in Louisville, CO. The 
fields of use shall mean the production 
and supply of deployable space 
structures or structural components for 
deployable space structures. NASA has 
not yet made a determination to grant 
the requested license and may deny the 
requested license even if no objections 
are submitted within the comment 
period. 

DATES: The prospective partially 
exclusive license may be granted unless 
NASA receives written objections 
including evidence and argument, no 
later than August 16, 2021 that establish 
that the grant of the license would not 
be consistent with the requirements 
regarding the licensing of federally 
owned inventions as set forth in the 
Bayh-Dole Act and implementing 

regulations. Competing applications 
completed and received by NASA no 
later than August 16, 2021 will also be 
treated as objections to the grant of the 
contemplated partially exclusive 
license. Objections submitted in 
response to this notice will not be made 
available to the public for inspection 
and, to the extent permitted by law, will 
not be released under the Freedom of 
Information Act. 
ADDRESSES: Objections relating to the 
prospective license may be submitted to 
Patent Counsel, Office of the General 
Counsel, NASA Langley Research 
Center, Phone (757) 864–3221. Email: 
robin.w.edwards@nasa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
notice of intent to grant a partially 
exclusive patent license is issued in 
accordance with 35 U.S.C. 209(e) and 37 
CFR 404.7(a)(1)(i). The patent rights in 
this invention have been assigned to the 
United States of America as represented 
by the Administrator of the National 
Aeronautics and Space Administration. 
The prospective partially exclusive 
license will comply with the 
requirements of 35 U.S.C. 209 and 37 
CFR 404.7. 

Information about other NASA 
inventions available for licensing can be 
found online at http://
technology.nasa.gov. 

Helen M. Galus, 
Agency Counsel for Intellectual Property. 
[FR Doc. 2021–16335 Filed 7–29–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–13–P 

NATIONAL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS 
ADMINISTRATION 

[NARA–21–0009; NARA–2021–036] 

Records Schedules; Availability and 
Request for Comments 

AGENCY: National Archives and Records 
Administration (NARA). 
ACTION: Notice of availability of 
proposed records schedules; request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The National Archives and 
Records Administration (NARA) 
publishes notice of certain Federal 
agency requests for records disposition 

authority (records schedules). We 
publish notice in the Federal Register 
and on regulations.gov for records 
schedules in which agencies propose to 
dispose of records they no longer need 
to conduct agency business. We invite 
public comments on such records 
schedules. 

DATES: NARA must receive comments 
by September 13, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments 
by the following method. You must cite 
the control number, which appears on 
the records schedule in parentheses 
after the name of the agency that 
submitted the schedule. 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Due to COVID–19 
building closures, we are currently 
temporarily not accepting comments by 
mail. However, if you are unable to 
comment via regulations.gov, you may 
contact request.schedule@nara.gov for 
instructions on submitting your 
comment. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Kimberly Keravuori, Regulatory and 
External Policy Program Manager, by 
email at regulation_comments@
nara.gov. For information about records 
schedules, contact Records Management 
Operations by email at 
request.schedule@nara.gov, by mail at 
the address above, or by phone at 301– 
837–1799. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Public Comment Procedures 

We are publishing notice of records 
schedules in which agencies propose to 
dispose of records they no longer need 
to conduct agency business. We invite 
public comments on these records 
schedules, as required by 44 U.S.C. 
3303a(a), and list the schedules at the 
end of this notice by agency and 
subdivision requesting disposition 
authority. 

In addition, this notice lists the 
organizational unit(s) accumulating the 
records or states that the schedule has 
agency-wide applicability. It also 
provides the control number assigned to 
each schedule, which you will need if 
you submit comments on that schedule. 
We have uploaded the records 
schedules and accompanying appraisal 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 17:24 Jul 29, 2021 Jkt 253001 PO 00000 Frm 00100 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\30JYN1.SGM 30JYN1lo
tte

r 
on

 D
S

K
11

X
Q

N
23

P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

1

https://www.dol.gov/agencies/eta/tradeact
https://www.dol.gov/agencies/eta/tradeact
mailto:regulation_comments@nara.gov
mailto:regulation_comments@nara.gov
http://technology.nasa.gov
http://technology.nasa.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
mailto:request.schedule@nara.gov
mailto:request.schedule@nara.gov
mailto:robin.w.edwards@nasa.gov


41102 Federal Register / Vol. 86, No. 144 / Friday, July 30, 2021 / Notices 

memoranda to the regulations.gov 
docket for this notice as ‘‘other’’ 
documents. Each records schedule 
contains a full description of the records 
at the file unit level as well as their 
proposed disposition. The appraisal 
memorandum for the schedule includes 
information about the records. 

We will post comments, including 
any personal information and 
attachments, to the public docket 
unchanged. Because comments are 
public, you are responsible for ensuring 
that you do not include any confidential 
or other information that you or a third 
party may not wish to be publicly 
posted. If you want to submit a 
comment with confidential information 
or cannot otherwise use the 
regulations.gov portal, you may contact 
request.schedule@nara.gov for 
instructions on submitting your 
comment. 

We will consider all comments 
submitted by the posted deadline and 
consult as needed with the Federal 
agency seeking the disposition 
authority. After considering comments, 
we will post on regulations.gov a 
‘‘Consolidated Reply’’ summarizing the 
comments, responding to them, and 
noting any changes we have made to the 
proposed records schedule. We will 
then send the schedule for final 
approval by the Archivist of the United 
States. You may elect at regulations.gov 
to receive updates on the docket, 
including an alert when we post the 
Consolidated Reply, whether or not you 
submit a comment. If you have a 
question, you can submit it as a 
comment, and can also submit any 
concerns or comments you would have 
to a possible response to the question. 
We will address these items in 
consolidated replies along with any 
other comments submitted on that 
schedule. 

We will post schedules on our 
website in the Records Control Schedule 
(RCS) Repository, at https://
www.archives.gov/records-mgmt/rcs, 
after the Archivist approves them. The 
RCS contains all schedules approved 
since 1973. 

Background 
Each year, Federal agencies create 

billions of records. To control this 
accumulation, agency records managers 
prepare schedules proposing retention 
periods for records and submit these 
schedules for NARA’s approval. Once 
approved by NARA, records schedules 
provide mandatory instructions on what 
happens to records when no longer 
needed for current Government 
business. The records schedules 
authorize agencies to preserve records of 

continuing value in the National 
Archives or to destroy, after a specified 
period, records lacking continuing 
administrative, legal, research, or other 
value. Some schedules are 
comprehensive and cover all the records 
of an agency or one of its major 
subdivisions. Most schedules, however, 
cover records of only one office or 
program or a few series of records. Many 
of these update previously approved 
schedules, and some include records 
proposed as permanent. 

Agencies may not destroy Federal 
records without the approval of the 
Archivist of the United States. The 
Archivist grants this approval only after 
thorough consideration of the records’ 
administrative use by the agency of 
origin, the rights of the Government and 
of private people directly affected by the 
Government’s activities, and whether or 
not the records have historical or other 
value. Public review and comment on 
these records schedules is part of the 
Archivist’s consideration process. 

Schedules Pending 

1. Department of Health and Human 
Services, Administration for Children 
and Families, Records of the National 
Responsible Fatherhood Clearinghouse 
website (DAA–0292–2019–0006). 

2. Department of Health and Human 
Services, Administration for Children 
and Families, Records of the NRFC 
Virtual Collaborative Community 
website (DAA–0292–2019–0010). 

3. Department of Health and Human 
Services, Agency for Healthcare 
Research and Quality, CAHPS and SOPs 
Surveys (DAA–0510–2019–0002). 

4. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Aviation Administration, Flight 
Operation Management System-Flight 
Inspection Airborne Processor 
Application (DAA–0237–2020–0008). 

5. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Aviation Administration, 
Aviation Environmental Design Tool 
(DAA–0237–2020–0023). 

6. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Aviation Administration, Flight 
Service for the 21st Century (DAA– 
0237–2020–0027). 

7. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Aviation Administration, Flight 
Activity and Crew Tracking System 
(DAA–0237–2020–0029). 

8. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Aviation Administration, Flight 
Program Aircraft Management System 
(DAA–0237–2021–0005). 

9. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Aviation Administration, 
Compliance Actions (DAA–0237–2021– 
0010). 

10. Department of Transportation, 
Federal Aviation Administration, Air 

Traffic Organization Voluntary Safety 
Reporting Programs (DAA–0237–2021– 
0019). 

11. Consumer Financial Protection 
Bureau, Office of Consumer Response, 
Consumer Response System 2.0 Records 
(DAA–0587–2021–0002). 

12. Court Services and Offender 
Supervision Agency, Pretrial Service 
Agency, Pretrial Automated Records 
and Information System (DAA–0562– 
2021–0001). 

13. Federal Communications 
Commission, Media Bureau, 
Transaction Documents (DAA–0173– 
2020–0005). 

14. National Security Commission on 
Artificial Intelligence, Agency-wide, 
Commission Records (DAA–0220–2021– 
0003). 

15. Peace Corps, Agency-wide, 
Fingerprint Cards (DAA–0490–2021– 
0001). 

Laurence Brewer, 
Chief Records Officer for the U.S. 
Government. 
[FR Doc. 2021–16210 Filed 7–29–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7515–01–P 

NATIONAL FOUNDATION ON THE 
ARTS AND THE HUMANITIES 

National Endowment for the Arts 

Subject 60-Day Notice for the 
‘‘Participant Outcomes Survey for the 
Creative Forces®: NEA Military Healing 
Arts Network Community Arts 
Engagement Subgranting Program;’’ 
Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: National Endowment for the 
Arts, National Foundation on the Arts 
and the Humanities. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The National Endowment for 
the Arts (NEA), as part of its continuing 
effort to reduce paperwork and 
respondent burden, conducts a 
preclearance consultation program to 
provide the general public and federal 
agencies with an opportunity to 
comment on proposed and/or 
continuing collections of information in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. This program 
helps to ensure that requested data is 
provided in the desired format; 
reporting burden (time and financial 
resources) is minimized; collection 
instruments are clearly understood; and 
the impact of collection requirements on 
respondents is properly assessed. 
Currently, the National Endowment for 
the Arts is soliciting comments 
concerning the proposed information 
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