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impact the change will have on project 
outcomes. Also, a budget request may 
require documentation showing that 
materials were more expensive than 
originally budgeted and substitutes were 
not available. Upon receiving an 
amendment request, the EDA engineer/ 
construction manager assigned to the 
project will evaluate the request and 
determine what type of documentation 
is required. The EDA engineer/ 
construction manager will then 
communicate this to the recipient. 

Affected Public: Current recipients of 
EDA assistance, to include (1) cities or 
other political subdivisions of a state, 
including a special purpose unit of state 
or local government engaged in 
economic or infrastructure development 
activities, or a consortium of political 
subdivisions; (2) states; (3) institutions 
of higher education or a consortium of 
institutions of higher education; (4) 
public or private non-profit 
organizations or associations; (5) District 
Organizations; and (6) Indian Tribes or 
a consortia of Indian Tribes; and (7) (for 
training, research, and technical 
assistance awards only) individuals and 
for profit businesses. 

Frequency: Annually. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Required to 

obtain or retain benefits. 
OMB Desk Officer: Nicholas Fraser, 

(202) 395–5887. 
Copies of the above information 

collection proposal can be obtained by 
calling or writing Jennifer Jessup, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance 
Officer, (202) 482–0336, Department of 
Commerce, Room 6616, 14th and 
Constitution Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20230 (or via the Internet at 
JJessup@doc.gov). 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to Nicholas Fraser, OMB Desk 
Officer, FAX number (202) 395–7285, or 
via the Internet at 
Nicholas_A._Fraser@omb.eop.gov. 

Dated: July 17, 2012. 
Gwellnar Banks, 
Management Analyst, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2012–17669 Filed 7–19–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–34–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for clearance the 
following proposal for collection of 

information under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (44 U.S.C. 
Chapter 35). 

Agency: Economic Development 
Administration (EDA). 

Title: Property Management. 
OMB Control Number: 0610–0103. 
Form Number(s): None. 
Type of Request: Regular submission 

(extension of a currently approved 
information collection). 

Number of Respondents: 150. 
Average Hours Per Response: 2 hours 

and 45 minutes. 
Burden Hours: 413. 
Needs and Uses: A recipient must 

submit a written request for EDA’s 
approval to undertake an incidental use 
of property acquired or improved with 
EDA investment assistance (see 13 CFR 
314.3 of EDA regulations). This 
collection of information allows EDA to 
determine whether an incidental use of 
property acquired or improved with 
EDA investment assistance is 
appropriate. An incidental use of 
property: (1) Does not interfere with the 
scope of the project or the economic 
purpose for which the investment was 
made; (2) provided that the recipient is 
in compliance with applicable law and 
the terms and conditions of the 
investment assistance, and (3) the 
incidental use of the property will not 
violate the terms and conditions of the 
investment assistance or otherwise 
adversely affect the economic useful life 
of the property. Eligible applicants and 
recipients should contact the 
appropriate regional office (whose 
contact information is available via the 
Internet at http://www.eda.gov) for 
guidelines on obtaining approval for 
incidental use of property. If a recipient 
wishes for EDA to release its real 
property or tangible personal property 
interests before the expiration of the 
property’s estimated useful life, the 
recipient must submit a written request 
to EDA and disclose the intended future 
use of the real property or the tangible 
personal property for which the release 
is requested (see 13 CFR 314.10 of 
EDA’s regulations). This collection of 
information allows EDA to determine 
whether to release its real property or 
tangible personal property interests. 

Affected Public: Current or past 
recipients of EDA construction (Public 
Works or Economic Adjustment) 
assistance, to include (1) cities or other 
political subdivisions of a state, 
including a special purpose unit of state 
or local government engaged in 
economic or infrastructure development 
activities, or a consortium of political 
subdivisions; (2) states; (3) institutions 
of higher education or a consortium of 
institutions of higher education; (4) 

public or private non-profit 
organizations or associations; (5) District 
Organizations; and (6) Indian Tribes or 
a consortia of Indian Tribes. 

Frequency: On occasion. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Required to 

obtain or retain benefits. 
OMB Desk Officer: Nicholas Fraser, 

(202) 395–5887. 
Copies of the above information 

collection proposal can be obtained by 
calling or writing Jennifer Jessup, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance 
Officer, (202) 482–0336, Department of 
Commerce, Room 6616, 14th and 
Constitution Avenue NW, Washington, 
DC 20230 (or via the Internet at 
JJessup@doc.gov). 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to Nicholas Fraser, OMB Desk 
Officer, FAX number (202) 395–7285, or 
via the Internet at 
Nicholas_A._Fraser@omb.eop.gov. 

Dated: July 17, 2012. 
Gwellnar Banks, 
Management Analyst, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2012–17670 Filed 7–19–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–34–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

[A–475–828, A–557–809, A–565–801] 

Stainless Steel Butt-Weld Pipe Fittings 
From Italy, Malaysia, and the 
Philippines: Continuation of 
Antidumping Duty Orders 

AGENCY: Import Administration, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 
SUMMARY: As a result of the 
determinations by the Department of 
Commerce and the U.S. International 
Trade Commission that revocation of 
the antidumping duty orders on 
stainless steel butt-weld pipe fittings 
(butt-weld pipe fittings) from Italy, 
Malaysia, and the Philippines would 
likely lead to continuation or recurrence 
of dumping and material injury to an 
industry in the United States, the 
Department of Commerce is publishing 
a notice of continuation of these 
antidumping duty orders. 
DATES: Effective Date: July 20, 2012. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Dena Crossland or Angelica Mendoza, 
AD/CVD Operations Office 7, Import 
Administration, International Trade 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Commerce, 14th Street and Constitution 
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