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is to make these submissions available
for public viewing at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are
received without change, including any
personal identifiers or contact
information.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: A
copy of this ICR with applicable
supporting documentation, may be
obtained by contacting the Retirement
Services Publications Team, Office of
Personnel Management, 1900 E Street
NW, Room 3316-L, Washington, DC
20415, Attention: Cyrus S. Benson, or
sent via electronic mail to
Cyrus.Benson@opm.gov or faxed to
(202) 606—0910 or via telephone at (202)
606—4808.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: As
required by the Paperwork Reduction
Act of 1995 (Pub. L. 104-13, 44 U.S.C.
chapter 35) as amended by the Clinger-
Cohen Act (Pub. L. 104-106), OPM is
soliciting comments for this collection
(OMB No. 3206—-0228). The Office of
Management and Budget is particularly
interested in comments that:

1. Evaluate whether the proposed
collection of information is necessary
for the proper performance of functions
of the agency, including whether the
information will have practical utility;

2. Evaluate the accuracy of the
agency’s estimate of the burden of the
proposed collection of information,
including the validity of the
methodology and assumptions used;

3. Enhance the quality, utility, and
clarity of the information to be
collected; and

4. Minimize the burden of the
collection of information on those who
are to respond, including through the
use of appropriate automated,
electronic, mechanical, or other
technological collection techniques or
other forms of information technology,
e.g., permitting electronic submissions
of responses.

Standard Form 3102, CSRS/FERS
Designation of Beneficiary, is used by an
employee or annuitant covered under
the Civil Service Retirement System or
the Federal Employees Retirement
System to designate a beneficiary to
receive any lump sum due in the event
of his/her death. The SF 3102 (FERS
Designation of Beneficiary) is being
combined with the SF 2808 (CSRS
Designation of Beneficiary). This
proposed version of SF 3102 will
supersede all previous editions of SF
2808 and SF 3102.

Analysis

Agency: Retirement Operations,
Retirement Services, Office of Personnel
Management.

Title: CSRS/FERS Designation of
Beneficiary.

OMB Number: 3206—0173.

Frequency: On occasion.

Affected Public: Individuals or
Households.

Number of Respondents: 5,888.

Estimated Time per Respondent: 15
minutes.

Total Burden Hours: 1,472 hours.

Office of Personnel Management.
Alexys Stanley,

Regulatory Affairs Analyst.

[FR Doc. 2020-17686 Filed 8-12—20; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6325-38-P

POSTAL REGULATORY COMMISSION

[Docket Nos. MC2020-211 and CP2020-239;
Docket Nos. MC2020-212 and CP2020-240;
MC2020-213 and CP2020-241; MC2020-214
and CP2020-242]

New Postal Products

AGENCY: Postal Regulatory Commission.
ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: The Commission is noticing a
recent Postal Service filing for the
Commission’s consideration concerning
a negotiated service agreement. This
notice informs the public of the filing,
invites public comment, and takes other
administrative steps.

DATES: Comments are due: August 17,
2020.

ADDRESSES: Submit comments
electronically via the Commission’s
Filing Online system at http://
www.prc.gov. Those who cannot submit
comments electronically should contact
the person identified in the FOR FURTHER
INFORMATION CONTACT section by
telephone for advice on filing
alternatives.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
David A. Trissell, General Counsel, at
202-789-6820.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:
Table of Contents

I. Introduction
II. Docketed Proceeding(s)

I. Introduction

The Commission gives notice that the
Postal Service filed request(s) for the
Commission to consider matters related
to negotiated service agreement(s). The
request(s) may propose the addition or
removal of a negotiated service
agreement from the market dominant or
the competitive product list, or the
modification of an existing product
currently appearing on the market
dominant or the competitive product
list.

Section II identifies the docket
number(s) associated with each Postal
Service request, the title of each Postal
Service request, the request’s acceptance
date, and the authority cited by the
Postal Service for each request. For each
request, the Commission appoints an
officer of the Commission to represent
the interests of the general public in the
proceeding, pursuant to 39 U.S.C. 505
(Public Representative). Section II also
establishes comment deadline(s)
pertaining to each request.

The public portions of the Postal
Service’s request(s) can be accessed via
the Commission’s website (http://
www.prc.gov). Non-public portions of
the Postal Service’s request(s), if any,
can be accessed through compliance
with the requirements of 39 CFR
3011.301.1

The Commission invites comments on
whether the Postal Service’s request(s)
in the captioned docket(s) are consistent
with the policies of title 39. For
request(s) that the Postal Service states
concern market dominant product(s),
applicable statutory and regulatory
requirements include 39 U.S.C. 3622, 39
U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR part 3030, and 39
CFR part 3040, subpart B. For request(s)
that the Postal Service states concern
competitive product(s), applicable
statutory and regulatory requirements
include 39 U.S.C. 3632, 39 U.S.C. 3633,
39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR part 3035, and
39 CFR part 3040, subpart B. Comment
deadline(s) for each request appear in
section II.

II. Docketed Proceeding(s)

1. Docket No(s).: MC2020-211 and
CP2020-239; Filing Title: USPS Request
to Add Priority Mail & First-Class
Package Service Contract 155 to
Competitive Product List and Notice of
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing
Acceptance Date: August 7, 2020; Filing
Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR
3040.130 through 3040.135, and 39 CFR
3035.105; Public Representative:
Kenneth R. Moeller; Comments Due:
August 17, 2020.

2. Docket No(s).: MC2020-212 and
CP2020-240; Filing Title: USPS Request
to Add Priority Mail & First-Class
Package Service Contract 156 to
Competitive Product List and Notice of
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing
Acceptance Date: August 7, 2020; Filing
Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR
3040.130 through 3040.135, and 39 CFR
3035.105; Public Representative:
Kenneth R. Moeller; Comments Due:
August 17, 2020.

1 See Docket No. RM2018-3, Order Adopting
Final Rules Relating to Non-Public Information,
June 27, 2018, Attachment A at 19-22 (Order No.
4679).
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3. Docket No(s).: MC2020-213 and
CP2020-241; Filing Title: USPS Request
to Add First-Class Package Service
Contract 111 to Competitive Product
List and Notice of Filing Materials
Under Seal; Filing Acceptance Date:
August 7, 2020; Filing Authority: 39
U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 3040.130 through
3040.135, and 39 CFR 3035.105; Public
Representative: Christopher C. Mohr;
Comments Due: August 17, 2020.

4. Docket No(s).: MC2020—-214 and
CP2020-242; Filing Title: USPS Request
to Add Priority Mail Contract 647 to
Competitive Product List and Notice of
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing
Acceptance Date: August 7, 2020; Filing
Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR
3040.130 through 3040.135, and 39 CFR
3035.105; Public Representative:
Christopher C. Mohr; Comments Due:
August 17, 2020.

This Notice will be published in the
Federal Register.

Erica A. Barker,
Secretary.

[FR Doc. 2020-17731 Filed 8-12-20; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 7710-FW-P

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE
COMMISSION

[Release No. 34-89507; File No. SR—-CBOE-
2020-077]

Self-Regulatory Organizations; Cboe
Exchange, Inc.; Notice of Filing and
Immediate Effectiveness of a Proposed
Rule Change To Amend Rule 5.34
(Order and Quote Price Protection
Mechanisms and Risk Controls) in
Connection With Sell Market Orders in
No-Bid Series

August 7, 2020.

Pursuant to Section 19(b)(1) of the
Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (the
“Act”),! and Rule 19b—4 thereunder,?
notice is hereby given that on August 5,
2020, Cboe Exchange, Inc. (the
“Exchange” or “Cboe Options”) filed
with the Securities and Exchange
Comumission (the “Commission”) the
proposed rule change as described in
Items I and II below, which Items have
been prepared by the Exchange. The
Exchange filed the proposal as a “non-
controversial” proposed rule change
pursuant to Section 19(b)(3)(A)(iii) of
the Act 3 and Rule 19b—4(f)(6)
thereunder.* The Commission is
publishing this notice to solicit

115 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1).

217 CFR 240.19b—4.

315 U.S.C. 78s(b)(3)(A)(iii).
417 CFR 240.19b—4(f)(6).

comments on the proposed rule change
from interested persons.

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s
Statement of the Terms of Substance of
the Proposed Rule Change

Cboe Exchange, Inc. (the “Exchange”
or “Cboe Options”) proposes to amend
Rule 5.34 (Order and Quote Price
Protection Mechanisms and Risk
Controls) in connection with sell market
orders in no-bid series. The text of the
proposed rule change is provided in
Exhibit 5.

The text of the proposed rule change
is also available on the Exchange’s
website (http://www.cbhoe.com/
AboutCBOE/
CBOELegalRegulatoryHome.aspx), at
the Exchange’s Office of the Secretary,
and at the Commission’s Public
Reference Room.

II. Self-Regulatory Organization’s
Statement of the Purpose of, and
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule
Change

In its filing with the Commission, the
Exchange included statements
concerning the purpose of and basis for
the proposed rule change and discussed
any comments it received on the
proposed rule change. The text of these
statements may be examined at the
places specified in Item IV below. The
Exchange has prepared summaries, set
forth in sections A, B, and C below, of
the most significant aspects of such
statements.

A. Self-Regulatory Organization’s
Statement of the Purpose of, and
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule
Change

1. Purpose

The Exchange proposes to amend
Rule 5.34(a)(1) in connection with the
System’s handling of a sell market
orders in no-bid series. Specifically, if
the System receives a sell market order
in a series after it is open for trading
with a national best bid (“NBB”’) of zero,
current Rule 5.34(a)(1)(A)(ii) provides
that if the NBO in the series is greater
than $0.50, then the System cancels or
rejects the market order. The proposed
rule change adds to Rule
5.34(a)(1)(A)(ii) that if the NBO in the
series is greater than $0.50, then the
System cancels or rejects the market
order or routes the market order to PAR
for manual handling, subject to a User’s
instructions. This proposed handling in
consistent with order instructions a
User may choose to apply to an order
wherein, if the order is not eligible for
electronic handling, the order routes to

PAR for manual handling.5> Current Rule
5.34(a)(1)(A)(ii), as written, does not
specifically consider the case in which
a User’s order instructions would route
an order to PAR when such order is not
eligible for electronic processing
because the NBO in the series is greater
than $0.50.

The System, however, currently
handles orders under these
circumstances in accordance with the
User instruction to route such an order
for manual handling.® The proposed
rule change codifies this behavior. The
Exchange notes that Rule 5.34 was
recently revised in connection with a
technology migration. The rule filing
that revised Rule 5.34 consolidated all
order and quote price protection
mechanisms and risk controls
provisions from the pre-migration
Exchange Rulebook into one single rule
(current Rule 5.34) as well as
harmonized Rule 5.34 with the
corresponding rules of the Exchange’s
affiliated exchanges, Cboe EDGX
Exchange, Inc. (“EDGX Options”) and
Cboe C2 Exchange, Inc. (“C2”).7 The
Exchange’s former rule provision
regarding market orders in no-bid (offer)
series provided that if the Exchange’s
best offer (i.e., NBO) was greater than
$0.50, the order would route to PAR if
so instructed by the submitting firm.8
The Exchange inadvertently omitted
this specific handling process when it
amended current Rule 5.34 in
connection with the technology
migration.

2. Statutory Basis

The Exchange believes the proposed
rule change is consistent with the
Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (the
“Act”) and the rules and regulations
thereunder applicable to the Exchange
and, in particular, the requirements of
Section 6(b) of the Act.? Specifically,
the Exchange believes the proposed rule
change is consistent with the Section

5 See e.g. Rule 5.6(c), a “Default” order is an order
a User designates for electronic processing, and
which order (or unexecuted portion) routes to PAR
for manual handling if not eligible for electronic
processing.

6 See Cboe U.S. Options FIX Specification (July
13, 2020) at 12, available at https://cdn.cboe.com/
resources/membership/US_Options_FIX_
Specification.pdf.

7 See Securities Exchange Release No. 86923
(September 10, 2019), 84 FR 48664 (September 16,
2019) (SR—-CBOE-2019-057).

8 Former Rule 6.13(b)(vi)(B) provided that if the
Exchange best offer in a no-bid series is greater than
$0.50, then the order entry firm has the discretion
to have the market order to sell via the order
handling system pursuant to Rule 6.12 (which
permitted a submitting firm to opt to route orders
not eligible for electronic processing to a designated
order management terminal or PAR Workstation).

915 U.S.C. 78f(b).


https://cdn.cboe.com/resources/membership/US_Options_FIX_Specification.pdf
https://cdn.cboe.com/resources/membership/US_Options_FIX_Specification.pdf
https://cdn.cboe.com/resources/membership/US_Options_FIX_Specification.pdf
http://www.cboe.com/AboutCBOE/CBOELegalRegulatoryHome.aspx
http://www.cboe.com/AboutCBOE/CBOELegalRegulatoryHome.aspx
http://www.cboe.com/AboutCBOE/CBOELegalRegulatoryHome.aspx

		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-04-27T16:43:19-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




