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Disparity, and (2) Recordkeeping in the 
Electronic Age. Descriptions of these 
topics are available on the ERISA 
Advisory Council’s web page at https:// 
www.dol.gov/agencies/ebsa/about-ebsa/ 
about-us/erisa-advisory-council. The 
ERISA Advisory Council will also 
discuss and finalize views on section 
2509.95–1 of title 29, Code of Federal 
Regulations (relating to the fiduciary 
standards under the Employee 
Retirement Income Security Act of 1974 
when selecting an annuity provider for 
a defined benefit pension plan). 

Instructions for public teleconference 
access will be available on the ERISA 
Advisory Council’s web page at https:// 
www.dol.gov/agencies/ebsa/about-ebsa/ 
about-us/erisa-advisory-council 
approximately one week prior to the 
meeting. 

Organizations or members of the 
public wishing to submit a written 
statement on any of the matters before 
the ERISA Advisory Council may do so 
on or before Tuesday, August 22, 2023, 
to Christine Donahue, Executive 
Secretary, ERISA Advisory Council. 
Statements should be transmitted 
electronically as an email attachment in 
text or pdf format to donahue.christine@
dol.gov. Statements transmitted 
electronically that are included in the 
body of the email will not be accepted. 
Relevant statements received on or 
before Tuesday, August 22, 2023, will 
be included in the record of the meeting 
and made available through the EBSA 
Public Disclosure Room. No deletions, 
modifications, or redactions will be 
made to the statements received as they 
are public records. Warning: Do not 
include any personally identifiable or 
confidential business information that 
you do not want publicly disclosed. 

Individuals or representatives of 
organizations interested in addressing 
the ERISA Advisory Council at the 
public meeting on the 2023 Council 
study topics: (1) Long-Term Disability 
Benefits and Mental Health Disparity, 
and (2) Recordkeeping in the Electronic 
Age must submit a written request to the 
Executive Secretary on or before 
Tuesday, August 22, 2023, via email to 
donahue.christine@dol.gov. Requests to 
address the ERISA Advisory Council on 
the 2023 Council study topics must 
include: (1) the name, title, 
organization, address, email address, 
and telephone number of the individual 
who would appear; (2) if applicable, the 
name of the organization(s) whose views 
would be represented; and (3) a concise 
summary of the statement that would be 
presented. Any oral presentation to the 
Council will be limited to ten minutes, 
but as indicated above, extended written 

statements may be submitted for the 
record on or before August 22, 2023. 

Individuals who need special 
accommodations should contact the 
Executive Secretary on or before 
Tuesday, August 22, 2023, via email to 
donahue.christine@dol.gov or by 
telephoning (202) 693–8641. 

For more information about the 
meeting, contact the Executive Secretary 
at the address or telephone number 
above. 

Signed at Washington, DC, this 24th day of 
July, 2023. 
Lisa M. Gomez, 
Assistant Secretary, Employee Benefits 
Security Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2023–16034 Filed 7–27–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–29–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Vacancy Posting: Member of the 
Administrative Review Board 

Summary of Duties: The incumbents 
exercise completely independent 
judgment in considering and deciding 
appeals and other matters which come 
before the Boards required by law and 
any applicable regulations. They sign 
decisions with which they agree or take 
such action as appropriate including 
that of writing concurring and/or 
dissenting opinions. Also included 
there in are the following 
responsibilities, exercised by the Chair 
and the Board Members: establishing 
general policies for the Board’s 
operations; participation at Board case 
conferences and at oral argument; and 
other responsibilities necessary for the 
orderly and efficient disposition of all 
matters properly before the Board. 

Appointment Type: Excepted—The 
term of appointment is for four years or 
less and may be extended. 

Qualifications: The applicant should 
be well versed in law and the appeals 
process as well as have the ability to 
interpret regulations and to come to a 
consensus to determine an overall 
appeals determination with members of 
board. This position has a Positive 
Education Requirement. Applicants 
must possess a J.D. and will be required 
to provide an original copy of their 
transcripts if selected. Applicants are 
required to be active members of the Bar 
in any US State or US Territory Court 
under the U.S. Constitution. 
Documentation of Bar License will be 
required before selection. 

To Be Considered: A detailed resume 
is required to be considered for this 
vacancy announcement. 

Closing Date: Resumes must be 
submitted by 11:59 p.m. EDT on August 

28, 2023. Resumes must be submitted 
to: white.robert.t@dol.gov, phone: 202– 
693–2457. This is not a toll-free number. 

Carolyn Angus-Hornbuckle, 
Acting Assistant Secretary for Administration 
& Management. 
[FR Doc. 2023–15974 Filed 7–27–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–HW–P 

NATIONAL FOUNDATION ON THE 
ARTS AND THE HUMANITIES 

Federal Council on the Arts and the 
Humanities 

Arts and Artifacts Indemnity Panel 
Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Federal Council on the Arts 
and the Humanities; National 
Foundation on the Arts and the 
Humanities. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, notice is 
hereby given that the Federal Council 
on the Arts and the Humanities will 
hold a meeting of the Arts and Artifacts 
Domestic Indemnity Panel. 
DATES: The meeting will be held on 
Thursday, August 17, 2023, from 12:00 
p.m. until adjourned. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held by 
videoconference originating at the 
National Endowment for the Arts, 
Washington, DC 20506. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Elizabeth Voyatzis, Committee 
Management Officer, 400 7th Street SW, 
Room 4060, Washington, DC 20506, 
(202) 606–8322; evoyatzis@neh.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
purpose of the meeting is for panel 
review, discussion, evaluation, and 
recommendation on applications for 
Certificates of Indemnity submitted to 
the Federal Council on the Arts and the 
Humanities, for exhibitions beginning 
on or after October 1, 2023. Because the 
meeting will consider proprietary 
financial and commercial data provided 
in confidence by indemnity applicants, 
and material that is likely to disclose 
trade secrets or other privileged or 
confidential information, and because it 
is important to keep the values of 
objects to be indemnified and the 
methods of transportation and security 
measures confidential, I have 
determined that that the meeting will be 
closed to the public pursuant to 
subsection (c)(4) of section 552b of Title 
5, United States Code. I have made this 
determination under the authority 
granted me by the Chairman’s 
Delegation of Authority to Close 
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