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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

Southwest Montana Resource 
Advisory Committee Meeting 

AGENCY: Forest Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the authorities in 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(Pub. L. 92–463) and under the Secure 
Rural Schools and Community Self- 
Determination Act of 2000 (Pub. L. 106– 
393) the Beaverhead-Deerlodge National 
Forest’s Southwest Montana Resource 
Advisory Committee will meet on 
Thursday June 3, 2010, from 9 a.m. until 
4 p.m., in Dillon, Montana. The purpose 
of the meeting is to review funding 
proposals for Title II funding. 
DATES: Thursday, June 3, 2010, from 9 
a.m. until 4 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held at 
the Beaverhead-Deerlodge Forest 
Headquarters located at 420 Barrett 
Street, Dillon, Montana (MT 59725). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Patty Bates, Committee Coordinator, 
Beaverhead-Deerlodge National Forest, 
420 Barrett Road, Dillon, MT 59725 
(406) 683–3979; e-mail pbates@fs.fed.us. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Agenda 
for this meeting includes discussion 
about 32 new project proposals seeking 
funding. Proposals for funding include 
Basin Creek Road Bridge Replacement, 
Targeted Weed Grazing, Little Sheep 
Creek Noxious Weed Control, Stock 
Lane Corridor Weed Control, 
Tumbledown Trail Maintenance and 
Access, Cherry Creek Trail Switchback 
and Grade Realignments, Yellow Star 
Thistle and Knapweed, Invasive Species 
Education and Awareness, Sentinel 
Creek/Expedition Pass Trout Habitat 
Restoration and Trail Reconstruction, 
Antelope Basin Road Gravel, Noxious 
Weed Aerial Treatment, Tepee Creek 
Stream Restoration, Birch Creek 
Resurfacing and Bridge Replacement, 
Laura Tolman Scott Wildflower Trail, 
Dry Creek Pipeline and Standpipe Fill 
Station, Madison District Ground 
Spraying, Madison District Route 
Enhancement, Indian Creek Bridge 
Replacement and Road Maintenance, 
Hell Roaring Odell Mountain Trail 
Improvement, North Meadow Creek 
Noxious Weed Education and Outreach, 
Narrows Creek Native Fish Spawning, 
South Arm Whitetail Reservoir 
Restoration, Shovel Creek Hardened 
Crossings, Madison Valley Wildlife 
Planning Model, Blacktail Ridge/Dyce 
Creek/Clark Canyon Reservoir Weed 
Treatment, Bloody Dick Cabin Jack 
Fence, Browne’s Lake Toilet, Dillon 

District Road Drainage Contract, Elk 
Productivity, Survival and Recruitment 
Study, Halfway Park Bridge 
Replacement, Little Sheep Creek Weed 
Treatment, Maud–S Canyon Trail 
Reconstruction, Maverick Mountain 
Hazard Tree Removal, and Southwest 
Montana Incident Recycling Trailer. The 
meeting is open to the public. Public 
input opportunity will be provided and 
individuals will have the opportunity to 
address the Committee throughout the 
meeting. 

Dated: May 11, 2010. 
David R. Myers, 
Designated Federal Official. 
[FR Doc. 2010–11839 Filed 5–18–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–11–M 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Food Safety and Inspection Service 

[Docket No. FSIS–2010–0013] 

Codex Alimentarius Commission: 
Meeting of the Codex Alimentarius 
Commission 

AGENCY: Office of Food Safety, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting and 
request for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Office of Food Safety, 
U.S. Department of Agriculture (USDA), 
is sponsoring a public meeting on June 
8, 2010. The objective of the public 
meeting is to provide information and 
receive public comments on agenda 
items and draft United States (U.S.) 
positions that will be discussed at the 
33rd Session of the Codex Alimentarius 
Commission (CAC), which will be held 
in Geneva, Switzerland, July 5–9, 2010. 
The Office of Food Safety recognizes the 
importance of providing interested 
parties the opportunity to obtain 
background information on the 33rd 
Session of the CAC and to address items 
on the agenda. 
DATES: The public meeting is scheduled 
for June 8, 2010, from 1 p.m. to 4 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: The public meeting will be 
held at USDA, Room 107–A, Jamie L. 
Whitten Building, 1400 Independence 
Avenue, SW., Washington, DC 20250. 
Documents related to the 33rd Session 
of the CAC will be accessible via the 
World Wide Web at the following 
address: http:// 
www.codexalimentarius.net/ 
current.asp. 

The U.S. Delegate to the 33rd Session 
of the CAC invites interested U.S. 
parties to submit their comments 
electronically to the following e-mail 
address Barbara.McNiff@fsis.usda.gov. 

Conference Call-in Number 

There will be a conference call-in 
number to the CAC public meeting. The 
call-in information is as follows: please 
call 1–866–692–3158, when asked for 
the conference code, please enter: 
5986642. 

For Further Information About the 
33rd Session of the CAC and About the 
Public Meeting Contact: Barbara McNiff, 
U.S. Codex Office, 1400 Independence 
Avenue, SW., Room 4861–S, 
Washington, DC 20250, Telephone: 
(202) 690–4719, Fax: (202) 720–3157, E- 
mail: Barbara.Mcniff@fsis.usda.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

The Codex Alimentarius Commission 
(Codex) was established in 1963 by two 
United Nations organizations, the Food 
and Agriculture Organization (FAO) and 
the World Health Organization (WHO). 
Through adoption of food standards, 
codes of practice, and other guidelines 
developed by its committees, and by 
promoting their implementation by 
governments, Codex seeks to protect the 
health of consumers and ensure fair 
practices in food trade; and promote 
coordination of all food standards work 
undertaken by international 
governmental and non-governmental 
organizations. The CAC will finalize 
standards developed in Codex 
Committees, and publish them in a 
Codex Alimentarius either as regional or 
worldwide standards. 

Issues To Be Discussed at the Public 
Meeting 

The following items on the agenda for 
the 33rd Session of the CAC will be 
discussed during the public meeting: 

• Amendments to the Codex 
Procedural Manual 

• Draft Standards and Related Texts 
Submitted to the Commission for 
Adoption 

• Proposed Draft Standards and 
Related Texts Submitted at Step 5 

• Existing Codex Standards and 
Related Texts whose Revocation is 
Recommended 

• Proposals for the Elaboration of 
New Standards and Related Texts 

• Financial and Budgetary Matters 
• Strategic Planning of the Codex 

Alimentarius Commission 
• General Matters Arising from the 

Reports of Codex Committees and Task 
Forces 

• FAO/WHO Project and Trust Fund 
for Enhanced Participation in Codex 

Each issue on the CAC agenda will be 
described in documents distributed by 
the Secretariat prior to the meeting. 
Members of the public may access 
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copies of these documents (see 
ADDRESSES). 

Public Meeting 

At the June 8, 2010, public meeting, 
draft U.S. positions on the agenda items 
will be described and attendees will 
have the opportunity to pose questions 
and offer comments. Written comments 
may be offered at the meeting or sent to 
the U.S. Delegate for the 33rd Session of 
the CAC, Karen Stuck, U.S. Codex 
Manager (see ADDRESSES). Written 
comments should state that they relate 
to activities of the 33rd session of the 
CAC. 

Additional Public Notification 

Public awareness of all segments of 
rulemaking and policy development is 
important. Consequently, in an effort to 
ensure that minorities, women, and 
persons with disabilities are aware of 
this notice, FSIS will announce it online 
through the FSIS Web page located at 
http://www.fsis.usda.gov/ 
Regulations_&_Policies/ 
2010_Notices_Index/index.asp. 

FSIS will also make copies of this 
Federal Register publication available 
through the FSIS Constituent Update, 
which is used to provide information 
regarding FSIS policies, procedures, 
regulations, Federal Register notices, 
FSIS public meetings, and other types of 
information that could affect or would 
be of interest to constituents and 
stakeholders. The Update is 
communicated via Listserv, a free 
electronic mail subscription service for 
industry, trade groups, consumer 
interest groups, health professionals, 
and other individuals who have asked 
to be included. The Update is also 
available on the FSIS Web page. 
Through the Listserv and Web page, 
FSIS is able to provide information to a 
much broader and more diverse 
audience. In addition, FSIS offers an 
electronic mail subscription service 
which provides automatic and 
customized access to selected food 
safety news and information. This 
service is available at http:// 
www.fsis.usda.gov/news_and_events/ 
email_subscription/. Options range from 
recalls to export information to 
regulations, directives and notices. 
Customers can add or delete 
subscriptions themselves, and have the 
option to password protect their 
accounts. 

Done at Washington, DC on May 13, 2010. 
Karen Stuck, 
U.S. Manager for Codex Alimentarius. 
[FR Doc. 2010–12005 Filed 5–18–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–DM–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

Fremont and Winema Resource 
Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Forest Service, USDA. 

ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Fremont and Winema 
Resource Advisory Committee will meet 
in Klamath Falls, Oregon, for the 
purpose of evaluating and 
recommending resource management 
projects for funding in FY 2011, under 
the provisions of Title II of the Secure 
Rural Schools and Community Self- 
Determination Act of 2008 (Pub. L. 110– 
343). 

DATES: The meeting will be held on June 
22 and 23, 2010. 

ADDRESSES: The meeting will take place 
at the Klamath Ranger District Office, 
2819 Dahlia Street, Klamath Falls, OR 
97601. Send written comments to 
Fremont and Winema Resource 
Advisory Committee, c/o USDA Forest 
Service, 2819 Dahlia Street, Klamath 
Falls, OR 97601 or electronically to 
agowan@fs.fed.us. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Amy Gowan, Designated Federal 
Official, c/o Klamath Ranger District, 
2819 Dahlia Street, Klamath Falls, OR 
97601, telephone (541) 883–6741. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
agenda will include a review of FY 2011 
Title II project proposals submitted by 
the Forest Service, the public, non- 
profits and other agencies, presentations 
by project proponents, and final 
recommendations for funding of fiscal 
year 2011 projects. 

All Fremont and Winema Resource 
Advisory Committee Meetings are open 
to the public. Public input and comment 
forum will take place in the afternoon 
of June 23, 2010. Interested citizens are 
encouraged to attend. 

Dated: May 10, 2010. 

Amy Gowan, 
DFO. 
[FR Doc. 2010–11888 Filed 5–18–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–11–M 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[Docket 34–2010] 

Foreign-Trade Zone 14—Little Rock, 
Arkansas Application for 
Reorganization/Expansion Under 
Alternative Site Framework 

An application has been submitted to 
the Foreign-Trade Zones (FTZ) Board 
(the Board) by the Arkansas Economic 
Development Commission, grantee of 
FTZ 14, requesting authority to 
reorganize and expand the zone under 
the alternative site framework (ASF) 
adopted by the Board (74 FR 1170, 
1/12/09; correction 74 FR 3987, 1/22/ 
09). The ASF is an option for grantees 
for the establishment or reorganization 
of general-purpose zones and can permit 
significantly greater flexibility in the 
designation of new ‘‘usage-driven’’ FTZ 
sites for operators/users located within 
a grantee’s ‘‘service area’’ in the context 
of the Board’s standard 2,000-acre 
activation limit for a general-purpose 
zone project. The application was 
submitted pursuant to the Foreign-Trade 
Zones Act, as amended (19 U.S.C. 81a– 
81u), and the regulations of the Board 
(15 CFR part 400). It was formally filed 
on May 11, 2010. 

FTZ 14 was approved by the Board on 
October 4, 1972 (Board Order 90, 37 FR 
24853, 11/22/72), relocated on March 
23, 1979 (Board Order 143, 43 FR 19502, 
4/3/79), and expanded on February 3, 
1999 (Board Order 1022, 64 FR 7853– 
7854, 2/17/99). 

The current zone project includes the 
following sites: Site 1 (759.48 acres)— 
located at the Little Rock Port Industrial 
Park; Site 2 (969.394 acres)—industrial 
area located adjacent to Site 1 at the 
southeast corner of the Little Rock Port 
Industrial Park, on the McClellan-Kerr 
Arkansas River Navigation System, 
Little Rock; and, Site 3 (191.54 acres)— 
located at the Little Rock National 
Airport, Adams Field, Little Rock. 

The grantee’s proposed service area 
under the ASF would be Clark, Conway, 
Dallas, Faulkner, Garland, Grant, Hot 
Spring, Jefferson, Lonoke, Montgomery, 
Nevada, Pike, Pulaski, Pope, Saline, Yell 
and White Counties, Arkansas. If 
approved, the grantee would be able to 
serve sites throughout the service area 
based on companies’ needs for FTZ 
designation. The proposed service area 
is within and adjacent to the Little Rock 
Customs and Border Protection port of 
entry. 

The applicant is requesting authority 
to reorganize its existing zone project to 
include all of the existing sites as 
‘‘magnet’’ sites and expand Site 1 to 
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