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Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
Currently, the IRS is soliciting 
comments concerning Form 8569, 
Geographic Availability Statement. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
received on or before November 19, 
2018 to be assured of consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all written comments 
to Laurie Brimmer, Internal Revenue 
Service, Room 6529, 1111 Constitution 
Avenue NW, Washington, DC 20224. 
Please send separate comments for each 
specific information collection listed 
below. You must reference the 
information collection’s title, form 
number, reporting or record-keeping 
requirement number, and OMB number 
(if any) in your comment. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
copies of the collection tools should be 
directed to Alissa Berry, at (901) 707– 
4988, at Internal Revenue Service, Room 
6529, 1111 Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20224, or through the 
internet at Alissa.A.Berry@irs.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Currently, 
the IRS is seeking comments concerning 
the following information collection 
tools, reporting, and record-keeping 
requirements: 

Title: Geographic Availability 
Statement. 

OMB Number: 1545–0973. 
Form Number: 8569. 
Abstract: This form is used to collect 

information from applicants for the 
Senior Executive Service Candidate 
Development Program and other 
executive positions. The form states an 
applicant’s minimum area of availability 
and is used for future job placement. 

Current Actions: There are no changes 
being made to the Form 8569 at this 
time. 

Type of Review: Extension without 
change of currently approved collection. 

Affected Public: Individuals and the 
Federal Government. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
500. 

Estimated Time per Respondent: 10 
minutes. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 84. 

The following paragraph applies to all 
of the collections of information covered 
by this notice: 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a valid OMB control number. 
Books or records relating to a collection 
of information must be retained as long 
as their contents may become material 
in the administration of any internal 
revenue law. Generally, tax returns and 

tax return information are confidential, 
as required by 26 U.S.C. 6103. 

Request for Comments: Comments 
submitted in response to this notice will 
be summarized and/or included in the 
request for OMB approval. All 
comments will become a matter of 
public record. Comments are invited on: 
(a) Whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of the burden of the collection of 
information; (c) ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; (d) ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on respondents, including 
through the use of automated collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology; and (e) estimates of capital 
or start-up costs and costs of operation, 
maintenance, and purchase of services 
to provide information. 

Approved: September 10, 2018. 
Laurie Brimmer, 
Senior Tax Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20222 Filed 9–17–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4830–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS 
AFFAIRS 

Veterans’ Family, Caregiver, and 
Survivor Advisory Committee, Notice 
of Meeting 

The Department of Veterans Affairs 
(VA) gives notice under the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act that the 
Veterans’ Family, Caregiver, and 
Survivor Advisory Committee will meet 
on October 3–4, 2018. The meeting will 
be held at the American Red Cross, 430 
17th Street NW, Washington, DC 20006. 
Both sessions will begin at 9:00 a.m. 
(EST) each day. The session on October 
3 will adjourn at approximately 5:00 
p.m. The session on the October 4 will 
adjourn at approximately 4:30 p.m. The 
meetings are open to the public. 

The purpose of the Committee is to 
advise the Secretary of Veterans Affairs 
on matters related to: Veterans’ families, 
caregivers, and survivors across all 
generations, relationships, and Veterans 
status; the use of VA care and benefits 
services by Veterans’ families, 
caregivers, and survivors, and possible 
expansion of such care and benefits 
services; Veterans’ family, caregiver, 
and survivor experiences; VA policies, 
regulations, and administrative 
requirements related to the transition of 
Servicemembers from the Department of 

Defense (DoD) to enrollment in VA that 
impact Veterans’ families, caregivers, 
and survivors; and factors that influence 
access to, quality of, and accountability 
for services and benefits for Veterans’ 
families, caregivers, and survivors. 

On October 3 and October 4, the 
agenda will include information 
briefings from the subcommittee and 
offices within Veterans Health 
Administration (that include Caregiver 
Support Program, Center of Excellence, 
Choose Home, Suicide Prevention- 
Impact on Veterans’ Family, Caregivers, 
and Survivors, and Opioid Crisis— 
Impact on Veterans’ Family, Caregivers, 
and Survivors, and the Office of 
Survivors Assistance), as well as 
opening remarks from VA senior leaders 
including the Chief Veterans Experience 
Officer and the Committee Chair. 
Committee members will also discuss 
the committee work plan and future 
activities. Public comments will be 
received at 4:45–5:30 p.m. on October 3, 
2018. 

Individuals wishing to speak should 
contact Dr. Betty Moseley Brown at 
Betty.MoseleyBrown@va.gov or (202) 
465–6199 and are requested to submit a 
1–2 page summary of their comments 
for inclusion in the official meeting 
record. In the interest of time, each 
speaker will be held to a 5 minute time 
limit. 

If you are interested in attending, 
please submit your name to Betty 
Moseley Brown by September 28, 2018 
to help expedite arrival process. Any 
member of the public seeking additional 
information should contact Dr. Betty 
Moseley Brown at Betty.MoseleyBrown@
va.gov or (202) 465–6199. 

Dated: September 13, 2018. 
Jelessa M. Burney, 
Federal Advisory Committee Management 
Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2018–20282 Filed 9–17–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8320–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS 
AFFAIRS 

[OMB Control No. 2900–0679] 

Agency Information Collection Activity 
Under OMB Review: Certification of 
Change or Correction of Name 
Government Life Insurance 

AGENCY: Veterans Benefits 
Administration, Department of Veterans 
Affairs. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 
1995, this notice announces that the 
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