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Filed Date: 3/30/23. 
Accession Number: 20230330–5001. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/20/23. 
Docket Numbers: ER23–1514–000. 
Applicants: PECO Energy Company, 

PJM Interconnection, L.L.C. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: 

PECO Energy Company submits tariff 
filing per 35.13(a)(2)(iii: PECO submits 
revisions to Formula Rate, OATT 
Attachment H–7A to be effective 5/30/ 
2023. 

Filed Date: 3/30/23. 
Accession Number: 20230330–5026. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/20/23. 
Docket Numbers: ER23–1515–000. 
Applicants: PJM Interconnection, 

L.L.C. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: 

Amendment to ISA, Service Agreement 
No. 5859; Queue No. AD1–081 to be 
effective 5/29/2023. 

Filed Date: 3/30/23. 
Accession Number: 20230330–5054. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/20/23. 
Docket Numbers: ER23–1516–000. 
Applicants: Southwest Power Pool, 

Inc. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: 

Tariff Clean-Up Filing for NorthWestern 
Formula Rate to be effective 9/1/2021. 

Filed Date: 3/30/23. 
Accession Number: 20230330–5055. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/20/23. 
Docket Numbers: ER23–1517–000. 
Applicants: IP Oberon II, LLC. 
Description: Baseline eTariff Filing: 

Application for Market Based Rate Tariff 
to be effective 5/30/2023. 

Filed Date: 3/30/23. 
Accession Number: 20230330–5147. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/20/23. 
Docket Numbers: ER23–1518–000. 
Applicants: Midcontinent 

Independent System Operator, Inc. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: 

2023–03–30_SA 3006 Duke-Jordan 
Creek 4th Rev GIA (J515 J1470) to be 
effective 3/21/2023. 

Filed Date: 3/30/23. 
Accession Number: 20230330–5164. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/20/23. 
Docket Numbers: ER23–1519–000. 
Applicants: Atlas Solar, III, LLC. 
Description: Baseline eTariff Filing: 

Atlas Solar III MBR Application Filing 
to be effective 3/31/2023. 

Filed Date: 3/30/23. 
Accession Number: 20230330–5211. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/20/23. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/
fercgensearch.asp) by querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 

must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: March 30, 2023. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07106 Filed 4–4–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER23–1504–000] 

Partin Solar LLC; Supplemental Notice 
That Initial Market-Based Rate Filing 
Includes Request for Blanket Section 
204 Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of Partin 
Solar LLC’s application for market- 
based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is April 19, 
2023. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 

must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
may mail similar pleadings to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Dated: March 30, 2023. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07103 Filed 4–4–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Southwestern Power Administration 

Integrated System Power Rates 

AGENCY: Southwestern Power 
Administration, DOE. 
ACTION: Notice of proposed change to 
Southwestern Power Administration 
Integrated System Wholesale Rates for 
Hydro Peaking Power Rate Schedule 
and opportunity for public review and 
comment. 

SUMMARY: The Administrator, 
Southwestern Power Administration 
(Southwestern), is proposing to update 
the Peaking Energy Schedule 
Submission Time in Southwestern’s 
existing Integrated System Wholesale 
Rates for Hydro Peaking Power (P–13A) 
Rate Schedule. Southwestern has 
determined that the shift in Peaking 
Energy Schedule Submission Time from 
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the current 2:30 p.m. CPT to the 
proposed 8:30 a.m. CPT provides 
Southwestern with more flexibility and 
greater certainty when making 
replacement power purchases, and 
better aligns with regional energy 
market considerations. 
DATES: The consultation and comment 
period will begin on April 5, 2023 and 
will end on May 5, 2023. Written 
comments are due on or before May 5, 
2023. 
ADDRESSES: Comments should be 
submitted to Ms. Fritha Ohlson, Senior 
Vice President and Chief Operating 
Officer, Southwestern Power 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Energy, 1 W 3rd St, Suite 1500, Tulsa, 
OK 74103. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Fritha Ohlson, Senior Vice President, 
Chief Operating Officer, Office of 
Corporate Operations, (918) 595–6684 or 
fritha.ohlson@swpa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Originally 
established by Order 1865, Secretary of 
the Interior, dated August 31, 1943 and 
effective September 1, 1943 (8 FR 12142 
(Sept. 3, 1943)), Southwestern is 
authorized by Congress to market the 
hydroelectric power and energy from 
Federal dams controlled by the U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers (Corps), 
pursuant to Section 302(a)(1) of the 
Department of Energy Organization Act 
(42 U.S.C. 7152(a)(1)), Section 5 of the 
Flood Control Act of 1944 (16 U.S.C. 
825s), and Public Law 95–456 (16 U.S.C. 
825s–3). Guidelines for preparation of 
power repayment studies are included 
in Department of Energy (DOE) Order 
No. RA 6120.2 (Sept. 20, 1979), entitled 
Power Marketing Administration 
Financial Reporting. Procedures for 
public participation in power and 
transmission rate adjustments of the 
Power Marketing Administrations are 
found at title 10, part 903, subpart A of 
the Code of Federal Regulations (10 CFR 
part 903). Procedures for the 
confirmation and approval of rates for 
the Federal Power Marketing 
Administrations are found at title 18, 
part 300, subpart L of the Code of 
Federal Regulations (18 CFR part 300). 

Southwestern markets power from 24 
multi-purpose reservoir projects with 
hydroelectric power facilities 
constructed and operated by the Corps. 
These projects are located in Arkansas, 
Missouri, Oklahoma, and Texas. 
Southwestern’s marketing area includes 
these states plus Kansas and Louisiana. 
The costs associated with 22 of these 24 
hydropower projects are repaid with 
revenues received under the Integrated 
System rates. These rates also cover the 
costs of Southwestern’s transmission 

facilities that consist of 1,381 miles of 
high-voltage transmission lines, 27 
substations, and 46 microwave and VHF 
radio sites. Additionally, Southwestern 
markets power from two hydropower 
projects in southeastern Texas, Sam 
Rayburn Dam and Robert D. Willis. 
These projects are isolated 
hydraulically, electrically, and 
financially from the Integrated System, 
and are repaid via separate rate 
schedules and therefore are not 
addressed in this Notice. 

On September 30, 2013, in Rate Order 
No. SWPA–66, the Deputy Secretary of 
Energy placed into effect 
Southwestern’s Integrated System rate 
schedules (P–13, NFTS–13, and EE–13) 
on an interim basis for the period 
October 1, 2013 to September 30, 2017. 
The Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission (FERC) confirmed and 
approved Southwestern’s interim 
Integrated System rates on a final basis 
on January 9, 2014 for a period ending 
September 30, 2017. 

Southwestern re-designated Integrated 
System rate schedule ‘‘NFTS–13’’ as 
‘‘NFTS–13A’’ with no revenue 
adjustment. In Rate Order No. SWPA– 
71, the Deputy Secretary of Energy 
placed into effect Southwestern’s rate 
schedule NFTS–13A on an interim basis 
beginning January 1, 2017. FERC 
confirmed and approved NFTS–13A on 
a final basis on March 9, 2017. 

On September 13, 2017, in Rate Order 
No. SWPA–72, the Deputy Secretary of 
Energy extended all of Southwestern’s 
Integrated System rate schedules (P–13, 
NTFS–13A, and EE–13) for two years, 
for the period of October 1, 2017 
through September 30, 2019. 

Southwestern re-designated Integrated 
System rate schedule ‘‘P–13’’ as ‘‘P– 
13A’’ with no revenue adjustment. In 
Rate Order No. SWPA–73, the Assistant 
Secretary for Electricity placed into 
effect Southwestern’s rate schedule P– 
13A on an interim basis beginning July 
1, 2019. FERC confirmed and approved 
P–13A on a final basis on August 29, 
2019. 

On September 22, 2019, in Rate Order 
No. SWPA–74, the Assistant Secretary 
for Electricity extended all of 
Southwestern’s Integrated System rate 
schedules (P–13A, NFTS–13A, EE–13) 
for two years, for the period of October 
1, 2019 through September 30, 2021. 

On August 30, 2021, in Rate Order 
No. SWPA–77, the Administrator, 
Southwestern, extended all of 
Southwestern’s Integrated System rate 
schedules (P–13A, NFTS–13A, EE–13) 
for two years, for the period of October 
1, 2021 through September 30, 2023. 

Decision Rationale 
The proposed update to Section 4.2, 

Peaking Energy Schedule Submission 
Time, establishes the Peaking Energy 
Schedule Submission Time as on or 
before 8:30 a.m. Central Prevailing Time 
(CPT) of the day preceding the day for 
delivery of Peaking Energy. 
Additionally, the proposed update to 
Section 4.2.2, Procedure for Adjusting 
the Peaking Energy Schedule 
Submission Time, allows the 
Southwestern Administrator to adjust 
the Peaking Energy Schedule 
Submission Time once annually to a 
time no earlier than 8:00 a.m. CPT and 
no later than 9:00 a.m. CPT. There is no 
change in annual revenues associated 
with the proposed P–13A Rate Schedule 
change. 

Southwestern must at times make 
replacement capacity and energy 
purchases to fulfill its contractual 
obligations associated with the delivery 
of Hydro Peaking Power as required 
through the majority of Power Sales 
Contracts that utilize Southwestern’s 
Integrated System rate schedules. 
Historically, a significant portion of 
needed replacement power purchases 
were made through pre-arranged 
Purchase Power Agreements (PPAs), 
many of which were capacity and 
energy ‘‘call options’’ that allowed 
Southwestern to schedule the energy as 
needed after the Peaking Energy 
Schedule Submission Time of 2:00 p.m. 
or 2:30 p.m. In recent months, the 
number of PPAs available to 
Southwestern has decreased and the 
pricing of available PPAs has increased. 
Southwestern has also recently become 
a Financial-Only Market Participant of 
the Midcontinent Independent System 
Operator (MISO), which enables 
Southwestern to make energy purchases 
from the MISO Day-Ahead Market. The 
MISO Day-Ahead Market closes bidding 
at 9:30 a.m. CPT every day. In order to 
best utilize the MISO Day-Ahead Market 
as a cost-competitive option for 
replacement energy purchases, 
Southwestern must have increased 
certainty about its Peaking Energy 
obligations before 9:30 a.m. the day 
before the Peaking Energy will be 
delivered. Earlier day-ahead certainty of 
Peaking Energy schedules will also 
likely provide Southwestern with better 
options when seeking new PPAs. Many 
of Southwestern’s customers have 
expressed support for such a change. 
Therefore, Southwestern determined 
that it would pursue shifting its Peaking 
Energy Schedule Submission Time from 
2:30 p.m. CPT to 8:30 a.m. CPT. 

The title of the P–13A Rate Schedule 
will be changed to P–13B to reflect 
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update to Section 4.2. A redlined 
version of the P–13A Rate Schedule, 
which shows the revision proposed by 
the P–13B Rate Schedule, will be made 
available upon request. 

Public Review and Comment 

In accordance with 10 CFR part 903, 
Southwestern’s proposed change to its 
P–13A Rate Schedule is considered a 
minor rate adjustment, as there is no 
change in annual revenues. 10 CFR part 
903 provides that neither a public 
information forum nor a public 
comment forum is required in 
conjunction with the consultation and 
comment period for a minor rate 
adjustment. Therefore, Southwestern 
finds that holding a public information 
and comment forum in conjunction 
with the consultation and comment 
period is not necessary. In accordance 
with 10 CFR 903.14, Southwestern is 
initiating a 30-day consultation and 
comment period (see DATES section) 
during which Southwestern will accept 
written comments from interested 
persons. 

Following review and consideration 
of written comments, the Administrator 
will determine whether to confirm, 
approve, and place the proposed P–13B 
Rate Schedule into effect on an interim 
basis, and subsequently submit to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission 
(FERC) for confirmation and approval 
on a final basis. The FERC will allow 
the public an opportunity to provide 
written comments on the proposed rate 
schedule change before making a final 
decision. 

Legal Authority 

By Delegation Order No. S1–DEL– 
RATES–2016, effective November 19, 
2016, the Secretary of Energy delegated: 
(1) the authority to develop power and 
transmission rates to Southwestern’s 
Administrator; (2) the authority to 
confirm, approve, and place such rates 
into effect on an interim basis to the 
Deputy Secretary of Energy; and (3) the 
authority to confirm, approve, and place 
into effect on a final basis, or to remand 
or disapprove such rates, to FERC. By 
Delegation Order No. S1–DEL–S3– 
2022–2, effective June 13, 2022, the 
Secretary of Energy also delegated the 
authority to confirm, approve, and place 
such rates into effect on an interim basis 
to the Under Secretary for 
Infrastructure. By Redelegation Order 
No. S3–DEL–SWPA1–2022, effective 
June 13, 2022, the Under Secretary for 
Infrastructure redelegated the authority 
to confirm, approve, and place such 
rates into effect on an interim basis to 
the Administrator, Southwestern. 

Environmental Impact 
Southwestern previously determined 

that the rate change actions, placed into 
effect on October 1, 2013, fit within the 
following class of categorically excluded 
actions as listed in Appendix B to 
Subpart D of 10 CFR part 1021, DOE’s 
Implementing Procedures and 
Guidelines of the National 
Environmental Policy Act of 1969, as 
amended (42 U.S.C. 4321–4347): B4.3 
(Electric power marketing rate changes). 
Categorically excluded actions do not 
require preparation of either an 
environmental impact statement or an 
environmental assessment. On March 
14, 2023, Southwestern determined that 
categorical exclusion B4.3 applies to the 
current action as well. 

Determination Under Executive Order 
12866 

Southwestern has an exemption from 
centralized regulatory review under 
Executive Order 12866; accordingly, no 
clearance of this notice by the Office of 
Management and Budget is required. 

Signing Authority 
This document of the Department of 

Energy was signed on March 27, 2023, 
by Mike Wech, Administrator for 
Southwestern Power Administration, 
pursuant to delegated authority from the 
Secretary of Energy. That document, 
with the original signature and date, is 
maintained by DOE. For administrative 
purposes only, and in compliance with 
requirements of the Office of the Federal 
Register, the undersigned DOE Federal 
Register Liaison Officer has been 
authorized to sign and submit the 
document in electronic format for 
publication, as an official document of 
DOE. This administrative process in no 
way alters the legal effect of this 
document upon publication in the 
Federal Register. 

Signed in Washington, DC, on March 31, 
2023. 
Treena V. Garrett, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, U.S. 
Department of Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07059 Filed 4–4–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OW–2023–0095; FRL–10844–01– 
OW] 

Proposed Information Collection 
Request; Comment Request; Clean 
Water Act Water Quality Certification 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) is planning to submit an 
information collection request (ICR), 
‘‘ICR Supporting Statement Information 
Collection Request for Clean Water Act 
Water Quality Certification’’ (EPA ICR 
No. 2603.07, OMB Control No. 2040– 
0295), to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for review and approval 
in accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act (PRA). Before doing so, 
EPA is soliciting public comments on 
specific aspects of the proposed 
information collection as described 
below. This is a proposed extension of 
an ICR (OMB Control No. 2040–0295), 
which is currently approved through 
July 31, 2023. An Agency may not 
conduct or sponsor, and a person is not 
required to respond to, a collection of 
information unless it displays a 
currently valid OMB control number. 
DATES: Comments must be submitted on 
or before June 5, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
referencing Docket ID No. EPA–HQ– 
OW–2023–0095, online using 
www.regulations.gov (our preferred 
method) or by mail to: EPA Docket 
Center, Environmental Protection 
Agency, Mail Code 28221T, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20460. 

EPA’s policy is that all comments 
received will be included in the public 
docket without change including any 
personal information provided, unless 
the comment includes profanity, threats, 
information claimed to be Confidential 
Business Information (CBI), or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Liana Prudencio, Oceans, Wetlands, and 
Communities Division, Office of 
Wetlands, Oceans, and Watersheds, (MC 
4504T), Environmental Protection 
Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20460; telephone 
number: (202) 564–3351; email address: 
cwa401@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Supporting documents which explain in 
detail the information that the EPA will 
be collecting are available in the public 
docket for this ICR. The docket can be 
viewed online at www.regulations.gov 
or in person at the EPA Docket Center, 
WJC West, Room 3334, 1301 
Constitution Ave. NW, Washington, DC. 
The telephone number for the Docket 
Center is 202–566–1744. For additional 
information about EPA’s public docket, 
visit http://www.epa.gov/dockets. 

Pursuant to section 3506(c)(2)(A) of 
the PRA, the EPA is soliciting comments 
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