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accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed in accordance 
with the provisions of Section 154.210 
of the Commission’s regulations (18 CFR 
154.210). Anyone filing an intervention 
or protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. Anyone 
filing an intervention or protest on or 
before the intervention or protest date 
need not serve motions to intervene or 
protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659.

Linda Mitry, 
Deputy Secretary.
[FR Doc. E5–2927 Filed 6–7–05; 8:45 am] 
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Questar Southern Trails Pipeline 
Company; Notice of Annual Fuel Gas 
Reimbursement Report 

June 2, 2005. 
Take notice that on May 31, 2005, 

Questar Southern Trails Pipeline 
Company (Southern Trails) submitted 
its annual Fuel Gas Reimbursement 
Percentage (FGRP) report pursuant to 

the Fuel Gas Reimbursement Provision 
(section 30) of the general terms and 
conditions of Original Volume No. 1 of 
its FERC Gas Tariff. 

Southern Trails states that copies of 
this filing have been served upon its 
customers and the Public Service 
Commissions of Utah, New Mexico, 
Arizona and California. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
date as indicated below. Anyone filing 
an intervention or protest must serve a 
copy of that document on the Applicant. 
Anyone filing an intervention or protest 
on or before the intervention or protest 
date need not serve motions to intervene 
or protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
June 9, 2005.

Linda Mitry, 
Deputy Secretary.
[FR Doc. E5–2926 Filed 6–7–05; 8:45 am] 
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June 2, 2005. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following electric rate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: ER01–2317–005. 
Applicants: Metro Energy, L.L.C. 
Description: Metro Energy, LLC 

submits its revised Tariff incorporating 
the change in status reporting 
requirements provisions under ER01–
2317. 

Filed Date: 05/27/2005. 
Accession Number: 20050601–0009. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Friday, June 17, 2005.
Docket Numbers: ER03–1312–008. 
Applicants: Midwest Independent 

Transmission System Operator, Inc. 
Description: Midwest Independent 

Transmission System Operator, Inc. 
submits proposed revisions to its Open 
Access Transmission & Energy Markets 
Tariff, FERC Electric Tariff, Third 
Revised Volume 1 in compliance with 
the Commission’s March 29, 2005 order. 

Filed Date: 05/27/2005. 
Accession Number: 20050601–0014. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Friday, June 17, 2005.
Docket Numbers: ER05–1028–000. 
Applicants: Southern Company 

Services, Inc. 
Description: Southern Co. Services 

Inc., as agent for Alabama Power 
Company, et al., submits the Generator 
Balancing Service Agreement between 
KGen Murray I and II LLC and Southern 
Companies dated as of 5/1/05. 

Filed Date: 05/27/2005. 
Accession Number: 20050531–0013. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Friday, June 17, 2005.
Docket Numbers: ER05–1029–000. 
Applicants: Midwest Independent 

Transmission System Operator, Inc. 
Description: Midwest Independent 

Transmission System Operator, Inc. 
submits proposed revisions to its Open 
Access Transmission and Energy 
Markets Tariff, FERC Electric Tariff, 
Third Revised Volume 1, etc., under 
ER05–1029. 

Filed Date: 05/27/2005. 
Accession Number: 20050601–0022. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Friday, June 17, 2005.
Docket Numbers: ER05–1030–000. 
Applicants: Pennsylvania Electric 

Company. 
Description: Pennsylvania Electric Co. 

submits an amended Interconnection 
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