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1 Excluding U.S. Government, State, local, Tribal, 
or territorial employees and those who hold a 
national security clearance. 

General Description of Collection: The 
FDIC proposes to use the Visitor 
Notification form to collect 
biographical, passport (for foreign 
nationals), and employment information 
from certain 1 visitors to the FDIC in 
order to assess the risk to FDIC facilities 
and personnel. The FDIC will require 
certain visitors to FDIC facilities, 
including support staff and interpreters, 
to complete and submit the form. 
Interested members of the public may 
obtain a copy of the proposed Visitor 
Notification form at the following web 
page: https://www.fdic.gov/federal- 
register-publications/fdic-visitor- 
notification-form. 

Request for Comment 
Comments are invited on (a) whether 

the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the FDIC’s functions, including whether 
the information has practical utility; (b) 
the accuracy of the estimates of the 
burden of the information collection, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on respondents, including through the 
use of automated collection techniques 
or other forms of information 
technology. All comments will become 
a matter of public record. 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 

Dated at Washington, DC, on November 5, 
2024. 
James P. Sheesley, 
Assistant Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–26056 Filed 11–7–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

GENERAL SERVICES 
ADMINISTRATION 

[OMB Control No. 3090–XXXX; Docket No. 
2024–0001; Sequence No. 15] 

Information Collection; Learning From 
Tribal Governments’ Experiences With 
American Rescue Plan Programs 

AGENCY: Office of Evaluation Sciences; 
Office of Government-wide Policy 
(OGP), General Services Administration 
(GSA). 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments regarding a request for a new 
OMB clearance. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act, the 

Regulatory Secretariat Division will be 
submitting to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) a request to review 
and approve a new information 
collection request regarding new data 
collection activities conducted by OES. 
The objective of this project is to record 
and amplify key lessons learned from 
the American Rescue Plan Act of 2021 
(ARP) programs that provided dedicated 
funding for Tribal governments. This 
project will include in-depth 
evaluations of three selected ARP 
programs that supported Tribal 
governments during the pandemic. We 
will conduct a set of qualitative, 
descriptive studies that aim to 
understand Tribal governments’ 
awareness of, access to, and allocation 
of ARP-funded programs and resources. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
January 7, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Submit comments 
identified by ‘‘Information Collection 
3090–XXXX; Learning from Tribal 
Governments’ Experiences with 
American Rescue Plan Programs’’ to 
https://www.regulations.gov. 

Submit comments via the Federal 
eRulemaking portal by searching for 
‘‘Information Collection 3090–XXXX; 
Learning from Tribal Governments’ 
Experiences with American Rescue Plan 
Programs’’. Select the link ‘‘Submit a 
Comment’’ that corresponds with 
‘‘Information Collection 3090–XXXX; 
Learning from Tribal Governments’ 
Experiences with American Rescue Plan 
Programs’’. Follow the instructions 
provided at the ‘‘Submit a Comment’’ 
screen. Please include your name, 
company name (if any), and 
‘‘Information Collection 3090–XXXX; 
Learning from Tribal Governments’ 
Experiences with American Rescue Plan 
Programs’’ on your attached document. 
If your comment cannot be submitted 
using regulations.gov, call or email the 
points of contact in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section of this 
document for alternate instructions. 

Instructions: Please submit comments 
only and cite ‘‘Information Collection 
3090–XXXX; Learning from Tribal 
Governments’ Experiences with 
American Rescue Plan Programs’’ in all 
correspondence related to this 
collection. Comments received generally 
will be posted without change to 
regulations.gov, including any personal 
and/or business confidential 
information provided. To confirm 
receipt of your comment(s), please 
check regulations.gov, approximately 
two-to-three business days after 
submission to verify posting. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Blair Read, Portfolio Lead, Office of 

Evaluation Sciences, at telephone 617– 
459–5428 or via email to blair.read@
gsa.gov for clarification of content. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

A. Purpose 

The Office of Evaluation Sciences 
(OES) at GSA has a mission to build and 
use evidence to better serve the public. 
The goal of this study is to look across 
several American Rescue Plan-funded 
programs that provided dedicated 
funding for Tribal governments. ARP 
represented the largest ever infusion of 
resources into Native nations by the 
federal governments. In some instances, 
the ARP was the first time Tribal 
governments and federal program teams 
worked together on a dedicated and 
direct transfer of program funds, 
requiring rapid innovation and 
experimentation in program design and 
intergovernmental partnership. Thus, it 
is vital to record and amplify key 
lessons learned, in order for the federal 
government to be better-positioned to 
support Native nations in future crises. 

Through three data collection 
methods (interviews, focus groups, and 
a survey), we seek to learn about and 
report on the experiences of Tribal 
government employees or 
representatives, and the broader 
communities served by Tribal 
governments, as it relates to programs 
funded by ARP for which those Tribal 
governments were eligible. 

With this effort, we seek to 
understand and highlight successes and 
challenges in learning about, applying 
for, and implementing these programs. 
This effort will be led by a Tribal 
Engagement Fellow and will be rooted 
in community engagement to ensure 
that the studies are informed by the 
priorities and perspectives of Tribal 
governments. The study aims to address 
the following research questions: 

• What are Tribes’ experiences with 
accessing ARP-funded programs? 

• What are Tribes’ experience with 
implementing ARP-funded programs? 

As case studies, we will focus on 
three different ARP-funded programs in 
Tribal communities programs as case 
studies. From this data, we will produce 
1–3 descriptive reports that share 
learnings about Tribal governments’ 
experiences with specific programs. 
These summaries of the interviews, 
focus groups, and survey data will be 
included in a series of public facing 
reports, which will seek to highlight 
areas of success and lessons learned for 
improving federal agency support for 
Tribal nations going forward. In 
addition, we plan to produce a report 
that will synthesize these findings. It 
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will include broader insights and shared 
learnings across these studies. 

Respondents: Representatives from 
Native nations who were involved in 
applying to or implementing the ARP- 
funded programs. 

B. Annual Reporting Burden 

The estimates below are calculated 
based on three data collection activities: 
24 60-minute interviews (8 per 
program), 9 two-hour focus groups with 
5 participants (3 per program), and a 
brief survey (100 respondents) of 
approximately 15 questions. These 
research activities will take place across 
the three ARP-funded programs 
included in our study. Respondents will 
only be asked to participate in one data 
collection activity. 

Respondents: 169. 
Responses per Respondent: 13. 
Total Annual Responses: 2,250. 
Hours per Response: 0.11. 
Total Burden Hours: 239. 

C. Public Comments 

Public comments are particularly 
invited on: Whether this collection of 
information is necessary, whether it will 
have practical utility; whether our 
estimate of the public burden of this 
collection of information is accurate, 
and based on valid assumptions and 
methodology; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and ways in 
which we can minimize the burden of 
the collection of information on those 
who are to respond, through the use of 
appropriate technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology. 

Obtaining Copies of Proposals: 
Requesters may obtain a copy of the 
information collection documents from 
the Regulatory Secretariat Division by 
calling 202–501–4755 or emailing 
GSARegSec@gsa.gov. Please cite OMB 
Control No. 3090–XXXX, Title, in all 
correspondence. 

Lois Mandell, 
Director, Regulatory Secretariat Division, 
General Services Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2024–26012 Filed 11–7–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6820–TZ–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Agency for Toxic Substances and 
Disease Registry 

[Docket No. ATSDR–2024–0004] 

Availability of Five Draft Toxicological 
Profiles 

AGENCY: Agency for Toxic Substances 
and Disease Registry (ATSDR), 
Department of Health and Human 
Services (HHS). 
ACTION: Notice with comment period. 

SUMMARY: The Agency for Toxic 
Substances and Disease Registry 
(ATSDR), within the Department of 
Health and Human Services (HHS), 
announces the opening of a docket to 
obtain comments on drafts of five 
updated toxicological profiles: benzene, 
carbon disulfide, cyanide, thallium, and 
chlorinated dibenzo-p-dioxins. This 
action is necessary as this is the 
opportunity for members of the public 
and organizations to submit comments 
on drafts of the profiles. The intended 
effect of this action is to ensure that the 
public can note any pertinent additional 
information or reports on studies about 
the health effects caused by exposure to 
the substances covered in these five 
profiles for review. 
DATES: Written comments must be 
received on or before February 6, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by Docket No. ATSDR–2024– 
0004 by either of the methods listed 
below. Do not submit comments by 
email. ATSDR does not accept 
comments by email. 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: 
https://www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Agency for Toxic Substances 
and Disease Registry, Office of 
Innovation and Analytics, 4770 Buford 
Highway, Mail Stop S106–5, Atlanta, 
GA 30341–3717. Attn: Docket No. 
ATSDR–2024–0004. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name and 
Docket Number. All relevant comments 
received will be posted without change 
to https://www.regulations.gov, 
including any personal information 
provided. For access to the docket to 
read background documents or 
comments received, go to https://
www.regulations.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Farhana Rahman, Agency for Toxic 
Substances and Disease Registry, Office 
of Innovation and Analytics, 4770 
Buford Highway, Mail Stop S106–5, 
Atlanta, GA 30341–3717; Email: 

ATSDRToxProfileFRNs@cdc.gov; Phone: 
1–800–232–4636. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: ATSDR 
has prepared drafts of five updated 
toxicological profiles based on current 
understanding of the health effects and 
availability of new studies and other 
information since their initial release. 
All toxicological profiles issued as 
‘‘Drafts for Public Comment’’ represent 
the result of ATSDR’s evidence-based 
evaluations of the available literature to 
provide important toxicological 
information on priority hazardous 
substances to the public and health 
professionals. ATSDR considers key 
studies for these substances during the 
profile development process, using a 
systematic review approach. To that 
end, ATSDR is seeking public 
comments and additional information or 
reports on studies about the health 
effects of these substances for review 
and potential inclusion in the profiles. 
ATSDR will evaluate the quality and 
relevance of such data or studies for 
possible inclusion in the final profiles 
which will be available in the docket 
(ATSDR–2024–0004) and online at 
https://www.atsdr.cdc.gov/ToxProfiles. 

Legislative Background 

The Superfund Amendments and 
Reauthorization Act of 1986 (SARA) (42 
U.S.C. 9601 et seq.) amended the 
Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation, and Liability 
Act of 1980 (CERCLA or Superfund) (42 
U.S.C. 9601 et seq.) by establishing 
certain requirements for ATSDR and the 
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency 
(EPA) regarding the hazardous 
substances most commonly found at 
facilities on the CERCLA National 
Priorities List. Among these statutory 
requirements is a mandate for the 
Administrator of ATSDR to prepare 
toxicological profiles for each substance 
included on the priority list of 
hazardous substances (also called the 
Substance Priority List (SPL)). This list 
identifies 275 hazardous substances that 
ATSDR has determined pose the most 
significant potential threat to human 
health. The SPL is available online at 
https://www.atsdr.cdc.gov/SPL. ATSDR 
is also mandated to revise and publish 
updated toxicological profiles, as 
necessary, to reflect updated health 
effects and other information. 

In addition, CERCLA provides ATSDR 
with the authority to prepare 
toxicological profiles for substances not 
found on the SPL. CERCLA authorizes 
ATSDR to establish and maintain an 
inventory of literature, research, and 
studies on the health effects of toxic 
substances (CERCLA section 
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