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Filings Instituting Proceedings 

Docket Numbers: RP25–1062–000. 
Applicants: National Fuel Gas Supply 

Corporation. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: 

Negotiated Rate for Citadel Energy 
Marketing to be effective 9/1/2025. 

Filed Date: 8/8/25. 
Accession Number: 20250808–5029. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 8/20/25. 

Any person desiring to intervene, to 
protest, or to answer a complaint in any 
of the above proceedings must file in 
accordance with Rules 211, 214, or 206 
of the Commission’s Regulations (18 
CFR 385.211, 385.214, or 385.206) on or 
before 5:00 p.m. Eastern time on the 
specified comment date. Protests may be 
considered, but intervention is 
necessary to become a party to the 
proceeding. 

Filings in Existing Proceedings 

Docket Numbers: RP24–780–000. 
Applicants: Maritimes & Northeast 

Pipeline, L.L.C. 
Description: Refund Report: 

Maritimes RP24–780 Refund Report to 
be effective N/A. 

Filed Date: 8/8/25. 
Accession Number: 20250808–5067. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 8/20/25. 

Any person desiring to protest in any 
the above proceedings must file in 
accordance with Rule 211 of the 
Commission’s Regulations (18 CFR 
385.211) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 

The filings are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/ 
fercgensearch.asp) by querying the 
docket number. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, community organization, 
Tribal members and others, access 
publicly available information and 
navigate Commission processes. For 
public inquiries and assistance with 
making filings such as interventions, 
comments, or requests for rehearing, the 
public is encouraged to contact OPP at 
(202) 502–6595 or OPP@ferc.gov. 

Dated: August 8, 2025. 
Carlos D. Clay, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–15337 Filed 8–12–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OLEM–2025–0586; 12864–01– 
OLEM] 

Financial Assurance Guidance for the 
Good Samaritan Remediation of 
Abandoned Hardrock Mines Act of 
2024 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In the Good Samaritan 
Remediation of Abandoned Hardrock 
Mines Act of 2024, as part of the permit 
application, Good Samaritan applicants 
must provide financial assurance for 
every project. This document provides 
guidance in drafting and fulfilling the 
financial assurance components of Good 
Samaritan permits. This guidance 
defines relevant terms, discusses initial 
and modified cost estimates and 
financial assurance mechanisms, and 
describes how financial assurance may 
be accessed and released by the 
Environmental Protection Agency 
(EPA). 

DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before September 12, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
referencing Docket ID No. EPA–HQ– 
OLEM–2025–0586 to EPA online using 
https://www.regulations.gov (our 
preferred method), or by mail to: EPA 
Docket Center, Environmental 
Protection Agency, Mail Code 28221T, 
1200 Pennsylvania Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20460. EPA’s policy is 
that all comments received will be 
included in the public docket without 
change including any personal 
information provided, unless the 
comment includes profanity, threats, 
information claimed to be Confidential 
Business Information (CBI) or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jamey Watt, Office of Mountains, 
Deserts and Plains, Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave. NW, Mail Code 5106P, 
Washington, DC 20460; telephone 
number: (202) 566–0196; email address: 
watt.jamey@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Good 
Samaritan Remediation of Abandoned 

Hardrock Mines Act of 2024 (the Act) 
establishes a pilot program authorizing 
the Administrator of the EPA, among 
other things, to grant up to 15 Good 
Samaritan permits for low-risk projects 
designed to remediate abandoned 
hardrock mine sites. The Administrator 
may grant a permit only if, among other 
considerations, the applicant for that 
permit has demonstrated to the 
satisfaction of the Administrator that the 
applicant has, or has access to, the 
financial resources to complete the 
project or has established a third-party 
financial assurance mechanism. In the 
event a Good Samaritan does not 
complete permit requirements, financial 
assurance funds secured under a third- 
party mechanism are intended to 
provide funding to complete the 
permitted work and for the purpose of 
carrying out the Act without the use of 
taxpayer funds. 

Lee Zeldin, 
Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2025–15352 Filed 8–12–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–1022; FR ID 308191] 

Information Collection Being 
Submitted for Review and Approval to 
Office of Management and Budget 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal Agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Pursuant to the Small Business 
Paperwork Relief Act of 2002, the FCC 
seeks specific comment on how it might 
‘‘further reduce the information 
collection burden for small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 
employees.’’ 

The Commission may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) control number. No person shall 
be subject to any penalty for failing to 
comply with a collection of information 
subject to the PRA that does not display 
a valid OMB control number. 
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