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ACTION: Notice to rescind a Notice of 
Intent to prepare an Environmental 
Impact Statement. 

SUMMARY: The FHWA is issuing this 
notice to advise the public that we are 
rescinding the Notice of Intent (NOI) to 
prepare a Supplemental Environmental 
Impact Statement (SEIS) for 
improvements that were proposed for 
U.S. 231 Jasper Huntingburg project in 
Dubois County, Indiana. In March 2004, 
FHWA released the U.S. 231 Draft EIS. 
The NOI for the SEIS was published in 
the Federal Register on June 2, 2010. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michelle Allen, Planning/
Environmental Specialist, Federal 
Highway Administration, Indiana 
Division, 575 North Pennsylvania 
Street, Room 254, Indianapolis, Indiana, 
Telephone: (317) 226–7344. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
FHWA, in cooperation with the Indiana 
Department of Transportation, is 
rescinding the NOI to prepare a 
Supplemental Draft Environmental 
Impact Statement (SDEIS) for the U.S. 
231 Jasper Huntingburg project in 
Dubois County, Indiana. Due to a 
reevaluation of the traffic information, 
the project is no longer warranted and 
the Notice of Intent is rescinded. 

Authority: 23 U.S.C. 31.5; 23 CFR 771.123; 
49 CFR 1.48. 

Dated: January 14, 2014. 
Richard J. Marquis, 
Division Administrator, Indianapolis, 
Indiana. 
[FR Doc. 2014–01498 Filed 1–24–14; 8:45 am] 
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Pipeline Safety: Meeting of the 
Technical Pipeline Advisory 
Committee and the Liquid Pipeline 
Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Pipeline and Hazardous 
Materials Safety Administration 
(PHMSA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice of advisory committee 
meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces a 
public meeting of the Gas Pipeline 
Advisory Committee (GPAC), also 
known as the Technical Pipeline Safety 
Standards Committee, and the Liquid 
Pipeline Advisory Committee (LPAC), 
also known as the Technical Hazardous 
Liquid Pipeline Safety Standards 
Committee. 

DATES: The committees will meet in 
joint sessions on Tuesday, February, 25, 
2014, from 1 p.m. to 5 p.m. and on 
Wednesday, February 26, 2014, from 9 
a.m. to 5 p.m., EST. 

The meetings will not be web cast; 
however, presentations will be available 
on the meeting Web site and posted on 
the E-Gov Web site: http://
www.regulations.gov under docket 
number PHMSA–2009–0203 within 30 
days following the meeting. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting location, 
agenda, and any additional information 
will be published on the PHMSA Web 
site (http://www.phmsa.dot.gov/public) 
under ‘‘Latest News’’ on the homepage. 
In the interim, please register on the 
following pipeline advisory committee 
page: https://primis.phmsa.dot.gov/
meetings/MtgHome.mtg?mtg=94. An 
email announcing the meeting location 
will be forwarded to all who have 
preregistered with PHMSA as soon as 
the meeting location is determined. 

Any additional information will be 
published on the PHMSA Web site 
(http://www.phmsa.dot.gov/public) 
under ‘‘Latest News’’ on the homepage. 

Comments on the meeting may be 
submitted to the docket in the following 
ways: 

E-Gov Web site: http://
www.regulations.gov. This site allows 
the public to enter comments on any 
Federal Register notice issued by any 
agency. 

Fax: 1–202–493–2251. 
Mail: Docket Management Facility; 

U.S. Department of Transportation 
(DOT), 1200 New Jersey Avenue SE., 
West Building, Room W12–140, 
Washington, DC 20590–001. 

Hand Delivery: Room W12–140 on the 
ground level of the DOT West Building, 
1200 New Jersey Avenue SE., 
Washington, DC, between 9 a.m. and 5 
p.m., Monday through Friday, except on 
Federal holidays. 

Instructions: Identify the docket 
number PHMSA–2009–0203 at the 
beginning of your comments. Note that 
all comments received will be posted 
without change to http://
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided. You 
should know that anyone is able to 
search the electronic form of all 
comments received into any of our 
dockets by the name of the individual 
submitting the comment (or signing the 
comment, if submitted on behalf of an 
association, business, labor union, etc.). 
Therefore, you may want to review 
DOT’s complete Privacy Act Statement 
in the Federal Register published on 
April 11, 2000, (65 FR 19476) or view 
the Privacy Notice at http://

www.regulations.gov before submitting 
any such comments. 

Docket: For access to the docket or to 
read background documents or 
comments, go to http://
www.regulations.gov at any time or to 
Room W12–140 on the ground level of 
the DOT West Building, 1200 New 
Jersey Avenue SE., Washington, DC, 
between 9 a.m. and 5 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, except Federal holidays. 

If you wish to receive confirmation of 
receipt of your written comments, 
please include a self-addressed, 
stamped postcard with the following 
statement: ‘‘Comments on PHMSA– 
2009–0203.’’ The Docket Clerk will 
date-stamp the postcard prior to 
returning it to you via the U.S. mail. 
Please note that due to delays in the 
delivery of U.S. mail to Federal offices 
in Washington, DC, we recommend that 
persons consider an alternative method 
(Internet, fax, or professional delivery 
service) of submitting comments to the 
docket and ensuring their timely receipt 
at DOT. 

Privacy Act Statement 

Anyone may search the electronic 
form of comments received in response 
to any of our dockets by the name of the 
individual who submitted the comment 
(or signing the comment, if submitted 
on behalf of an association, business, 
labor union, etc.). DOT’s complete 
Privacy Act Statement was published in 
the Federal Register on April 11, 2000 
(65 FR 19476). 

Information on Services for Individuals 
With Disabilities 

For information on facilities or 
services for individuals with 
disabilities, or to seek special assistance 
at the meeting, please contact Cheryl 
Whetsel at 202–366–4431 by February 
10, 2014. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
information about the meeting, contact 
Cheryl Whetsel by phone at 202–366– 
4431 or by email at cheryl.whetsel@
dot.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Meeting Details 

The committees will meet to discuss 
whether or not to support the exclusion 
of section 4.2 of ASTM D2513–09a, 
‘‘Standard Specification for 
Polyethylene (PE) Gas Pressure Pipe, 
Tubing, and Fittings,’’ for PE materials. 
Section 4.2 addresses the use of rework 
materials. Other topics to be discussed 
will include performance metrics for 
pipeline operations, safety management 
systems in other industries, and agency, 
State, and stakeholder priorities. 
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Members of the public may attend 
and make a statement during the 
advisory committee meeting. If you 
intend to make a statement, please 
notify PHMSA in advance by 
forwarding an email to cheryl.whetsel@
dot.gov by February 10, 2014. 

II. Committee Background 

The GPAC and LPAC are statutorily 
mandated advisory committees that 
advise PHMSA on proposed safety 
standards, risk assessments, and safety 
policies for natural gas pipelines and for 
hazardous liquid pipelines. Both 
committees were established under the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (Pub. 
L. 92–463, 5 U.S.C. App. 1) and the 
pipeline safety law (49 U.S.C. Chap. 
601). Each committee consists of 15 
members—with membership evenly 
divided among the Federal and State 
government, the regulated industry, and 
the public. The committees advise 
PHMSA on the technical feasibility, 
practicability, and cost-effectiveness of 
each proposed pipeline safety standard. 

III. Agenda 

The Agenda will be published on the 
PHMSA Web site. 

Authority: 49 U.S.C. 60102, 60115; 60118. 

Issued in Washington, DC, on January 17, 
2014. 
Jeffrey D. Wiese, 
Associate Administrator for Pipeline Safety. 
[FR Doc. 2014–01347 Filed 1–24–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–60–P 

DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS 
AFFAIRS 

Privacy Act of 1974 

AGENCY: Department of Veterans Affairs 
(VA). 
ACTION: Notice of new system of records. 

SUMMARY: The Privacy Act of 1974 (5 
U.S.C. 552(e)(4)) requires that all 
agencies publish in the Federal Register 
a notice of the existence and character 
of their systems of records. Notice is 
hereby given that the Department of 
Veterans Affairs (VA) is establishing a 
new system of records entitled ‘‘VHA 
Corporate Data Warehouse-VA’’ 
(172VA10P2). 

DATES: Comments on this new system of 
records must be received no later than 
February 26, 2014. If no public 
comment is received during the period 
allowed for comment or unless 
otherwise published in the Federal 
Register by VA, the new system will 
become effective February 26, 2014. 

ADDRESSES: Written comments 
concerning the proposed amended 
system of records may be submitted by: 
mail or hand-delivery to Director, 
Regulations Management (02REG), 
Department of Veterans Affairs, 810 
Vermont Avenue NW., Room 1068, 
Washington, DC 20420; fax to (202) 
273–9026; or email to http://
www.Regulations.gov. All comments 
received will be available for public 
inspection in the Office of Regulation 
Policy and Management, Room 1063B, 
between the hours of 8 a.m. and 4:30 
p.m., Monday through Friday (except 
holidays). Please call (202) 461–4902 
(this is not a toll-free number) for an 
appointment. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Veterans Health Administration (VHA) 
Privacy Officer, Department of Veterans 
Affairs, 810 Vermont Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20420; telephone (704) 
245–2492. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Background: VHA is the largest health 
care provider in the country. In order to 
maintain this organization, VHA 
collects patient health data, financial 
data, employee data, and patient entered 
data for patient care, decision support, 
population studies, research, behavior 
profiling, workflow integration and 
other business intelligence applications. 
The data is entered and stored in the 
appropriate system of record. 

I. Description of Proposed Systems of 
Records: The proposed system of record 
identifies data warehouses that contains 
health information such as patient 
assessments, diagnoses, treatments, 
tests, and pharmaceutical data. The 
records include information created or 
collected during the course of normal 
clinical and administrative work and is 
provided by employees, students, 
volunteers, caregivers, contractors, 
subcontractors, and consultants. It also 
contains patient self-entered data and 
patient financial information provided 
by patients or other governmental 
agencies. 

All data collected by the organization 
and centrally stored in the Corporate 
Data Warehouse (CDW) provides a 
central source of data that supports the 
delivery of health care, supports 
management decision making, allows 
for performance measurement, and 
provides a rich resource for VHA 
research. The CDW is located in Austin, 
Texas. VA delivers information 
technology support by dividing the 
United States into four regions. Each 
region contains a regional data 
warehouse (RDW) that may contain 
some or all of the CDW content. 

VHA uses data stored in data 
warehouses to prepare various 
management, tracking, and follow-up 
reports necessary for the effective 
operation of VHA as it plans for and 
then delivers quality health care, which 
includes evaluating patient eligibility, 
benefits and care services; monitoring 
the distribution and utilization of 
resources including provider panel 
management; tracking disease and 
patient outcomes; program review, 
accreditation and licensing; quality 
assurance audits and investigations; law 
enforcement investigations; and 
measuring Veterans Integrated Service 
Network (VISN) performance. The data 
may be used to validate labor policies 
and practices and be extracted or 
interrogated by VA researchers in 
accordance with established protocols. 
The data warehouses covered by this 
system of records are identified and 
listed with their physical location in 
Appendix A. 

II. Proposed Routine Use Disclosures 
of Data in the System: To the extent that 
records contained in the system include 
information protected by 38 U.S.C. 
7332, (i.e., medical treatment 
information related to drug abuse, 
alcoholism or alcohol abuse, sickle cell 
anemia or infection with the human 
immunodeficiency virus), that 
information cannot be disclosed under a 
routine use unless there is also specific 
statutory authority permitting 
disclosure. 

VHA is proposing the following 
routine use disclosures of information to 
be maintained in the system: 

1. On its own initiative, VA may 
disclose information, except for the 
names and home addresses of veterans 
and their dependents, to a Federal, 
State, local, tribal, or foreign agency 
charged with the responsibility of 
investigating or prosecuting civil, 
criminal or regulatory violations of law, 
or charged with enforcing or 
implementing the statute, regulation, 
rule or order issued pursuant thereto. 
On its own initiative, VA may also 
disclose the names and addresses of 
veterans and their dependents to a 
Federal agency charged with the 
responsibility of investigating or 
prosecuting civil, criminal or regulatory 
violations of law, or charged with 
enforcing or implementing the statute, 
regulation, rule or order issued pursuant 
thereto. VA must be able to comply with 
the requirements of agencies charged 
with enforcing the law and conducting 
investigations. VA must also be able to 
provide information to State or local 
agencies charged with protecting the 
public’s health as set forth in State law. 
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