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Classified National Security 
Information, and the Intelligence 
Reform and Terrorism Prevention Act of 
2004 (Public Law 108–458). 

PURPOSE(S): 
The Office of Security gathers 

information in order to create 
investigative records which are used for 
processing personal security 
background investigations to determine 
eligibility to be awarded a federal 
security clearance, suitability 
determination for federal employment, 
access to federally owned/controlled 
facilities and access to federally owned/ 
controlled information systems. 

ROUTINE USE OF RECORDS MAINTAINED IN THE 
SYSTEM, INCLUDING CATEGORIES OF USERS AND 
THE PURPOSES OF SUCH USES: 

In addition to USAID’s Statement of 
General Routine Uses, the Office of 
Security may disclose information in 
this system as follows: 

(1) To consumer reporting agencies in 
order to obtain consumer credit reports, 

(2) To federal, international, state, and 
local law enforcement agencies, U.S. 
Government Agencies, courts, the 
Department of State, Foreign 
Governments, to the extent necessary to 
further the purposes of an investigation, 

(3) Results of the investigation may be 
disclosed to the Department of State or 
other Federal Agencies for the purposes 
of granting physical and/or logical 
access to federally owned or controlled 
facilities and/or information systems in 
accordance with the requirements set 
forth in HSPD–12. 

POLICIES AND PRACTICES FOR STORING, 
RETRIEVING, ACCESSING, RETAINING, AND 
DISPOSING OF RECORDS IN THE SYSTEM: 

STORAGE: 
Paper copies of information are 

maintained in file folders and secured 
using locked cabinets and safes. 
Electronic copies of information are 
secured using password protection and 
role-based protocols. 

RETRIEVABILITY: 
Records are retrievable by last name, 

social security number, and/or USAID 
assigned case number or other unique 
identifier attributed to the individual. 

SAFEGUARDS: 
Records are kept within the Office of 

Security secured space. Access to this 
space is controlled by electronic card 
readers, office personnel to control 
access, visitor escorts policy and 
supplemented by an armed response 
force. Administrative safeguards of 
records are provided through the use of 
internal Standard Operating Procedures 
and routine appraisal reviews of the 

personnel security and suitability 
program by the Office of Personnel 
Management. 

RETENTION AND DISPOSAL: 
Records are retained using the 

approved National Archives Records 
Administration, Schedule 18—Security 
and Protective Services Records. 

SYSTEM MANAGER AND ADDRESS: 
Director, USAID Office of Security, 

RRB Suite 2.06A, 1300 Pennsylvania 
Ave, NW., Washington, DC 20523. 

NOTIFICATION PROCEDURES: 
Records in this system are exempt 

from notification, access, and 
amendment procedures in accordance 
with subsection (k)(1) and (5) of the 5 
U.S.C. 552a, and 22 CFR 215.14. 
Individuals wishing to inquire whether 
this system of records contains 
information about themselves should 
submit their inquires in writing to the 
USAID Chief Privacy Officer, 1300 
Pennsylvania Avenue, NW., Room 2.12– 
003, Washington, DC 20523. 

The request must be in writing and 
include the requestor’s full name, date 
of birth, social security number (or other 
government-issued identity number) 
and current address. In addition, 
requestors must also reasonably specify 
the record contents being sought. 

RECORD ACCESS PROCEDURES: 
Individuals wishing to request access 

to a non-exempt record must submit the 
request in writing according to the 
‘‘Notification Procedures’’ above. An 
individual wishing to request access to 
records in person must provide identity 
documents, such as a government- 
issued photo ID, sufficient to satisfy the 
custodian of the records that the 
requester is entitled to access. 

CONTESTING RECORD PROCEDURES: 
An individual requesting amendment 

of a record maintained on himself or 
herself must identify the information to 
be changed and the corrective action 
sought. Requests must follow the 
‘‘Notification Procedures’’ above. 

RECORD SOURCE CATEGORIES: 
Information in this system is obtained 

from the individual on whom it applies; 
independent sources such as other 
government agencies, state/local 
government; law enforcement agencies; 
credit bureaus; medical providers; 
educational institutions; private 
organizations; information provided by 
personal references; and through source 
interviews. 

EXEMPTIONS CLAIMED FOR THE SYSTEM: 
Under the specific authority provided 

by subsection (k)(1), (3), and (5) of 5 

U.S.C. 552a, USAID has promulgated 
rules specified in 22 CFR 215.14, that 
exempts this system from notice, access, 
and amendment requirements of 5 
U.S.C. 552a, subsections (c)(3), (d); 
(e)(1); (e)(4); (G); (H); (I); and (f). The 
reasons for these exemptions are to 
maintain confidentiality of sources, 
National Security, and to prevent 
frustration of the federal investigative 
process. 

[FR Doc. E8–8240 Filed 4–16–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6116–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

April 11, 2008. 
The Department of Agriculture has 

submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments 
regarding (a) whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of burden including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on those who are to respond, including 
through the use of appropriate 
automated, electronic, mechanical, or 
other technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology should be addressed to: Desk 
Officer for Agriculture, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB), 
OIRA_Submission@OMB.EOP.GOV or 
fax (202) 395–5806 and to Departmental 
Clearance Office, USDA, OCIO, Mail 
Stop 7602, Washington, DC 20250– 
7602. Comments regarding these 
information collections are best assured 
of having their full effect if received 
within 30 days of this notification. 
Copies of the submission(s) may be 
obtained by calling (202) 720–8681. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
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displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Agricultural Marketing Service 

Title: Recordkeeping Requirements 
for Certified Applicators of Federally 
Restricted Use Pesticides (7 CFR part 
110). 

OMB Control Number: 0581–0164. 
Summary of Collection: The Food, 

Agriculture, Conservation, and Trade 
(FACT) Act of 1990 (Subtitle H, Sec. 
1491) mandates the Department of 
Agriculture (USDA) in consultation 
with the Administrator of the 
Environmental Protection Agency 
(EPA), ‘‘ shall require certified 
applicators of federally restricted use 
pesticides to maintain records 
comparable to records maintained by 
commercial applicators in each state.’’ 
In addition, USDA and the 
Administrator of EPA are required 
under section 1491(f) of the FACT Act 
to survey the records and develop and 
maintain a data base so USDA and the 
Administrator of EPA can prepare and 
publish annual pesticide use reports, 
copies of which must be transmitted to 
Congress. Agricultural Marketing 
Service (AMS) is charged with 
administering the Federal Pesticide 
Recordkeeping Program. AMS requires 
certified private applicators of federally 
restricted use pesticides to maintain 
records of all restricted use pesticide 
applications for a period of two years. 

Need and Use of the Information: 
AMS will collect information using the 
ST–8, Pesticide Recordkeeping 
Inspection Form. In order to properly 
administer the Pesticide Recordkeeping 
Program, AMS needs to monitor and 
determine to what extent private 
applicators are complying with the 
program’s requirements and identify the 
reasons for non/or partial compliance. 
AMS has the responsibility to assure 
records are kept to provide information 
to be utilized by licensed health care 
professionals for possible medical 
treatment. In addition, the stature 
requires USDA to submit annual reports 
to Congress pertaining to the use of 
restricted use pesticides in agricultural 
production. 

Description of Respondents: Farms; 
State, Local or Tribal Government. 

Number of Respondents: 592,233. 
Frequency of Responses: 

Recordkeeping; Reporting: On occasion. 
Total Burden Hours: 1,797,714. 

Charlene Parker, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. E8–8264 Filed 4–16–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3410–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

A–583–833 

Certain Polyester Staple Fiber from 
Taiwan: Preliminary Results of 
Antidumping Duty Administrative 
Review 

AGENCY: Import Administration, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 
SUMMARY: The Department of Commerce 
is conducting an administrative review 
of the antidumping duty order on 
certain polyester staple fiber from 
Taiwan. The period of review is May 1, 
2006, through April 30, 2007. This 
review covers imports of certain 
polyester staple fiber from one 
producer/exporter. We have 
preliminarily found that sales of the 
subject merchandise have been made 
below normal value. If these 
preliminary results are adopted in our 
final results, we will instruct U.S. 
Customs and Border Protection to assess 
antidumping duties on all appropriate 
entries. Interested parties are invited to 
comment on these preliminary results. 
Parties who submit comments in this 
review are requested to submit with 
each argument (1) a statement of the 
issue and (2) a brief summary of the 
argument. We will issue the final results 
not later than 120 days after the date of 
publication of this notice. 
EFFECTIVE DATE: April 17, 2008. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Thomas Schauer or Richard Rimlinger, 
AD/CVD Operations, Office 5, Import 
Administration, International Trade 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Commerce, 14th Street and Constitution 
Avenue, NW, Washington DC 20230; 
telephone (202) 482–0410 and (202) 
482–4477, respectively. 

Background 

On May 25, 2000, the Department of 
Commerce (Department) published an 
antidumping duty order on certain 
polyester staple fiber (PSF) from 
Taiwan. See Notice of Amended Final 
Determination of Sales at Less Than 
Fair Value: Certain Polyester Staple 
Fiber From the Republic of Korea and 
Antidumping Duty Orders: Certain 
Polyester Staple Fiber From the 
Republic of Korea and Taiwan, 65 FR 
33807 (May 25, 2000). On May 1, 2007, 
the Department published a notice of 
‘‘Opportunity to Request Administrative 
Review’’ of this order. See Antidumping 
or Countervailing Duty Order, Finding, 
or Suspended Investigation; 
Opportunity to Request Administrative 

Review, 72 FR 23796 (May 1, 2007). On 
May 31, 2007, Far Eastern Textile 
Limited (FET), a Taiwanese producer 
and exporter of the subject merchandise, 
and Wellman Inc. and Invista S.a.r.L. 
(collectively, the petitioners) requested 
an administrative review of FET. On 
June 29, 2007, the Department 
published a notice initiating an 
administrative review for PSF from 
Taiwan. See Initiation of Antidumping 
and Countervailing Duty Administrative 
Reviews, Request for Revocation in Part 
and Deferral of Administrative Review, 
72 FR 35690 (June 29, 2007). The period 
of review (POR) is May 1, 2006, through 
April 30, 2007. 

Scope of the Order 
The product covered by the order is 

PSF. PSF is defined as synthetic staple 
fibers, not carded, combed or otherwise 
processed for spinning, of polyesters 
measuring 3.3 decitex (3 denier, 
inclusive) or more in diameter. This 
merchandise is cut to lengths varying 
from one inch (25 mm) to five inches 
(127 mm). The merchandise subject to 
the order may be coated, usually with a 
silicon or other finish, or not coated. 
PSF is generally used as stuffing in 
sleeping bags, mattresses, ski jackets, 
comforters, cushions, pillows, and 
furniture. Merchandise of less than 3.3 
decitex (less than 3 denier) currently 
classifiable in the Harmonized Tariff 
Schedule of the United States (HTSUS) 
at subheading 5503.20.00.20 is 
specifically excluded from the order. 
Also specifically excluded from the 
order are polyester staple fibers of 10 to 
18 denier that are cut to lengths of 6 to 
8 inches (fibers used in the manufacture 
of carpeting). In addition, low–melt PSF 
is excluded from this order. Low–melt 
PSF is defined as a bi–component fiber 
with an outer sheath that melts at a 
significantly lower temperature than its 
inner core. 

The merchandise subject to this order 
is currently classifiable in the HTSUS at 
subheadings 5503.20.00.45 and 
5503.20.00.65. Although the HTSUS 
subheadings are provided for 
convenience and customs purposes, the 
written description of the merchandise 
subject to the order is dispositive. 

Fair–Value Comparisons 
To determine whether FET’s sales of 

PSF to the United States were made at 
less than normal value (NV), we 
compared export price (EP) to NV, as 
described in the ‘‘Export Price’’ and 
‘‘Normal Value’’ sections of this notice. 

Pursuant to section 777A(d)(2) of the 
Tariff Act of 1930, as amended (the Act), 
we compared the EP of individual U.S. 
transactions to the monthly weighted– 
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