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identified noncompliance with the 
criteria in 34 CFR 602.18(c), 602.25(a), 
602.25(d), 602.25(e), and 602.25(f). 
Please note: Given the time constraints 
of this review and multiple time 
extensions provided to the agency for 
response to Department inquiries, the 
Department determined that it was not 
practicable to invite the public to 
submit written comments in advance of 
the NACIQI meeting. The public is 
invited to provide oral comments at the 
meeting, and instructions for 
registration for oral comments are set 
forth at the end of this notice. 

NACIQI Subcommittee on Governance 
The subcommittee will provide an 

update on its research of accreditor and 
state/gubernatorial relations. 

Presentation on Student Success 
A NACIQI member will lead a 

discussion on student success focusing 
on accreditation and preaccreditation 
standards, as discussed under 34 CFR 
602.16(a)(1)(i). 

Submission of requests to make an 
oral comment regarding a specific 
accrediting agency under review, or to 
make an oral comment or written 
statement regarding other issues within 
the scope of NACIQI’s authority: 
Opportunity to submit a written 
statement regarding a specific 
accrediting agency under review was 
requested by a previous Federal 
Register notice published on March 4, 
2020 (85 FR 12778; Document Number 
2020–04410). The period for submission 
of such statements is now closed. 
Additional written comments regarding 
a specific agency or state approval 
agency under review will not be 
accepted at this time. However, 
members of the public may submit 
written statements regarding other 
issues within the scope of NACIQI’s 
authority for consideration by NACIQI 
in the manner described below. Oral 
comments may not exceed three 
minutes. 

Oral comments about an agency’s 
recognition after review of a compliance 
report must relate to issues identified in 
the compliance report and the criteria 
for recognition cited in the senior 
Department official’s letter that 
requested the report, or in the 
Secretary’s appeal decision, if any. Oral 
comments about an agency seeking 
expansion of scope must be directed to 
the agency’s ability to serve as a 
recognized accrediting agency with 
respect to the kinds of institutions or 
programs requested to be added. Oral 
comments about the renewal of an 
agency’s recognition based on a review 
of the agency’s petition and oral 

comments about the review of an agency 
during its period of recognition 
pursuant to § 602.33 must relate to its 
compliance with the Criteria for the 
Recognition of Accrediting Agencies, 
which are available at http://
www.ed.gov/admins/finaid/accred/ 
index.html. Written statements and oral 
comments concerning NACIQI’s work 
outside of a specific accrediting agency 
under review must be limited to the 
scope of NACIQI’s authority as outlined 
under section 114 of the HEA. 

To request to make a third-party oral 
comment of three minutes or less during 
the July 29 & 30, 2020 meeting, please 
follow either Method One or Method 
Two noted below. To submit a written 
statement to NACIQI concerning its 
work outside of a specific accrediting 
agency under review, please follow 
Method One. 

Method One: Submit written 
statements and/or a request for oral 
comment by email to the 
ThirdPartyComments@ed.gov mailbox. 
Please do not send material directly to 
NACIQI members. Written statements 
relating to NACIQI’s work outside of a 
specific agency under review and 
requests to make oral comment must be 
received by July 15, 2020 and include 
the subject line ‘‘Oral Comment 
Request: (Agency name),’’ ‘‘Oral 
Comment Request: (Subject)’’ or 
‘‘Written Statement: (Subject).’’ The 
email must include the name(s), title, 
organization/affiliation, mailing 
address, email address, telephone 
number, of the person(s) submitting a 
written statement or requesting to speak, 
and a brief summary (not to exceed one 
page) of the principal points to be made 
during the oral presentation, if 
applicable. All individuals submitting 
an advance request in accordance with 
this notice will be afforded an 
opportunity to speak during the virtual 
meeting. 

Method Two: (Only available to those 
seeking to submit oral comments). 
Register on July 29, 2020, from 7:45 
a.m.–8:45 a.m., to make an oral 
comment during NACIQI’s 
deliberations, using the designated entry 
link for Wednesday, July 29, 2020 
https://ems8.intellor.com?do=register&
t=1&p=827612. The requestor must 
provide the subject on which he or she 
wishes to comment, in addition to his 
or her name, title, organization/ 
affiliation, mailing address, email 
address, and telephone number. A total 
of up to 15 minutes for each agenda 
item will be allotted for oral 
commenters who register on July 29, 
2020 by 8:45 a.m. Individuals will be 
selected on a first-come, first-served 

basis. If selected, each comment may 
not exceed three minutes. 

Access to Records of the Meeting: The 
Department will post the official report 
of the meeting on the NACIQI website 
within 90 days after the meeting. In 
addition, pursuant to the FACA, the 
public may request to inspect records of 
the meeting at 400 Maryland Avenue 
SW, Washington, DC, by emailing 
aslrecordsmanager@ed.gov or by calling 
(202) 453–7415 to schedule an 
appointment. 

Reasonable Accommodations: The 
meeting weblinks, personalized dial in 
details, access code, and conference 
weblink are accessible to individuals 
with disabilities. If you will need an 
auxiliary aid or service to participate in 
the meeting (e.g., interpreting service, 
assistive listening device, or materials in 
an alternate format), notify the contact 
person listed in this notice at least two 
weeks before the scheduled meeting 
date. Although we will attempt to meet 
a request received after that date, we 
may not be able to make available the 
requested auxiliary aid or service 
because of insufficient time to arrange 
it. 

Electronic Access to This Document: 
The official version of this document is 
the document published in the Federal 
Register. Free internet access to the 
official edition of the Federal Register 
and the Code of Federal Regulations is 
available via the Federal Digital System 
at: www.gpo.gov/fdsys. At this site you 
can view this document, as well as all 
other documents of this Department 
published in the Federal Register, in 
text or Adobe Portable Document 
Format (PDF). To use PDF, you must 
have Adobe Acrobat Reader, which is 
available free at the site. You also may 
access documents of the Department 
published in the Federal Register by 
using the article search feature at: 
www.federalregister.gov. Specifically, 
through the advanced search feature at 
this site, you can limit your search to 
documents published by the 
Department. 

Authority: 20 U.S.C. 1011c. 

Robert L. King, 
Assistant Secretary, Office of Postsecondary 
Education. 
[FR Doc. 2020–13723 Filed 6–24–20; 8:45 am] 
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ACTION: Notice of open meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces a 
meeting of the Basic Energy Sciences 
Advisory Committee (BESAC). The 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
requires that public notice of these 
meetings be announced in the Federal 
Register. 
DATES: Thursday, July 30, 2020; 10:45 
a.m. to 4:40 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: This meeting is open to the 
public. This meeting will be held 
digitally via Zoom. Information to 
participate can be found on the website 
closer to the meeting date at: https://
science.osti.gov/bes/besac/Meetings. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Katie Runkles; Office of Basic Energy 
Sciences; U.S. Department of Energy; 
Germantown Building, 1000 
Independence Avenue SW, Washington, 
DC 20585; Telephone: (301) 903–6529; 
email: Katie.runkles@science.doe.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Purpose of the Board: The purpose of 
this Board is to make recommendation 
to DOE–SC with respect to the basic 
energy sciences research program. 

Tentative Agenda: 
• Call to Order, Introductions, Review 

of the Agenda 
• News from the Office of Science 
• News from the Office of Basic Energy 

Sciences 
• Neutron Subcommittee Draft Report 

Presentation 
• International Benchmarking Study 

Update 
• Chemical Sciences, Geosciences and 

Biosciences Division COV Meeting 
Announcement 

• Energy Frontier Research Centers/Hub 
COV Meeting Announcement 

• Basic Research Needs Workshop on 
Transformative Manufacturing Update 

• Public Comments 
• Adjourn 
Breaks Taken As Appropriate 

Public Participation: The meeting is 
open to the public. A webcast of this 
meeting will be available. Please check 
the website below for updates and 
information on how to view the 
meeting. If you would like to file a 
written statement with the Committee, 
you may do so either before or after the 
meeting. If you would like to make oral 
statements regarding any of the items on 
the agenda, you should contact Katie 
Runkles at katie.runkles@
science.doe.gov. You must make your 
request for an oral statement at least five 
business days before the meeting. 
Reasonable provision will be made to 
include the scheduled oral statements 
on the agenda. The Chairperson of the 
Committee will conduct the meeting to 

facilitate the orderly conduct of 
business. Public comment will follow 
the 10-minute rule. Information about 
the committee can be found at: https:// 
science.osti.gov/bes/besac. 

Minutes: The minutes of this meeting 
will be available for public review and 
copying within 30 days at the 
committee’s website: https://
science.osti.gov/bes/besac. 

Signed in Washington, DC on June 19, 
2020. 
LaTanya Butler, 
Deputy Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2020–13674 Filed 6–24–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER20–2098–000] 

Titan Solar 1, LLC; Supplemental 
Notice That Initial Market-Based Rate 
Filing Includes Request for Blanket 
Section 204 Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced Titan Solar 1, LLC’s 
application for market-based rate 
authority, with an accompanying rate 
tariff, noting that such application 
includes a request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is July 9, 2020. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
may mail similar pleadings to the 

Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Dated: June 19, 2020. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–13712 Filed 6–24–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings #1 

Take notice that the Commission 
received the following exempt 
wholesale generator filings: 

Docket Numbers: EG20–193–000. 
Applicants: Titan Solar 1, LLC. 
Description: Titan Solar 1, LLC Notice 

of Self-Certification of Exempt 
Wholesale Generator Status. 

Filed Date: 6/18/20. 
Accession Number: 20200618–5185. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 7/9/20. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following electric rate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: ER10–1633–002. 
Applicants: Deseret Generation and 

Transmission Co-operative, Inc. 
Description: Supplement to July 26, 

2019 Updated Market Power Analysis of 
Deseret Generation and Transmission 
Co-operative, Inc. 

Filed Date: 6/18/20. 
Accession Number: 20200618–5141. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 7/9/20. 
Docket Numbers: ER19–1939–002. 
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