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DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

Title: Division of Unaccompanied 
Children’s Services (DUCS) Request for 
Specific Consent. 

OMB No.: New Collection. 
Description: The William Wilberforce 

Trafficking Victims Protection 
Reauthorization Act of 2008 (TVPRA of 
2008), Public Law 110–457 was enacted 
into law December 23, 2008. Section 
235(d) directs the Secretary of HHS to 
grant or deny requests for specific 
consent for unaccompanied alien 

children in HHS custody who seek to 
invoke the jurisdiction of a state court 
for a dependency order and who also 
seek to invoke the jurisdiction of a state 
court to determine or alter his or her 
custody status or release from ORR. 
These requests can be extremely time 
sensitive since a child must ask a state 
court for dependency before turning 18 
years old. 

In developing procedures for 
collecting the necessary information 
from unaccompanied alien children, 
their attorneys, or other representatives 
to allow HHS to approve or deny 
consent requests, ORR/DUCS devised a 
form. Specifically, the form asks the 
requestor for his/her identifying 
information, basic identifying 
information on the unaccompanied 

alien child, the name of the HHS-funded 
facility where the child is in HHS 
custody and care, the name of the court 
and its location, and the kind of request 
(e.g., for a change in custody, etc.). The 
form also asks that the unaccompanied 
alien child’s attorney or authorized 
representative attach a Notice of 
Representation, which is an approved 
federal government agency form used 
for immigration procedures that 
authorizes the attorney to act on behalf 
of the child (i.e., G–28, EOIR–28, EOIR– 
29), or any other form of authorization 
to act on behalf of the unaccompanied 
alien child. 

Respondents: Attorneys, accredited 
legal representatives, or others 
authorized to act on behalf of a 
unaccompanied alien child. 

Instrument Number of 
respondents 

Number of 
responses per 

respondent 

Average bur-
den hours per 

response 

Total 
burden 
hours 

Request for Specific Consent to Juvenile Court Jurisdiction (ORR–0132) ..... 72 1 0.3333 24 

Additional Information 
Copies of the proposed collection may 

be obtained by writing to the 
Administration for Children and 
Families, Office of Administration, 
Office of Information Services, 370 
L’Enfant Promenade, SW., Washington, 
DC 20447, Attn: ACF Reports Clearance 
Officer. All requests should be 
identified by the title of the information 
collection. E-mail address: 
infocollection@acf.hhs.gov. 

OMB Comment 
OMB is required to make a decision 

concerning the collection of information 
between 30 and 60 days after 
publication of this document in the 
Federal Register. Therefore, a comment 
is best assured of having its full effect 
if OMB receives it within 30 days of 
publication. Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 

directly to the following: Office of 
Management and Budget, Paperwork 
Reduction Project, Fax: 202–395–7285, 
E-mail: 
OIRA_SUBMISSION@OMB.EOP.GOV, 
Attn: Desk Officer for the 
Administration for Children and 
Families. 

Robert Sargis, 
Reports Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–32504 Filed 12–27–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

Title: Notice of Interstate Lien. 

OMB No.: 0970–0153. 
Description: Section 452(a)(11) of the 

Social Security Act requires the 
Secretary of Health and Human Services 
to promulgate a form for imposition of 
liens to be used by the State child 
support enforcement (Title IV–D) 
agencies in interstate cases. Section 
454(9)(E) of the Social Security Act 
requires each State to cooperate with 
any other State in using the Federal 
form for imposition of liens in interstate 
child support cases. Tribal IV–D 
agencies are not required to use this 
form but may choose to do so. OMB 
approval of this form is expiring in 
February 2011 and the Administration 
for Children and Families is requesting 
an extension of this form. 

Respondents: State, local or Tribal 
agencies administering a child support 
enforcement program under title IV–D 
of the Social Security Act. 

ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES 

Instrument Number of 
respondents 

Number of 
responses per 
respondents 

Average 
burden hours 
per responses 

Total burden 
hours 

Notice of Lien ................................................................................................... 1,832,384 1 0.25 458,096 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 458,096. 

Additional Information: Copies of the 
proposed collection may be obtained by 
writing to the Administration for 
Children and Families, Office of 
Administration, Office of Information 

Services, 370 L’Enfant Promenade, SW., 
Washington, DC 20447, Attn: ACF 
Reports Clearance Officer. All requests 
should be identified by the title of the 
information collection. E-mail address: 
infocollection@acf.hhs.gov. 

OMB Comment: OMB is required to 
make a decision concerning the 
collection of information between 30 
and 60 days after publication of this 
document in the Federal Register. 
Therefore, a comment is best assured of 
having its full effect if OMB receives it 
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within 30 days of publication. Written 
comments and recommendations for the 
proposed information collection should 
be sent directly to the following: 

Office of Management and Budget, 
Paperwork Reduction Project. Fax: 202– 
395–7285. E-mail: 
OIRA_SUBMISSION@OMB.EOP.GOV. 
Attn: Desk Officer for the 
Administration for Children and 
Families. 

Dated: December 22, 2010. 
Robert Sargis, 
Reports Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–32592 Filed 12–27–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Food and Drug Administration 

[Docket No. FDA–2010–N–0198] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Announcement of Office of 
Management and Budget Approval; 
Premarket Notification 

AGENCY: Food and Drug Administration, 
HHS. 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Food and Drug 
Administration (FDA) is announcing 
that a collection of information entitled 
‘‘Premarket Notification’’ has been 
approved by the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) under the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Daniel Gittleson, Office of Information 
Management, Food and Drug 
Administration, 1350 Piccard Dr., PI50– 
400B, Rockville, MD 20850, 301–796– 
5156, e-mail: 
Daniel.Gittleson@fda.hhs.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In the 
Federal Register of August 11, 2010 (75 
FR 48696), the Agency announced that 
the proposed information collection had 
been submitted to OMB for review and 
clearance under 44 U.S.C. 3507. An 
Agency may not conduct or sponsor, 
and a person is not required to respond 
to, a collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. OMB has now approved the 
information collection and has assigned 
OMB control number 0910–0120. The 
approval expires on December 31, 2013. 
A copy of the supporting statement for 
this information collection is available 
on the Internet at http:// 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 

Dated: December 21, 2010. 

Leslie Kux, 
Acting Assistant Commissioner for Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2010–32508 Filed 12–27–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4160–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Food and Drug Administration 

[Docket No. FDA–2010–N–0447] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for Office of 
Management and Budget Review; 
Comment Request; Medical Devices; 
Third Party Review Program Under the 
Food and Drug Administration 
Modernization Act 

AGENCY: Food and Drug Administration, 
HHS. 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Food and Drug 
Administration (FDA) is announcing 
that a proposed collection of 
information has been submitted to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and clearance under 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(the PRA). 

DATES: Fax written comments on the 
collection of information by January 27, 
2011. 

ADDRESSES: To ensure that comments on 
the information collection are received, 
OMB recommends that written 
comments be faxed to the Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
OMB, Attn: FDA Desk Officer, FAX: 
202–395–7285, or e-mailed to 
oira_submission@omb.eop.gov. All 
comments should be identified with the 
OMB control number 0910–0375. Also 
include the FDA docket number found 
in brackets in the heading of this 
document. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Daniel Gittleson, Office of Information 
Management, Food and Drug 
Administration, 1350 Piccard Dr., PI50– 
400B, Rockville, MD 20850, 301–796– 
5156, e-mail: 
Daniel.Gittleson@fda.hhs.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
compliance with 44 U.S.C. 3507, FDA 
has submitted the following proposed 
collection of information to OMB for 
review and clearance. 

Medical Devices; Third Party Review 
Program Under the Food and Drug 
Administration Modernization Act— 
(OMB Control Number 0910–0375)— 
Extension 

Section 210 of the Food and Drug 
Administration Modernization Act 
(FDAMA) established section 523 of the 
Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act 
(the FD&C Act) (21 U.S.C. 360m), 
directing FDA to accredit persons in the 
private sector to review certain 
premarket notifications (510(k)s). 
Participation in this third-party review 
program by accredited persons is 
entirely voluntary. A third party 
wishing to participate will submit a 
request for accreditation to FDA. 
Accredited third-party reviewers have 
the ability to review a manufacturer’s 
510(k) of the FD&C Act (21 U.S.C. 360) 
submission for selected devices. After 
reviewing a submission, the reviewer 
will forward a copy of the 510(k) 
submission, along with the reviewer’s 
documented review and 
recommendation to FDA. Third-party 
reviewers should maintain records of 
their 510(k) reviews and a copy of the 
510(k) for a reasonable period of time, 
usually a period of 3 years. 

This information collection will allow 
FDA to continue to implement the 
accredited person review program 
established by FDAMA and improve the 
efficiency of 510(k) review for low- to 
moderate-risk devices. 

Respondents to this information 
collection are businesses or other for- 
profit organizations. 

I. Reporting 

510(k) Reviews Conducted by 
Accredited Third Parties 

According to FDA’s data in 2009, the 
Agency has experienced that the 
number of 510(k)s submitted for third- 
party review is approximately 260 
annually, which is 26 annual reviews 
per each of the 10 accredited reviewers. 

II. Recordkeeping 

Third party reviewers are required to 
keep records of their review of each 
submission. According to FDA’s in 
2009, the Agency anticipates 
approximately 260 submissions of 
510(k)s for third-party review per year. 

In the Federal Register of September 
22, 2010 (75 FR 57801), FDA published 
a 60-day notice requesting public 
comment on the proposed collection of 
information. FDA received one 
comment; however, it was not PRA 
related. 

FDA estimates the burden of this 
collection of information as follows: 
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