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n. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene: Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214. 
In determining the appropriate action to 
take, the Commission will consider all 
protests or other comments filed, but 
only those who file a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
Commission’s Rules may become a 
party to the proceeding. Any comments, 
protests, or motions to intervene must 
be received on or before the specified 
comment date for the particular 
application. 

o. Filing and Service of Responsive 
Documents: Any filing must (1) bear in 
all capital letters the title 
‘‘COMMENTS’’, ‘‘PROTEST’’, or 
‘‘MOTION TO INTERVENE’’ as 
applicable; (2) set forth in the heading 
the name of the applicant and the 
project number of the application to 
which the filing responds; (3) furnish 
the name, address, and telephone 
number of the person protesting or 
intervening; and (4) otherwise comply 
with the requirements of 18 CFR 
385.2001 through 385.2005. All 
comments, motions to intervene, or 
protests must set forth their evidentiary 
basis and otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 4.34(b). All 
comments, motions to intervene, or 
protests should relate to project works 
which are the subject of the license 
amendment. Agencies may obtain 
copies of the application directly from 
the applicant. A copy of any protest or 
motion to intervene must be served 
upon each representative of the 
applicant specified in the particular 
application. If an intervener files 
comments or documents with the 
Commission relating to the merits of an 
issue that may affect the responsibilities 
of a particular resource agency, they 
must also serve a copy of the document 
on that resource agency. A copy of all 
other filings in reference to this 
application must be accompanied by 
proof of service on all persons listed in 
the service list prepared by the 
Commission in this proceeding, in 
accordance with 18 CFR 4.34(b) and 
385.2010. 

Dated: January 8, 2014. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–00540 Filed 1–14–14; 8:45 am] 
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[Docket No. CP14–34–000] 

Transcontinental Gas Pipe Line 
Company, LLC; Notice of Application 

Take notice that on December 27, 
2013, Transcontinental Gas Pipe Line 
Company, LLC (Transco), P.O. Box 
1396, Houston, Texas 77251, filed an 
application in Docket No. CP14–34–000, 
pursuant to Section 7(b) of the Natural 
Gas Act (NGA) and Part 157 of the 
Commission’s regulations, for a 
certificate of public convenience and 
necessity to abandon certain pipeline 
lateral facilities. Specifically, Transco 
proposes (i) The abandonment by sale to 
High Point Gas Gathering, LLC of 
Transco’s pipeline lateral extending 
from Mississippi Canyon Block 108 to 
South Pass Block 53 offshore Louisiana, 
and (ii) the abandonment by assignment 
to High Point Gas Transmission, LLC 
Transco’s 25.3% interest in the pipeline 
lateral extending from Mississippi 
Canyon Block 194 to Romere Pass, 
located offshore and onshore Louisiana. 
Transco also requests a finding that 
Transco’s pipeline lateral extending 
from Mississippi Canyon Block 108 to 
South Pass Block 53 will, upon 
abandonment, be non-jurisdictional 
under Section 1(b) of the NGA, and that 
the lines are gathering facilities exempt 
from the Commission’s jurisdiction 
under NGA Section 1(b), all as more 
fully set forth in the application, which 
is on file with the Commission and open 
to public inspection. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Any questions regarding this 
application should be directed to Ray 
Green, Staff Analyst, Certificates & 
Tariffs (713) 215–3385, P.O. Box 1396, 
Houston, Texas 77251 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: complete 
its environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 

issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule for Environmental 
Review will serve to notify federal and 
state agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
federal authorizations within 90 days of 
the date of issuance of the Commission 
staff’s FEIS or EA. 

There are two ways to become 
involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project. First, any person wishing to 
obtain legal status by becoming a party 
to the proceedings for this project 
should, on or before the comment date 
stated below file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
a motion to intervene in accordance 
with the requirements of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.214 or 385.211) 
and the Regulations under the NGA (18 
CFR 157.10). A person obtaining party 
status will be placed on the service list 
maintained by the Secretary of the 
Commission and will receive copies of 
all documents filed by the applicant and 
by all other parties. A party must submit 
7 copies of filings made in the 
proceeding with the Commission and 
must mail a copy to the applicant and 
to every other party. Only parties to the 
proceeding can ask for court review of 
Commission orders in the proceeding. 

However, a person does not have to 
intervene in order to have comments 
considered. The second way to 
participate is by filing with the 
Secretary of the Commission, as soon as 
possible, an original and two copies of 
comments in support of or in opposition 
to this project. The Commission will 
consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
provide copies of their protests only to 
the party or parties directly involved in 
the protest. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commentors will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
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environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commentors will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commentors 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and will not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://
www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to file 
electronically should submit an original 
and 5 copies of the protest or 
intervention to the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE., Washington, DC 20426. 

Comment Date: January 29, 2014. 
Dated: January 8, 2014. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–00543 Filed 1–14–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Filings Instituting Proceedings 
Docket Numbers: RP14–359–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: 01/08/14 Negotiated 

Rates—Sequent Energy Management 
(HUB) 3075–89 to be effective 1/7/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/8/14. 
Accession Number: 20140108–5094. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/21/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–360–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: 01/08/14 Negotiated 

Rates—Trafigura AG (HUB) 7445–89 to 
be effective 1/7/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/8/14. 
Accession Number: 20140108–5134. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/21/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–361–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: 01/08/14 Negotiated 

Rates—JP Morgan Ventures Energy Corp 
(HUB) 6025–89 to be effective 1/7/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/8/14. 
Accession Number: 20140108–5136. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/21/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–362–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: 01/08/14 Negotiated 

Rates—United Energy Trading, LLC 
(HUB) 5095–89 to be effective 1/7/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/8/14. 
Accession Number: 20140108–5143. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/21/14. 
Any person desiring to intervene or 

protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

Filings in Existing Proceedings 

Docket Numbers: RP13–606–001. 
Applicants: Columbia Gas 

Transmission, LLC. 
Description: Submits tariff filing per 

154.203: LNG Settlement to be effective 
2/1/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/2/14. 
Accession Number: 20140102–5005. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/14/14. 
Any person desiring to protest in any 

of the above proceedings must file in 
accordance with Rule 211 of the 
Commission’s Regulations (18 CFR 
385.211) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 

The filings are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the links or querying the 
docket number. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: January 9, 2014. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–00590 Filed 1–14–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Filings Instituting Proceedings 

Docket Numbers: RP14–347–000. 
Applicants: Gulf Crossing Pipeline 

Company LLC. 
Description: Amendment to Neg Rate 

Agmt (BP37–14) to be effective 1/7/ 
2014. 

Filed Date: 1/3/14. 
Accession Number: 20140103–5027. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/15/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–348–000. 
Applicants: TransColorado Gas 

Transmission Company L. 
Description: DART Electronic 

Execution Update to be effective 2/3/ 
2014. 

Filed Date: 1/3/14. 
Accession Number: 20140103–5044. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/15/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–349–000. 
Applicants: Wyoming Interstate 

Company, L.L.C. 
Description: Request for Limited 

Waivers of Wyoming Interstate 
Company, L.L.C. 

Filed Date: 1/3/14. 
Accession Number: 20140103–5069. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/15/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–350–000. 
Applicants: Enable Gas Transmission, 

LLC. 
Description: Negotiated Rate Filing— 

January 2014—Tenaska 9840 Att A to be 
effective 1/3/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/3/14. 
Accession Number: 20140103–5096. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/15/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–351–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: 01/06/14 Negotiated 

Rates—JP Morgan Ventures Energy Corp 
(HUB) 6025–89 to be effective 1/3/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/6/14. 
Accession Number: 20140106–5079. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/21/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–352–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: 01/06/14 Negotiated 

Rates—Sequent Energy Management 
(HUB) 3075–89 to be effective 1/3/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/6/14. 
Accession Number: 20140106–5080. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/21/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–353–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: 01/06/14 Negotiated 

Rates—Trafigura AG (HUB) 7445–89 to 
be effective 1/3/2014. 

Filed Date: 1/6/14. 
Accession Number: 20140106–5081. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/21/14. 
Docket Numbers: RP14–354–000. 
Applicants: Texas Eastern 

Transmission, LP. 
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