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SE is a public document and is filed on 
occasion. Form SE is filed by 
individuals, companies or other entities 
that are required to file documents 
electronically. Approximately 19 
registrants file Form SE and it takes an 
estimated 0.10 hours per response for a 
total annual burden of 2 hours (0.10 
hours per response × 19 responses). 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid 
control number. 

The public may view background 
documentation for this information 
collection at the following website: 
www.reginfo.gov. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to (i) www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain and (ii) David Bottom, 
Director/Chief Information Officer, 
Securities and Exchange Commission, 
c/o John Pezzullo, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549, or by sending an 
email to: PRA_Mailbox@sec.gov. 

Dated: December 28, 2021. 
J. Matthew DeLesDernier, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–28439 Filed 12–30–21; 8:45 am] 
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Notice is hereby given that pursuant 

to the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(‘‘PRA’’) (44 U.S.C. 3501 et seq.), the 
Securities and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’) has submitted to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(‘‘OMB’’) a request for approval of 
extension of the previously approved 
collection of information provided for in 
Rule 17f–1(b) (17 CFR 240.17f–1(b)), 
under the Securities Exchange Act of 
1934 (15 U.S.C. 78a et seq.). 

Under Rule 17f–1(b) under the 
Exchange Act, approximately 10,000 
entities in the securities industry are 

registered in the Lost and Stolen 
Securities Program (‘‘Program’’). 
Registration fulfills a statutory 
requirement that entities report and 
inquire about missing, lost, counterfeit, 
or stolen securities. Registration also 
allows entities in the securities industry 
to gain access to a confidential database 
that stores information for the Program. 

The Commission staff estimates that 
10 new entities will register in the 
Program each year. The staff estimates 
that the average number of hours 
necessary to comply with Rule 17f–1(b) 
is one-half hour. Accordingly, the staff 
estimates that the total annual burden 
for all participants is 5 hours (10 × one- 
half hour). The Commission staff 
estimates that compliance staff work at 
subject entities results in an internal 
cost of compliance, at an estimated 
hourly wage of $283, of $141.50 per year 
per entity (.5 hours × $283 per hour = 
$141.50 per year). Therefore, the 
aggregate annual internal cost of 
compliance is approximately $1,415 
($141.50 × 10 = $1,415). 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
under the PRA unless it displays a 
currently valid OMB control number. 

The public may view background 
documentation for this information 
collection at the following website: 
www.reginfo.gov. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to (i) www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain and (ii) David Bottom, 
Director/Chief Information Officer, 
Securities and Exchange Commission, c/ 
o John R. Pezzullo, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549, or by sending an 
email to: PRA_Mailbox@sec.gov. 

Dated: December 28, 2021. 

J. Matthew DeLesDernier, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–28431 Filed 12–30–21; 8:45 am] 
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Notice is hereby given that pursuant 

to the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(‘‘PRA’’) (44 U.S.C. 3501 et seq.), the 
Securities and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’) has submitted to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(‘‘OMB’’) a request for extension of the 
previously approved collection of 
information discussed below. The Code 
of Federal Regulation citations 
associated with this collection of 
information are 17 CFR 240.15Fb1–1 
through 240.15Fb6–2, and 17 CFR 
249.1600, 249.1600a, 249.1600b, 
249.1600c and 249.1601. 

The Commission adopted Rules 
15Fb1–1 through 15Fb6–2 and Forms 
SBSE, SBSE–A, SBSE–BD, SBSE–C and 
SBSE–W on August 5, 2015 to create a 
process to register SBS Entities. Forms 
SBSE, SBSE–A, and SBSE–BD and 
SBSE–C were designed to elicit certain 
information from applicants. The 
Commission uses the information 
disclosed by applicants through the SBS 
Entity registration rules and forms to: (1) 
Determine whether an applicant meets 
the standards for registration set forth in 
the provisions of the Exchange Act; and 
(2) develop an information resource 
regarding SBS Entities where members 
of the public may obtain relevant, up-to- 
date information about SBS Entities, 
and where the Commission may obtain 
information for examination and 
enforcement purposes. Without the 
information provided through these SBS 
Entity registration rules and forms, the 
Commission could not effectively 
determine whether the applicant meets 
the standards for registration or 
implement policy objectives of the 
Exchange Act. 

The information collected pursuant to 
Rule 15Fb3–2 and Form SBSE–W allows 
the Commission to determine whether it 
is appropriate to allow an SBS Entity to 
withdraw from registration and to 
facilitate that withdrawal. Without this 
information, the Commission would be 
unable to effectively determine whether 
it was appropriate to allow an SBS 
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