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exporters, who certify to the eligibility 
of their exports for EXIM support. The 
completed forms are held by the 
financial institution policy holders, only 
to be submitted to EXIM in the event of 
a claim filing. A requirement of EXIM’s 
policies is that the insured financial 
institution policy holder obtains a 
completed Exporter’s Certificate at the 
time it provides financing for an export. 
This form will enable EXIM to identify 
the specific details of the export 
transaction. These details are necessary 
for determining the eligibility of claims 
for approval. EXIM staff and contractors 
review this information to assist in 
determining that an export transaction, 
on which a claim for non-payment has 
been submitted, meets all of the terms 
and conditions of the insurance 
coverage. 

The form can be viewed at https://
www.exim.gov/sites/default/files/pub/ 
pending/eib-94-07.pdf. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before November 2, 2018 to be 
assured of consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Comments may be 
submitted electronically on 
WWW.REGULATIONS.GOV (EIB 94–07) 
or by mail to Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, 725 17th Street NW, 
Washington, DC 20038, Attn: OMB 
3048. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Titles and Form Number: EIB 94–07 

Exporters Certificate for Use with a 
Short Term Export Credit Insurance 
Policy. 

OMB Number: 3048–0041. 
Type of Review: Regular. 
Need and Use: EXIM uses the 

referenced form to obtain exporter 
certification regarding the export 
transaction, U.S. content, non-military 
use, non-nuclear use, compliance with 
EXIM’s country cover policy, and their 
eligibility to participate in USG 
programs. These details are necessary to 
determine the legitimacy of claims 
submitted. It also provides the financial 
institution policy holder a check on the 
export transaction’s eligibility, at the 
time it is fulfilling a financing request. 

Affected Public: This form affects 
entities involved in the export of U.S. 
goods and services. 

Annual Number of Respondents: 240. 
Estimated Time per Respondent: 15 

minutes. 
Annual Burden Hours: 60 hours. 
Frequency of Reporting of Use: As 

required. 
Government Expenses: 
Reviewing Time per Year: 12 hours. 
Average Wages per Hour: $42.50. 
Average Cost per Year: $510 (time * 

wages). 

Benefits and Overhead: 20%. 
Total Government Cost: $612. 

Bassam Doughman, 
IT Specialist. 
[FR Doc. 2018–21513 Filed 10–2–18; 8:45 am] 
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FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0419] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995 (PRA), the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
Commission) invites the general public 
and other Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collections. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 

The FCC may not conduct or sponsor 
a collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid OMB 
control number. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
submitted on or before December 3, 
2018. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contacts below as soon as 
possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Cathy Williams, FCC, via email: PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
OMB Control Number: 3060–0419. 
Title: Sections 76.94, Notification; 

76.95, Exceptions; 76.105, Notification; 
76.106, Exceptions; 76.107, Exclusivity 
Contracts and 76.1609, Non-Duplication 
and Syndicated Exclusivity. 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities. 
Number of Respondents and 

Responses: 5,977 respondents and 
249,577 responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.5–2.0 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement; One-time 
reporting requirement; Third Party 
Disclosure requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is contained in Section 4(i) of the 
Communications Act of 1034, as 
amended. 

Total Annual Burden: 233,153 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 

There is no need for confidentiality with 
this collection of information. 

Privacy Impact Assessment(s): No 
impact(s). 

Needs and Uses: The Commission 
rules that are covered under this 
collection require broadcast television 
stations and program distributors to 
notify cable television system operators 
of network non-duplication protection 
and syndicated exclusivity rights being 
sought within prescribed limitations 
and terms of contractual agreements. 
These various notification and 
disclosure requirements are to protect 
broadcasters who purchase the 
exclusive rights to transmit network and 
syndicated programming in their 
recognized markets. 

Federal Communications Commission. 

Katura Jackson, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, Office of the 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2018–21475 Filed 10–2–18; 8:45 am] 
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