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the relationship as defined in 
§ 771(4)(B) of the Act (19 U.S.C. 
1677(4)(B)). 

(6) A list of all known and currently 
operating U.S. importers of the Subject 
Merchandise and producers of the 
Subject Merchandise in the Subject 
Country that currently export or have 
exported Subject Merchandise to the 
United States or other countries after 
2015. 

(7) A list of 3–5 leading purchasers in 
each Domestic Market Area for the 
Domestic Like Product and the Subject 
Merchandise (including street address, 
World Wide Web address, and the 
name, telephone number, fax number, 
and Email address of a responsible 
official at each firm). 

(8) A list of known sources of 
information on national or regional 
prices for the Domestic Like Product or 
the Subject Merchandise in the U.S. or 
other markets. 

(9) If you are a U.S. producer of the 
Domestic Like Product, provide the 
following information on your firm’s 
operations on that product in each 
Domestic Market Area during calendar 
year 2021, except as noted (report 
quantity data in short tons and value 
data in U.S. dollars, f.o.b. plant). If you 
are a union/worker group or trade/ 
business association, provide the 
information, on an aggregate basis, for 
the firms in which your workers are 
employed/which are members of your 
association. 

(a) Production (quantity) and, if 
known, an estimate of the percentage of 
total U.S. production of the Domestic 
Like Product accounted for by your 
firm’s(s’) production; 

(b) Capacity (quantity) of your firm to 
produce the Domestic Like Product (that 
is, the level of production that your 
establishment(s) could reasonably have 
expected to attain during the year, 
assuming normal operating conditions 
(using equipment and machinery in 
place and ready to operate), normal 
operating levels (hours per week/weeks 
per year), time for downtime, 
maintenance, repair, and cleanup, and a 
typical or representative product mix); 

(c) the quantity and value of U.S. 
commercial shipments of the Domestic 
Like Product produced in your U.S. 
plant(s); 

(d) the quantity and value of U.S. 
internal consumption/company 
transfers of the Domestic Like Product 
produced in your U.S. plant(s); and 

(e) the value of (i) net sales, (ii) cost 
of goods sold (COGS), (iii) gross profit, 
(iv) selling, general and administrative 
(SG&A) expenses, and (v) operating 
income of the Domestic Like Product 
produced in your U.S. plant(s) (include 

both U.S. and export commercial sales, 
internal consumption, and company 
transfers) for your most recently 
completed fiscal year (identify the date 
on which your fiscal year ends). 

(10) If you are a U.S. importer or a 
trade/business association of U.S. 
importers of the Subject Merchandise 
from the Subject Country, provide the 
following information on your firm’s(s’) 
operations on that product during 
calendar year 2021 (report quantity data 
in short tons and value data in U.S. 
dollars). If you are a trade/business 
association, provide the information, on 
an aggregate basis, for the firms which 
are members of your association. 

(a) The quantity and value (landed, 
duty-paid but not including 
antidumping duties) of U.S. imports 
into each Domestic Market Area and, if 
known, an estimate of the percentage of 
total U.S. imports into each Domestic 
Market Area of Subject Merchandise 
from the Subject Country accounted for 
by your firm’s(s’) imports; 

(b) the quantity and value (f.o.b. U.S. 
port, including antidumping duties) of 
U.S. commercial shipments into each 
Domestic Market Area of Subject 
Merchandise imported from the Subject 
Country; and 

(c) the quantity and value (f.o.b. U.S. 
port, including antidumping duties) of 
U.S. internal consumption/company 
transfers into each Domestic Market 
Area of Subject Merchandise imported 
from the Subject Country. 

(11) If you are a producer, an exporter, 
or a trade/business association of 
producers or exporters of the Subject 
Merchandise in the Subject Country, 
provide the following information on 
your firm’s(s’) operations on that 
product during calendar year 2021 
(report quantity data in short tons and 
value data in U.S. dollars, landed and 
duty-paid at the U.S. port but not 
including antidumping duties). If you 
are a trade/business association, provide 
the information, on an aggregate basis, 
for the firms which are members of your 
association. 

(a) Production (quantity) and, if 
known, an estimate of the percentage of 
total production of Subject Merchandise 
in the Subject Country accounted for by 
your firm’s(s’) production; 

(b) Capacity (quantity) of your firm(s) 
to produce the Subject Merchandise in 
the Subject Country (that is, the level of 
production that your establishment(s) 
could reasonably have expected to 
attain during the year, assuming normal 
operating conditions (using equipment 
and machinery in place and ready to 
operate), normal operating levels (hours 
per week/weeks per year), time for 
downtime, maintenance, repair, and 

cleanup, and a typical or representative 
product mix); and 

(c) the quantity and value of your 
firm’s(s’) exports to the United States of 
Subject Merchandise and, if known, an 
estimate of the percentage of total 
exports to the United States of Subject 
Merchandise from the Subject Country 
accounted for by your firm’s(s’) exports. 

(12) Identify significant changes, if 
any, in the supply and demand 
conditions or business cycle for the 
Domestic Like Product that have 
occurred in each Domestic Market Area 
or in the market for the Subject 
Merchandise in the Subject Country 
after 2015, and significant changes, if 
any, that are likely to occur within a 
reasonably foreseeable time. Supply 
conditions to consider include 
technology; production methods; 
development efforts; ability to increase 
production (including the shift of 
production facilities used for other 
products and the use, cost, or 
availability of major inputs into 
production); and factors related to the 
ability to shift supply among different 
national markets (including barriers to 
importation in foreign markets or 
changes in market demand abroad). 
Demand conditions to consider include 
end uses and applications; the existence 
and availability of substitute products; 
and the level of competition among the 
Domestic Like Product produced in the 
United States, Subject Merchandise 
produced in the Subject Country, and 
such merchandise from other countries. 

(13) (OPTIONAL) A statement of 
whether you agree with the above 
definitions of the Domestic Like Product 
and Domestic Industry; if you disagree 
with either or both of these definitions, 
please explain why and provide 
alternative definitions. 

Authority: This proceeding is being 
conducted under authority of title VII of 
the Tariff Act of 1930; this notice is 
published pursuant to § 207.61 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: May 25, 2022. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2022–11627 Filed 5–31–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

NATIONAL CREDIT UNION 
ADMINISTRATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Appraisals 

AGENCY: National Credit Union 
Administration (NCUA). 
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ACTION: Notice and request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The National Credit Union 
Administration (NCUA), as part of a 
continuing effort to reduce paperwork 
and respondent burden, invites the 
general public and other Federal 
agencies to comment on the following 
extension of a currently approved 
collection, as required by the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
received on or before August 1, 2022 to 
be assured consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments on 
the information collection to Dawn 
Wolfgang, National Credit Union 
Administration, 1775 Duke Street, Suite 
6032, Alexandria, Virginia 22314; email 
at PRAComments@NCUA.gov. Given the 
limited in-house staff because of the 
COVID–19 pandemic, email comments 
are preferred. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Address requests for additional 
information to Dawn Wolfgang at the 
address above or telephone 703–548– 
2279. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
OMB Number: 3133–0125. 
Title: Appraisals, 12 CFR 722. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Abstract: Title XI of the Financial 

Institutions, Reform, Recovery and 
Enforcement Act of 1989 (FIRREA) was 
enacted to protect federal financial and 
public policy interests in real estate 
related transactions. To achieve this 
purpose, the statute directed the 
National Credit Union Administration 
(NCUA), as one of the federal financial 
institutions regulatory agencies, to 
adopt standards for the performance of 
real estate appraisals in connection with 
federally related transactions. The 
FIRREA requires that appraisals be 
maintained in writing and meet certain 
minimum standards. The NCUA 
regulation Part 722 carries out the 
statutory requirements. The information 
collection activity requires a credit 
union to obtain a written appraisal on 
federally related transactions or 
maintain written support of the 
estimated market value for certain other 
transactions not required to have an 
appraisal. These information collections 
are attributable to the regulation and are 
a direct consequence of the legislative 
intent and statutory requirements. 

Federally insured credit unions 
(FICU) use the information in 
determining whether and upon what 
terms to enter into a federally related 
transaction, such as making a loan 
secured by real estate. In addition, 

NCUA uses this information in its 
examinations of FICUs to ensure that 
extensions of credit by the FICU that are 
collateralized by real estate are 
undertaken in accordance with 
appropriate safety and soundness 
principles. The use of their information 
by credit unions and NCUA helps 
ensure that FICUs are not exposed to 
risk of loss from inadequate appraisals 
or written estimates of market value. 

Affected Public: Private Sector: Not- 
for-profit institutions. 

Estimated No. of Respondents: 3,365. 
Estimated No. of Responses per 

Respondent: 618. 
Estimated Total Annual Responses: 

2,079,707. 
Estimated Burden Hours per 

Response: 0.083. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden 

Hours: 173,309. 
Reason for Change: An increase of 

36,211 burden hours is the result of an 
adjustments. The number of FICUs have 
decreased since the previous 
submission, but the number of real 
estate loans have increased, thus an 
increase in the number of responses per 
respondent. 

Request for Comments: Comments 
submitted in response to this notice will 
be summarized and included in the 
request for Office of Management and 
Budget approval. All comments will 
become a matter of public record. The 
public is invited to submit comments 
concerning: (a) Whether the collection 
of information is necessary for the 
proper execution of the function of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of the burden of the collection of 
information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 
(c) ways to enhance the quality, utility, 
and clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of the 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

By Melane Conyers-Ausbrooks, 
Secretary of the Board, the National 
Credit Union Administration, on May 
25, 2022. 

Dated: May 26, 2022. 

Dawn D. Wolfgang, 
NCUA PRA Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2022–11702 Filed 5–31–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7535–01–P 

OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR OF 
NATIONAL INTELLIGENCE 

Submission for Review: Financial 
Disclosure Form (SF–714) 

AGENCY: Office of the Director of 
National Intelligence. 
ACTION: 30-Day notice of request for 
extension of the SF–714. 

The Personnel Security Group, 
Special Security Directorate, National 
Counterintelligence and Security 
Center, Office of the Director of National 
Intelligence (ODNI) offers notification of 
the request for extension to an existing 
information collection request (ICR) SF– 
714. This request is for an extension of 
the expiration date of the current SF– 
714 for an additional three years. As 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995, as amended by the Clinger- 
Cohen Act, ODNI solicited comments 
for this collection during a 60 day 
Federal Register posting. No public 
comments were received during the 60 
day posting. However, comments were 
received from ODNI internal review 
that, while non-substantive to the 
contents of the form, led to minor 
corrections in the Privacy Act 
Statement. Comments in regard to this 
request for extension can be sent to the 
Office of Management and Budget, who 
is particularly interested in comments 
that: 

1. Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

2. Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

3. Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

4. Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submissions 
of responses. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted until July 1, 2022. This 
process is conducted in accordance with 
5 CFR 1320.1. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments on 
the proposed information collection to 
OMB. 
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