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public meeting during which you wish 
to make comments. If you have 
questions regarding the meeting please 
email TTAC@treasury.gov. 

If you require a reasonable 
accommodation, please contact the 
Departmental Offices Reasonable 
Accommodations Coordinator at 
ReasonableAccommodationRequests@
treasury.gov. If requesting a sign 
language interpreter, please make sure 
your request to the Reasonable 
Accommodations Coordinator is made 
at least (5) five days prior to the event 
if at all possible. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Nancy Montoya, Policy Analyst, 
Department of the Treasury, 1500 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW, Room 
1426G, Washington, DC 20220, at (202) 
622–2031 (this is not a toll-free number) 
or by emailing TTAC@treasury.gov. 
Persons who have difficulty hearing or 
speaking may access this number via 
TTY by calling the toll-free Federal 
Relay Service at (800) 877–8339. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 
Section 3 of the Tribal General 

Welfare Exclusion Act of 2014, Public 
Law 113–68, 128 Stat. 1883, enacted on 
September 26, 2014 (TGWEA), directs 
the Secretary of the Treasury (Secretary) 
to establish a seven member Tribal 
Advisory Committee to advise the 
Secretary on matters related to the 
taxation of Indians, the training of 
Internal Revenue Service field agents, 
and the provision of training and 
technical assistance to Native American 
financial officers. 

Pursuant to Section 3 of the TGWEA 
and in accordance with the provisions 
of the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), 5 U.S.C. App. 1 et seq., the 
TTAC was established on February 10, 
2015, as the ‘‘U.S. Department of the 
Treasury Tribal Advisory Committee.’’ 
The TTAC’s Charter provides that it 
shall operate under the provisions of the 
FACA and shall advise and report to the 
Secretary on: 

(1) Matters related to the taxation of 
Indians; 

(2) The establishment of training and 
education for internal revenue field 
agents who administer and enforce 
internal revenue laws with respect to 
Indian tribes of Federal Indian law and 
the Federal Government’s unique legal 
treaty and trust relationship with Indian 
tribal governments; and 

(3) The establishment of training of 
such internal revenue field agents, and 
provisions of training and technical 
assistance to tribal financial officers, 
about implementation of the TGWEA 
and any amendments. 

Seventh and Eighth Periodic Meetings 
In accordance with section 10(a)(2) of 

the FACA and implementing regulations 
at 41 CFR 102–3.150, Krishna P. 
Vallabhaneni, the Designated Federal 
Officer of the TTAC, has ordered 
publication of this notice to inform the 
public that the TTAC will convene its 
seventh periodic meeting on 
Wednesday, March 17, 2021, from 1:00 
p.m.–4:00 p.m. Eastern Time. The 
eighth periodic meeting will be held 
Wednesday, June 16, 2021 1:00 p.m.– 
4:00 p.m. Eastern Time. Due to the 
COVID–19 pandemic, these meetings 
will be held via teleconference. 

Summary of Agenda and Topics To Be 
Discussed 

During these meetings, the seven 
TTAC members will provide updates on 
the work of the TTAC’s three 
subcommittees, hear comments from the 
public, and take other actions necessary 
to fulfill the TTAC’s mandate. 

Public Comments 
Members of the public wishing to 

comment on the business of the TTAC 
are invited to submit written comments 
by any of the following methods: 

Electronic Comments 
• Send electronic comments to 

TTAC@treasury.gov. Comments are 
requested no later than 15 calendar days 
before the Public Meeting in order to be 
considered by the TTAC. 

Paper Comments 
• Send paper comments in triplicate 

to the Treasury Tribal Advisory 
Committee, Department of the Treasury, 
1500 Pennsylvania Avenue NW, Room 
1426G, Washington, DC 20220. 

The Department of the Treasury will 
post all comments received on its 
website (https://www.treasury.gov/ 
resource-center/economic-policy/tribal- 
policy/Pages/Tribal-Policy.aspx) 
without change, including any business 
or personal information provided such 
as names, addresses, email addresses, or 
telephone numbers. The Department of 
the Treasury will also make these 
comments available for public 
inspection and copying in the 
Department of the Treasury’s Library, 
720 Madison Place NW, Room 1020, 
Washington, DC 20220, on official 
business days between the hours of 
10:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. Eastern Time. 
You can make an appointment to 
inspect statements by telephoning (202) 
622–2000. All statements received, 
including attachments and other 
supporting materials, are part of the 
public record and subject to public 
disclosure. You should submit only 

information that you wish to make 
available publicly. 

Krishna P. Vallabhaneni, 
Tax Legislative Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2021–03224 Filed 2–17–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4810–25–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Agricultural Marketing Service 

[Doc. No. AMS–NOP–20–0089; NOP–20–06] 

Meeting of the National Organic 
Standards Board 

AGENCY: Agricultural Marketing Service, 
USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, as 
amended, the Agricultural Marketing 
Service (AMS), U.S. Department of 
Agriculture (USDA), is announcing a 
meeting of the National Organic 
Standards Board (NOSB). Among other 
things, NOSB assists USDA in the 
development of standards for substances 
to be used in organic production and 
advises the Secretary of Agriculture 
(Secretary) on other aspects of the 
implementation of the Organic Foods 
Production Act. 
DATES: NOSB will meet virtually April 
28 through April 30, 2021, from 12:00 
p.m. to approximately 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time (ET) each day. NOSB will hear 
oral public comments via webinars prior 
to the meeting on Tuesday, April 20, 
2021, and Thursday, April 22, 2021, 
from 12:00 p.m. to approximately 5:00 
p.m. ET. The deadline to submit written 
comments and/or sign up for oral 
comment is 11:59 p.m. ET, April 5, 
2021. 

ADDRESSES: The NOSB meeting and the 
webinars are virtual and can be accessed 
via the internet and/or phone. Access 
information will be available on the 
AMS website. Detailed information 
pertaining to the webinars and public 
meeting can be found at https://
www.ams.usda.gov/event/national- 
organic-standards-board-nosb-meeting- 
crystal-city-va-0. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Michelle Arsenault, Advisory 
Committee Specialist, National Organic 
Standards Board, USDA–AMS–NOP, 
1400 Independence Avenue SW, Room 
2642–S, STOP 0268, Washington, DC 
20250–0268; Phone: (202) 997–0115; 
Email: nosb@usda.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act, 5 U.S.C. App. 2 and 7 
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U.S.C. 6518(e), as amended, AMS is 
announcing a meeting of the NOSB. 
NOSB makes recommendations to 
USDA about whether substances should 
be allowed or prohibited in organic 
production and/or handling, assists in 
the development of standards for 
organic production, and advises the 
Secretary on other aspects of the 
implementation of the Organic Foods 
Production Act, 7 U.S.C. 6501 et seq. 
NOSB is holding a public meeting to 
discuss and vote on proposed 
recommendations to USDA, to obtain 
updates from the USDA National 
Organic Program (NOP) on issues 
pertaining to organic agriculture, and to 
receive comments from the organic 
community. The meeting is open to the 
public. Registration is only required to 
sign up for oral comments. All meeting 
documents and instructions for 
participating will be available on the 
AMS website at https://
www.ams.usda.gov/event/national- 
organic-standards-board-nosb-meeting- 
crystal-city-va-0. Please check the 
website periodically for updates. 
Meeting topics will encompass a wide 
range of issues, including substances 
petitioned for addition to or removal 
from the National List of Allowed and 
Prohibited Substances (National List), 
substances on the National List that are 
under sunset review, and guidance on 
organic policies. 

Public Comments 

Comments should address specific 
topics noted on the meeting agenda. 

Written comments: Written public 
comments will be accepted on or before 
11:59 p.m. ET on April 5, 2021, via 
http://www.regulations.gov (Docket No. 
AMS–NOP–20–0089). Comments 
submitted after this date will be added 
to the public comment docket, but 
Board members may not have adequate 
time to consider those comments prior 
to making recommendations. NOP 
strongly prefers comments be submitted 
electronically. However, written 
comments may also be submitted (i.e., 
postmarked) via mail to the person 
listed under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT by or before the deadline. 

Oral Comments: NOSB will hear oral 
public comments via webinars on 
Tuesday, April 20, 2021, and Thursday, 
April 22, 2021, from 12:00 p.m. to 
approximately 5:00 p.m. ET. Each 
commenter wishing to address the 
Board must pre-register by 11:59 p.m. 
ET on April 5, 2021, and can register for 
only one speaking slot. Instructions for 
registering and participating in the 
webinars can be found at https://
www.ams.usda.gov/event/national- 

organic-standards-board-nosb-meeting- 
crystal-city-va-0. 

Meeting Accommodations 

The meeting is being held virtually. If 
you are a person requiring reasonable 
accommodation, please make requests 
in advance for sign language 
interpretation, assistive listening 
devices, or other reasonable 
accommodation to the person listed 
under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

Determinations for reasonable 
accommodation will be made on a case- 
by-case basis. 

Dated: February 3, 2021. 
Cikena Reid, 
USDA Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2021–03185 Filed 2–17–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Property Management Division; Notice 
of Request for Approval of an 
Information Collection 

AGENCY: Office of Property and 
Environmental Management, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice and request for public 
comments regarding an extension to an 
existing OMB clearance. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, this 
notice announces the Office of Property 
and Environmental Management 
intention to request an extension of a 
currently approved information 
Technical Equipment Pursuant to 
Section 14220 of the 2008 Farm Bill. 
DATES: Comments on this notice must be 
received by 60 days after publication in 
the Federal Register to be assured of 
consideration. 

ADDRESSES: Office of Property and 
Environmental Management invites 
interested persons to submit comments 
on this notice. Comments may be 
submitted by one of the following 
methods: 

b Federal eRulemaking Portal: This 
website provides the ability to type 
short comments directly into the 
comment field on this web page or 
attach a file for lengthier comments. Go 
to http://www.regulations.gov. Follow 
the on-line instructions at that site for 
submitting comments. 

b Mail: U.S. Department of 
Agriculture, Property Management 
Division, Office of Property and 
Environmental Management, Attn: 
Pernell Ridley, 1400 Independence Ave. 
SW, Mailstop 9304, Suite 1069, 
Washington, DC 20250–9304. 

b Hand- or courier-delivered 
submittals: Deliver to U.S. Department 
of Agriculture, Office of Property and 
Environmental Management, 1400 
Independence Ave. SW, Mailstop 9304, 
Suite 1069, Washington, DC 20250– 
9304. 

b Instructions: All items submitted 
by mail or electronic mail must include 
the Agency name and docket number 
U.S. Department of Agriculture, Office 
of Property and Environmental 
Management, Docket Clerk, 1400 
Independence Ave. SW, Mailstop 9304, 
Suite 1069, Washington, DC 20250– 
9304. Comments received in response to 
this docket will be made available for 
public inspection and posted without 
change, including any personal 
information, to http://
www.regulations.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Contact Pernell Ridley Office of 
Property and Environmental 
Management, U.S. Department of 
Agriculture, 1400 Independence Ave. 
SW, Washington, DC 20250, Phone 202– 
309–1125 or by Email at pernell.ridley@
usda.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 
Chapter 35), this notice announces the 
intention of Office of Property and 
Environmental Management to request 
approval for an existing collection in 
use without an OMB control number. 

Title: Guidelines for the Transfer of 
Excess Computers or Other Technical 
Equipment Pursuant to Section 14220 of 
the 2008 Farm Bill. 

OMB Number: 0505–0023. 
Expiration Date of Approval: April 30, 

2021. 
Type of Request: Extension and 

revision of a currently approved 
information collection. 

Abstract: USDA requires information 
in order to verify eligibility of 
requestors, determine availability of 
excess property, and have contact 
information for the requestor available 
to ensure an organization is designated 
to receive property on behalf of an 
eligible recipient. Information will be 
used to coordinate the transfer of excess 
property to eligible recipients. 
Respondents will be authorized 
representatives of a city, town, or local 
government entity located in a rural area 
as defined in 7 U.S.C. 1991(a)(13)(A). 

Estimate of Burden: Public reporting 
burden for this collection of information 
is estimated to average .167 hours per 
response. 

Respondents: City, town, or local 
government entities located in a rural 
area. 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 17:47 Feb 17, 2021 Jkt 253001 PO 00000 Frm 00129 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\18FEN1.SGM 18FEN1jb
el

l o
n 

D
S

K
JL

S
W

7X
2P

R
O

D
 w

ith
 N

O
T

IC
E

S

http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
mailto:pernell.ridley@usda.gov
mailto:pernell.ridley@usda.gov
https://www.ams.usda.gov/event/national-organic-standards-board-nosb-meeting-crystal-city-va-0
https://www.ams.usda.gov/event/national-organic-standards-board-nosb-meeting-crystal-city-va-0
https://www.ams.usda.gov/event/national-organic-standards-board-nosb-meeting-crystal-city-va-0
https://www.ams.usda.gov/event/national-organic-standards-board-nosb-meeting-crystal-city-va-0
https://www.ams.usda.gov/event/national-organic-standards-board-nosb-meetingcrystal-city-va-0
https://www.ams.usda.gov/event/national-organic-standards-board-nosb-meetingcrystal-city-va-0
https://www.ams.usda.gov/event/national-organic-standards-board-nosb-meetingcrystal-city-va-0
https://www.ams.usda.gov/event/national-organic-standards-board-nosb-meetingcrystal-city-va-0

		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-04-27T12:14:32-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




