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alternative is accordingly not further 
considered. 

Conclusion 

The NRC staff has concluded that the 
proposed action is consistent with the 
NRC’s unrestricted release criteria 
specified in 10 CFR 20.1402. Because 
the proposed action will not 
significantly impact the quality of the 
human environment, the NRC staff 
concludes that the proposed action is 
the preferred alternative. 

Agencies and Persons Consulted 

NRC provided a draft of this 
Environmental Assessment to the North 
Carolina Department of Environment 
and Natural Resources, Radioactive 
Materials Branch for review on February 
13, 2008. On February 14, 2008, the 
North Carolina Department of 
Environment and Natural Resources 
responded by e-mail. The State agreed 
with the conclusions of the EA, and 
otherwise had no comments. 

The NRC staff has determined that the 
proposed action is of a procedural 
nature, and will not affect listed species 
or critical habitat. Therefore, no further 
consultation is required under Section 7 
of the Endangered Species Act. The 
NRC staff has also determined that the 
proposed action is not the type of 
activity that has the potential to cause 
effects on historic properties. Therefore, 
no further consultation is required 
under Section 106 of the National 
Historic Preservation Act. 

III. Finding of No Significant Impact 
The NRC staff has prepared this EA in 

support of the proposed action. On the 
basis of this EA, the NRC finds that 
there are no significant environmental 
impacts from the proposed action, and 
that preparation of an environmental 
impact statement is not warranted. 
Accordingly, the NRC has determined 
that a Finding of No Significant Impact 
is appropriate. 

IV. Further Information 
Documents related to this action, 

including the application for license 
amendment and supporting 
documentation, are available 
electronically at the NRC’s Electronic 
Reading Room at http://www.nrc.gov/ 
reading-rm/adams.html. From this site, 
you can access the NRC’s Agencywide 
Document Access and Management 
System (ADAMS), which provides text 
and image files of NRC’s public 
documents. The documents related to 
this action are listed below, along with 
their ADAMS accession numbers. 

1. NUREG–1720, ‘‘Re-Evaluation of 
the Indoor Resuspension Factor for the 

Screening Analysis of the Building 
Occupancy Scenario for NRC’s License 
Termination Rule—Draft Report;’’ 

2. NUREG–1757, ‘‘Consolidated 
NMSS Decommissioning Guidance;’’ 

3. Title 10 Code of Federal 
Regulations, Part 20, Subpart E, 
‘‘Radiological Criteria for License 
Termination;’’ 

4. Title 10, Code of Federal 
Regulations, Part 51, ‘‘Environmental 
Protection Regulations for Domestic 
Licensing and Related Regulatory 
Functions;’’ 

5. NUREG–1496, ‘‘Generic 
Environmental Impact Statement in 
Support of Rulemaking on Radiological 
Criteria for License Termination of NRC- 
Licensed Nuclear Facilities’’ Volumes 
1–3 (ML042310492, ML042320379, and 
ML042330385); 

6. NRC License No. 45–23645–01NA 
inspection and licensing records. 

7. Department of the Navy, 
Termination of Naval Radioactive 
Materials Permit No. 32–65923–S1NP 
issued to Naval Air Depot, Cherry Point, 
North Carolina, dated March 17, 2006 
(ML060890561); and 

8. Department of the Navy, Request 
Assistance in Preparing an 
Environmental Assessment for 
Termination of Naval Radioactive 
Materials Permit No. 32–65923–S1NP 
issued to Naval Air Depot, Cherry Point, 
North Carolina, dated May 21, 2007 
(ML071450474). 

If you do not have access to ADAMS, 
or if there are problems in accessing the 
documents located in ADAMS, contact 
the NRC Public Document Room (PDR) 
Reference staff at 1–800–397–4209, 301– 
415–4737, or by e-mail to pdr@nrc.gov. 
These documents may also be viewed 
electronically on the public computers 
located at the NRC’s PDR, O 1 F21, One 
White Flint North, 11555 Rockville 
Pike, Rockville, MD 20852. The PDR 
reproduction contractor will copy 
documents for a fee. 

Dated at King of Prussia, Pennsylvania this 
8th day of May 2008. 

For the Nuclear Regulatory Commission. 

Marie Miller, 
Chief, Security and Industrial Branch, 
Division of Nuclear Materials Safety, Region 
I. 
[FR Doc. E8–10860 Filed 5–14–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

[Docket No. 50–305] 

Dominion Energy Kewaunee, Inc; 
Notice of Withdrawal of Application for 
Amendment to Facility Operating 
License 

The U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission (the Commission) has 
granted the request of Dominion Energy 
Kewaunee, Inc. (the licensee), to 
withdraw its November 9, 2007 
(Agencywide Documents Access and 
Management System (ADAMS) 
Accession No. ML073180499), 
application for proposed amendment to 
Facility Operating License No. DPR–43 
for the Kewaunee Power Station (KPS), 
located in Kewaunee County, 
Wisconsin. 

The proposed amendment would 
have revised the license to allow the use 
of a methodology not currently 
approved for use at KPS for performing 
the seismic qualification analysis of the 
auxiliary building crane. 

The Commission had previously 
issued a Notice of Consideration of 
Issuance of Amendment published in 
the Federal Register on December 18, 
2007 (72 FR 71707). However, by letter 
dated April 11, 2008 (ADAMS 
Accession No. ML081050011), the 
licensee withdrew the proposed change. 

For further details with respect to this 
action, see the application for 
amendment dated November 9, 2007, 
and the licensee’s letter dated April 11, 
2008, which withdrew the application 
for license amendment. Documents may 
be examined, and/or copied for a fee, at 
the NRC’s Public Document Room 
(PDR), located at One White Flint North, 
Public File Area O1 F21, 11555 
Rockville Pike (first floor), Rockville, 
Maryland. Publicly available records 
will be accessible electronically from 
the Agencywide Documents Access and 
Management Systems (ADAMS) Public 
Electronic Reading Room on the Internet 
at the NRC Web site, http:// 
www.nrc.gov/reading-rm.html. Persons 
who do not have access to ADAMS or 
who encounter problems in accessing 
the documents located in ADAMS 
should contact the NRC PDR Reference 
staff by telephone at 1–800–397–4209, 
or 301–415–4737 or by e-mail to 
pdr@nrc.gov. 

Dated at Rockville, Maryland, this 9th day 
of May 2008. 
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For the Nuclear Regulatory Commission. 
Margaret H. Chernoff, 
Senior Project Manager, Plant Licensing 
Branch III–1, Division of Operating Reactor 
Licensing, Office of Nuclear Reactor 
Regulation. 
[FR Doc. E8–10861 Filed 5–14–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES 
TRADE REPRESENTATIVE 

Generalized System of Preferences 
(GSP): Notice Regarding the Initiation 
of the 2008 Annual GSP Product and 
Country Eligibility Practices Review 
and Deadlines for Filing Petitions 

AGENCY: Office of the United States 
Trade Representative. 
ACTION: Notice and Solicitation for 
Public Petitions. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces that 
the Office of the United States Trade 
Representative (USTR) will receive 
petitions in 2008 to modify the list of 
products that are eligible for duty-free 
treatment under the GSP program and to 
modify the GSP status of certain GSP 
beneficiary developing countries 
because of country practices. This 
notice further determines that the 
deadline for submission of product 
petitions, other than those requesting 
competitive need limitation (CNL) 
waivers, and country practice petitions 
for the 2008 Annual GSP Product and 
Country Eligibility Practices Review is 5 
p.m., Wednesday, June 18, 2008. The 
deadline for submission of product 
petitions requesting CNL waivers is 5 
p.m., Thursday, November 13, 2008. 
The list of product petitions and 
country practice petitions accepted for 
review will be announced in the 
Federal Register at later dates. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Contact the GSP Subcommittee of the 
Trade Policy Staff Committee, Office of 
the United States Trade Representative, 
1724 F Street, NW., Room F–220, 
Washington, DC 20508. The telephone 
number is (202) 395–6971, the facsimile 
number is (202) 395–9481, and the e- 
mail address is FR0807@ustr.eop.gov. 
(Note: the digit before the number in the 
e-mail address is the number ‘‘zero,’’ not 
a letter.) Public versions of all 
documents relating to this Review will 
be available for examination 
approximately 30 days after the 
pertinent due date, by appointment, in 
the USTR public reading room, 1724 F 
Street, NW., Washington, DC. 
Availability of documents may be 
ascertained, and appointments may be 
made from 9:30 a.m. to noon and 1 p.m. 

to 4 p.m., Monday through Friday, by 
calling (202) 395–6186. 

2008 Annual GSP Review 
The GSP regulations (15 CFR part 

2007) provide the timetable for 
conducting an annual review, unless 
otherwise specified by Federal Register 
notice. Notice is hereby given that, in 
order to be considered in the 2008 
Annual GSP Product and Country 
Eligibility Practices Review, all petitions 
to modify the list of articles eligible for 
duty-free treatment under GSP or to 
review the GSP status of any beneficiary 
developing country, with the exception 
of petitions requesting CNL waivers, 
must be received by the GSP 
Subcommittee of the Trade Policy Staff 
Committee no later than 5 p.m. on 
Wednesday, June 18, 2008. Petitions 
requesting CNL waivers must be 
received by the GSP Subcommittee of 
the Trade Policy Staff Committee no 
later than 5 p.m. on Thursday, 
November 13, 2008, in order to be 
considered in the 2008 Annual Review. 
Petitions submitted after the respective 
deadlines will not be considered for 
review. 

Interested parties, including foreign 
governments, may submit petitions to: 
(1) Designate additional articles as 
eligible for GSP benefits, including to 
designate articles as eligible for GSP 
benefits only for countries designated as 
least-developed beneficiary developing 
countries, or only for countries 
designated as beneficiary sub-Saharan 
African countries under the African 
Growth and Opportunity Act (AGOA); 
(2) withdraw, suspend or limit the 
application of duty-free treatment 
accorded under the GSP with respect to 
any article, either for all beneficiary 
developing countries, least-developed 
beneficiary developing countries or 
beneficiary sub-Saharan African 
countries, or for any of these countries 
individually; (3) waive the ‘‘competitive 
need limitations’’ for individual 
beneficiary developing countries with 
respect to specific GSP-eligible articles 
(these limits do not apply to either least- 
developed beneficiary developing 
countries or AGOA beneficiary sub- 
Saharan African countries); and (4) 
otherwise modify GSP coverage. 

As specified in 15 CFR 2007.1, all 
product petitions must include a 
detailed description of the product and 
the 8-digit subheading of the 
Harmonized Tariff Schedule of the 
United States (HTSUS) under which the 
product is classified. 

Further, product petitions requesting 
CNL waivers for GSP-eligible articles 
from beneficiary developing countries 
that exceed the CNLs in 2008 must be 

filed in the 2008 Annual Review. In 
order to allow petitioners an 
opportunity to review additional 2008 
U.S. import statistics, these petitions 
may be filed after Wednesday, June 18, 
2008, but must be received on or before 
the Thursday, November 13, 2008, 
deadline described above in order to be 
considered in the 2008 Annual Review. 
Copies will be made available for public 
inspection after the November 13, 2008, 
deadline. 

Any person may also submit petitions 
to review the designation of any 
beneficiary developing country, 
including any least-developed 
beneficiary developing country, with 
respect to any of the designation criteria 
listed in sections 502(b) or 502(c) of the 
Trade Act (19 U.S.C. 2462(b) and (c)) 
(petitions to review the designation of 
beneficiary sub-Saharan African 
countries are considered in the Annual 
Review of the AGOA, a separate 
administrative process not governed by 
the GSP regulations). Such petitions 
must comply with the requirements of 
15 CFR 2007.0(b). 

Requirements for Submissions 
All such submissions must conform to 

the GSP regulations set forth at 15 CFR 
part 2007, except as modified below. 
These regulations are reprinted in the 
‘‘U.S. Generalized System of Preferences 
Guidebook’’ (‘‘GSP Guidebook’’), 
available at http://www.ustr.gov/assets/ 
Trade_Development/ 
Preference_Programs/GSP/ 
asset_upload_file666_8359.pdf. 

Any person or party making a 
submission is strongly advised to review 
the GSP regulations. Submissions that 
do not provide the information required 
by sections 2007.0 and 2007.1 of the 
GSP regulations will not be accepted for 
review, except upon a detailed showing 
in the submission that the petitioner 
made a good faith effort to obtain the 
information required. Petitions with 
respect to waivers of the ‘‘competitive 
need limitations’’ must meet the 
information requirements for product 
addition requests in section 2007.1(c) of 
the GSP regulations. A model petition 
format is available from the GSP 
Subcommittee and is included in the 
GSP Guidebook. Petitioners are 
requested to use this model petition 
format so as to ensure that all 
information requirements are met. 
Furthermore, interested parties 
submitting petitions that request action 
with respect to specific products should 
list on the first page of the petition the 
following information after typing 
‘‘2008 Annual GSP Review’’: (1) The 
requested action; (2) the HTSUS 8-digit 
subheading in which the product is 
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