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DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Transportation Security Administration 

Intent To Request Extension From 
OMB of One Current Public Collection 
of Information: Military Severely 
Injured Joint Support Operations 
Center (MSIJSOC) and Travel Protocol 
Office (TPO) Programs 

AGENCY: Transportation Security 
Administration, DHS. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Transportation Security 
Administration (TSA) invites public 
comment on one currently approved 
Information Collection Request (ICR), 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) control number 1652–0069, 
abstracted below that we will submit to 
OMB for an extension in compliance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act 
(PRA). The ICR describes the nature of 
the information collection and its 
expected burden. The collection 
involves the submission of travel 
information to TSA to provide wounded 
warriors, severely injured military 
personnel, and certain other travelers 
with assistance through the airport 
security screening process. 
DATES: Send your comments by 
November 25, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Comments may be emailed 
to TSAPRA@tsa.dhs.gov or delivered to 
the TSA PRA Officer, Information 
Technology (IT), TSA–11, 
Transportation Security Administration, 
6595 Springfield Center Drive, 
Springfield, VA 20598–6011. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Christina A. Walsh at the above address, 
or by telephone (571) 227–2062. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Comments Invited 
In accordance with the Paperwork 

Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501 
et seq.), an agency may not conduct or 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
unless it displays a valid OMB control 
number. The ICR documentation will be 
made available at https://
www.reginfo.gov upon its submission to 
OMB. Therefore, in preparation for 
OMB review and approval of the 
following information collection, TSA is 
soliciting comments to— 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
information requirement is necessary for 
the proper performance of the functions 
of the agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including using 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Information Collection Requirement 

OMB Control Number 1652–0069; 
Military Severely Injured Joint Support 
Operations Center (MSIJSOC) and 
Travel Protocol Office (TPO) Programs. 
TSA established the MSIJSOC and the 
TPO programs to support and facilitate 
the movement of wounded warriors, 
severely injured military personnel, 
veterans, and other travelers requiring 
an escort through the airport security 
screening process. The MSIJSOC and 
TPO programs are available at 
commercial airports within the 
continental United States and its 
territories. 

The MSIJSOC program works with 
passengers who are wounded warriors, 
severely injured military members, and 
veterans. Once flight arrangements are 
made with the airlines, the traveler, his 
or her family, or other representative 
may contact the TSA Cares Hotline no 
later than 72 hours prior to their 
scheduled flight time with the details of 
the itinerary. TSA collects the traveler’s 
name, travel itinerary (flight departure 
and arrival information), and a point-of- 
contact’s mobile phone number. Once 
TSA collects this information, TSA 
Cares contacts MSIJSOC, where the staff 
vets the request via the appropriate 
Wounded Warrior Care Coordinator to 
verify the eligibility for an escort of a 
wounded warrior, severely injured 
military member, or veteran. After 
verifying eligibility, the MSIJSOC 
contacts the respective TSA official at 
the appropriate airport for action. 

Additionally, the TPO program 
facilitates the movement of foreign 
dignitaries, accredited Ambassadors to 
the United States, and others who may 
require an escort through the airport 
security screening process. These 
travelers may contact the TPO office by 
submitting a request for travel support 
via telephone. Travelers and their 
points-of-contact should submit their 
travel support requests no later than 72 
hours prior to the respective scheduled 
flight to allow TSA to make timely 
notification regarding the travel. TSA 
collects the traveler’s name, travel 
itinerary (flight departure and arrival 
information), and a point-of-contact’s 
mobile phone number. 

The estimated annual burden for this 
collection is 444.7 hours. The estimated 
number of annual respondents is 5,336, 
with each response taking 
approximately 0.08333 hours (444.7 = 
5,336 × 0.08333). 

Dated: September 19, 2024. 
Christina A. Walsh, 
TSA Paperwork Reduction Act Officer, 
Information Technology. 
[FR Doc. 2024–21795 Filed 9–23–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–05–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Transportation Security Administration 

[Docket No. TSA–2002–11602] 

Intent To Request Extension From 
OMB of One Current Public Collection 
of Information: Security Programs for 
Foreign Air Carriers 

AGENCY: Transportation Security 
Administration, DHS. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Transportation Security 
Administration (TSA) invites public 
comment on one currently approved 
Information Collection Request (ICR), 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) control number 1652–0005, 
abstracted below that we will submit to 
OMB for an extension in compliance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act. The 
ICR describes the nature of the 
information collection and its expected 
burden. This information collection is 
mandatory for foreign air carriers and 
must be submitted prior to entry into 
the United States. 
DATES: Send your comments by 
November 25, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Comments may be emailed 
to TSAPRA@tsa.dhs.gov or delivered to 
the TSA PRA Officer, Information 
Technology, TSA–11, Transportation 
Security Administration, 6595 
Springfield Center Drive, Springfield, 
VA 20598–6011. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Christina A. Walsh at the above address, 
or by telephone (571) 227–2062. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Comments Invited 
In accordance with the Paperwork 

Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501 
et seq.), an agency may not conduct or 
sponsor, and a person is not required to 
respond to, a collection of information 
unless it displays a valid OMB control 
number. The ICR documentation will be 
available at http://www.reginfo.gov 
upon its submission to OMB. Therefore, 
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in preparation for OMB review and 
approval of the following information 
collection, TSA is soliciting comments 
to— 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
information requirement is necessary for 
the proper performance of the functions 
of the agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including using 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Information Collection Requirement 
OMB Control Number 1652–0005; 

Security Programs for Foreign Air 
Carriers, 49 CFR part 1546. TSA uses 
the information collected to determine 
compliance with 49 CFR part 1546 and 
to ensure passenger safety by 
monitoring foreign air carrier security 
procedures. Foreign air carriers must 
carry out security measures to provide 
for the safety and security of persons, 
property, and cargo transported on 
aircraft provided by the foreign air 
carrier against acts of criminal violence 
and air piracy, and the introduction of 
unauthorized explosives, incendiaries, 
or other destructive devices, items, or 
substances aboard an aircraft. The 
information TSA collects includes 
identifying information on foreign air 
carriers’ flight crews, passengers, and 
cargo. Specifically, TSA requires foreign 
air carriers to electronically submit the 
following information: (1) a master crew 
list of all flight and cabin crew members 
flying to and from the United States; (2) 
the flight crew list on a flight-by-flight 
basis; (3) passenger identifying 
information on a flight-by-flight basis; 
and (4) cargo shipment information. 
This information collection is 
mandatory for foreign air carriers and 
must be submitted before entry into the 
United States. 

Additionally, foreign air carriers must 
maintain these records, as well as 
training records for crew members and 
individuals performing security-related 
functions and other records of 
compliance associated with the security 
programs, and make them available to 
TSA for inspection upon request. TSA 
will continue to collect information 
described above to determine foreign air 
carrier compliance with requirements of 
49 CFR part 1546. TSA estimates that 
there will be approximately 180 

respondents to the information 
collection, with an annual burden 
estimate of 241,485 hours. 

Dated: September 19, 2024. 
Christina A. Walsh, 
TSA Paperwork Reduction Act Officer, 
Information Technology. 
[FR Doc. 2024–21787 Filed 9–23–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–05–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

U.S. Citizenship and Immigration 
Services 

[CIS No. 2781–24; DHS Docket No. USCIS– 
2022–0007] 

Implementation of Employment 
Authorization for Individuals Covered 
by Deferred Enforced Departure for 
Liberia 

AGENCY: U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration Services (USCIS), 
Department of Homeland Security 
(DHS). 
ACTION: Notice of Employment 
Authorization for Individuals Covered 
by Deferred Enforced Departure (DED). 

SUMMARY: On June 28, 2024, President 
Joseph Biden issued a memorandum to 
the Secretary of State and the Secretary 
of Homeland Security (Secretary) 
determining that it was in the foreign 
policy interest of the United States to 
defer until June 30, 2026, the removal of 
certain Liberians present in the United 
States and to provide them with 
employment authorization 
documentation. This notice provides 
information about Deferred Enforced 
Departure (DED) for Liberians and how 
eligible individuals may apply for DED- 
based Employment Authorization 
Documents (EADs) with USCIS, as well 
as for travel authorization. 
DATES: The extension of DED began on 
June 28, 2024, and ends on June 30, 
2026, for eligible noncitizens who are 
nationals of Liberia (or persons having 
no nationality who last habitually 
resided in Liberia) who are covered 
under DED by the June 28, 2024, 
Presidential Memorandum. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 

• You may contact Rená Cutlip- 
Mason, Chief, Humanitarian Affairs 
Division, Office of Policy and Strategy, 
U.S. Citizenship and Immigration 
Services, Department of Homeland 
Security, by mail at 5900 Capital 
Gateway Drive, Camp Springs, MD 
20746, or by phone at 240–721–3000. 

• For further information on DED, 
including additional information on 

eligibility, please visit the USCIS DED 
web page at https://www.uscis.gov/ 
humanitarian/deferred-enforced- 
departure. You can find specific 
information about DED for Liberia by 
selecting ‘‘DED Covered Country— 
Liberia’’ from the menu on the left of the 
DED web page. 

• If you have additional questions 
about DED, please visit https://
www.uscis.gov/tools. Our online virtual 
assistant, Emma, can answer many of 
your questions and point you to 
additional information on our website. 
If you are unable to find your answers 
there, you may also call our USCIS 
Contact Center at 800–375–5283 (TTY 
800–767–1833). 

• Applicants seeking information 
about the status of their individual Form 
I–765, Application for Employment 
Authorization, or Form I–131, 
Application for Travel Document, may 
check Case Status Online, available on 
the USCIS website at https://
www.uscis.gov, or visit the USCIS 
Contact Center at https://www.uscis.gov/ 
contactcenter. 

• You can also find more information 
at local USCIS offices, listed on the 
USCIS website at https://www.uscis.gov/ 
about-us/find-a-uscis-office, after this 
notice is published. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Table of Abbreviations 

CFR—Code of Federal Regulations 
DED—Deferred Enforced Departure 
DHS—U.S. Department of Homeland 

Security 
DoS—Department of State 
EAD—Employment Authorization Document 
FNC—Final Non-confirmation 
Form I–131—Application for Travel 

Document 
Form I–765—Application for Employment 

Authorization 
Form I–797—Notice of Action 
Form I–9—Employment Eligibility 

Verification 
Form I–912—Request for Fee Waiver 
Form I–94—Arrival/Departure Record 
FR—Federal Register 
Government—U.S. Government 
IER—U.S. Department of Justice, Civil Rights 

Division, Immigrant and Employee Rights 
Section 

INA—Immigration and Nationality Act 
SAVE—USCIS Systematic Alien Verification 

for Entitlements Program 
Secretary—Secretary of Homeland Security 
TTY—Text Telephone 
USCIS—U.S. Citizenship and Immigration 

Services 
U.S.C.—United States Code 

Purpose of This Action 

Under the President’s constitutional 
authority to conduct the foreign 
relations of the United States, President 
Biden has determined that it is in the 
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