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the refuge and the airport. The trail 
system within the refuge would be more 
extensive than under Alternative C. 
Working with our partners, we would 
manage access to the perimeter trail and 
promote trail linkages to the Rocky 
Mountain Greenway Trail and other 
regional trails. We would manage the 
refuge’s habitat and wildlife as in 
Alternative B and we would work with 
neighboring landowners and state 
agencies to extend the range of native 
species. 

Comments 

We solicited comments on the draft 
CCP and draft EIS from May 6, 2015, 

through July 6, 2015. During the 
comment period, we thoroughly 
evaluated and considered all the 
comments we received verbally or via 
letters, email, and electronic forms from 
the public. Our responses to comments 
are included in the final EIS. 

Changes to the Final EIS 

We made the following changes in the 
final EIS from the draft CCP and draft 
EIS: 

• Several comments pointed out the 
need to increase the number of law 
enforcement officers in the refuge to 
better cope with the increased visitation 
and new access to the refuge. Thus the 

Final EIS reflects our desire to seek 
more than one full-time law 
enforcement officer for the refuge under 
Alternatives C and D. 

• As necessary, we updated maps, 
corrected errors, and provided 
additional clarification throughout the 
final EIS. 

Public Availability of Documents 

In addition to any one method in 
ADDRESSES, you can view or obtain 
documents at the following locations: 

• Our Web site: http://www.fws.gov/
mountain-prairie/planning/ccp/co/rkm/
rkm.html. 

• Public libraries: 

Library Address Phone number 

Aurora Central Public Library .................. 14949 E Alameda Parkway, Aurora, CO 80012 ..................................................... (303) 739–6600. 
Commerce City Public Library ................ 7185 Monaco Street, Commerce City, CO 80022 .................................................. (303) 287–0063. 
Denver Central Library ............................ 10 W Fourteenth Avenue, Denver, CO 80204 ........................................................ (720) 865–1111. 
Montbello Public Library .......................... 12955 Albrook Drive, Denver, CO 80239 ............................................................... (720) 865–0200. 
Rangeview Library District ...................... 327 E Bridge Street, Brighton, CO 80601 ............................................................... (303) 405–3230. 

Next Steps 
We will document the final decision 

in a record of decision, which will be 
published in the Federal Register after 
a 30-day ‘‘wait period’’ that begins when 
EPA announces this final EIS. For more 
information, see EPA’s Role in the EIS 
Process. 

Dated: August 3, 2015. 
Matt Hogan, 
Acting Regional Director, Mountain-Prairie 
Region, U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service. 
[FR Doc. 2015–21234 Filed 8–26–15; 8:45 am] 
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ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The purpose of this notice is 
to inform the public and interested State 
and local government officials of the 
filing of Plats of Survey in Nevada. 
DATES: Unless otherwise stated filing is 
effective at 10:00 a.m. on the dates 
indicated below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michael O. Harmening, Chief, Branch of 
Geographic Sciences, Bureau of Land 
Management, Nevada State Office, 1340 
Financial Blvd., Reno, NV 89502–7147, 
phone: 775–861–6490. Persons who use 

a telecommunications device for the 
deaf (TDD) may call the Federal 
Information Relay Service (FIRS) at 1– 
800–877–8339 to contact the above 
individual during normal business 
hours. The FIRS is available 24 hours a 
day, 7 days a week, to leave a message 
or question with the above individual. 
You will receive a reply during normal 
business hours. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

1. The Plat of Survey of the following 
described lands was officially filed at 
the BLM Nevada State Office, Reno, 
Nevada on April 17, 2015. 

The plat, in 2 sheets, representing the 
dependent resurvey of a portion of the 
north boundary and a portion of the 
subdivisional lines, the subdivision of 
section 2 and metes-and-bounds surveys 
in section 2, Township 4 South, Range 
60 East, of the Mount Diablo Meridian, 
Nevada, under Group No. 914, was 
accepted April 16, 2015. This survey 
was executed to meet certain 
administrative needs of the Bureau of 
Land Management. 

2. The Plat of Survey of the following 
described lands was officially filed at 
the Bureau of Land Management (BLM) 
Nevada State Office, Reno, Nevada on 
June 4, 2015: 

The plat, in 1 sheet, representing the 
dependent resurvey of a portion of the 
south boundary and a portion of the 
subdivisional lines, the subdivision of 
sections 35 and 36, and a metes-and- 
bounds survey of the centerline of 
Nevada State Route 318 through a 
portion of section 35, Township 3 
South, Range 60 East, Mount Diablo 
Meridian, Nevada, under Group No. 

929, was accepted June 2, 2015. This 
survey was executed to meet certain 
administrative needs of the Bureau of 
Land Management. 

3. The Plat of Survey of the following 
described lands was officially filed at 
the Bureau of Land Management (BLM) 
Nevada State Office, Reno, Nevada on 
June 4, 2015: 

The plat, in 1 sheet, representing the 
dependent resurvey of a portion of the 
east boundary, a portion of the north 
boundary and a portion of the 
subdivisional lines, and the subdivision 
of section 1, Township 4 South, Range 
60 East, Mount Diablo Meridian, 
Nevada, under Group No. 929, was 
accepted June 2, 2015. This survey was 
executed to meet certain administrative 
needs of the Bureau of Land 
Management. 

4. The Plat of Survey of the following 
described lands was officially filed at 
the Bureau of Land Management (BLM) 
Nevada State Office, Reno, Nevada on 
June 25, 2015: 

The plat, in 3 sheets, representing the 
dependent resurvey of a portion of the 
south boundary, a portion of the 
subdivisional lines, and portions of 
Mineral Survey Nos. 4892 and 4893, 
and a metes-and-bounds survey in 
sections 35 and 36, Township 13 North, 
Range 26 East, Mount Diablo Meridian, 
Nevada, under Group No. 941, was 
accepted June 12, 2015. This survey was 
executed to facilitate the conveyance of 
certain public land to the municipality 
of Yerington, Nevada, as authorized by 
Public Law 113–291. 

5. The Plat of Survey of the following 
described lands was officially filed at 
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the Bureau of Land Management (BLM) 
Nevada State Office, Reno, Nevada on 
June 30, 2015: 

The plat, in 2 sheets, representing the 
dependent resurvey of a portion of the 
north boundary, a portion of the 
subdivisional lines, and the subdivision 
of sections 3 and 4, Township 34 North, 
Range 55 East, Mount Diablo Meridian, 
Nevada, under Group No. 942, was 
accepted June 29, 2015. This survey was 
executed to define and mark boundaries 
for management of the Te-Moak trust 
lands transferred by legislation, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

6. The Plat of Survey of the following 
described lands was officially filed at 
the Bureau of Land Management (BLM) 
Nevada State Office, Reno, Nevada on 
July 24, 2015: 

The plat, in 2 sheets, representing the 
dependent resurvey of a portion of the 
east boundary, a portion of the 
subdivisional lines, and the subdivision 
of section 25, and certain metes-and- 
bounds surveys in section 25, Township 
34 North, Range 54 East, Mount Diablo 
Meridian, Nevada, under Group No. 
943, was accepted July 22, 2015. This 
survey was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public lands, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

7. The Plat of Survey of the following 
described lands was officially filed at 
the Bureau of Land Management (BLM) 
Nevada State Office, Reno, Nevada on 
July 24, 2015: 

The plat, in 1 sheet, representing the 
dependent resurvey of a portion of the 
east boundary, and a metes-and-bounds 
survey in section 25, Township 34 
North, Range 54 1/2 East, Mount Diablo 
Meridian, Nevada, under Group No. 
943, was accepted July 22, 2015. This 
survey was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public lands, as 
authorize by Public Law 113–291. 

8. The Plat of Survey of the following 
described lands was officially filed at 
the Bureau of Land Management (BLM) 
Nevada State Office, Reno, Nevada on 
July 30, 2015: 

The plat, in 1 sheet, representing the 
dependent resurvey of Mineral Survey 
Nos. 3962 and 3971, in unsurveyed 
Township 5 South, Range 46 East, 
Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, under 
Group No. 946, was accepted July 29, 
2015. This survey was executed to 
identify the boundaries of certain 
mineral surveys to the extent necessary 
to identify federal interest for eventual 
conveyance to the United States. 

9. The Supplemental Plat of the 
following described lands was officially 
filed at the BLM Nevada State Office, 
Reno, Nevada on June 4, 2015: The 
supplemental plat, in 1 sheet, showing 
amended lottings in section 17, 

Township 19 South, Range 60 East, of 
the Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, 
under Group No. 947, was accepted 
June 3, 2015. This supplemental plat 
was prepared to meet certain 
administrative needs of the Bureau of 
Land Management. 

10. The Supplemental Plat of the 
following described lands was officially 
filed at the BLM Nevada State Office, 
Reno, Nevada on June 25, 2015: 

The supplemental plat, in 1 sheet, 
showing amended lottings in section 2, 
Township 12 North, Range 26 East, of 
the Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, 
under Group No. 951, was accepted 
June 22, 2015. This supplemental plat 
was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public land to the 
municipality of Yerington, Nevada, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

11. The Supplemental Plat of the 
following described lands was officially 
filed at the BLM Nevada State Office, 
Reno, Nevada on June 25, 2015: 

The supplemental plat, in 1 sheet, 
showing amended lottings in section 3, 
Township 12 North, Range 26 East, of 
the Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, 
under Group No. 951, was accepted 
June 22, 2015. This supplemental plat 
was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public land to the 
municipality of Yerington, Nevada, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

12. The Supplemental Plat of the 
following described lands was officially 
filed at the BLM Nevada State Office, 
Reno, Nevada on June 25, 2015: 

The supplemental plat, in 1 sheet, 
showing amended lottings in section 4, 
Township 12 North, Range 26 East, of 
the Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, 
under Group No. 951, was accepted 
June 22, 2015. This supplemental plat 
was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public land to the 
municipality of Yerington, Nevada, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

13. The Supplemental Plat of the 
following described lands was officially 
filed at the BLM Nevada State Office, 
Reno, Nevada on June 25, 2015: 

The supplemental plat, in 1 sheet, 
showing amended lottings in section 9, 
Township 12 North, Range 26 East, of 
the Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, 
under Group No. 951, was accepted 
June 22, 2015. This supplemental plat 
was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public land to the 
municipality of Yerington, Nevada, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

14. The Supplemental Plat of the 
following described lands was officially 
filed at the BLM Nevada State Office, 
Reno, Nevada on June 25, 2015: 

The supplemental plat, in 1 sheet, 
showing amended lottings in section 10, 

Township 12 North, Range 26 East, of 
the Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, 
under Group No. 951, was accepted 
June 22, 2015. This supplemental plat 
was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public land to the 
municipality of Yerington, Nevada, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

15. The Supplemental Plat of the 
following described lands was officially 
filed at the BLM Nevada State Office, 
Reno, Nevada on June 25, 2015: 

The supplemental plat, in 1 sheet, 
showing amended lottings in section 11, 
Township 12 North, Range 26 East, of 
the Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, 
under Group No. 951, was accepted 
June 22, 2015. This supplemental plat 
was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public land to the 
municipality of Yerington, Nevada, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

16. The Supplemental Plat of the 
following described lands was officially 
filed at the BLM Nevada State Office, 
Reno, Nevada on August 11, 2015: 

The supplemental plat, in 1 sheet, 
showing amended lottings in section 33, 
Township 13 North, Range 26 East, of 
the Mount Diablo Meridian, Nevada, 
under Group No. 953, was accepted 
August 11, 2015. This supplemental plat 
was executed to facilitate the 
conveyance of certain public land to the 
municipality of Yerington, Nevada, as 
authorized by Public Law 113–291. 

The surveys and supplemental plats 
listed above are now the basic record for 
describing the lands for all authorized 
purposes. These records have been 
placed in the open files in the BLM 
Nevada State Office and are available to 
the public as a matter of information. 
Copies of the surveys and related field 
notes may be furnished to the public 
upon payment of the appropriate fees. 

Dated: August 21, 2015. 
Michael O. Harmening, 
Chief Cadastral Surveyor, Nevada. 
[FR Doc. 2015–21245 Filed 8–26–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4310–HC–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Bureau of Land Management 

[LLNMP00000 L13110000.PP0000 
15XL1109PF] 

Notice of Public Meeting, Pecos 
District Resource Advisory Council 
Meeting, New Mexico 

AGENCY: Bureau of Land Management, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Land Policy and Management 
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