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Manufacturing industry Element 

• Railroad Rolling Stock Manufacturing. 
• Other Transportation Equipment Manufacturing. 

IV. Incorporation of the Critical 
Manufacturing Sector Into the NIPP 
Framework 

The NIPP framework includes a SCC 
within all of the sectors containing 
private sector CIKR owners and/or 
operators. The SCC includes CIKR 
owners and/or operators and private 
industry trade associations 
representative of CIKR owners and/or 
operators. By policy, SCCs are self- 
created and self-led entities, and DHS 
encourages public engagement in the 
development of the Critical 
Manufacturing SCC. Each of the sectors 
also has a GCC whose membership 
includes a lead Federal agency that is 
defined as the SSA, and all of the 
relevant Federal, State, local, Tribal, and 
Territorial government agencies (or their 
representative trade associations) whose 
mission interests also involve the scope 
of the NIPP activities for that particular 
sector. As directed and authorized by 
section 4.1.1 of the NIPP (National-Level 
Coordination), the Assistant Secretary, 
Office of Infrastructure Protection will 
assume interim leadership in supporting 
the development of an SCC and 
coordinating the development of a GCC, 
and identify an SSA to meet the 
requirements of HSPD–7 and the NIPP. 

At the conclusion of the above 
process, the Secretary will identify the 
GCC government agency membership 
and designate a Federal agency as the 
SSA. The SSA, SCC, and GCC will 
thereafter comprise the Critical 
Manufacturing Sector and continue to 
organize and coordinate in order to 
accommodate the intent of the NIPP and 
full integration into the CIKR Sector 
Partnership. 

As the NIPP is the primary 
mechanism for coordinating the 
coverage of CIKR sectors and their 
constituent systems and assets, DHS 
will revise its contents to include the 
Critical Manufacturing CIKR sector. As 
part of a comprehensive national 
review, DHS seeks comments on 
changes to the NIPP to reflect the 
addition of the Critical Manufacturing 
sector. These changes will include 
adding the Critical Manufacturing sector 
and its SSA to those sections of the 
NIPP where sectors and their SSAs are 
listed, referenced, or described. DHS 
will also amend the last sentence of the 
definition of ‘‘Sector’’ in the Glossary to 
read, ‘‘The NIPP addresses the 17 CIKR 
sectors enumerated in HSPD–7 and any 

additional sectors created by the 
Secretary of Homeland Security 
pursuant to HSPD–7.’’ 

For purposes of review, the NIPP can 
be found at http://www.dhs.gov/nipp. 

Robert B. Stephan, 
Assistant Secretary, Office of Infrastructure 
Protection, Department of Homeland 
Security. 
[FR Doc. E8–9412 Filed 4–29–08; 8:45 am] 
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National Security Telecommunications 
Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: National Communications 
System, DHS. 
ACTION: Notice of Time Change in Open 
Session. 

SUMMARY: The President’s National 
Security Telecommunications Advisory 
Committee (NSTAC) will meet in a 
partially closed session. 
DATE: Thursday, May 1, 2008, from 2:30 
p.m. until 5 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will take place 
at the U.S. Chamber of Commerce, 1615 
H St., NW., Washington, DC. If you 
desire meeting materials, contact Ms. 
Sue Daage at (703) 235–5526 or by e- 
mail at sue.daage@dhs.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
information published in the Federal 
Register, Volume 73, No. 67, Monday, 
April 7, 2008, p. 18804, remains the 
same except for a change in the time of 
the NSTAC Open Session, which will 
now begin at 2:30 p.m. and end at 3:35 
p.m. 

Between 2:30 p.m. and 3:35 p.m., the 
NSTAC will receive government 
stakeholder feedback, and discuss 
ongoing NSTAC work on research and 
development, and outreach. This 
portion of the meeting will be open to 
the public. Accordingly, the time of the 
Closed Session is now 3:35 p.m.–5 p.m. 

Lawrence Hale, 
Acting Director, National Communications 
System. 
[FR Doc. E8–9413 Filed 4–29–08; 8:45 am] 
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U.S. Citizenship and Immigration 
Services 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Extension of a Currently 
Approved Information Collection; 
Comment Request 

ACTION: 60-Day Notice of Information 
Collection Under Review: File No. 
OMB–25, Special Immigrant Visas for 
Fourth Preference Employment-Based 
Broadcasters; OMB Control No. 1615– 
0064. 

The Department of Homeland 
Security, U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration Services (USCIS) has 
submitted the following information 
collection request for review and 
clearance in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. The 
information collection is published to 
obtain comments from the public and 
affected agencies. Comments are 
encouraged and will be accepted for 
sixty days until June 30, 2008. 

Written comments and suggestions 
regarding items contained in this notice, 
and especially with regard to the 
estimated public burden and associated 
response time should be directed to the 
Department of Homeland Security 
(DHS), USCIS, Chief, Regulatory 
Management Division, Clearance Office, 
111 Massachusetts Avenue, NW., Suite 
3008, Washington, DC 20529. 
Comments may also be submitted to 
DHS via facsimile to 202–272–8352, or 
via e-mail at rfs.regs@dhs.gov. When 
submitting comments by e-mail please 
add the OMB Control Number 1615– 
0064 in the subject box. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
concerning the proposed collection of 
information should address one or more 
of the following four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
collection of information, including the 
validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; 
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