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confidentiality. The Commission is 
required to withhold from disclosure 
certain information about the individual 
such as date of birth or telephone 
number. FCC 605 application is a 
consolidated application form for Ship, 
Aircraft, Amateur, Restricted and 
Commercial Radio Operators, and 
General Mobile Radio Services and is 
used to collect licensing data for the 
Universal Licensing System. The 
Commission is requesting OMB 
approval for an extension (no change in 
the reporting, recordkeeping and/or 
third party disclosure requirements). 
The Commission is making minor 
clarifications to the instructions on the 
main form and schedule B as well as a 
clarification to Item 3 on the main form. 
4 The data collected on this form 
includes the Date of Birth for 
Commercial Operator licensees however 
this information will be redacted from 
public view. 

Privacy Impact Assessment: Yes. 
Needs and Uses: The FCC uses the 

information in FCC Form 605 to 
determine whether the applicant is 
legally, technically, and financially 
qualified to obtain a license. Without 
such information, the Commission 
cannot determine whether to issue the 
licenses to the applicants that provide 
telecommunication services to the 
public, and therefore, to fulfill its 
statutory responsibilities in accordance 
with the Communications Act of 1934, 
as amended. The Commission is 
revising the basic qualifications section 
of the form to include a question 
regarding whether an application has 
been convicted of a felony in any state 
or federal court. Applicants, answering 
yes must provide an explanation. This 
item enables the FCC to determine 
whether an Applicant is eligible under 
§§ 310(d) and 308(b) of the 
Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended, to hold or have ownership 
interest in a station license. In addition 
we are seeking approval to change the 
ship application form require the 
applicant provide the official ship 
number. Coast Guard requests we 
change this question from optional to 
required. Obtaining the ship number is 
the only way to reliably link a license 
to a specific vessel. The Information 
provided on this form will also be used 
to update the database and to provide 
for proper use of the frequency 
spectrum as well as enforcement 
purposes. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene H. Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2017–17394 Filed 8–16–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P6712–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The applications will also be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than September 13, 
2017. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of 
Minneapolis (Brendan S. Murrin, 
Assistant Vice President) 90 Hennepin 
Avenue, Minneapolis, Minnesota 
55480–0291: 

1. Border Bancshares, Inc., 
Greenbush, Minnesota; to acquire 100 
percent of First State Bank of 
Clearbrook, Clearbrook, Minnesota. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, August 14, 2017. 
Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2017–17415 Filed 8–16–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P6210–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisitions of Shares of a Bank or 
Bank Holding Company 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 

§ 225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire shares of a bank 
or bank holding company. The factors 
that are considered in acting on the 
notices are set forth in paragraph 7 of 
the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The notices are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank indicated. The notices 
also will be available for inspection at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
Interested persons may express their 
views in writing to the Reserve Bank 
indicated for that notice or to the offices 
of the Board of Governors. Comments 
must be received not later than 
September 5, 2017. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Kansas 
City (Dennis Denney, Assistant Vice 
President) 1 Memorial Drive, Kansas 
City, Missouri 64198–0001: 

1. Jeff Schumacher, Lincoln, 
Nebraska; to acquire voting shares of 
Farm and Home Insurance Agency, Inc., 
and thereby acquire shares of First 
Northeast Bank of Nebraska, both of 
Lyons, Nebraska. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, August 14, 2017. 
Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2017–17414 Filed 8–16–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P6210–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Agency for Healthcare Research and 
Quality 

Patient Safety Organizations: 
Voluntary Relinquishment From the 
Specialty Benchmarks PSO 

AGENCY: Agency for Healthcare Research 
and Quality (AHRQ), Department of 
Health and Human Services (HHS). 
ACTION: Notice of delisting. 

SUMMARY: The Patient Safety Rule 
authorizes AHRQ, on behalf of the 
Secretary of HHS, to list as a PSO an 
entity that attests that it meets the 
statutory and regulatory requirements 
for listing. A PSO can be ‘‘delisted’’ by 
the Secretary if it is found to no longer 
meet the requirements of the Patient 
Safety Act and Patient Safety Rule, 
when a PSO chooses to voluntarily 
relinquish its status as a PSO for any 
reason, or when a PSO’s listing expires. 
AHRQ has accepted a notification of 
voluntary relinquishment from the 
Specialty Benchmarks PSO of its status 
as a PSO, and has delisted the PSO 
accordingly. 
DATES: The directories for both listed 
and delisted PSOs are ongoing and 
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