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Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), 5 U.S.C. App. 2, to provide 
advice and recommendations to EPA on 
innovative approaches to funding 
environmental programs, projects, and 
activities. Administrative support for 
the EFAB is provided by the Water 
Infrastructure and Resiliency Finance 
Center within EPA’s Office of Water. 
Pursuant to FACA and EPA policy, 
notice is hereby given that the EFAB 
will hold a virtual public meeting for 
the following purposes: 

(1) Provide EFAB workgroup updates 
to the Board regarding work products 
and workplans related to the 
Opportunity Zones charge the Board 
accepted during its October 2020 
meeting; 

(2) Receive briefings from invited 
speakers from EPA and the 
Environmental Finance Center Network 
on environmental finance topics; and 

(3) Discuss potential future EFAB 
projects including Stormwater Credit 
Trading, Environmental Risk and the 
Cost of Capital, Financing Small 
Manufacturer Pollution Prevention 
Project, and others. 

Registration for the Meeting: Register 
for the meeting at https://www.epa.gov/ 
waterfinancecenter/efab#meeting. 

Availability of Meeting Materials: 
Meeting materials (including the 
meeting agenda and briefing materials) 
will be available on EPA’s website at 
https://www.epa.gov/ 
waterfinancecenter/efab. 

Procedures for Providing Public Input: 
Public comment for consideration by 
EPA’s federal advisory committees has a 
different purpose from public comment 
provided to EPA program offices. 
Therefore, the process for submitting 
comments to a federal advisory 
committee is different from the process 
used to submit comments to an EPA 
program office. Federal advisory 
committees provide independent advice 
to EPA. Members of the public can 
submit comments on matters being 
considered by the EFAB for 
consideration by members as they 
develop their advice and 
recommendations to EPA. 

Oral Statements: In general, 
individuals or groups requesting an oral 
presentation at a virtual EFAB public 
meeting will be limited to three minutes 
each. Persons interested in providing 
oral statements at the April 2021 
meeting should register in advance and 
provide notification as noted in the 
registration confirmation by April 12, 
2021 to be placed on the list of 
registered speakers. 

Written Statements: Written 
statements for the April 2021 meeting 
should be received by April 12, 2021 so 

that the information can be made 
available to the EFAB for its 
consideration prior to the meeting. 
Written statements should be sent via 
email to efab@epa.gov. Members of the 
public should be aware that their 
personal contact information, if 
included in any written comments, may 
be posted to the EFAB website. 
Copyrighted material will not be posted 
without explicit permission of the 
copyright holder. 

Accessibility: For information on 
access or services for individuals with 
disabilities or to request 
accommodations for a disability, please 
register for the meeting and list any 
special requirements or 
accommodations needed on the 
registration form at least 10 business 
days prior to the meeting to allow as 
much time as possible to process your 
request. 

Dated: March 1, 2021. 
Andrew D. Sawyers, 
Director, Office of Wastewater Management, 
Office of Water. 
[FR Doc. 2021–04828 Filed 3–8–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL ACCOUNTING STANDARDS 
ADVISORY BOARD 

Notice of Request for Volunteers for 
Intangible Assets Task Force 

AGENCY: Federal Accounting Standards 
Advisory Board. 
ACTION: Notice. 

Pursuant to 31 U.S.C. 3511(d), the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (Pub. 
L. 92–463), as amended, and the FASAB 
Rules Of Procedure, as amended in 
October 2010, notice is hereby given 
that the Federal Accounting Standards 
Advisory Board (FASAB) is seeking 
volunteers for a task force to study 
federal intangible assets and potentially 
develop accounting and financial 
reporting guidance for such assets. The 
Board seeks broad task force 
representation to include financial 
statement users, preparers, and auditors, 
as well as relevant operational and 
technical experts. Task force members 
should have some familiarity with 
federal financial statements and/or 
subject matter knowledge regarding 
federal intangible assets. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Monica R. Valentine, Executive 
Director, 441 G Street NW, Suite 1155, 
Washington, DC 20548, or call (202) 
512–7350. 

Authority: Federal Advisory Committee 
Act, Pub. L. 92–463. 

Dated: March 4, 2021. 
Monica R. Valentine, 
Executive Director. 
[FR Doc. 2021–04859 Filed 3–8–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 1610–02–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0854, FRS 17544] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act of 1995 (PRA), the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
Commission) invites the general public 
and other Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collections. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
The FCC may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid OMB 
control number. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before May 10, 2021. 
If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Cathy Williams, FCC, via email to PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
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