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contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov; call toll- 
free at (866) 208–3676; or, for TTY, 
contact (202) 502–8659. Although the 
Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filing, documents may also be 
paper-filed. To paper-file, mail an 
original and eight copies to: Kimberly D. 
Bose, Secretary, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First 
Street, NE., Washington, DC 20426. 

More information about this project, 
including a copy of the application, can 
be viewed or printed on the ‘‘eLibrary’’ 
link of Commission’s Web site at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
elibrary.asp. Enter the docket number 
(P–13617) in the docket number field to 
access the document. For assistance, 
contact FERC Online Support. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2010–5210 Filed 3–10–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2244–000] 

Energy Northwest; Notice of 
Authorization for Continued Project 
Operation 

March 4, 2010. 
On March 7, 2008, Energy Northwest, 

licensee for the Packwood Lake 
Hydroelectric Project, filed an 
Application for a New License pursuant 
to the Federal Power Act (FPA) and the 
Commission’s regulations thereunder. 
The Packwood Lake Hydroelectric 
Project is located on Lake Creek, a 
tributary to the Cowlitz River, in Lewis 
County in southwestern Washington. 

The license for Project No. 2244 was 
issued for a period ending February 28, 
2010. Section 15(a)(1) of the FPA, 16 
U.S.C. 808(a)(1), requires the 
Commission, at the expiration of a 
license term, to issue from year-to-year 
an annual license to the then licensee 
under the terms and conditions of the 
prior license until a new license is 
issued, or the project is otherwise 
disposed of as provided in section 15 or 
any other applicable section of the FPA. 
If the project’s prior license waived the 
applicability of section 15 of the FPA, 
then, based on section 9(b) of the 
Administrative Procedure Act, 5 U.S.C. 
558(c), and as set forth at 18 CFR 
16.21(a), if the licensee of such project 
has filed an application for a subsequent 
license, the licensee may continue to 
operate the project in accordance with 

the terms and conditions of the license 
after the minor or minor part license 
expires, until the Commission acts on 
its application. If the licensee of such a 
project has not filed an application for 
a subsequent license, then it may be 
required, pursuant to 18 CFR 16.21(b), 
to continue project operations until the 
Commission issues someone else a 
license for the project or otherwise 
orders disposition of the project. 

If the project is subject to section 15 
of the FPA, notice is hereby given that 
an annual license for Project No. 2244 
is issued to Energy Northwest for a 
period effective March 1, 2010 through 
February 28, 2011, or until the issuance 
of a new license for the project or other 
disposition under the FPA, whichever 
comes first. If issuance of a new license 
(or other disposition) does not take 
place on or before February 28, 2011, 
notice is hereby given that, pursuant to 
18 CFR 16.18(c), an annual license 
under section 15(a)(1) of the FPA is 
renewed automatically without further 
order or notice by the Commission, 
unless the Commission orders 
otherwise. If the project is not subject to 
section 15 of the FPA, notice is hereby 
given that Energy Northwest is 
authorized to continue operation of the 
Packwood Lake Hydroelectric Project, 
until such time as the Commission acts 
on its application for a subsequent 
license. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2010–5204 Filed 3–10–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings #1 

March 4, 2010. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following electric corporate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: EC10–44–000. 
Applicants: Cresent Ridge, LLC. 
Description: Supplemental 

Information for Crescent Ridge LLC. 
Filed Date: 03/04/2010. 
Accession Number: 20100304–5045. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Monday, March 15, 2010. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following electric rate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: ER10–689–001. 
Applicants: Virginia Electric and 

Power Company. 

Description: Dominion Virginia Power 
submits substitute sheet to the JOA 
reflects the modifications. 

Filed Date: 03/03/2010. 
Accession Number: 20100304–0209. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Wednesday, March 24, 2010. 
Docket Numbers: ER10–812–000. 
Applicants: Power Choice, Inc. 
Description: Application of Power 

Choice Inc for an Order Accepting 
Initial Market Based Rate Schedule and 
Granting Waivers and Blanket 
Authorizations. 

Filed Date: 03/03/2010. 
Accession Number: 20100303–0223. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Wednesday, March 24, 2010. 
Docket Numbers: ER10–820–000. 
Applicants: Detroit Edison Company. 
Description: Detroit Edison Company 

submits Notice of Cancellation to Open 
Access Transmission Tariff, FERC 
Electric Tariff, Original Volume 2 to 
confirm the cancellation of Detroit 
Edison’s OATT, effective 3/4/2010. 

Filed Date: 03/03/2010. 
Accession Number: 20100303–0225. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Wednesday, March 24, 2010. 
Docket Numbers: ER10–821–000. 
Applicants: Central Maine Power 

Company 
Description: Central Maine Power 

Company submits its Engineering and 
procurement Agreement dated February 
3, 2010 with Spruce Mt Wind, LLC 
designated as Original Service 
Agreement CMP–EP–2–S under 
Schedule 23 etc. 

Filed Date: 03/03/2010. 
Accession Number: 20100303–0224. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Wednesday, March 24, 2010. 
Docket Numbers: ER10–822–000. 
Applicants: Southwest Power Pool, 

Inc. 
Description: Southwest Power Pool, 

Inc. submits an executed Meter Agent 
Service Agreement with Westar Energy, 
Inc Generation Services. 

Filed Date: 03/02/2010. 
Accession Number: 20100303–0220. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Tuesday, March 23, 2010. 
Docket Numbers: ER10–823–000. 
Applicants: Southwest Power Pool, 

Inc. 
Description: Southwest Power Pool, 

Inc submits an executed service 
agreement for Network Integration 
Transmission Service with Westar 
Energy, Inc. et al. 

Filed Date: 03/02/2010. 
Accession Number: 20100303–0221. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 

on Tuesday, March 23, 2010. 
Docket Numbers: ER10–824–000. 
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